JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7968

APPROVAL DATE: June 08, 2021

ITEM(S) QUOTED: PRINTING: 2021-2022 CODE OF ACCEPTABLE
BEHAVIOR .

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: April 14, 2021

CONTRACT PERIOD: From June 08, 2021 through May 31, 2022

RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: The Board has opted to award Item No. 4.

An * indicates an award.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Black Tie Productions, Inc.

As specified

30 days from date of art approval

K.K. Stevens Publishing

Net 30

Printwell, Inc.

Accepted per specifications. Reprint prices in
each line item Response Terms

Net 30 Days

Stephen Gould Corporation

Vivid Impact Corporation

No Bid - this fits full web press or publisher
best
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ITEM NO. 1 - Printing. 40 pages plus cover (10 sheets of text paper plus 1 cover sheet). As per specifications. Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies if ordered after initial guantity.

Price per additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial guantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if ordered after initial quantity. 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 105,000 (4600548-1714169)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Vivid Impact Corporation Vivid Impact 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid - this fits full web press or publisher best

K.K. Stevens Publishing K.K. Stevens Publishing Co. 0.2256
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 40 page plus cover
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1,000 copies=$2,955.54 2,500 copies=%$3,216.89 5,000 copies=$3,780.47

Black Tie Productions, Inc. BTP/W-S 0.2457
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: J7968
Printwell, Inc. Printwell, Inc. 0.2471

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: -
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Price for reprints: 1,000: 2.0292 each 2,500: .8872 each 5,000: .5199 each

Stephen Gould Corporation Stephen Gould Corporation 0.4000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SGC-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: .40 Per unit Additional Units: $1.66 -1,000 units $.94-2,500 units $.70-5,000 units

ITEM NO. 2 - Printing, 44 pages plus cover (11 sheets of text paper plus 1 cover sheet). As per specifications. Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies if ordered after initial guantity.
Price per additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial guantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if ordered after initial guantity. 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 105,000

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Vivid Impact Corporation Vivid Impact 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid - this fits full web press or publisher best

K.K. Stevens Publishing K.K. Stevens Publishing Co. 0.2476

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 44 page plus cover
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1,000 copies=$3,138.91 2,500 copies=$3,445.60 5,000 copies=$4,074.24

Printwell, Inc. Printwell, Inc. #- 0.2647
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: -
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Reprint prices: 1,000: 2.1216 each 2,500: .9346 each 5,000: .5524 each

Black Tie Productions, Inc. BTP/W-S 0.2833
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: J7968

Stephen Gould Corporation Stephen Gould Corporation 0.4300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SGC-2

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net30

. .
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Additional Units: $1.84-1,000 units $1.05-2,500 units $.75-5,000 units

ITEM NO. 3 - Printing. 48 pages plus cover (12 sheets of text paper plus 1 cover sheet). As per specifications. Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies if ordered after initial guantity.

Price per additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial guantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if ordered after initial qguantity. 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 105,000

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Vivid Impact Corporation Vivid Impact 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid - this fits full web press or publisher best

K.K. Stevens Publishing K.K. Stevens Publishing Co. 0.2475
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 48 page plus cover
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1,000 copies=$3,040.50 2,500 copies=%$3,338.33 5,000 copies=$3,959.53

Printwell, Inc. Printwell, Inc. #- 0.2689
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: -
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Reprint price: 1,000: 2.0271 each 2,500: .9181 each 5,000: .5581 each

Black Tie Productions, Inc. BTP/W-S 0.2710
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: J7968

Stephen Gould Corporation Stephen Gould Corporation 0.4400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SGC-3

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Additional Units $1.73-1,000 units $1.00- 2,500 units $.72-5,000 units

ITEM NO. 4 - Printing, 52 pages plus cover (13 sheets of text paper plus 1 cover sheet). As per specifications. Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies if ordered after initial guantity.
Price per additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial guantity. Price per additional 5.000 copies if ordered after initial guantity. 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 105,000

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Vivid Impact Corporation Vivid Impact 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid - this fits full web press or publisher best

K.K. Stevens Publishing K.K. Stevens Publishing Co. 0.2681*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 52 page plus cover
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1,000 copies=$3,262.96 2,500 copies=$3,601.63 5,000 copies=$4,281.86

Printwell, Inc. Printwell, Inc. #- 0.2921
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: -
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Reprint price: 1,000: 2.4284 each 2,500: 1.0117 each 5,000: .6068 each

Black Tie Productions, Inc. BTP/W-S 0.2962
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: J7968
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Stephen Gould Corporation Stephen Gould Corporation 0.4800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SGC-4
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Additional Units: $1.90- 1,000 units $1.11- 2,500 units $.80-5,000 units

ITEM NO. 5 - Printing, 56 pages plus cover (14 sheets of text paper plus 1 cover sheet). As per specifications. Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Price per additional 1,000 copies if ordered after initial guantity.
Price per additional 2,500 copies if ordered after initial guantity. Price per additional 5,000 copies if ordered after initial qguantity. 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 105,000

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Vivid Impact Corporation Vivid Impact 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid - this fits full web press or publisher best

K.K. Stevens Publishing K.K. Stevens Publishing Co. 0.2676
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 56 page plus cover
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1,000 copies=$3,148.97 2,500 copies=$3,477.89 5,000 copies=$4,149.59

Printwell, Inc. Printwell, Inc. #- 0.3046

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: -
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Reprint price: 1,000: 2.4786 each 2,500: 1.0281 each 5,000: .6259 each

Black Tie Productions, Inc. BTP/W-S 0.3120
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: J7968

Stephen Gould Corporation Stephen Gould Corporation 0.4900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SGC-5

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Additional Units $2.01-1,000 units $1.15-2,500 units $.81- 5,000 units

. .
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3$) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Black Tie Productions, Inc. 147,861.00
K.K. Stevens Publishing 131,922.00 28,150.50
Printwell, Inc. 144,627.00
Stephen Gould Corporation 235,200.00
Vivid Impact Corporation 52.50

28,150.50

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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