
General Vehicle Specifications

6-Speed automatic transmission Y Y Y Y
8’ Bed Y Y Y Y
6.2 V8 gas engine Y - 6.6 V8 Y Y Y
XL Trim Y - Chev. WT Y Y Y
Power Steering Y Y Y Y
Power locks Y Y Y Y
Cruise control Y Y Y Y
Air conditioning Y Y Y Y
Trailer tow package Y Y Y Y
Limited axel Y Y Y Y
Rubber Floors Y Y Y Y
Anti-lock brakes Y Y Y Y
AM/FM stereo Y Y Y Y
Vinyl seats Y Y Y Y
Cab steps Y Y Y Y
Rear-view Camera Y Y Y Y
Knapheide 8” Service body with flip top Y Y Y Y
Spray-in bed liner Y Y Y Y
TOMMY GATE w/1600# capacity Y Y Y Y
Exterior color - White Y Y Y Y

Model of Vehicle Bid
2022 Silverado 2500 

HP
Ford F350

Ford F250 F250
Trim Level of Vehicle Bid Work Truck XL XL XL
Rated MPG:  City N/R N/A N/A
Rated MPG:  Highway N/R N/A N/A

Warranty:  Basic
3 yr 36,000 or 5 yr 

100,000
3 yr 36,000

Standard 36/36 Yes
Delivery Time from Date of Order 180 Days 4-6 wks TBD Sept. 2021

Description Price

MSRP Price     $ $39,918.00
$58,265.00 

per vehicle $49,130.00 $41,105.00

Dealer Installed Options $10,864.00
$13,275.00 - 

Bed & Lift Gate
Other
Less:  Discount $9,857.00 $13,480.00

Net Bid Price (must include all costs)     $ $40,925.00
$73,265.00 

per vehicle $39,938.00 $40,900.00 each
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General Vehicle Specifications

6-Speed automatic transmission Y
Y - 10 speed 

Auto Trans. Y Y

5.0 V8 gas engine(or equivalent) Y
Y - 3.5L V6 

Twin Turbo
3.5L EcoBoost 

V6

3.5 L V-6 

Ecoboost
Hands Free Talking Y Y Y Y
Power Steering Y Y Y Y
Power locks and windows Y Y Y Y
Cruise control Y Y Y Y
Air conditioning Y Y Y Y
Trailer tow package(with Trailer Brakes) Y Y Y Y
Anti-lock brakes Y Y Y Y
AM/FM/CD stereo Y - No CD Y Y Y
Rear-view Camera Y Y Y Y
Exterior color - White Y Y Y Y

Model of Vehicle Bid 2022 Chevry Tahoe
Ford 

Expedition Ford Expediton

Expeditioin XL 

4X4
Trim Level of Vehicle Bid 1 FL Commercial XLT Base XL 101A
Rated MPG:  City 20 17 17 18
Rated MPG:  Highway 16 22 22 21

Warranty:  Basic
3 yr 36,000 or 5 yr 

100,000
3 yr 36,000

Standard 36/36 Yes
Delivery Time from Date of Order 180 4-6 wks TBD Late August

Description Price

MSRP Price     $ $53,501.00
$64,775.00 

per vehicle $54,565 $55,395.00
Dealer Installed Options
Other
Less:  Discount $9,390.00 $15,160.00

Net Bid Price (must include all costs)     $ $44,111.00
$79,775.00 

per vehicle $40,306.00 $40,275.00 each

Pual Miller 

Auto Sales
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2 - NEW ½ Ton-4 Door SUV 4x4 Third row Seating
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Audubon 
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Dempewolf 

Ford 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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General Vehicle Specifications

6-Speed automatic transmission Y
Y - 10 speed 

Auto Trans. Y Y

6.0 V8 gas engine(or equivalent) Y - 6.6 V8 Y Y 6.2K V8

Hands Free Talking Y Y Y Y

Power Steering Y Y Y Y

Power locks and windows Y Y Y Y

Cruise control Y Y Y Y

Air conditioning Y Y Y Y

Trailer tow package(with Trailer Brakes) Y Y Y Y

Anti-lock brakes Y Y Y Y

AM/FM/CD stereo Y - No CD Y Y Y

Rear-view Camera Y Y Y Y

Exterior color - White Y Y Y Y

Kanpheide Drop Side Dump Bed 9ft 12in drop Y Y Y Y

Snow Plow 8 ½ Ft Pro-Plus Y Y Y Y

Model of Vehicle Bid
2022 Silverado 3500 

HP
Ford F350

Ford F350 CC F350

Trim Level of Vehicle Bid Chev. WT XL XL XL

Rated MPG:  City Not Rated N/A N/A

Rated MPG:  Highway Not Rated N/A N/A

Warranty:  Basic
3 yr 36,000 or 5 yr 

100,000
3 yr. 

Standard 36/36 Yes

Delivery Time from Date of Order 180 Days 4-6 wks TBD Sept. 2021

Description Price

MSRP Price     $ $41,993.00
$62,360.00 

per vehicle $58,589.00 $43,965.00 Chassis

Dealer Installed Options $13,539.00
$18,100.00 Bed 

& Plow

Other

Less:  Discount $10,133.00 $12,504.00

Net Bid Price (must include all costs)     $ $45,396.00
$77,360.00 

per vehicle $50,784.00 $49,561.00

Contact Info: Jason Moore Roger Hoon Bruce Spalding Zach Baugh Rick Ausbrook Tom Legate Terry Hendricks

Address 2945 US 41 4144 Bardstown Rd. 2530 US 41 1590 Altorac Way 610 Happy Valley Rd. 2746 US 41 7720 E. Division St

Henderson, KY 42420 Louisville, KY 40218 Henderson, KY 42420 Lexington, KY 40509 Glasgow, KY 42141 Henderson, KY 42420 Evansville, IN 47715

Phone 270-826-1270 502-499-0800 270-827-3566 317-412-4797 270-651-2125 270-844-4599 812-401-1160

Fax 502-657-3352 270-831-7070 270-842-4057 812-401-1162

Email rhoon@bobhook.net

bruce.spaldi

ng@dempew

olf.com

zachbaugh321@y

ahoo.com

rick.fleet.sales@o

utlook.com

hendrickstcford.

aol.com

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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