
Company

Applause 

Learning 

Resources Barnes & Noble Broad Reach

Bound to 

Stay Bound 

Books, Inc. Capstone

Cavendish 

Squire 

Publishing Complete Book

Classroom 

Library 

Company

Enslow 

Publishing, 

LLC Follett

Gareth 

Stevens 

Publishing

GL Group, Inc. 

dba 

BookSource

Greenha

ven 

Publishi

ng, LLC

Junior Library 

Guild

Joseph-Beth 

Booksellers Enterprises, 

LLC KAPCO

Knowbuddy 

Resources

Lookout 

Books

Mackin Educational 

Resources Penworthy

Perma-

BoundBooks

Rosen 

Publishing 

Group

Saddleback 

Educational, 

Inc. Scholastic

Smart Apple 

Media Solution Tree

World Book, 

Inc.

% Discount 

off books with 

publisher's 

bindings

0% 30% off non-

fiction

30% 25%

0-50% 0% 25% 0%
30% off non-

fiction

30% off non-

fiction

8% off already 45% 

dicounted prices

0% (website 

already 

reflects 25% 

discount)

Discount on 

Website/Catalog
30%

30% off non-

fiction
0%

0% (catalog 

reflect varying 

discount 3-

12%)

% Discount 

off books with 

publisher's 

trade bindings

0-35% 30% off non-

fiction

No Bid N/A

0-50% 0% 25% 0%
30% off non-

fiction

30% off non-

fiction

8% off already 45% 

dicounted prices

0% (website 

already 

reflects 25% 

discount)

Discount on 

Website/Catalog
40%

30% off non-

fiction
0% N/A

% Discount 

off Supplies

NO Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

0-20% N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

0% (website 

already 

reflects 25% 

discount)

0% N/A N/A 0% N/A

Services 

Offered

Wide array of published 

products including 

novels, children's 

books, young adult 

books, textbook 

dictionaries, 

encyclopedias, audio 

books, e-books and 

NOOK e-readers

0% discount 

on fiction 

trade 

bindings. 

Free 

downloadable 

MARC record 

on any size 

order.

Prebound 

juvenile 

library books 

with full 

processing 

and 

automation 

support 

available.

Library 

Processing: 

Attached and 

unattached 

library 

processing is 

free on orders 

of 25 books 

or more. 

Orders 24 

books or less, 

MARC 

records are 

$20.00 per 

order: 

attached 

labels are 

0.99 per book 

and 

unattached 

labelss are 

0.39 per 

book; theft 

protection is 

0.79 per 

book. 

Capstone 

reward 

members 

We are a wholesale 

book distributor 

providing books, 

textbooks, instructional 

materials, educatoinal 

supplies, subscriptions, 

media and ebooks. Our 

discount structure will 

remail the same but list 

prices are subject to 

increase. Not all items 

are returnable unless 

incorrect or damaged. 

We distribute books, 

reference materials, 

digital resources, 

eBooks, and 

audiovisual materals, 

as well as new and pre-

owned textbooks. We 

alson provide integrated 

educational technology 

for the management of 

physical and digitial 

assets, the tracking, 

storing, and analyzing 

of academic data; and 

digital learning 

environment tools.

Trade books 

and classroom 

libraries

Library books, 

classroom books, 

audio books, ebooks, 

spannish language 

books, bilingual 

books, Library look 

cataloging, & 

processing

0% discount on 

fiction trade 

bindings. Free 

downloadable 

MARC record 

on any size 

order.

0% discount 

on fiction 

trade 

bindings. 

Free 

downloadable 

MARC record 

on any size 

order.

Books & educational 

materials in print and 

digital to schools and 

libraries. Includes print 

books, eBooks, digital 

audiobooks, CD, DVD, 

Playaways, BluRay, 

Makerspace materials, 

educational database, and 

more. 

Our website 

reflects a 

25% distount 

on library 

bound books 

and the 

Penworthy 

rebounds are 

competitively 

priced.

We have 

unconditional 

gaurantee

Library binding-Children's 

Press, Franklin Watts, and 

selected Scholastic titles. Trade 

binding-selected Scholastic 

titles.

0% discount 

on fiction 

trade 

bindings. 

Free 

downloadable 

MARC record 

on any size 

order.

Professional 

development to 

educators around the 

world. For more than 

20 years, we have 

e3mpowered K-12 

schools and districst 

to raise student 

achievement through 

a comprehensive 

range of services and 

products including 

events, district 

centered solutions for 

long-term professional 

development, 

workshops, books, 

videos, and much 

more.

Leading 

educational 

and reference 

publisher, 

providing 

exceptional 

resources for 

the library 

and 

classroom in 

print, online, 

and e-book 

format.

Shipping

$4.99 for the first book 

and 0.99 per additional 

book to the same 

address with free 

shipping after $500. 

No charge on 

any size order

No charge Free on 

orders of 

$500.00 or 

more; 10% of 

subtotal on 

orders below 

$500.00 with 

$7.00 

minimum. 

Capstone 

reward 

members get 

free shipping 

on all orders, 

enrollment is 

free.

Free for orders over 

$50.00. $8.50 for orders 

below $50.00

Free shipping & 

handling on all orders 

other than textbooks, 

Hardware or Barcode 

orders within the US & 

territories. Textbook 

orders will be chargere 

10% merchinse total for 

shoppong and handling 

unless the order is over 

$15,000. Standard 

shipping rates will be 

applied to any hardware 

or barcode orders. 

Free shipping 

on orders over 

$150. Flat rate 

$9.99 on orders 

under $150. 

Free shipping even 

on returns

No charge on 

any size order

No charge on 

any size order

Free shipping on all 

orders. 

Free shipping 

on oders over 

$100.00

Free shipping and 

handling

Free shipping & handling on 

orders over $350. For orders 

less there is a 5% charge.

No charge on 

any size order
Continental US add $4 

handling fee plus 

shipping charges of 

$2 per unit ordered. 

Add $1 for each 

additional unit over 

100. Outside the 

continental US add 

$30 handling plus $5 

per unit ordered. 

Please note that kits 

may count as muliple 

pieces when 

calculating shipping 

costs. We are not 

responsible for  and 

will not refund 

international customs 

fees.

Standard 

shipping and 

handling are 

included in 

catalog price. 

There are 

additional 

fees if 

expedited 

shippping is 

required. 

Number of 

Books in 

Inventory 1,800,000 Over 10.000 3,000 over 3.8 millions units

Around 1.5 

Million Up to 5,000 70,000 - 3,000,000 750 N/A Varies 150,000

Procedures 

for reporting 

back orders

Account manage will 

alert you immediately to 

report any backorders 

and/or out of stock, 

and/or out of print 

books. 

We do not do 

backorders, 

books out of 

print or out of 

stock will not 

ship and titles 

will show as 

zero quantity 

shipped and 

zero dollar 

value on 

invoice.

See attached 

order form

Orginal 

shipment are 

delivered 

immediately 

and any 

backorders 

are held until 

all titles on 

backorder 

come in so 

customer only 

receive 2 

invoices/ship

ments. The 

original 

shipment will 

note any 

backordered 

titles. 

Notification immediately 

via email if a publication 

has gone on backorder 

or moved to out of print 

status. 

Online catalog , 

titlewave.com, give the 

ability to check 

backorder, out of stock, 

out of print, orders 

tattus from start to 

finish, invoices, and 

order history.

See attached 

specifications

We do not sell items 

that is OSS or 

backordered. 

Website does not 

allow.

We do not do 

backorders, 

books out of 

print or out of 

stock will not 

ship and titles 

will show as 

zero quantity 

shipped and 

zero dollar 

value on 

invoice.

We do not do 

backorders, 

books out of 

print or out of 

stock will not 

ship and titles 

will show as 

zero quantity 

shipped and 

zero dollar 

value on 

invoice.

We do not backorder. We 

report out of print, out of 

stock indefinitely, or 

unavailable immediately.

All titles on 

website are in 

stock, We 

don't back 

order. 

If backorder is 

requested, we will 

immediately ship out 

the available titles 

and you will see the 

back ordered titles 

listed on the invoice 

but not billed.  We 

only invoice what we 

ship unless the 

customer requests 

an invoice up front. 

Will watch the order 

and whenthe other 

books arrive from 

publisher we will 

ship out the 

remainder of the 

order.

Notice will be noted on your 

packing slip and invoice. You 

may contact customer service 

for availability.

We do not do 

backorders, 

books out of 

print or out of 

stock will not 

ship and titles 

will show as 

zero quantity 

shipped and 

zero dollar 

value on 

invoice.

The website will note 

if a book Is out of 

print. We publish our 

own books, so we do 

not have backorders 

or out of stock items. 

All catalog 

items are 

maintained in 

our 

warehouse. If 

an item is 

orderd pre-

pub or back-

ordered, 

pending print, 

you will be 

notified via 

email or 

phone call by 

your local 

representativ

e or order 

processing 

personnel. 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Henderson County Schools

No BidNo Bid No BidNo Bid

Henderson, KY  42420

1805 Second Street

Effective July 1, 2021 through June 30, 2022

Bid # 3-21-5-5

Library Books, Services, and Supplies

No Bid



Delivery

UPS or FedEx. Orders 

with a quantity 200 or 

less have a delivery 

window of 7-14 

business days. Orders 

with a quantity over 200 

have a delivery window 

of 4-6 weeks. 

We ship all 

books via 

FedEx, 

shipping is 

usually within 

5 days of 

receipt of 

order. 

1st Shipment 

within 14 

days ARO. 

Shipped 

FedEx

Orders ship in 

7-10 days 

ARO, we use 

a common 

carrier, with 

inside 

delivery that 

arrives in 2-4 

days within 

the USA. 

Orders with 

library 

processing 

require up to 

2 1/2 - 3 

weeks. 

We ship FedEx, UPS, 

or USPS. All trackable. 

Delivery time 5-14 

working days.

UPS - We provide 97-

100% fill rate within 15 

days after receipt of 

order. If a backorder is 

were necessary, it 

would be shipped within 

60 days after receipt of 

order. If desired, 

backorders will not be 

shipped unless 

authorized by your 

admin. 

See attached 

specifications

USPS, UPS, FedEx, 

FOB 30 days or as 

scheduled

We ship all 

books via 

FedEx, 

shipping is 

usually within 5 

days of receipt 

of order. 

We ship all 

books via 

FedEx, 

shipping is 

usually within 

5 days of 

receipt of 

order. 

First shipment will be 

made 28 days ARO and 

second shipment (if 

necessary) 45 dyas ARO 

to complete your order.

100% 

completely 

next day, no 

backorder 

and free 

shipping thru 

UPS

 If backorder is ok 

the first shipment 

should arrive 20 

days ARO. We try to 

close out the order 

within 60 days ARO. 

If we can't get a title 

we will contact 

customer service to 

as to how to 

proceed.

10-14 day non library 

processed and 21-30 days 

library processed orders. 

We ship all 

books via 

FedEx, 

shipping is 

usually within 

5 days of 

receipt of 

order. 

Most orders ship 

within 7 business 

days. However, rush 

orders received by 

12:00 p.m. Eastern 

may ship the same 

day.

7-10 days. 

World Book, 

Inc. mode of 

delivery is 

through UPS 

shipping.

Name

Michael Pollach

John Delich or N. Evans-

Watt Laurie Osburn

Amy 

Janczarek or 

Lori Smith

Mike Howard 

or Connie 

Ruyter Arlene Riley Kendall Montiegel Ben Conn Arlene Riley

James Wilson or 

Anthony Pfister Arlene Riley

Anna Frazier or 

Steven Hicks Arlene Riley

Drew Scott or Angela 

Christianson Mr. Lorn Smith Shaun SmithLaurie Osburn Laurie Osburn Tim Kane or Grace Mundt Holly Rite

Jennifer Hayes or 

Heather Cook Arlene Riley Lisa Raraborrelli

Melissa Sutherland  or Kathy 

Brown Laurie Osburn

Cathy McClemens or 

Jim Watson

Allison Horton 

or Jeff 

Williamson or 

Sarah 

Nienaber

Address

85 Fernwood 

Lane Roslyn, NY  

11576

624 S Green River Rd  

Evansville, IN  47715

P.O. Box 

3127 

Mankato, MN 

56002

1880 West 

Morton 

Jacksonville, 

IL 62650

1710 Roe 

Crest Drive 

56003

243 5th Ave 

Suite 136 

New York, NY 

10016

1200 Toro Grande Dr. 

Suite 200 Cedar Park, 

TX 78613

3901 Union 

Blvd Suite 

155 St. Louis, 

MO 63115

101 West 

23rd Street 

Suite 240 

New York, NY 

10011

1340 Ridgeview Dr. 

McHenry, IL 60050

111 East 14th 

Street Suite 

349 New 

York, NY 

10003

1230 Macklind 

Ave. St. Louis, 

MO 63110

353 3rd 

Ave 

Suite 

255 New 

York, NY 

10010

7858 Industrial 

Parkway Plain City, 

OH 43064 Cincinnati, OH 45227

1000 

Cherry 

St. Kent, 

OH 

44240

P.O. Box 3227 

Mankato, MN 

56002

P.O. Box 

3144 

Mankato, MN 

56002

3505 County Road 42 

West Burnsville, MN 

55306

219 N 

Milwaukee St. 

4th Floor 

Milwaukee, 

WI 53202

617 E. Vandalie 

Road Jacksonville, 

IL 62650

29 East 

21st New 

York, NY 

10010

3120-A 

Pullman 

Street Costa 

Mesa, CA 

92626

90 Old Sherman Turnpike 

Danbury, CT 06810

P.O. Box 206 

Mankato, MN 

56002

555 N. Morton St. 

Bloomington, IN 

47404

180 N LaSalle 

St. Suite 900 

Chicago, IL 

60601

Phone 800-277-5287 812-475-1054 or 212-633-3300866-535-0004

800-637-6586 

ext. 3523 800-747-4992 877-980-4450 800-986-1775 ex. 105 888-318-2665 800-398-2504 888-511-5114 800-542-2595 800-444-0435 844-317-7404

800-325-9558 ext. 

7227or 800-491-

0174 513-412-5700 ext. 1140 800-791-8965888-865-6455 ext. 5400866-551-5816 ext. 5400

502-565-5036 or 800-245-

9540 414-921-1508

859-312-5996 or 

800-637-6581 800-237-9932714-640-5200

800-387-1437 ext. 6287 or 800-

621-1115 ext. 4

800-561-3943 

ext. 5400 800-733-6786

312-819-8949 

or 312-350-

0778 or 800-

975-3250 

Fax 877-365-7484 217-685-0728 or 812-475-1063866-893-4789 800-747-2872 800-443-8660 or 888-262-0705877-980-4454 512-616-0410 877-716-7272 877-980-4454 800-852-5458 877-542-2596 800-647-1923 844-317-7405800-827-3080 800-451-3724877-362-5750 877-551-8516 800-369-5490 414-287-4602 800-551-1169 888-436-4643714-640-5298 877-242-5865 877-894-1304 812-336-7790 888-922-3766

Email

info@applauselearn

ing.com

jdelich@bn.com or 

businessdevelopmentbi

ds@bn.com
losburn@broadr

eachbooks.com

ajanczarek@bts

b.com or 

sales@btsb.com

mike@howar

dbooks.net or 

bids@capsto

nepub.com bids@csqpub.com

kendall@completebook.c

om
ben@classrooml

ibrary.com bids@enslow.com

fssbidadmin@follett.co

m

jdwilson@follett

.com or 

bids@gspub.co

m

afrazier@booksou

rce.com or 

bids@booksource.

com

bids@gr

eenhave

npub.co

m

ascott@juniorlibraryquild

.com or 

jlgbids@juniorlibraryguil

d.com

book@kap

co.com

losburn@know

buddyresource

s.com

losburn@look

outbooks.com bids@mackin.com

holly.rite@penw

orthy.com

jenniferhayes@per

ma-bound.com or 

bids@perma-

bound.com

bids@rose

npub.com bids@sdlback.com

msutherland@scholastic.com 

or 

kbrown@scholasticlibrary.com
losburn@smarta

pple.com bids@solutiontree.com

SLHELP@wo

rldbook.com

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid

mailto:info@applauselearning.com
mailto:info@applauselearning.com
mailto:crm2692@bn.com
mailto:crm2692@bn.com
mailto:crm2692@bn.com
mailto:losburn@broadreachbooks.com
mailto:losburn@broadreachbooks.com
mailto:bids@capstonepub.com
mailto:bids@capstonepub.com
mailto:bids@capstonepub.com
mailto:bids@capstonepub.com
mailto:bids@csqpub.com
mailto:kendall@completebook.com
mailto:kendall@completebook.com
mailto:ben@classroomlibrary.com
mailto:ben@classroomlibrary.com
mailto:bids@enslow.com
mailto:fssbidadmin@follett.com
mailto:fssbidadmin@follett.com
mailto:bids@gspub.com
mailto:bids@gspub.com
mailto:bids@gspub.com
mailto:bids@gspub.com
mailto:afrazier@booksource.com
mailto:afrazier@booksource.com
mailto:afrazier@booksource.com
mailto:afrazier@booksource.com
mailto:bids@greenhavenpub.com
mailto:bids@greenhavenpub.com
mailto:bids@greenhavenpub.com
mailto:bids@greenhavenpub.com
mailto:achristianson@juniorlibraryguild.com
mailto:achristianson@juniorlibraryguild.com
mailto:achristianson@juniorlibraryguild.com
mailto:achristianson@juniorlibraryguild.com
mailto:book@kapco.com
mailto:book@kapco.com
mailto:losburn@knowbuddyresources.com
mailto:losburn@knowbuddyresources.com
mailto:losburn@knowbuddyresources.com
mailto:losburn@lookoutbooks.com
mailto:losburn@lookoutbooks.com
mailto:bids@mackin.com
mailto:holly.rite@penworthy.com
mailto:holly.rite@penworthy.com
mailto:bids@perma-bound.com
mailto:bids@perma-bound.com
mailto:bids@perma-bound.com
mailto:bids@perma-bound.com
mailto:bids@rosenpub.com
mailto:bids@rosenpub.com
mailto:bids@sdlback.com
mailto:kbrown@scholasticlibrary.com
mailto:kbrown@scholasticlibrary.com
mailto:kbrown@scholasticlibrary.com
mailto:losburn@smartapple.com
mailto:losburn@smartapple.com
mailto:bids@solutiontree.com
mailto:SLHELP@worldbook.com
mailto:SLHELP@worldbook.com

