
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

COMMENTS:

7947

May 25, 2021

ATHLETIC FIELD MARKING PAINT . 

February 01, 2021

From May 25, 2021 through April 30, 2022

A one-year renewal at the option of both parties. 

Awarded to Pioneer Manufacturing . 
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Vendor Response Terms

Response Payment TermsResponse TermsVendor Name

ANV Composites Limited All 5 gallon containers delivered at one time to 

one location.

Net 30

BSN Sports FOB DESTIONATION (FREE SHIPPING 

ALLOWED)

NET 30 DAYS

Pioneer Manufacturing Net 15 days

US Specialty Coatings, Inc Check out our USSC Athletic Catalog at 

www.usscproducts.com/catalog

Net 60 Day Terms
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ITEM NO. 1  - LOT CODE: - 1-4  -  Athletic Field Marking Paint. Approved Product:  Pioneer or equal, orange, 5-gallon container.   

Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Does the paint you are quoting require straining 

before use?    1 - 5.0000 Gallon Container, Estimated Quantity - 13 (5720400-1714516)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject BSN Sports - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.  Reject US Specialty Coatings, Inc. - 

durability not acceptable per evaluation for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.  Awarded to Pioneer Manufacturing as 

low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  #NO BID 0.0001BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

*Pioneer  #ATHOR5 54.5000Pioneer Manufacturing

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ATHOR5

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Pioneer Brite Stripe Orange - 5 gal

Athletic Specialties  58.0000ANV Composites Limited

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5GWO

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: All 13 5-gallon containers delivered at one time to one location

U.S. Specialty Coatings  #ASO 63.7500US Specialty Coatings, Inc

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ASO

Net 60 DaysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No straining required

ITEM NO. 2  - LOT CODE: - 1-4  -  Athletic Field Marking Paint. Approved Product:  Pioneer or equal, white, 5-gallon container.   

Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  Does the paint you are quoting require straining 

before use?  1 - 5.0000 Gallon Container, Estimated Quantity - 186 (5720400-1713800)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject BSN Sports - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.  Reject US Specialty Coatings, Inc. - 

durability not acceptable per evaluation for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.  Awarded to Pioneer Manufacturing as 

low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  #NO BID 0.0001BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

NO BIDRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

*Pioneer  30.0000Pioneer Manufacturing

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FRONT5

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Pioneer Frontline, 5 gal

U.S. Specialty Coatings  #ASW2B 44.3500US Specialty Coatings, Inc

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ASW2B

Net 60 Day TermsRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Straining Required

Athletic Specialities  58.0000ANV Composites Limited

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5GWW

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: All 186 5-gallon containers delivered at one time to one location.  This will reduce your 

costs substantially.
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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ITEM NO. 3  - LOT CODE: - 1-4  -  Athletic Field Marking Paint, Aerosol, white, 12/cs. Approved Product:  Max #AMAXW12 or 

equal.  1 - 12.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 200 (5720400-2013724)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject BSN Sports - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.  Reject US Specialty Coatings, Inc. - 

durability not acceptable per evaluation for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.  Awarded to Pioneer Manufacturing as 

low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

U.S. Specialty Coatings  #DSW 34.0000US Specialty Coatings, Inc

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: DSW

Net 60 Day TermsRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

BSN/RUST-OLEUM  #215010 39.0300BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0792XXXX

NET 30 DAYSRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

Athletic Specialities  45.0000ANV Composites Limited

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WLPW

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: All 200 12/cs  delivered at one time to one location.  This will reduce your costs 

substantially.

*Pioneer  46.5000Pioneer Manufacturing

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AMAXW12

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Pioneer GameDay Aerosol White

ITEM NO. 4  - LOT CODE: - 1-4  -  Athletic Field Marking Paint, Aerosol, flourescent orange, 12/cs. Approved Product:  Max 

#AMAFO12 or equal.  1 - 12.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 200 (5720400-2013725)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject BSN Sports - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.  Reject US Specialty Coatings, Inc. - 

durability not acceptable per evaluation for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.  Awarded to Pioneer Manufacturing as 

low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 4.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

U.S. Specialty Coatings  #DSFLO 36.0000US Specialty Coatings, Inc

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: DSFLO

Net 60 Day TermsRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

BSN/RUST-OLEUM  #206044 39.0300BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0792ORXX

NET 30 DAYSRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

*Pioneer  47.5000Pioneer Manufacturing

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AMAXFO12

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Pioneer GameDay Fluorescent Orange Aerosol

Athletic Specialities  51.0000ANV Composites Limited

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WLPO

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: All 200 12/cs  delivered at one time to one location.  This will reduce your costs 

substantially.
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS - 1-4

AWARDED TOTAL ($)TOTAL ($)VENDOR NAME

 25,088.5025,088.50Pioneer Manufacturing

15,612.02BSN Sports

23,077.85US Specialty Coatings, Inc

30,742.00ANV Composites Limited

$25,088.50
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

30,742.00ANV Composites Limited

15,612.02BSN Sports

25,088.50  25,088.50Pioneer Manufacturing

23,077.85US Specialty Coatings, Inc

25,088.50
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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