HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS

1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

RFP Tabulation Sheet
Drug ScreeningMedical Services RFP

RFP # 3-21-5-4
Assuraqce Concorde, Deaconess Comp Envivo Fast Pace . Phamatech | TOMO Drug i Stau_a
Company Consulting Blue Water Inc Center Health Urgent Care Involvement, Inc. Mom Clinic Inc Testin Community
(ACTS) 9 ' 9 | clinics, LLC

5 panel urine dip screen for Students:
Tests for cocaine, amphetamines, PCP,
THC, and opiates. $45.00 $15.00 each No bid
8 panel urine dip screen for Students:
Tests for cocaine, amphetamnes, PCP, THC,
barbiturates, methamphetamines,
benzodiazepines, and opiates.

$15.00 each No bid No bid
12 panel urine dip screen for Students:
Tests for cocaine, amphetamines,
methamphetamines, THC, opiates,
OxyContin, propoxyphene, PCP,
barbiturates, benzodiazepines, methadone,
and MDMA (ecstasy). $56.00 $20.00 each No bid
6 panel mouth swab screen for Students:
Tests for cocaine, amphetamines,
methamphetamines, THC, opiates, and
benzodiazepines. $20.00 each No bid
K2 urine dip screen for Students: will test
for the use (?f synthetic cannabinoids. $45.00 (bgsed on non- . .

rapid test) No bid No bid
K2 Urine Dip Test: Synthetic Cannabinoids No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alcohol Uring Dip Test: Detects alcohol up
to 80 hours after consuming alcohol. No bid No Bid No bid
Nicotine Urine Dip Test: Nicotine No bid No Bid No bid
5 panel urine dip screen for Staff: Tests for
cocaine, amphetamines,
methamphetamines, THC, and opiates. $45.00 $15.00 each No bid
6 panel urine dip screen for Staff: Tests
for cocaine, amphetamines,
methamphetamine, marijuana (THC),
opiates, and PCP No bid No bid No bid
5 panel urine screen for Staff: Tests for
cocaine, amphetamines, marijuana (THC),
opiates, and PCP. $45.00 $15.00 each No bid
DOT Physical $75.00 No bid $85.00
Pre-Employment Physical $49.00 No bid $85.00
TB Skin Test $19.50 No bid $25.00
Essentials Function Test $26.57 No bid No bid
Post Offer Basic Test included above $78.81 No bid No bid
Post Offer Test With Medical History
Review included above $97.50 No bid No bid
Post Offer Comprehensive Test included above $ 97.50 No bid No bid
Contact John Siewert Steven Moore Sean Collins Sarah Howlett Susan Anderson Vickie Petty Michelle Wilson Debbie Stone Dana Conde  |John Throckmorton| Elizabeth Gish
Address 223 1st Street 1835 Market Street Suite 600 Mary St. P.O. Box 1376 2634 N Central 108 N. Elm St 1015 N. Elm St. b175 Innovation Driy5 S. Stewart Ave. StN Kentucky Avenue, Suite A
Henderson, KY Philadelphia, PA Evansville, IN ssell Springs, KY 42€) Henderson, KY Henderson, KY Henderson, KY an Diego, Californig| Springfield, MO Evansville, IN
42420 19105 47710 42420 42420 42420 92128 65804 47725

Phone 270-826-2308 215-563-5555 812-568-3990 866-936-8486 |931-253-1110 ext. 270-831-2609 270-826-8009 888-635-5840 x 27€¢| 417-849-0277 888-492-8722
Fax 270-826-7516 215-525-5341 615-510-3457 270-831-2609 270-826-7010 858-635-5843
E-mail iewert@actstesting.ng.moore@bluewatercpllins@concorde20(] sarah.white@deaconess.com pervices@envivoheal| cehealth.com involvementinc@gmail.com dstone@hendersonmom.com nde@phamatech.ch@yourdrugtesting. pbeth.sisk1 @ascension.org
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