
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

7959BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE: April 20, 2021

ITEM(S) QUOTED: GLASS, PLASTIC & GLAZING COMPOUNDS . 

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: March 08, 2021

From May 12, 2021 through November 11, 2021CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S): No renewal option. 

COMMENTS: Awarded to General Rubber & Plastics, Inc. 
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Vendor Response Terms

Response Payment TermsResponse TermsVendor Name

General Rubber &Plastics, Inc.

Oscar's Germantown Hardware NO BID NO BID
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ITEM NO. 1   -  Clear polished Nuweld wire glass, 1/4" x approx. 78" x 100", diamond. Tru-lite or equal.   Please respond to the 

following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. of lites per case.    THE QUANTITIES STATED FOR THIS 

ITEM WILL BE ORDERED AT ONE TIME.  1 - 1.0000 Sheet Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 20 (4620180-1079112)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

0.0  0.0010Oscar's Germantown Hardware

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 2   -  Acrylic prismatic light lense, clear, GP SP-12 pattern, .093" to .187" thickness, nominal 2' x 4' sheet.  Plaskolite or 

equal.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.     1 - 1.0000 Sheet 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 20 (2700520-1727330)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Bayer COVERSTRO  11.2700General Rubber &Plastics, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LP-21

NET 30 DAYSRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: SOLD 2- PER BOX LEAT TIME  2-10 DAYS

ITEM NO. 3   -  Acrylic sheet, 15/64" (.220) x 48" x 96".  Colorless, both sides, stipple, #DP32 pattern.  Rohm & Haas or equal.    

ITEM NOS. 3 THRU 5 WILL BE ORDERED IN CASE QUANTITIES.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE 

ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.     1 - 1.0000 Sheet Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (4620120-1720828)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Bayer Covestro  208.0000General Rubber &Plastics, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: .220X48X96DP32

net 30 daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: SOLD IN FULL PALLET OF 50 SHEETS ONLY LEAD TIME 4 WEEKS

ITEM NO. 4   -  Polycarbonate sheet, 1/4" (.236) x 48" x 96", coated, clear, ultraviolet sunscreen. Five-year warranty against 

yellowing.  Bayer, GE Lexan XL-1 or equal.    ITEM NOS. 3 THRU 5 WILL BE ORDERED IN CASE QUANTITIES.    Please respond 

to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.     1 - 1.0000 Sheet Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 1 (4620120-1705599)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Bayer Covestro  157.2200General Rubber &Plastics, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SL-1

Net 30 daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Sold in full skids  23 per skid 5 yr warranty against yellowing  normal lead time is 4 

weeks  current because Covid related of shortage is 10 weeks

ITEM NO. 5   -  Polycarbonate sheet, 1/8" (.125) x 52" x 100", coated, clear, ultraviolet sunscreen.  Five-year warranty against 

yellowing.  Bayer, GE Lexan XL-1 or equal.    ITEM NOS. 3 THRU 5 WILL BE ORDERED IN CASE QUANTITIES.   Please respond 

to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.      1 - 1.0000 Sheet Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 1 (4620120-2002282)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Bayer Covestro  88.4900General Rubber &Plastics, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SL-1

net 30 daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Sold in full skids. 43 sheets per skid 5 year warranty against yellowing normal lead time 

4 weeks  current lead time because of Covid delays is 10 weeks
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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ITEM NO. 6   -  Polycarbonate sheet, 1/4" (.220) x 48" x 96", FM clear.   1 - 1.0000 Sheet Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 100 

(4620120-2014720)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*POLYGAL  103.9000General Rubber &Plastics, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 220X48X96POLYCARB

NET 30 DAYSRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: .220 X 48 X 96" CLEAR POLYCARB SHEET FILM MASK  NO ULV COAT LEAD TIME 

1-3 DAYS NO MINIMUM ORDER

ITEM NO. 7   -  Frame, mirror, 18" x 24", Meek or equal, stainless steel #M1100.   1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 

12 (4620080-1717056)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 

ITEM NO. 8   -  Glass, clear, double strength, 1/8" thickness, 48" x 84", 1,200 square feet. Tru-lite or equal.    ITEM NOS. 8 THRU 

13 WILL BE ORDERED IN CASE QUANTITIES.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  

State no. per case.    1 - 1.0000 Sheet Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 40 (4620040-1723400)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 

ITEM NO. 9   -  Plate glass, clear, float, 1/4" x 72" x 130". Tru-lite or equal.    ITEM NOS. 8 THRU 13 WILL BE ORDERED IN CASE 

QUANTITIES.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.     1 - 1.0000 

Sheet Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 20 (4620140-1685848)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 

ITEM NO. 10   -  Plate glass, clear, float, 3/16" x 72" x 130". Tru-lite or equal.   ITEM NOS. 8 THRU 13 WILL BE ORDERED IN 

CASE QUANTITIES.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.    1 - 

1.0000 Sheet Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (4620140-1719416)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 

ITEM NO. 11   -  Plate glass, gray tint, 1/4" x 72" x 130". Tru-lite or equal.   ITEM NOS. 8 THRU 13 WILL BE ORDERED IN CASE 

QUANTITIES.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.    1 - 1.0000 

Sheet Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 6 (4620140-1683358)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 

ITEM NO. 12   -  Plate mirror, clear, 1/4" x 72" x 120", raw edge. Tru-lite or equal.   ITEM NOS. 8 THRU 13 WILL BE ORDERED IN 

CASE QUANTITIES.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.    1 - 

1.0000 Sheet Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (4620080-1696874)
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 

ITEM NO. 13   -  Safety glass, clear, laminated, 1/4" x 48" x 96".  18 lites per case. .030 plastic interlayer to meet Federal 

Specifications effective 7-1-77.  Tru-lite or equal.   ITEM NOS. 8 THRU 13 WILL BE ORDERED IN CASE QUANTITIES.   Please 

respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.    1 - 1.0000 Sheet Purchase, 

Estimated Quantity - 20 (4620160-1079274)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 

ITEM NO. 14   -  Glazing compound, aluminum gray.  For face glazing aluminum, steel, bonderized galvanized and bronze metal 

sash, primed wood, glass, porcelain and other materials.  Fast setting, forms a flexible watertight seal, non-shrink, requires no 

painting.  Meets Federal Specifications #TT-G-410.  In one-gallon cans.  Dap #1012 or equal.   GLAZING COMPOUND MUST BE 

FRESH.  WE WILL NOT ACCEPT OLD, CRUSTED OVER COMPOUND.  1 - 1.0000 Gallon Can, Estimated Quantity - 1 

(4620220-1440355)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 

ITEM NO. 15   -  Butyl glazing tape, 1/2" wide x 1/8" thick x 25' roll. An extruded, preformed, architectural glazing tape furnished on 

release paper rolls.  Based upon a butyl rubber formulation with proven age and weather resistant properties.  Product is designed to 

create a long lasting flexible weather seal between two surfaces which will be subject to normal expansion/contraction and wind 

loading forces.  Typically used as an exterior primary spacing and glazing seal when glazing glass into a window sash.  It is also 

widely used to seal other architectural surfaces such as metal to metal joints, wood to glass, metal to plastic, etc.  Color:  

Black-bronze.  Tape must pass AAMA Spec. 807.1 for glazing tapes to be used with architectural aluminum.  20 rolls per case.  

Tremco #440 or equal.   Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  State no. per case.     1 - 

20.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 6 (7630032-1689323)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

  No Response

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS - 

AWARDED TOTAL ($)TOTAL ($)VENDOR NAME

6

Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

11,069.11  11,069.11General Rubber &Plastics, Inc.

.02Oscar's Germantown Hardware

11,069.11
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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