JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7952

APPROVAL DATE: March 23, 2021

ITEM(S) QUOTED: COMMODITY PROCESSING FOR STATE APPROVED
PROCESSORS.

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: February 22, 2021

CONTRACT PERIOD: From July 03, 2021 through July 02, 2022

RENEWAL(S): A one-year renewal at the option of both parties.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Asian Food Solutions

8-17 Business Day Lead Time. Order contact
is Norma Millan at
orders@asianfoodsolutions.com

NET 30 Days

Bongards Creameries

n/a

Net 30

Brookwood Farms, Inc

Lead Time 14 days

Net 7 days

Cargill Meat Solutions Corp.

Our turkey is CRAU, USDA verified. No
anti-biotics are used to promote growth.
Please remove John O'Keeffe from our
company info and put my name (Valerie
McCoy). John has not been with Cargill for
several years.

NET 30, but we're in the process of changing
to 60 days.

Classic Delight Inc

Don Lee Farms

5,000 Ibs. combined minimum for delivery.

NET 30 DAYS

Gold Creek Foods, LLC

Minimum shipment: combined product 5000#

NET 30 Days

J.R. Simplot Company

prices are based on full truck load and can be
in any combination of frozen items Offered
prices are good until start date of the bid, Aug
1, 2021. Two weeks bid award notice is
needed for first orders. After that order lead
time is 10 days.

2% 10 Net 15 days, can also offer Net 30 with
no early payment terms

Jennie-O Turkey Store Sales, LLC Net 10 Days Net 10 Days
JTM Provisions Co., Inc.

Kasa's Food Distributing Co. Inc. Net 14 days
Land O Lakes Net 30 days
Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, LLC Maid-Rite has a shipping minimum of 5,000 Net 30 Days

Ibs. Minimum can be any combination of
products.

McCain

Acknowledged

2% 10/NET 15

Nardone Bros Baking Co Inc.

1% 10 Days Net 30

1% 10 Days Net 30

Parsley Marketing

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation

2% 10 days, NET 30

Red Gold, LLC Please note the pricing provided is for full Net 30 Days
truckload commodity delivered pricing. Less
than full truckload pricing can be requested.

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Net 30 Days

Sysco Louisville

4 WEEKS WITH USE OF SYSCO ACCOUNT
CENTER

Tasty Brands, LLC

Minimum Delivery: 5000 Ibs Lead time: 14
calendar days

1% 10, net 20

The J. M. Smucker Company

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc

Net 14 Days

Yangs 5th Taste

713/2021 through 7/2/2022. Yangs Payment
Terms are Net 30 Days
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ITEM NO. 1 - Beef, Steak Burger, frozen, fully cooked. Product to contain no allergens. Weight of patty to be approx. 2.25 oz.
Each fully cooked beef patty provides 2.0 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent for Child Nutrition Programs. To contain ground beef
no more than 20% fat). No artificial colors, flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. No caramel coloring. Packed approx. 200
servings per case. Approved Products: Don Lee Farms #CNQ162253 & JTM #CP5620. Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of patty, no. of servings per case and PTV per case. PROCESSED
COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 200.0000 Count Case, Estimated

Quantity - 5,000 (4445600-2010946)
ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc. - caramel coloring not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 19.3300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10000037600
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

Don Lee Farms DON LEE FARMS #CNQ162253 27.5700%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CNQ162253
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

JTM Provisions Co., Inc. JTM Provisions Co., Inc #CP5670 31.4800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CP5670
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 0% Net 30 Days
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: I bid CP5670 in place of CP5620 as it was discontinued. Patty Size = 2.450z. Servings

per Case = 195 Servings PTV = $100.23/Case Delivered Price = $31.48/Case

Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, LLC Maid-Rite 34.8000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 75156-93320

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: This item contains caramel color. This item can be made without caramel color but
Maid-Rite will not accept returns or credit should "pinking" occur in the burgers. The
code number is 75156-93321.

ITEM NO. 2 - LOT CODE: - 2-5 - Cheese Cubes, Reduced Fat, Mild Cheddar. Total calories not to exceed 125 per 1 portion. Total
fat not to exceed 10 grams per package. Total sodium not to exceed 200 mg per package. NO TRANS FAT. Must meet 1 oz.
meat/meat alternate equivalent credit per portion. Packed approx. (200) 1 oz. packages per case. Approved Product: Land O
Lakes #44113. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no.
of servings per case and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE-BID PRICE TO

REFLECT FFS. 1 - 200.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 6,000 (4445840-2013282)
LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Bongards Creameries - did not submit sample for evaluation.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Bongards Creameries Bongards #482101 14.7000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 482101
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NOI Case Price $23.68

. .
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Land O Lakes Land O Lakes #44113 32.2500*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 44113
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 oz serving; 200 servings per case; PTV = $22.45 per case;

ITEM NO. 3 - LOT CODE: - 2-5 - Cheese, pasteurized, cheddar, mild, low fat, shredded. No more than 2 grams of fat per .50z.
serving. Packed approx. (4) 5-Ib. bags per case. Approved Product: Land O lakes #1003450041749. Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, and PTV per
case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 -20.0000 Pound
Case, Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (4445300-2012604)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Bongards Creameries - did not submit sample for evaluation.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Land O Lakes Land O Lakes #41749 11.1000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 41749
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 oz serving; 320 servings per case; PTV = $35.91 per case

Bongards Creameries Bongards #755711 12.2000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 755711
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NOI Case $48.11

ITEM NO. 4 - LOT CODE: - 2-5 - Cheese, Sliced, pasteurized, Reduced Sodium and Reduced Fat, American. No more than 2

rams of fat per 1 slice. Packed approx. (6) 5 Ib. loaves per case. Approved Product: Land O | akes #46288. Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, and PTV per

case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 30.0000 Pound
Case, Estimated Quantity - 7,500 (4445300-1728897)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Bongards Creameries - did not submit sample for evaluation.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Bongards Creameries Bongards #101351 22.2000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 101351
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NOI Case $63.80

Land O Lakes Land O Lakes #46288 23.4600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 46288
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 oz serving (2 slices); 480 servings per case; PTV = $41.14 per case

. .
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ITEM NO.5 -LOT CODE: - 2-5 - Cheese, String Mozzarella 100%, Stick. Cheese Natural American FBD. 1-0z. serving. Packed
approx. 168 servings per case. Approved Product: Land O Lakes #59701. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED
COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 168.0000 Count Case, Estimated
Quantity - 6,000 (4445840-2000538)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Bongards Creameries - did not submit sample for evaluation.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Land O Lakes Land O Lakes #59701 11.8100*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 59701
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 oz serving size (1 stick); 168 servings per case; PTV = $18.85

Bongards Creameries Bongards #402951 12.7000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 402951
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NOI Case $31.55

ITEM NO. 6 - Chicken, breaded pieces with Mandarin Orange sauce. Approx. (6) 5 Ibs. chicken and approx. (6) 36 0z. sauce per

case. Shall meet 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent per servings. Product must yield approx. (192) 3.6 0z. servings per case.

No artificial colors, flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. Approved Products: Asian Food Solution Green Dragon #72001, Schwan's
#69020 and Yang's #8-52724-15552-4. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
portion size by weight, no. of servings per case. PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY

DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FES. 1 - 192.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 5,900
(4445840-2014213)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Schwan's Food Service, Inc. based on 240 srv/case @ $0.4940/srv.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Gold Creek Foods, LLC Gold Creek Foods 60.7200

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 791872
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS price listed. Portion size 4.5 0z. 113 servings per case. 44# case. FFS price per
serving $0.537. PTV $43.15. Commercial price: $103.87. Sample Submitted

Asian Food Solutions International Food Solutions, Inc. 88.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 72001 Tangerine
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: $88.00cs is the FFS Price direct ship to School warehouse. NOI $103.68cs &
Commercial Bid Price $106.00cs 8-17 Day Lead Time. Pricing not Valid Through Dot
Foods. 176/3.900z Servings per case. Net Wt 42.90lb , 2M/MA & 0.5G , PTV $15.68
We are an approved Vendor on this item.

Yangs 5th Taste Out of the Shell, LLC d.b.a. Yangs 5th Taste 95.9000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8-52724-15555-5

. .
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RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Yangs payment terms are net 30 days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Portion size: 3.6 oz. provides 2 M/MA Servings per case: 192 Donated Food Value per
Case: $17.22 Commercial price per case: $113.12

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Schwan's Food Service, Inc. #69020 118.5600*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 69020
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Portion size: 2.8 0z.; No. of servings per case: 240 servings; PTV per case: $18.27;
Brand: Minh; *Price supplied is Net price per case. (Commercial: $136.83 - DFV: $18.27
= Net: 118.56 / $0.4940 per serving) Total adjusted cases, based on 240 servings per
case: 4,720 cases; Total Dollar Value Based on Net Price Per Case: $559,603.20

ITEM NO. 7 - Chicken, breakfast patty, Whole Grain, breaded, fully cooked. Weight to be approx. 2 0z. per patty. Breading must
be whole grain rich containing at least 51% whole grain ingredients by weight. Each patty must provide approx. 1 0z. meat/meat
alternate equivalent and 0.5 o0z. grain equivalent for the USDA Child Nutrition Programs. No artificial colors, flavors, sweeteners or
preservatlves NO MSG. NO TRANS FAT. Packed approx 218 servings per case. Approved Products Gold Creek #792426 and
ortion size by

weight, no. of servings per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID
PRICE TO REFLECT FFES. 1 - 218.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 4,600 (4445840-2014220)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc. - product does not credit for grain equivalency. Reject Pilgrim's
Pride Corporation - product not acceptable, contains artificial flavors listed in ingredients. Awarded
to Gold Creek Foods, LLC based on 256 srv/case @ $0.2187/srv.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 25.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10057780928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

Parsley Marketing John Soules/ ProView 40.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53115
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net: 30 Days Send orders to: dan.parsley@parsleyma

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Pack Size: 4X5 pound bags Serving Size 1 (2.20 oz) fillet Dill breakfast fillet matches
Chick Fil A No artificial colors, flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. NO MSG NO
TRANS FAT NAE NO SOY

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Corporation #635300 48.3730

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 635300
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 635300 CN WG Homestyle Brd Breakfast Patty w/ISP 294 / 1.63 Ounces Commercial
$67.173/cs; $0.228/sv PTV $18.80/cs Commodity $48.373/cs; $0.165/sv

Gold Creek Foods, LLC Gold Creek Foods 56.0000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 792426
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS price listed. Portion size 2.0 oz. 256 servings per case. 32# case. FFS price per
serving $0.219. PTV $30.56. Commercial price: $86.56.

. .
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ITEM NO. 8 - Chicken, breast chunks, hot and spicy, Whole Grain, breaded, fully cooked. Golden, Crispy Whole Grain made with
whole muscles, boneless wings. Serving to be approx. (5) 0.76 o0z. chunk/wings to provide a minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate
equivalent and 1 oz. grain equivalent for the USDA Child Nutrition Programs. Must contain whole muscle breast pieces. No artificial
colors, flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. NO MSG. NO TRANS FATS. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH USDA WHOLE
GRAIN RICH REQUIREMENTS FOR NSLP AND SBP; SP30-2012 MEMO. Packed approx. 30 pound case, providing approx. 126
servings per case. Approved Product: Tyson #10703720928. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup.
PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 126.0000 Count Case,
Estimated Quantity - 7,900 (4445840-2014214

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Pilgrim's Pride Corporation and Parsley Marketing - product does not contain hot and spicy
flavoring per bid specifications.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Corporation #7518 54.4930

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7518
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 7518 Chris P WG Whole Muscle Breast Chicken Bites 128 / 3.75 Ounces Commerical
$77.443/cs; $0.605/sv PTV $22.95/cs Commodity $54.493/cs; $0.426/sv

Parsley Marketing John Soules/ ProView 56.2000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 64630-WG
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET: 30 Days Send Orders to: dan.parsley@parsleyma

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Pack Size 4X5 pound bags No artificial colors, flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. NO
MSG NO TRANS FAT

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 60.0000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10703720928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

Gold Creek Foods, LLC Gold Creek Foods 61.9200

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 792402
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS price listed. Portion size 4.0 oz. 128 servings per case. 32# case. FFS price per
serving $0.484. PTV $29.37. Commercial price: $91.29. Sample Submitted

ITEM NO. 9 - Chicken, grilled, fajita flavored strips. Dark Meat. Packed approx. 10 Ibs. per case. Product to contain no allergens.
Approved Product: Pierce Chicken #1250. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup. PROCESSED
COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 10.0000 Pound Case, Estimated
Quantity - 4,000 (4445840-2009627)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Pilgrim's Pride Corporation based on 195/srv @ $0.2989/srv.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 49.2000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10046210928

. .
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RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Corporation #1250 58.3000%

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1250
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1250 CN Unbreaded Chicken Fajita Strips 195 / 2.47 Ounces Commercial $91.67/cs;
$0.47/sv PTV $33.37/cs Commodity $58.30/cs; $0.299/sv

ITEM NO. 10 - LOT CODE: - 10-11 - Chicken, patty, Whole Grain, breaded, fully cooked. Weight to be a minimum of 3.0 0z. per
patty. Breading must be whole grain rich containing at least 51% whole grain ingredients by weight. Each patty must provide a
minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent and 1 0z. grain equivalent for the Child Nutrition Programs. May contain vegetable
or dried eqq protein to reduce fat. NO MSG. NO TRANS FAT. NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS OR FLAVORS. Packed approx. 113
servings per case. Approved Products: Gold Kist #7522 and Tyson #10703040928. Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, PTV per case, and commercial
pricing for backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 -
113.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 8,850 (4445840-1733693)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Gold Creek Foods, LLC Gold Creek Foods 39.3600*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 791421
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS price listed. Portion size 3.0 0z. 170 servings per case. 32# case. FFS price per
serving $0.232. PTV $22.55. Commercial price: $61.91. Sample Submitted

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 39.7100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10703040928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Corporation #7522 49.8300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7522
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 7522 A+ Chicken - CN WG 4.25 oz. Fillet 113 / 4.25 Ounces Commercial $74.85/cs;
$0.662/sv PTV $25.02/cs Commodity $49.83/cs; $0.441/sv

ITEM NO. 11 - LOT CODE: - 10-11 - Chicken, patty. hot & spicy, Whole Grain, breaded, fully cooked. Weight to be a minimum of
3.0 oz. per patty. Breading must be whole grain rich containing at least 51% whole grain ingredients by weight. Each patty must
provide a minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent and 1 oz. grain equivalent for the Child Nutrition Programs. May contain
vegetable or dried egg protein to reduce fat. NO MSG. NO TRANS FAT. NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS OR FLAVORS. Packed

approx. 130 servings per case. Approved Products: Gold Creek #792431, Pilgrim's Pride #666600, and Tyson #10703120928.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight. no. of servings per

case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID
PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 130.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 7,700 (4445840-2001617)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

. .
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Gold Creek Foods, LLC Gold Creek Foods 42.4000~*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 791431
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS price listed. Portion size 3.0 0z. 170 servings per case. 32# case. FFS price per
serving $0.249. PTV $22.55. Commercial price: $64.95. Sample Submitted

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Corporation #666600 44.0200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 666600
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 666600 CN WG Hot & Spicy Breaded Patty w/ISP 156 / 3.05 Ounces Commercial
$62.82/cs; $0.403/sv PTV $18.80/cs Commodity $44.02/cs; $0.282/sv

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 61.8000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10703120928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

ITEM NO. 12 - Chicken, Smackers. Whole Grain breaded popcorn chicken, fully cooked. Dark Meat. Serving to be approx. (10)
43 0z. popcorn chicken pieces to provide 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent and 1 oz. grain equivalent for the USDA Child
Nutrition Programs. Total case weight to be approx. 30 pounds. No artificial colors, flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. NO MSG.
NO TRANS FAT. Packed approx. 108 servings per case. Approved Product: Pilgrim's Pride #110458. Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, PTV per case,
and commercial pricing for backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT
FES. 1 -108.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 9,250 (4445840-2014216)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Corporation #110458 35.6200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 110458
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 110458 CN WG Breaded DARK MEAT Chicken Smackers 108 / 4.3 Ounces
Commercial $73.20/cs; $0.678/sv PTV $37.58/cs Commaodity $35.62/cs; $0.33/sv

Parsley Marketing John Soules/ ProView 40.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 43057-WG
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net: 30 Days Send orders to: dan.parsley@parsleyma

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: SOY FREE No artificial colors flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. NO MSG NO
TRANS FAT.

Gold Creek Foods, LLC Gold Creek Foods 42.2400

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 791893
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS price listed. Portion size 4.5 0z. 113 servings per case. 32# case. FFS price per
serving $0.374. PTV $43.15. Commercial price: $85.39. Sample Submitted

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 71.6800

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10269760928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

Asian Food Solutions International Food Solutions, Inc. 84.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 72002 Chicken Nugget
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RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: $84.00 FFS Price Direct to school warehouse. $104.91 NOI Price & $108.00
Commercial Price. 8-17 Day lead time. Pricing not available through Dot Foods.
234/2.730z servings per case. Net Wt. 40lb 2M/MA & 0.5G Random piece Wgt. PTV
$20.91

ITEM NO. 13 - Chicken, Sausage patty, fully cooked. Dark Meat. Weight of patty to be approx. 1.4 oz. Each fully cooked chicken
patty provides 1.0 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent for Child Nutrition Programs. No BHT/BHA or propylgallate. Packed approx.
20 Ibs. per case. Approved Product: Tyson #10174430928. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup.
PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 20.0000 Pound Case,
Estimated Quantity - 3,000 (4445840-2014610)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Corporation #6390 37.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 6390
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 6390 Gold Kist DARK MEAT Chicken Sausage 350/ 1.37 Ounces Commercial
$90.82/cs; $0.259/sv PTV $53.82/cs Commaodity $37.00/cs; $0.106/sv

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 37.5900

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10174430928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

ITEM NO. 14 - Chicken, tenders, Whole Grain, breaded, fully cooked, all white, made from whole muscle. Approx. 3 tenders to
provide a serving. Breading must be whole grain rich containing at least 51% whole grain ingredients by weight. Each serving must
provide a minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent and 1 oz. grain equivalent for the USDA Child Nutrition Programs. No
artificial colors, flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. NO MSG. NO TRANS FAT. Packed approx. 110 servings per case. Approved
Products: Gold Creek #792441, Gold Kist #7572 and Tyson #703322-928. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for
backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 -110.0000 Count
Case, Estimated Quantity - 3,500 (4445840-2014217)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Gold Creek Foods, LLC based on 113/srv. @ $0.4290/srv.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Parsley Marketing John Soules/ ProView 44.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4615-WG
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net: 30 Days Send orders to: dan.parsley@parsleyma

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: SOY FREE NAE No atrtificial colors, flavors, sweeteners or preservatives. NO MSG NO
TRANS FAT

Gold Creek Foods, LLC Gold Creek Foods 48.4800*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 792441
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 days
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS price listed. Portion size 4.5 oz. 113 servings per case. 32# case. FFS price per
serving $0.429. PTV $29.37. Commercial price: $77.85.

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Coporation #7572 53.6400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7572
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 7572 A+ Chicken - CN WG 1.5 oz. Tenders 110 / 4.35 Ounces Commercial $77.79/cs;
$0.707/sv PTV $24.15/cs Commodity $53.64/cs; $0.488/sv

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 68.1800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17033220928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

ITEM NO. 15 - Chicken, Whole Grain, breaded. 8-piece, cut-up, bone in, fully cooked. Chicken pieces must consist of eight
pieces per bird including breasts, thighs, legs and wings. Backs and necks not to be included. Finished product must be able to

be heated in conventional or convection oven. Packed approx. 96 servings per case. Approved Product: Pierce Chicken #7812.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight. no. of servings per

case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID
PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 96.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 5,100 (4445840-1725725)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc. - product does not contain wings per bid specifications. Reject
Pilgrim's Pride Corporation - cost prohibitive to the District. There were no other bids received.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 53.3500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 16660000928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Pilgrim's Pride Coporation #7823 67.8800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7823
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 7823 8 piece bulk pack 67 / 30.0 Pounds Commercial $90.00/cs; $1.343/sv PTV
$22.12/cs Commodity $67.88/cs; $1.013/sv

ITEM NO. 16 - Corndog. Chicken, Whole Grain, breading. Frozen. Low fat, reduced sodium. Dark Meat Primary ingredient of
batter must be from a whole wheat flour and whole grain corn. Each serving must provide a minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate
equivalent and 1 oz. grain equivalent for the Child Nutrition Programs. NO TRANS FAT. Sodium not to exceed 500 mg. per serving.
Packed approx. 48 servings per case. Approved Product: Tyson #10363650928. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of corndogs per case. weight of corndog. PTV per case, and commercial pricing for

backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 48.0000 Count
Case, Estimated Quantity - 20,800 (4445600-1729059)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc. - mini corndog not acceptable. There were no other bids

received.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc Tyson 47.0800
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10270240928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 Days

ITEM NO. 17 - Pepperoni, Turkey, seasoned, sliced, frozen, coin. Packed approx. (8) 2-2.5 Ib. packages per case. Serving to
provide a minimum of 1 oz. meat/meat alternate equivalent for USDA Child Nutrition Programs. Case to provide approx. 242 servings
per case. Approved Product: Jennie-O #213008. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS
WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 8.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 1,900 (4445840-2014612)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Jennie-O Turkey Store Sales, LLC Jennie-O Turkey Store 66.6000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 213008
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 10 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Product is a random weight item, cost is per pound. Commercial cost $4.82 - Net Off
Invoice discount of $1.12. Fee For Service price $3.70 per pound. Price is figued as 8/
2.25# (average case weight)

ITEM NO. 18 - LOT CODE: - 18-19 - Pizza, Cheese, 4x6 rectangle. Frozen. Crust to be at least 51% whole grain. Serving to
provide 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent, 2 0z. grain equivalent and 1/8 cup red/orange vegetable. No artificial colors, flavors,
preservatives or sweeteners. Packed approx. 96 pizzas per case. Approved Products: Nardone Bros #961SWCMA2 and Schwanis
#78697. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of
servings per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO
REFLECT FFS. 1 - 96.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 10,000 (4445690-2002784)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Kasa's Food Distributing Co., Inc. - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 18 thru 19.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Schwan's Food Service, Inc. #78697 22.4700%

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 78697
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Portion size: 4.50 oz.; No. of servings per case: 96 servings; PTV per case: $15.51;
Brand: Tony's; *Price supplied is Net price per case. (Commercial: $37.98 - DFV: $15.51
= Net: $22.47 / $0.2341 per serving)

Nardone Bros Baking Co Inc. Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc. #961swcma2 27.3500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 961SWCMA2
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%10 net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 96/4.900z.

Kasa's Food Distributing Co. Inc. Kasa's Food Distributing Co. Inc. 46.3500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: KAS00052
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 14 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 48 slices/case, 6 0z. portion (170 grams) PTV = $11.08/case, NOI (NET OFF INVOICE),
1 pallet minimum (72 cases) delivery (dock required)
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ITEM NO. 19 - LOT CODE: - 18-19 - Pizza, Turkey Sausage, 4x6 rectangle. Frozen. Crust to be at least 51% whole grain.

Serving to provide 2 oz. meat/meat alternate equivalent, 2 oz. grain equivalent and 1/8 cup red/orange vegetable. No artificial colors,
flavors, preservatives or sweeteners. Packed approx. 96 pizzas per case. Approved Products: Nardone Bros. #961SWTSA2 and
Schwanis #78771. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight,
no. of servings per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO
REFLECT FFS. 1 - 96.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 5,000 (4445690-2013963)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Kasa's Food Distributing Co., Inc. - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 18 thru 19.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Kasa's Food Distributing Co. Inc. Kasais Food Distributing Co Inc 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Kas00000

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: No Bid - Do not manufacture

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid - Do not manufacture this item

Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Schwan's Food Service, Inc. #78771 28.4200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 78771
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Portion size: 4.69 oz.; No. of servings per case: 96 servings; PTV per case: $10.53;
Brand: Tony's; *Price supplied is Net price per case. (Commercial: $38.95 - DFV: $10.53
= Net: $28.42 / $0.2960 per serving)

Nardone Bros Baking Co Inc. Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Inc. #961swtsa2 31.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 961SWTSA2
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%10 net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 96/4.950z.

ITEM NO. 20 - LOT CODE: - 20-21 - Potatoes, crispy, bakeable, seasoned, 8-cut wedge fry. NO TRANS FAT. Approx. 2.88 oz.
portion. Serving to provide a minimum of 1/2 cup starchy vegetable serving according to Child Nutrition Program. Packed approx.
(6) 5 Ib. bags per case. Approved Products: McCain #MCX03626 and Simplot #10071179478089. Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, and PTV per case.
PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 6.0000 Count Case,
Estimated Quantity - 16,000 (4445915-2013357

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

J.R. Simplot Company Simplot #10071179478089 14.8300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 478089
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 2% 10 net 15 days from invoice date,

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: commodity price based on full truck loads (38K) in any combination of frozen items

McCain McCain Foods 15.4400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MCX03626
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 2% 10/NET 15
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Portion - 2.83z Servings - 169 PTV - $7.16cs

ITEM NO. 21 - LOT CODE: - 20-21 - Potatoes, formed cylindrical shapes. Approx. 7/81 diameter and 1 1/41 in length. Oven ready.
No sulfites. NO TRANS FAT. Serving to provide a minimum of 1/2 cup starchy vegetable serving according to Child Nutrition
Program. Packed approx. (6) 5 Ib. bags per case. Approved Products: McCain #0I1F00215A and Simplot #10071179004189.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per
case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 -
6.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 16,000 (4445915-1729032)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

J.R. Simplot Company Simplot #10071179004189 14.0900~*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4189
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 2% 10 net 15 days from invoice date.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: commodity price. based on full truck load, 38K minimum that can be in any combination
of frozen items

McCain McCain Foods USA 14.3400

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: OIF00215A
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 2% 10/NET 15

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Portion - 2.52z Servings - 190 PTV - $7.16¢cs

ITEM NO. 22 - LOT CODE: - 22-23 - Sandwich, PB & J, Grape, Whole Grain, round, individually-wrapped, frozen. Approx. weight
5.3 oz. per sandwich. Shall contain a mixture of peanut butter and grape jelly on whole-grain rich crustless bread. Primary
ingredient of crust must be whole wheat flour. Sandwich shall meet a minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent and 2 oz.
grain equivalent for Child Nutrition Programs. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH USDA WHOLE GRAIN RICH REQUIREMENTS
FOR NSLP AND SBP; SP30-2012 MEMO. Packed approx. 72 sandwiches per case. Approved Product: Smuckers #5150021027.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per
case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 -
72.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 10,000 (4445840-2012566)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject The J.M. Smucker Company and Classic Delight, Inc. - item bid does not meet 2 oz.
equivalents per bid specifications. Cost prohibitive to the District to meet specified equivalent. There
were no other bids received.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

The J. M. Smucker Company Smucker Foodservice, Inc 32.4300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5150006960

Classic Delight Inc Classic Delight Inc 33.1100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 831-40

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Standard terms Net 15 Days, but can be discussed.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: The case price we entered is the commodity price based on your 72ct calculation. Our
spec is currently a 40ct case, but we are working on a 72ct. Our commercial bid price
for 40ct case is $20.60/cs. PTV is $2.21/cs. Commodity price is $18.39/cs.
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ITEM NO. 23 - LOT CODE: - 22-23 - Sandwich, PB & J, Strawberry, Whole Grain, round, individually-wrapped. frozen. Approx.
weight 5.3 0z. per sandwich. Shall contain a mixture of peanut butter and strawberry jelly on whole-grain rich crustless bread.
Primary ingredient of crust must be whole wheat flour. Sandwich shall meet a minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent and
2 0z. grain equivalent for Child Nutrition Programs. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH USDA WHOLE GRAIN RICH
REQUIREMENTS FOR NSLP AND SBP; SP30-2012 MEMO. Packed approx. 72 sandwiches per case. Approved Product:

Smuckers #5150021028. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by

weight, no. of servings per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID
PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 72.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 5,000 (4445840-2014219)
LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject The J.M. Smucker Company and Classic Delight, Inc. - item bid does not meet 2 oz.
equivalents per bid specifications. Cost prohibitive to the District to meet specified equivalent. There
were no other bids received.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Classic Delight Inc Classic Delight Inc 33.1100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 832-40
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Standard terms Net 15 Days, but can be discussed.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: The case price we entered is the commaodity price based on your 72ct calculation. Our
spec is currently a 40ct case, but we are working on a 72ct. Our commercial bid price
for 40ct case is $20.60/cs. PTV is $2.21/cs. Commodity price is $18.39/cs.

The J. M. Smucker Company Smucker Foodservice, Inc 33.9900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5150006961

ITEM NO. 24 - LOT CODE: - 24-25 - Sandwich, Turkey, Turkey Ham, and American Cheese WG Wrap. IW. Serving to provide a

minimum of 1 grain and 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent according the Child Nutrition Program. Packed approx. 80 sandwiches
per case. Approved Product: Tasty Brands #70006. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES

field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO
JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 80.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 12,500 (4445600-2013047)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Tasty Brands, LLC Tasty Brands 64.6800*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 70006
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 5000Ibs minimum ship - mixed product 1%10, net 20

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Commodity code: 110242 Barrel Cheese Commodity Drawdown: 4.36 Ibs Commodity
value per case: $7.82 Commercial Case price: $72.50

ITEM NO. 25 - L OT CODE: - 24-25 - Sandwich, Turkey. Turkey Ham. and 2 Cheese Wedge on WG Bread. IW. Serving to provide

a minimum of 1 grain and 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent according the Child Nutrition Program. Packed approx. 80

sandwiches per case. Approved Product: Tasty Brands #70013. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight. no. of servings per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY

DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 80.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 12,500
(4445600-2013046)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
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Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Tasty Brands, LLC Tasty Brands 60.1000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 70013
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 5000 Ibs minimum ship - mixed product 1%10,net 20

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Commodity code: 110242 Barrel Cheese Commodity Drawdown: 3.92 Ibs Commodity
Value per case: $7.04 Commercial Case price: $67.14

field: Specify size of cup. no. of cups per case, and PTV per case. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS
WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 264.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 3,800 (4445725-2011304)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Sysco Louisville - sample submitted not acceptable, container smaller than bid

specifications.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville KRAFT HEINZ #00716037000189 7.1400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5746987

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 100/1 OZ.

Red Gold, LLC Red Gold, LLC 51.8900*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: REDNAHZC264
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: The pricing provided is for a full truckload Commodity Delivered pricing. This item credits
for a 1/4 cup Red/Orange Vegetable. We can provide less than full truckload pricing
upon request.

ITEM NO. 27 - Turkey, BBQ. Chopped with low sodium sauce, frozen. Packed approx. (4) 5 Ib. bags per case. Each serving

must provide a minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent for Child Nutrition Programs. Approved Product: Brookwood Farms
#16300. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight. no. of

servings per case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS
WAREHOQUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 20.0000 Pound Case, Estimated Quantity - 6,500 (4445840-2014614)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Brookwood Farms, Inc Brookwood Farms #16300 32.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 16300
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 7 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS $32.00 / case or $1.60 / LB. 84 Servings per case, 3.75 oz. / Serving
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ITEM NO. 28 - Turkey Breast, all natural preslice, Premium Thick cut, Oven Roasted. Packed approx. (6) 5 Ibs. per case. Serving
to provide a minimum of 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent. Case to provide approx. 140 servings. Approved Products: Jennie-O
#230324 and Carqill/Shady Brook Farms #700269. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup. PROCESSED
COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 30.0000 Pound Case, Estimated
Quantity - 4,200 (4445840-2013965)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Jennie-O Turkey Store Sales, LLC Jennie-O Turkey Store 67.8700*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 230324
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 10 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Fee For Service Price $2.75 per pound. Commercial Price $4.00 per pound. Pass
Through Value $1.12 Jennie-O Pass Through $0.13

Cargill Meat Solutions Corp. Cargill Meat Solutions 82.1200

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 700369
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FFS case price listed here. The product code should be 700369, same product as
700269 only it is free from phosphates, caramel color and nitrites/nitrates. We submitted
a sample last year. Our turkey is CRAU, USDA verified. No anti-biotics used to promote
growth. This product is free from phosphates, caramel color and nitrites/nitrates. We
have plenty of white turkey meat to transfer from another State.

ITEM NO. 29 - Turkey. Ground, all Natural Raw Turkey Thigh, frozen. Product to contain no allergens or gluten. Product serving
should provide 2 0z. meat/meat alternate equivalent. Packed approx. (4) 5 Ib. rolls per case. Approved Product: Jennie-O #205135.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per
case, PTV per case, and commercial pricing for backup. PROCESSED COMMODITY DELIVERED TO JCPS WAREHOUSE - BID
PRICE TO REFLECT FFS. 1 - 20.0000 Pound Case, Estimated Quantity - 5,000 (4445840-1731022)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Jennie-O Turkey Store Sales, LLC Jennie-O Turkey Store 31.0000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 205135
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 10 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Fee for Service Price per pound $1.55 Commercial Price per pound $3.18 Pass Through
Value $1.63

ITEM NO. 30 - Apples, Red, sliced. Each 2 0z. bag must provide a 1/2 cup serving of apples. Packed approx. (100) 2 oz. bags
per case. Approved Product: Peterson Farms, Inc. #210005. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify portion size by weight, no. of servings per case, and DV per case. NOI ITEMS (PROCESSED COMMODITY
SCHOOL DELIVERY BID PRICE TO REFLECT NOI. PROVIDE PURCHASED PRICE EXCLUDING DONATED VALUE.) 1 -
100.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 20,000 (4445840-2011730)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Sysco Louisville PETERSON FARMS #203102/COMM.210005 19.8000*

. .
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8205072
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 100 CT/2 OZ.

ki .
Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 18



TOTAL BIDS - 10-11

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Gold Creek Foods, LLC 674,816.00 674,816.00
Sysco Louisville 165.50
Pilgrim's Pride Corporation 779,949.50
Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc 827,293.50
$674,816.00
TOTAL BIDS - 18-19
VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. 366,800.00 366,800.00
Sysco Louisville 150.00
Nardone Bros Baking Co Inc. 429,750.00
Kasa's Food Distributing Co. Inc. 463,550.00
$366,800.00
TOTAL BIDS - 20-21
VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
J.R. Simplot Company 462,720.00 462,720.00
Sysco Louisville 320.00
McCain 476,480.00
$462,720.00
TOTAL BIDS - 22-23
VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Sysco Louisville 150.00
The J. M. Smucker Company 494,250.00
Classic Delight Inc 496,650.00
TOTAL BIDS - 24-25
VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Tasty Brands, LLC 1,559,750.00 1,559,750.00
Sysco Louisville 250.00
$1,559,750.00
TOTAL BIDS - 2-5
VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Land O Lakes 462,510.00 462,510.00

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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Sysco Louisville 215.00

Bongards Creameries 355,300.00
$462,510.00

Note: * indicates a pendin rd.
pending award PAGE 20



TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Asian Food Solutions 1,296,200.00
Bongards Creameries 355,300.00
Brookwood Farms, Inc 208,000.00 208,000.00
Cargill Meat Solutions Corp. 344,904.00
Classic Delight Inc 496,650.00
Don Lee Farms 137,850.00 137,850.00
Gold Creek Foods, LLC 2,340,232.00 1,102,096.00
J.R. Simplot Company 462,720.00 462,720.00
Jennie-O Turkey Store Sales, LLC 566,594.00 566,594.00
JTM Provisions Co., Inc. 157,400.00
Kasa's Food Distributing Co. Inc. 463,550.00
Land O Lakes 462,510.00 462,510.00
Maid-Rite Specialty Foods, LLC 174,000.00
McCain 476,480.00
Nardone Bros Baking Co Inc. 429,750.00
Parsley Marketing 1,151,980.00
Pilgrim's Pride Corporation 2,640,573.00 673,685.00
Red Gold, LLC 197,182.00 197,182.00
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. 1,066,304.00 1,066,304.00
Sysco Louisville 425,249.00 396,000.00
Tasty Brands, LLC 1,559,750.00 1,559,750.00
The J. M. Smucker Company 494,250.00
Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc 3,975,532.50 474,000.00
Yangs 5th Taste 565,810.00

7,306,691.00

Note: * indic ndin .
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