
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

7946BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE: March 23, 2021

ITEM(S) QUOTED: RECONDITIONING OF ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT . 

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: February 01, 2021

From May 01, 2021 through April 30, 2022CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S): Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties. 

COMMENTS: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports. 
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Vendor Response Terms

Response Payment TermsResponse TermsVendor Name

BSN Sports We are no-bidding lines 5-27. Was unable to 

issue a no-bid in the system for those lines, 

so we used a placeholder small amount.

NET30

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. 60 days Net 30 days

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

Riddell / All American 1/10 N/30
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ITEM NO. 1  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  FOOTBALL HELMETS:  Reconditioning shall include, but not be limited to, disassembly, 

school inspection, factory examination, sanitizing, buffing, replacing component parts AS NEEDED, including facemasks, jaw pads 

and chin straps and reassembling of the helmet with its component parts according to factory specifications, using OEM parts.  The 

helmet shall be recertified to NOCSAE standards (at no additional charge) and must have a recertification seal and date affixed per 

helmet.   Estimated annual quantity  - 1,200.    1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (4600015-1724340)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

RIDDELL  26.9800Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: DOES NOT INCLUDE MISSING PARTS WHEN HELMETS ARE PICKED UP.

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  33.0000Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HLMTRECON

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  46.9500Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRH

Schutt Recon.  #RECON 55.0000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Base helmet is $30. $25 is to replace the masks if needed.

ITEM NO. 2  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  FOOTBALL HELMETS:  Repainting (by request only) - cost per football helmet. Estimated 

annual quantity - 1,200.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

RIDDELL  7.0000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  7.5000Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FBHLMTPNT

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  8.4000Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRP

Schutt  14.0000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: PAINT

ITEM NO. 3  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  FOOTBALL HELMETS:  Custom color painting per helmet. Estimated annual quantity - 1,200.  

1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRCP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CSTPNT

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Included in Line 2

RIDDELL  8.2500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: PRICE SHOWN IS PER COLOR

Schutt  150.0000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Customer Color Paint
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PAGE 



RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Pricing can range from $35 - $150 depending on paint.

ITEM NO. 4  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  FOOTBALL HELMETS:  Stainless steel hardware (must be requested by school) per helmet. 

Estimated annual quantity - 1,200.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Schutt  0.0100BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: INCLUDED

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: This is included in the Reconditioning price. Not offered without being awarded the 

reconditioning line.

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRHDW

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FBHLMTPRT

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Included in Line 001

RIDDELL  0.0100Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO CHARGE

ITEM NO. 5  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  SHOULDER PADS:  Reconditioning shall include, but not be limited to, cleaning, sanitizing, 

sewing, installation of straps, collars, neck binder, epaulets and caps, elastic cups, flaps, cantilevers, key hole slides, T-hooks, 

rivets and laces per pad.   Estimated annual quantity - 750  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NOT BIDDING LINES 5-27

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  7.0000Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRSP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  7.5000Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FBSHPD

RIDDELL  8.0000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 6  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  FOOTBALL SHOES: Shoes, pair, molded or cleated:  In school examination, factory 

inspection, clean/sanitize, replace laces and insoles, refinish, same color per pair.   Estimated annual quantity - 200.  1 - 1.0000 

Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRSH

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FBSHOES

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  6.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 7  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  FOOTBALL SHOES:  Cleats, set male, urethane replaced per set. Estimated annual quantity 

- 200.  1 - 1.0000 Each Set, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRCL

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FBSHOES

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  6.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 8  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  FOOTBALL SHOES:  Cleats, set, male, nylon replaced per set. Estimated annual quantity - 

200.  1 - 1.0000 Each Set, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRCL

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FBSHOES

NB  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  6.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 9  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL BATTERS' HELMETS: In school examination, factory inspection, 

clean/sanitize, buff and shine, all repairs, including all repairs of interior parts, but excluding replacing interior parts per helmet.  If 

interior parts would need replacing, the process would not be economically sensible for the customer.   Estimated annual quantity - 

20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRBH

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: BBSBHLMT

NB  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  8.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 10  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL BATTERS' HELMETS:  Standard one-color painting per helmet. 

Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRBH

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: BBSBHLMTPT

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  7.0000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 11  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL BATTERS' HELMETS: Custom two-color painting per helmet. 

Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRBHP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: BBSBBTRHLMTCPT

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  8.2500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: PRICE PER COLOR

ITEM NO. 12  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' HELMETS: In school examination, factory inspection, 

clean/sanitize,  buff and shine, all repairs, including all repairs of interior parts, but excluding replacing interior parts per helmet.  If 

interior parts would need replacing, the process would not be economically sensible for the customer.   Estimated annual quantity - 

20.    1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRCH

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: BBSBCATCHLMT

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  8.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 13  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' HELMETS: Standard one-color painting per helmet.  

Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRCHP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: BBSBCATCHLTPT

NO BID  1.0000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  7.0000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 14  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' MASK: In school examination, factory inspection, 

clean/sanitize,  re-paint wire mask, as necessary and all repairs per mask.   Estimated annual quantity - 10.  1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRCHM

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CATCHMSK

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  6.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 15  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' MASK: Mask pads replaced per mask. Estimated 

annual quantity - 10.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRCMP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MASKPRTS

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  10.9900Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 16  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' MASK:  Harness replaced per mask. Estimated annual 

quantity - 10.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRCMH

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MSKHRNSS

NB  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  5.9900Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 17  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' MASK:  Throat protector replaced per mask. Estimated 

annual quantity - 10.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRTP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: THROATPROT

NO BID  1.0000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  7.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 18  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK:  One piece, hockey style, catchers' 

helmet with mask:  In school examination, factory inspection, clean/sanitize, buff and shine, all repairs, including but not limited to, 

repair of interior parts per helmet.   Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRHCM

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HOCKEYHLMT

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27
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RIDDELL  13.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 19  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK:  Standard one-color painting per 

helmet. Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRHMP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HOCKEYHLMTPNT

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  7.0000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 20  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK:  Custom two-color painting per 

helmet. Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRHCMSP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HOCKEYCSTPT

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  14.0000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 21  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK:  Mask pads replaced per helmet. 

Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVHCMP

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HOCKEYPRTS

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  12.9900Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON
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ITEM NO. 22  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK:  Harness replaced per helmet. 

Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRHCMH

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HOCKEYHRNSS

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  6.9900Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 23  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  SHIN GUARDS:   In school examination, factory inspection, clean/sanitize, buff and shine, all 

repairs, including but not limited to, binding repair and replacement as necessary of elastics and fastener hardware.   Estimated 

annual quantity - 20.    1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRSG

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SHINGUARDS

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  8.0000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 24  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  SHIN GUARDS:  Knee caps replaced each. Estimated annual quantity - 20.  1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRSGK

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SHINKNEES

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  19.2400Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON
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ITEM NO. 25  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BATS:  In school examination, factory inspection, regrip each. Estimated annual quantity - 

50.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRB

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: BATS

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  9.5000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 26  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  BATS:  Leather grips each. Estimated annual quantity - 50.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, 

Estimated Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRBLG

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: BATLEATHER

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  11.5000Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 27  - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27  -  GLOVES:  In school examination, factory inspection, clean/sanitize, leather preservative, all 

repairs, including but not limited to restringing each.   Estimated annual quantity - 50.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 1 

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports as low total bidder for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 27.

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.  0.0100Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CVRRGL

*Schutt Sports Reconditioning  0.0100Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GLOVES

NO BID  0.1000BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WE ARE NO BIDDING LINES 5-27

RIDDELL  23.9500Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS - 1 - 27

AWARDED TOTAL ($)TOTAL ($)VENDOR NAME

 48.2448.24Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

62.59Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

223.11BSN Sports

270.24Riddell / All American

$48.24
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

223.11BSN Sports

62.59Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

48.24  48.24Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

270.24Riddell / All American

48.24
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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