THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF

EDUCATION

1055 EATON DRIVE, FORT WRIGHT, KENTUCKY
, . 41017
it | It's about ALL Kids.  TELEPHONE: (859) 344-8888 / FAX: (859) 344-1531
WEBSITE: www.kenton.kyschools.us

Dr. Henry Webb, Superintendent of Schools

KCSD ISSUE PAPER

DATE:
06/14/18

AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM):

Consider/Approve the recommendation to award Advance Auto Parts, All Pro Supply, American
Bus, Auto-Jet Muffler, Battery Men, Bluegrass International, Bus Parts Warehouse, Farm & City
Supply, FYDA, George’s Truck, Heavy Duty Bus Parts, Jasper Engines, KOI, OAM, Rush, School
Bus Parts, Terminals Plus, TruckPro, Unity, VMP, and Whayne the Bus Parts Bid

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY:
Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.1

HISTORY/BACKGROUND:
An Advertisement was posted to the district website on May 9, 2018, to accept sealed bids for Bus
Parts. Sealed bids were publicly opened and read on May 30, 2018. This is a single year bid.

FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT:
Fiscal/Budgetary impact was unable to be calculated due to purchases being made on an as needed

basis.

RECOMMENDATION:

Approval to accept the bids from Advance Auto Parts, All Pro Supply, American Bus, Auto-Jet
Muffler, Battery Men, Bluegrass International, Bus Parts Warchouse, Farm & City Supply, FYDA,
George’s Truck, Heavy Duty Bus Parts, Jasper Engines, KOI, OAM, Rush, School Bus Parts,
Terminals Plus, TruckPro, Unity, VMP, and Whayne the Bus Parts Bid as indicated on the Bid
Tabulation.

CONTACT PERSON:
Carrie Hooten, Purchasing Agent f
R,
(08720 0 LAy
Principal District Administrator' erintendent

Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items fo be added to the Board Meeting Agenda.
Principal —complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director —if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent’s mailbox.

Kenton County Board of Education

Board Members: Carl Wicklund, Chairperson Karen L. Collins, Vice Chairperson Joshua Crabtree, Esqg.  Carla Egan  Jesica Jehn
“The Kenton County Board of Education provides Equal Education & Employment Opportunities.”




KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
BUS PARTS STORE DISCOUNT BID 2018-2019

DAIMLER. FREE FRIEGHT ON
ALL STOCKED ITEMS. FREIGHT
WILL BE CHARGED ON SPECIAL
ORDERED ITEMS.

VENDOR DISCOUNT EXCEPTION(S) LABOR RATES
ADVANCE AUTO PARTS : S 5-65%
ALLPRO. suppw 0%
AMERICAN BUS - 0%
AUTO-JET MUFFLER 0%
BATTERY MEN'-’ Erau o%
' BMS BODY PARTS ARE
BLUEGRAss INTERNATIONAL 39»54% EXCLUDED $130.00/HR
fBUS PARTs WAREHOUSE - 74%|
FARM & CITY SUPPLY - {.41.55-65.2%
FYDA FREIGHTLINER = T 0%
GEORGE'S TRUCK: 'CENTER 0%
HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS 0%
JASPER ENGINES 13-20%|
|<_0|.:. i 0%
- 1475 MINIMUM ORDER FOR
OAM SUPPLY co 0% L oE e DELIVERY
RUSH TRUCK CENTERS 10% $127.80/hr
SCHOOL BUS PARTS co 0%
TERMINALS PLUS : 0%
TRUCKPRO - S 0%
UNITY: SCHOOL BUS PARTS 0%
VMP. 0%
b | DISCOUNT DOESN'T INCLUDE
. |SEON OR MOBILE CLIMATE
e G PARTS. DISCOUNT OFF OF ALL
WHAYNESUPPLY . 20% o S T o $114/HR

RECOMMENDATION:

The Kenton County Board of Education award the Bus Parts
Store Discount Bid to all fully compliant vendors as indicated

above in highlighted cells
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KENTON COUNTY SCHOO!, DISTRICT
BUS PARTS - EXHAUST BID 18-12

ALL F’ARTS MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH OTHER SYSTEMS SUCH AS: AUTO-ET EXHAUST SYSTEMS

AUTOnJET MUFFLER Lo 3 Lo BLUEGRASS INTERNATIONAL GECRGE'S TRUCK CENTER KOl
pEseRIP] oo ESTIMATED el e | peserip DESGRIP DESCRIP
--TION-'-' PART_NLEMBER QUAN'HTY : ; 1._INlT_P_RIC_E EXCEPTIONS TION TION UNIT TION UNIT
S ¥ O : Uom UNIT PRICE | EXCEPTIONS UOM |PRICE| EXCEPTIONS UGoM PRICE |EXCEPTIONS
TIYI=200T AINTAN K. F66E SIgIE, ““== (19992001 AT A [LE. A95E B

- 11989-2001 Amtran R.E. 466E Engine, Automatic

1999-2001 mtr.an.R,E. 85 Engzne, A“tommc T"" s Automatic Transmission, 72 Passenger Air {Automatic Transmission, 72 Passenger Alr

Suspensmn' L - o - fTransmission, 72 Passenger Air Suspension & i P
Header o S R e : o ....JHeader Header Header
EXH-11350 pive L s : AIED et S e Each Pipe Each Pipe Each No Bid
EXH-11375 . taddrevhda < cBaghi b 0027048 s Muffler Each Muffler Each Muffler Each Ne Bld
: ; i E&ch'”' e I s Sxtension Extension Extenslon
EXH-11400 SRR D e ~|Pipe Each Pipe Each Pipe Each Ne: Bid
EXH-11428 s raadretpse o Eachy Tail Pipe Each Tail Pipe Each Tail Pipe Each No Bid
[ :{Muffier Muffler Muffler
- gvrmha - Hanger Hanger Hanger
RO CIRE G, RE IIC, RE IfC,
EXH-40265 OVMHCE Each QVMHCE Each OVMHCE ;  Each 43.57 174.28
HMusfler Muffler Muffier
Hgr Oval Hgr Oval Hgr Cval
wi Brit w/ Brit RE w/ Brit RE
IREMC, c, IC,
2 OVMHIH OVMHIHD QVMHIMD
EXH-40270 -{DTAJ Each TAJ Each TAJ Each 45.84 199,35
11997-1998 Amfran FG DT456E Engine Automatic | Lo/ 1000 ATAN [ DTREGE ENgme 159798 ety FU D TREEE E

Azﬁtrari FC DT466E Enging Automatic Trar o . o : d b -
: T e FTransmission, 72 Passenger Air Suspension Automatic Transmission, 72 Passenger Air |Automatic Transmission, 72 Passenger Air

R TR 81 inn Sisnpasion
ST E L o s tiE JExtension Extension Extension
EXH-12075 _ S R GRS ey Each Pipe Each Pige Each Ne Bid
EXH-12125 i : idtpas o o S A28Z oA | Tail Pipe Each Tai| Pipe Each Tall Plipe Each No Bid
d Hangers - Ll Lo .- |Clamps and Hangers Clamps and Hangers Clamps and Hangers
| IR RV 32 312"
‘{Band Band Band
EXH-12225 2 iCIkamp Each Clamp Each 2,31 Clamp Each No Bid
.- JExhaust Exhaust Exhaust
i Pipe Pipe Fipe
i |Hanger Hanger Hanger
o 4", 4",
JFORD4O0 FORD400 FORD40Q
EXH-12275 “|PH Each PH Each PH Each 16,83 33,66
EX :\Exh Pipe Exh Pipe Exh Pipe
‘Hahger 4" o s {Hanger 4" Hanger 4" Hanger 4"
2piece; 400phape i qidd . +]2 plece, 2 plece, 2 piece,
400PHZP L DR CIHAQOPH2P 400PHZP AC0PHZP
Extzsoo i L e Ezch © Each c Zach : 1183 225
4" Band; CROGeE Cgna |4 Band 4" Band 4" Band
EXH-12325 Claripi . A STTR Clamp Each Clamp Each 271 Clamp Each Ne Bid
Exhaust .} -~ [Exhaust Exhaust Exhaust
Hanger | o ~|Hanger Hanger Hanger
UGy 3 Ilioy W, ¥c,
EXH-10275 330881 | 11339661 Each 330861 Each 338861 Each 4.63 9,38
Turbo . 1Turbo Turbo Turbo
clamp Clarmg Clamp
cat, i Cat, Cat,
35538030 3553603C 3563803C
EXH-40280 | SHECRRAR 301 Each 2 Each 2 Each 20,21 4042
el Clamp Clamp
EXH-40285 ] S : B Each 26.50 R/EIC, Each R/E IFC, Each 20.21 40.42
n T ZUUT=20U% TVCITES -5, 55 3 (20 GH T Enge ZUT =200 TGS 15, B9 o 126 WA T ) ZUUI-Z00S THONES I3 B 3TZ0 TR TIgume
2?1051'2003 Thomas F.5. 65 3125 c 'T B ‘}Automatic Transmission Air Suspension 52 Automatic Transmission Air Suspension 52 |Automatic Transmission Air Suspension 52
perision 52 Passenger Pp—— I
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KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUS PARTS - EXHAUST BID 18.19

ALL PARTS MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH OTHER SYSTEMS SUCH AS: AUTO-JET EXHAUST SYSTEMS

- AUTO-JET, MUFFLER BLUEGRASS INTERNATIONAL GECRGE'S TRUCK CENTER KOl
Joi e ESTIMATED_ : SR PR (- DESCRIP DESCRIP
PART '*_'”.“_"BE.R QUARTITY | | UNIT PRICE | EXCEPTIONS| ™ TION UNIT TION UNIT
. L o IR B RSt G L e UomMm UNIT PRICE | EXCEPTIONS UOM |PRICE| EXCEPTIONS UoM PRICE | EXCEPTIONS
Head” RS S RS “{Header Header Header
Pipe. 1p31264190°: : 1_10.59 : [Pipe Flpe Pipe
EXH-12400 5224119“ P T 22411900 Each g22411801 Each 62241190 Each | g543 17096
Straxght i Straight Straight Straight
Pipe 788 - JPipe Pipe Pipe
EXH-12405 62206832 ] Sl 16220682 Each 5220882 Each 6220882 Each No Bid
M"F.ﬁg-f. it F1Eas T C{Muffier Muffler Muffler
EXH-12410 §1240811:| .- R 612409111  Each 512409111 Each 51240911 Each No Bid
g."e"'f’ﬁ“e" foarttas Camast L " Jover fute Over Axle Over A
EXH-30500 A LA e ::{Pipe Each Pipe Each Fipe Each Na Bid
EXH-30350 Taif Pipe | oty e CBach i 10987 .| Tall Pipe Each Tail Fipe Each Tail Pipe Each No Bid
2004 ‘!‘homasRE C7Cat B : . |2004 Thomas R.E. ©-7 Cat 2004 Thomas RE. C-7 Cat 2004 Thomas R.E. C-7 Cat
Header - R T T ... |Header Header Header
EXH:29850 Plos AQ Ly o Badh s 09,68 |Pipe Each Ppe Each Pipe Each Na Bid
EXH-29475 Muffler . oo i Baghof o 214408 - | Muffler Each Muffler Each Muffler Each Nofid |
EXH-30000 Tail pipe | - ovdaoo: g oo Eagh 2205 - -|Tail Pipe Each Tal Pipe Each Tail Pipe Each Mo Bld
CAT B - - - “ICAT TAT TAT
TURBD L TuRBO TURBO TURBO
SLAME 31_1_5‘“‘—’. et JoLamp, CLAMP, CLAMP,
EXH-10280 ( B FOe R Sl . 1W2431 EACH 1W2431 EACH 1W2431 | EACH 24.56 o524
2005-2006- Thomas F.$88 t‘.‘? CAT'_En'g'ii:e'Automaﬁi_:' Al SuspénSioh"_GG 7o) 2008-2006 Thomas F.8.65 C7 CAT Engine 2005-2606 Thomas F.5.65 C7 CAT Engine  ]2605-2006 Thomas F.$.65 C7 CAT Engine
Passenger R T L - :FAutomatic Air Suspension 66 Passenger Automatic Afr Suspension 66 Passenger  |Automatic Alr Suspension §6 Passenger
Pipe;’: i " |over Axie Gver Axle Over Axle
3| i einasans “|Pipe, Fipe, Pipe,
FRIOASA| o0 L {FRLOAS FRLOAS4 FRLOAS4
EXH-30250 24 J434 Each 34 Each 34 Each | 13200 528
Tail Pipe, ~Tail Pipe, Tail Pipe, Tail Pipe,
EXH-30200 FRLTPOZ “JFRLTPO2E  Each FRLTPOZ | Each FRLTPO2 | Each 65.51 131.02
2008 _'mm-afmmi ¢E ‘2006 International C.E. 2006 International C.E. 2005 International C.E.
Po:;r'qﬂe 2| over axie Over Axle Over Axle
-- - |Pipe, Pipe, Pipe,
NAVEE4Z) S INAVCES NAVOE42 NAVCE42
EXH-40235 T soler Each 7 Each 7 Each 38.48 76.96
gi\:irﬁxle”“ S i fover Axte Over Axle Over Axle
TIPS CBach T < Pipe, Pipe, Pine,
NAVCE4S] - o |Navces NAVCEA4S NAVCE4S
EXH-40240 LR 2151 Each 1 Each 1 Each 14216 28432
Header - : : ) . ... [Meader Header Header
Bige EESRTCRSONY “|Pipe, Fipe, Pipe,
3534’519(; [ mseigre A - 13584618 35846190 3584519C
EXH-40260 o Ry : R R : cz2 Each 2 Each 2 Each 174,28 8564
Tanpnpe g "h'::' e Tailpipe Tailpipe Taipipe
EXH-40205 RIE e (Bach -5 8169 HRIE WG Each RE IIC Each RIE G Each Na Bid
TICATALYT CATALYTT CATALTTT
CATALYT (R i e} C
(o [ B murrLs MUEELE MUFFLE
350400catoe ;i
MUFFLER]  220000t0s. IR 2008 R 2008 R 2008
EXH-4G300 2085 IC - {re Each [lis Each el Each No Bld
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KENTON COUNTY SCHQOL DISTRICT
BUS PARTS - EXHAUST BID 18-19

ALL PARTS MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH OTHER SYSTEMS SUCH AS: AUTO-JET EXHAUST SYSTEMS

- AUTO-JET MUFFLER BLUEGRASS INTERNATIONAL GEORGES TRUGK GENTER KOt
DESCRIP ]t EST!MATED e mie el e DESCRIP DESCRIP DESCRIP
“TION - P”-‘RT ”-M_-BE_R QUANTITY i -U'N'.T'?R’CE- E_(_CE?TION_S TION TION unET TION UNIT
: Rt T L UM UNIT PRICE | EXCEPTIONS UOM  |PRICE| EXCEPTIONS uom PRICE | EXCEPTIONS
2007 Thomas RE. /057 - J2007 Thomas R.E. 2607 Thomas R.E. 2007 Thomas R.E.
Tail Pige,- L |rail Pipe, Tail Fipe, Tail Pipe,
CEdeh g Taed A TeTREET TPTPSET TRTROST
EXH-40245 B L B Bach B Each B Each 49.45 247.25
| CATALYT
e : i g [[o} CATALYTI CATALYT!
MUFFLER IR PR CHMUBRLE o c
3508 cEReh iR 2008 MUFFLE MUFFLE
'rHo‘MAs, _ R I ATHOMAS, R 2008 R 2008
dpvcaTer] - H400CATS THOMAS, THOMAS,
EXH-40305 S B! Each 400CATS]:  Each 400CATSIT  Each 56.68 119,32
Miuiffler Su Muffler Suppart FC International Muffler Support FC international Muffler Support FC Intematicnal
Muther y i ATt TAtTer i
Sippo, i R - Support, Suppert, Support,
15§§:1'5'3c cEach:.: 5186 " |1e80183 1680133C 1880153C
EXH-40250 9i B SR ! : N [o:1] Each 81 Zach 91 Each 152,08 316.18
2010 Thomias 340 . 2010 Thomas 340 2010 Thomas 240 2010 Thomas 346
Exhaust.-_ . . RESEER S A - Exhaust Exhaust Exhaust
Diffuser -3 R P BRI IR | Diffuser Diffuser Diffuser
oa:pagri] o Fach: .} 888 o = |oa-zagr 04-24871- 04-24871-
EXH-40265 gg0 L o 21000 Each 000 Each 000 Each 9329 186.58
E : | Bxh Flex Exh Flax Exh Flex ™
Lo B D Plpe 4" Fipe 4" Pipe 4"
i iPERFOQT; /1788 . 185, 18- 8%, 18- PER SS,16- | PER
EXH-40310 R N Bt 4008 PER FQOT 4005 FOOT 4008 FOOT 253,12 25312
Pipe {Bus S iExhs- Exh 8- Exh §-
#95.99), o Pipe (Bus Pipe {Bus Pipe (Bug
KYINDET [ - 1%95-99), 495.9¢), 4#95-99),
MvpEOR [ AKYINDET KYINDET KYINDET
EXH-40315 S o “IMVPFOA Each MVPFOA Each MVPFOA Each No Bid
ZPiece .- |- [ BRI ST T2 Prece 2 Plece 2 Piace
Exh Pipe, R U - |Exh Pipe, Exh Pipe, Exh Pips,
TMVPFO | S i TaveEo TMVPFO THYPFO
EXH-40320 A |ads Each AdE Each A45 Each N 8id
Exh Plpe ... |Exh Fipe
over [ S| Over Exh Pipe Exh Pipe
Ao frivpoags i Bagh “:|Axe, Qver Axe, Over Axle,
TMVBOASE e [TMVPOA TMVPOA TMVPOA
EXH-40325 4 183 Each 83 Each 83 Each No Bid
B I Exh Pipe
Exh Pipe’( SRR ¢ Bus Exh Pipe { Exh Pipe {
Bus #98), CUEaeH i fussy, Bus #08), Bus #08),
TMVTESS T ~{TMVTRES TMVTRSS TMVTPS5
EXH-40530 oL JoL Each o-L Each 0-L Each No Bid
Mufﬂe_r_:. N B BN TIIN Iy Muffler Muffler Muffier
HorRE . S o Hagr RE Hgr RE Har RE
Thiomas, B 2 Thomas, Thomas, Thomas,
EXH-40335 TPMHY01 Z|TPMHS01:  Each TPMHOO1 !  Each TPMHSO01! Each Ne Bid
MIUFfer 4 oo B e e Muffler Muffler Mutfler
Cat#22s- ] 110065 U Each ' 226.86" 1 “nonicatalytic | Cat #228- Cat #228- Cat #228-
EXH-40340 42606 ST S Tty i o | ABBE Each 4860 Each 4860 Each No Rid

Page3cofd




KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUS PARTS - EXHAUST BID 18-18

ALL PARTS MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH OTHER SYSTEMS SUCH AS: AUTO-JET EXHAUST SYSTEMS

-AUTO-JET MUFFLER - BLUEGRASS INTERNATIONAL GEQRGE'S TRUCK CENTER KOl
BRseRip | EST]MATED i O CRI R T e o) DESCRIP DESCRIP
RN -E‘.“RT"._“!"‘.BER QUANTITY | U.N"‘"-‘_’R.’_CE EXCEPTIONS [0 oy TIoN UNIT TIoN unNIT
o : e Uok  JUNIT PRICE] EXCEPTIONS Uom  |PRICE] EXCEPTIONS UoM PRICE | EXCEPTIONS
Exhaust. {-:: R : - |Exhaust Exhaust Exhaust
Clamp 4 TEadno {Clamp Clamp Clamp
#3612047 | - - Fach:. B MY 3612947 4612947
EXH-40345 e : ey Each c1 Each c1 Each NoBld
Sin [Exhanst
agst__ i : o | pipe turba Exhaust Exhaust
pipe turho S S L 2ilto DRF pipe turbo pipe turbe
toiOPE Ca): Bach. i 663.05 . ez to DPF 02 to DPF C2
#FRLT511 SRCTIRI) Bt R ClarRLTE #FRLTS1 #ERLTS1
EXM-40350 1 : i ik Each 11 Each 11 Each No Bid
Mufier e o T THer MIGHEr
STP4004D Each 1 paaea ] $TP4004 #TP40040 #TP40040
EXH-40355 GETE R P i ““|oocTst Each 0CTS! Each ocTs Each No 8id
Y ; : “[Header Headar Header
Header, .- LT T e Pipe, 04- Pipe, 04- Pipe, D4-
Pipe; 04-:4 CEACh 15656 ~ 22446 20445 D2445-
22.446-?0_0. R L ':' TR : - |ooco Each 000 Each 000 Each 183,07 183,07
LEAD TIME: 2-3 DAYS LEAD TIME: 1-3 DAYS LEAD TIME: 4 DAYS LEAD TIME: 1 DAY
RECOMMENDATICN:  The Kenton County Board of Education Award the Exhaust Parts to Aute-Jet Muffler they are the only firm to bid compiete systems that work with KCBE current bus exhaust systems
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THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUS PARTS BID - SEAT PARTS 18-19

AMERICAN BUS

HEAVY DUTY BUS

Commodity
Codes

PART NAME

BRAND
NAME

EST, QTY.

UOM

TTEM UNIT
Numeer| PRICE

IXCEPTION

UM

ITEM
NUMBER

UNIT
PRIGE

SEAT-10900

Amiran 59° Seat Back
JFoam

Triad

20

$ 27.37

Cisach

EXCEPTIONS

SEAT-10550

Amiran Kentucky Biue
Seat 30" Fireblock
Cushion Cover

O.EM.

S 15.93

0214234

17011132130 ¢

$ 246

SEAT-10475

Amtran Kentucky Blue
Seat 39" Fireblock
Back Cover (Velcro)

0.EM,

20

EIEVITIE

'Z'i_.9_5. s

SEAT-10500

Amtran Kentucky Blue
Seat 39" Fireblock
Cushicn Cover

Q.E.M.

20

$ 3591

1879476 ]

SEAT-11825

Amtran, Kentucky
blue seats, 38",
fireblack back cover

CEM

20

$§ 3119

01-11321 $

RPN Y

15.00

Cates|

SEAT-14400

Amtran, Kentucky
biue seats, 39,
firablock barrier, with
4 pockets

QEM

15

lot-14321BPVi §

36,00

SEAT-14660

Cover th 30 kevlar
blue barrier with
fnockets

$ 6255

No quote

SEAT-14870

Cover th 30 ny kevlar
Jbarrier with pockets

No quote

SEAT-14655

Cover th keviar blue p
barrier with pockets
39"

seso|

No guote

SEAT-14665

Cover th ny kevlar
biue barrier with
pockets 39"

18 9284

No quote

SEAT-14640

Cover wy kevier tan
po barrier with
pockets 3g"

No quote

SEAT-14550

Thomas 30" High
Back Cover nfy
(velcro), p/n 470230-
085

OEM

20

NO BID

¢ azas

SEAT-14575

Thomas 39" High
Back Seat Back
Foam, niy

Triad

20

5 3036

1 o2e2e1

No quote

§ 2800

SEAT-11450

Thomas 39" seat back
foam

Triad

20

1 oasazn -

$2550)

SEAT-14525

Thomas Btue 39"
High Back Caover,
Velcro, p/n 470238-
095

OEM

20

27.37

$ 3257

SEAT-11425

Thomas Blue Seat
30" Fireblock Back
Cover (Velero)

QOEM

2¢

$ 3841

" |otredszd-a0v,.

Mo quote

SEAT-11400

Thomas Blue Seat
30" Fireblock Cushion
Cover

OQEM

20

$ 3139

1.01:64321-30 | §

SEAT-11500

Thomas Blue Seat
39" Fireblock Back
Cover {Velcro)

QEM

20

$ 3591

“oreaazty |

SEAT-11475

Themas Blue Seat
39" Fireblock Cushion
Cover

QEM

20

S saz|

61-61321 $

SEAT-40240

THOMAS SEAT
BACK FOAM 3g"
#T23910

QOEM

25

$ 30.36

o oeaat 1y

SEAT-40245

THOMAS SEAT BACK
COVER SQUARE TOP
1472238-0005

OEM

00

I aos7] 0 o

SEAT-40215

Amfran 38" High Back
KY Blue Back Cover
Fire Block Velcro

OEM

50

S 4265

S osadazt
o NYV

No quote

$:.92860

SEAT-40225

Amtran 38" High Back
IFoam #T723910

Triad

50

$ 3036

0215234

$ 2485

3 DAY LEAD TIME

4 DAY LEAD TIME

RECOMMENDATION: THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION AWARD THE SEATS BID AS INDECATED [N HIGHLIGHTED CELLS
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THE KENTAN COUNTY SCHOCL DASTRACT
BYS PARTS 310 1419
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