THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF

EDUCATION

1055 EATON DRIVE, FORT WRIGHT, KENTUCKY
: . 41017
| 1¢’s about ALL Kids.  TE| EPHONE: (859) 344-8888 | FAX: (859) 344-1531
WEBSITE: www.kenton.kyschools.us

Dr. Henry Webb, Superintendent of Schools

KCSD ISSUE PAPER

DATE:
04/26/18

AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM):
Consider/Approve the recommendation to award Quill and School Kids Healthcare the First Aid
Supplies Bid.

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY:
Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.1

HISTORY/BACKGROUND:

An advertisement was posted to the district website on March 28, 2018, to accept sealed bids for
First Aid Supplies. Sealed bids were publicly opened and read on April 18, 2018. This is a single
year bid.

FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT:
Fiscal/Budgetary impact was unable to be calculated due to the purchasing of items on an as
needed basis.

RECOMMENDATION:
Approval to accept the bids from Quill and School Kids Healthcare and award on a per item basis
as indicated on the First Aid Supplies Bid Tabulation.

CONTACT PERSON:
Carrie Hooten, Purchasing Agent
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&, 741’/2 Cex M W

Principal District AdministratW

%erintendent

Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meeting Agenda. -
Principal —complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director —if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent’s mailbox.

Kenton County Board of Education
Board Members: Carl Wicklund, Chairperson Karen L. Collins, Vice Chairperson Joshua Crabtree, Esq. Carla Egan Jesica Jehn
“The Kenton County Board of Education provides Equal Education & Employment Opportunities.”



THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

FIRST AID SUPPLIES BID TABULATION EFFECTIVE: JUNE 1, 2018 - MAY 31, 2019
QUILL SCHOOL KIDS HEALTHCARE
Est. — —
item# | Qty. Commodity Code Description Brand Name Item No. Unit Price Brand Name Item No. Unit Price
1. 21 HEA-10760 1 gal Sharps Container NO BID KENDALL 4801 $ 2.65
2, 6 HEA-10010 Alcohol prep, 2" x 1 ¥”, 200/box WEBCOL BID-19818M : $ 3,17 | MEDSOURCE | MS-17402 | § 1.28
Alcohol, isopropyl, rubbing FIRST AID
3. 1 HEA-10000 compound, plastic container, 16 oz. NoBID ONLY L $ il
i 3 ek tsn Ammonia Inhalant Products, 10/box FII;%‘IL:{\ID BID-071285 | $ 1.31 SAFETEC $52022 $ 1.65
Applicators, 6", wood stick with BID-
5. 1 HEA-10040 cotton tip, non-sterile, 1000/box DYNREX 1612182DTD | ° 6.64 [EEREREEES @so2 $ =50
Applicators, 6", wood stick,
6. 1 HEA-10030 188%0)( NO BID DUKAL D90000 | $ 1.85
Bags, white, plastic, with handles,
1000/box, (SAMPLE REQUIRED) NO BID NO BID
T 1 HEA-10060
Bags, zip-lock ply bags, 6" x 8", 2
mil, 100/box, (SAMPLE NO BID NO BID
8. 72 HEA-10070 REQUIRED)
Balls, absorbent, medium, pure
9. 4 HEA-10080 natural cotton, non-sterile, NOBID DUBARES 170 $ o
Bandages, 2" x 4", Not Wing,
10. 1 HEA-11300 50/box, LATEX FREE NO BID CAREBRAND CBDA4016 $ 272
Bandages, 4 wing, fabric, 3" x 3",
50/box, NOT knuckle bandages, CURITY BID-019108M i $ 497 DYNAREX 3620 $ 4.94
11. 1 HEA-10100 LATEX FREE
Bandages, elastic, wrapped in FIRST AID
cellophane, includes 2 clips, 3" x5 | ONLY - BOX BID-071326 | $ 7.02 NO BID
12. 1 HEA-10130 yards, each OF 12
Bandages, fabric, flexible strips, 1"
13. 315 HEA-10110 X3, 100/box, LATEX FREE NO BID CAREBRAND | CBD4018 | $ 1.77
Bandages, mini-strips, 3/8” x 1 %", NO BID CAREBRAND | CBD2027 | $ 1.02
14. 1 HEA-10950 latex-free, 100/box, LATEX FREE
15, 1 HEA-11200 Bandage Scissors, 5 %" hNoaln DINARES 411 $ 058
Band-aids, Fabric, %" x 3", 100/box,
16. 2 HEA-10900 LATEX FREE NO BID NOBID
Chart, Far Vision Acuity, 9" x 14",
17. 1 HEA-10160 10 direct, unbreakable, each, NO'8ID NOJBID
Cough drops, non-menthol, fruit
L g NO BID NO BID
18. 155 HEA-10200 flavored. suaar-free, 25/box
rops, non-menthol, fruit
19. 5 HEA-11460 d. 600/box HoBIR i
, Hydrocortisone, 1%, 1
20. 20 HEA-10205 {0, each NOBID NOBID
Cups, medicine, plastic, 1 0z, MEDLINE - BID-
21. 235 HEA-10210 100/tube — 50 tubes/case CASE 110185MED $ 4467| DYNAREX 4258 $ 0.72
o 4 EAY 0220 ?g&f::m' WG, DRSNS DUKAL | BID-107631BX | § 454 DYNAREX 4312 | 3.60
Disposable generic specula for BRIGGS BID-
23. 1 HEA-11150 otoscope 2.5mm, 50 per tube HEALTHCARE | 388970BRG | ® 14.44 NO BID
Disposable generic specula for
24, 1 HEA-11175 otoscope 3.0mm, 50 per tube NO BID NO BID
36 i —_— Dressing, surgipads, 5" x 9", 25/box NO BID DYNAREX s s 10
i Dressing, non-stick; telfa; 2" x 3", -
26. 1 HEA-10240 100/box NOBID NO'BID
Ear Ease — for ear ache discomfort
27. 1 HEA-10250 NOBID NOBID
Eye Chart, near vision eye chart, w/
28. 1 HEA-10260 non-stretch measuring cord, 7" x 9", oEID NO BID
Finger Pulse Oximeter (can be
used on both adult and pediatric HE‘fL?S?:RE BID-44451DHT | $ 26.89 | CURAPLEX 69100 $ 27.00
29. 1 HEA-11250 patients, auto off
Cuifs with No"Tubes or Connector
30. 1 HEA-11025 (Raw Cuff) - One each Welch NOBID WELEHALL I ARvSe e T 00
Cuffs with No"Tubes or Connector
31. 1 HEA-11050 (Raw Cuff) — One each Welch NOBIB PHERC AR Al | 2200
Cuffs with N6 “Tubes or Connector
32. 1 HEA-11075 (Raw Cuff) — One each Welch NO BID WELCHACEYIY BEUSEAD T[S 21.00
FlexiPeit ReUsabIe BI66a
33, 1 HEA-11100 Pressure Cuffs with No Tubes NOEID WELGHALLYN) REUSE9 {5 EA
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THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
FIRST AID SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

EFFECTIVE: JUNE 1, 2018 - MAY 31, 2019

QUILL SCHOOL KIDS HEALTHCARE
Est.
item#| Qty. Commodity Code Description Brand Name Item No. Unit Price Brand Name Item No. Unit Price
Foam Strip Splints, %" x 18”,
34, 1 HEA-10270  i4g/ackaqe NOBID NQ'BIB
Gatge With Faifiily Practice Kit
35. 1 HEA-11000  i(includes: large adult, small HEkBID DIERSHA | R S
GaUge, WEICH-AIYHOr Tyed
36. 1 HEA-10975 Dura Shock lifetime calibration NosIn NO'BID
37. 56 HEA-10750 Glutose 15, oral glucose gel, 15gm | NOBID TRANSCEND 6739 $ 3.30
Lotion, relieves itching, Caladryl or
18, 29 HEA-10330 rndisaall cledr, Batis B, NO BID CALDYPHEN 2281699 | $ 2.15
Lysol Disinfectant Foam Cleaner,
39. 20 HEA-10370 Germicidal, Virucidal, Fungicidal, LYSOL BID-02775 | $ 2.67 LYSOL RCO5524 | $ 3.49
40. 1 HEA-11225 Magnifying Forceps, 3 %" NOIEID e =8 el
Ointment, antibiotic, 3 in 1, multi-
4. 78 HEA-10400 S NEOSPORIN | BID-73087Q }$ 528 DYNAREX 1185 $ 1.55
Ointment, antiseptic, Anbesol, .31
42. 10 HEA-10410 fl. Oz, each NO BID ANBESOL 3031879 $ 4.55
Ointment, burn treatment, FIRST AID
43. 1 HEA-10390 anesthetic, 1 0z., each ONLY EBRERED B Wk NOBID
44, 9 HEA-10745 Orthodontic Wax NoBlL ERLEER ke i
Otoscope — Reister or equivalent BRIGGS
45. 2 HEA-10420 (not plastic) with 3 spatula and HEALTHCARE | BID-47321BRG | $ #il.22 ADC S $ 100
Pads, eye, oval, sterile, 1 %" x 2
46. 2 HEA-10450 5/8", 50/box NO BID DYNAREX 3360 $ 4.00
Pads, sanitary, maxi-pad, with RMC
47. 1 HEA-10460 adhesive strip, individually wrapped| NATURELLE BID-0g $ 49:82 S i $ 4500
Pen light, reusable, uses AAA
48. 1 HEA-10470 batieries each NO BID DYNAREX 32765 $ 1.65
Peroxide, Hydrogen 3% Solution,
49. 24 HEA-10480 plastic container, 16 oz., each NoBlD =Rz Sl $ 8.0
Petroleum jelly, 4 oz. Jar, each
50. | 20 HEA-10490 NOBID Ne BIb
Saline for rinsing contact lenses,
51. 1 HEA-10825 contact solution, 2 oz., each NO BID NO BID
Sanitizer, hand sanitizer, alcohol
52. 1 HEA-10770 free, effective against MRSA, 7 oz NO BID AVANT 17619-24 | $ 2.39
Solarcaine, 4 oz. Aerosol, each
53, 48 HEA-10550 NOEID Ne BID
Shampoo with comb, pediculicide
54. 1 HEA-10520 treatment, kills lice and their eggs, NO-BID RID 1121925 ¥ 620
Solution, eyewash, sterile isotonic FIRST AID
55. 7 HEA-10560 formula, cleanses irritated eyes, ONLY-10z | BID-8002%8 $ 175 NG BID
Solution, Saline Solution, % oz. or 1
56. 1 HEA-10570 oz., BOTTLE MUST HAVE NO BID ACME 7-008 $ 2.05
Snellen eye chart (wall chart), 22" x GRAHAM-
57. 6 HEA-10875 11", RED/GREEN COLOR BARS NO BID FIELD 1240 $ 3.98
non-sterile, 12 ply, individually
58. 48 HEA-10610 wrapped, 200/package, 2" x 2" DUKAL | BID-107660BG | $ 2.13| DYNAREX 3223 $ 1.20
non-sterile, 12 ply, individually
59. 36 HEA-10620 wrapped, 200/package, 3’ x 3" DUKAL i BID-107614BG | $ 226| DYNAREX 3233 $ 2.25
60. 2 HEA-10630 Steri Strips, 1/8” x 3", 50/box 3M BID-114448BX | § 57.57|  NOBID
for comfortable fit, lient'sound
61. 1 HEA-10640 transmission, lightweight, 22" log OMRON SIBB5%67 1% 8.6 e o P
Sure Temp Plus 690 thermometer,
62. 7 HEA-10780 Welch-Allyn NO BID WELCH ALLYN| 01690200 | $ 236.00
Sure Temp Plus Thermometer
63. 33 HEA-10790 probe covers, 1000 in box NO BID NO BID
Sure Temp Plus 690, Welch-Allyn
64. 1 HEA-11350 Oral Probe with Probe Well MO BIE, BB | WEERAY | O 20
regular size, Tampax or Equal,
65. 1 HEA-10660 500/case TAMPAX BID-PT  |$ 45.69 |  TAMPAX T500 $ 7747
roll, Bérmalite hypoallergenic paper
66. 2 HEA-10670 tape, J & J #5115 or equal, %" x 10 NO BID NO BID
Tape, cloth, heavy duty, 17"x 5 FIRST AID
67. 1 HEA-10680 yards, roll ONLY glDssansale | NoBD
paper tape, hypo-allergenic, gentle
68. 2 HEA-10690 to the skin, very porous, 1" x 10 N BIA002898X: 3 &40 il B e
hypo-allergenic, 1" x 10 yards, 12
69. 2 HEA-10700 rolls NO BID DYNAREX 3562 $ 7.74
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THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
FIRST AID SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

EFFECTIVE: JUNE 1, 2018 - MAY 31, 2019

QUILL SCHOOL KIDS HEALTHCARE
ESt.
item#| Qty. Commodity Code Description Brand Name Item No. Unit Price Brand Name Item No. Unit Price
antiseptic, individually wrapped, MEDLINE - BID-
70. 37 HEA-10730 Viro Nox-9 or Equal, 500/case CASE 111177mep | ® 24341  NOBID
71. 1 HEA-10740 Wipes, relives insect stings, 10/box | ~ NO BID SAFETEC S52015 $ 1.32
Wooden splints, 18" x 3 %" x 1/8"
72. 2 HEA-10925 (approximately) OB MORRISON 1815 $ L=t
73, 1 HEA-11355 Vinyl powder free gloves, small AMBITEX BID-101532 | $ 2.39| DYNAREX SPF100S | § 2.80
74, 4 HEASI1380 Viny| powder free gloves, medium | jyprex | mip.ssoter |$ 237| DYNAREX | SPF100M | $ 2.80
75, 1 HEA-11365 Viny! powder free gloves, large AMBITEX | BID-101538 |$ 237| DYNAREX | SPF1o0L 2.80
76. 3 HER=TARR Vinyl powder free gloves, xlarge AMBITEX | BID-101539 |$ 2.38| DYNAREX | SPF100XL | § 2.80
7 4 1 HEA-11370 Nasal plug non-sterile NO BID NO BID
78. 1 HEA-11375 Nose clip, latex free NOBID ALLED sole B 024
79. 1 HEA-11380 Obstetrical kit NO BID DYNAREX g2 $ 269
80. 1 HEA-11385 Otoscope PICCOLIGHT | BID-36568 | $ 69.11| VERIDIAN 1213301 i § 85.50
FIRST AID FIRST AID
BID-222U | $ 7.18 222-U $ 10.85
81. 1 HEA-11390 First aid kit ONLY -63 PCS ONLY
82, 1 HEA-11395 Sports tape 1% * x 10 yards NO'BIR RNO:BID
83, 1 HEA-11440 Pill Counter with spatula NOBID NOIBIE
84. 1 HEA-11445 Sterile wound wash spray, 3 oz NO BID NO BID
PDI - 1,000 / BID-
85. 1 HEA-11450 Castile Soap Towelettes BOX 113990MED $ 49.01 NO BID
CARING BID-
86. 1 HEA-11400 Non-sterile conforming gauze-kling | SUPRA FORM | 115150MED $ 13.72 NO BID
2" x5 Yards Coban/self adherent
87. 1 HEA-11405 wrap 3M - 36/CASE i BID-101995CS | $ 67.90 | DYNAREX 3188 $ 1.00
88. 1 HEA-11460 2 mil clear bags, 4" x 4", 100/box HolE HoblE
89. 1 HEA-11465 Splinter Out NO BID NO BID
Tooth saver necklace, 1" tooth RHODE
chest with closeable top with plastic Mi"ﬂ'!'ggs BID-58407 | § 12.18|  ISLAND SLNECTO | $ 4.50
90. i) HEA-11470 tie necklace NOVELTY
RIS BID-940244 1.63| DYNARE SOL52MD
91. 1 HEA-11475 5 oz wax lined flat bottom cup PACK : $ . YNAREX $ 2.50
BID-
92. 1 HEA-11480 Excergen Temporal Scanner EXCERGEN 110515MED $ 516.79 NO BID
93. 1 HEA-11485 Thermofocus Thermometer NO BID NO BID
BRIGGS BID-
94. 1 HEA-11415 Pill Crusher HEALTHCARE| 183o7sBrG |$ 344 NOBID
BRIGGS BID-
95. 1 HEA-11455 Pill Cutter HEALTHCARE | 2120408rRG | 2.33|  NOBID
~ican be used on hard non-porous PDI
96. 1 HEA-11420 surfaces & vinyl. Must be effective | sanicLoT | BPP31712 | § 5.41 PDI QoBar2 $ 575
Facial Tissues, 100 tissues/box, 36 | QuILL - SOLD DYNAREX -
97. 1 HEA-11430 g - ety BID-7TF830 | $ 0.60 [ e F3607 $ 13.30
Hand Sanitizer, 64 oz or greater
98. 1 HEA-11435 with pump QUILL  [BID-7QBSAN67| $ 747 | SAFETEC 18357 $ 19.85
99. 1 HEA-11480 Sharps container, 1 QT SHARPS BID-646065 | $ 405 KENDALL 8900 $ 1.75
HEALTH BID-
100 1 HEA-11485 Urinal, Male, with plastic lid SMART 276663BRG | ° 3.05( DYNAREX 80235 $ 0.68
101 1 HEA-11490 Lice Comb, Nit Free Terminator NO BID NIT NEICE $ 2
Cart, Medical, 5 Drawer with key
102 1 HEA-11495 lock on casters NO BID NOBID
Thermometer, Veridian 09-349 VERIDIAN BID-
103 1 HEA-11500 Infrared Forehead HEALTHCARE { 1717795VHC $ 27.06 | VERIDIAN 09-349 $ 22.70
THE FOLLOWING VENDORS WERE CONSIDERED NON-COMPLIANT: BSN, EVERYTHING QUILL BID #: LEAD TIME: 1-2 CATALOG LEAD TIME: 3 CATALOG
MEDICAL, HENRY SCHEIN, MOORE MEDICAL, AND SCHOOL NURSE DID NOT COMPLY 18-16593 DAYS DISCOUNT: 10% DAYS DISCOUNT: 20%
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THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

FIRST AID SUPPLIES BID TABULATION EFFECTIVE: JUNE 1, 2018 - MAY 31, 2019
QUILL SCHOOL KIDS HEALTHCARE
ESt.
item#| Qty. Commodity Code Description Brand Name Item No. Unit Price Brand Name item No. Unit Price

WITH THE DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS

RECOMMENDATION: THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION AWARD THE BID AS INDICATED IN HIGHLIGHTED CELLS
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