
Kenton County School District I It's a6out)f.££ kjas. 

THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF 
EDUCATION 

1055 EATON DRIVE, FORT WRIGHT, KENTUCKY 
41017 

TELEPHONE: (859) 344-8888 / FAX: (859) 344-1531 
WEBSITE: www.kenton.kyschools.us 

Dr. Henry Webb, Superintendent of Schools 

KCSD ISSUE PAPER 

DATE: 
October 23, 2020 

AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM): 
Consider/Approve the recommendation to award the First Aid Supplies Bid as indicated on the 
attached tabulation for the period of December 1, 2020, through November 30, 2021. 

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY: 
Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.1 

HISTORY /BACKGROUND: 
An advertisement was posted on the district website on October 1, 2020, to accept sealed bids for 
the First Aid Supplies Bid. Sealed Bids were publicly opened and read on Monday, October 19, 
2020, at 2:00 PM via a Google Meets Meeting. This is a single year bid. 

FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT: 
The Fiscal/Budgetary impact is unable to be calculated due to purchases being made on an as 
needed basis. 

RECOMMENDATION: 
Approval to award the First Aid Supplies Bid as indicated on the attached tabulation for the period 
of December 1, 2020 through November 30, 2021. 

CONTACT PERSON: 
Cinda Roberts, Purchasing Agent 

~~;ewi2 
Principal 

Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meeting Agenda. 
Principal - complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director -if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent's mailbox. 

Kenton County Board of Education 
Board Members: Carl Wicklund, Chairperson Karen L. Collins, Vice Chairperson Carla Egan Shannon Herold Jesica Jehn 

"The Kenton County Board of Education provides Equal Education & Employment Opportunities." 



ADVANCED MED
SURG, CONg_PTS 

EMPIRE MEDICAL 
SOLUTIQNS 

FIRST AID SUPPLIES BID 2020-2021 

PYRAMID SCHOOL 
PRODUCTS QUIU. 

ZHOU MEDICAL 
SOLUTIONS 

Item• I Est. Qty. I Commodity Code Oesulptlon Product Number UnltPrlee Product Number Unit Price Product Number UnJtprfce Product Number Unit Price Product Number Unit Price Product Number Unit Price 
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HEA-10000 
1A1.,:u Ammonia Inhalant Products, 1D/box ! ! 71115 $1.19 No Sid 1401 S2.54 HEA-:AAOA 
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_
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HEA-~""•" 

0030 Aoolla<o", 6", wood ola, 1000/bo, ·•, Bid ·--·-· 107 $7 .. 87~!-----i ~ 

HEA-10060 
-- ~;,:;~~~:1~7ithh• ndles,1ooojbox, j I ~-~·:;~ j ... I N~-e~ INosro 

HEA-1007O 

Sap,tlp-tockplybap,6•xa· ,2mlt,lDO/bOX, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED) 

Salls,absorbent,medJum,purenatur.i ]ccttcn,non-
HEA-1O08O uuo"' sterlle,2000/bag 111671MED 

NoBld NOBID INOBID 

HH ____ ,$16,0!Jh4}1357 s, •. ool"'"' I '"·"I I 
HEA-11300 I ncA•u:1uu 1Banda11es,l" x4",NotWlng,50/box,lATEXFREE I I I I I j I.Q.lll!!ft:1 

Banda11es, 4 wing. fabric, 3• x 3", SO/box, NOT 
.$.~,~~ 1.1.<1.rn_~ i5,_a2 1ceoco16 il.51 

HEA-10100 knudttebandaces.!.~lEXFREE i7.471No81d fS.19 

eandaces,elasti~wrappedlncel!ophane,\ndudesl 
HEA-1013O 
nu.-,u,.:iu :~nd:;~sf

11
:;~c:•fle~~l~~:.~:exl",lOO/box, .H~3922 j $0.821 MOSOS5D03 I S6.701ZHOU$0.67EACH I 

HEA-1O11O .. --............ LATEXfREf 4444 S!:~ 1332395 

HEA-10900 

HEA-1O95O 

Band-aids, Fabr1~ ,c· x r. ]00/box, lATEX FREE 
Bandages,mlnl-strlps,3/S-xlX",latex-free, 
100/box,LATEXFREE 

i4:,!~_I J!~~16C 

NoBld 

jUl I NOC Pl5013S Sl.51 

il,9_9 l 99993 fl.Jg 

'"' fl.25 
QUIU BIO WRONG 

.. uu" BandageSclssors,SW I I I 813161 I $1.08 1449068 I $10.43 CH144NB S1.12 JstZE ~ 
;..;~-::.~::.:: Nall Clippers ..... H.... •·•••··•· 'N•~H8jd.. · 3073BUUC $0.47 HEA-11510 

HEA-1016O 

HEA-1O200 

Chart,FarVlslonAarlty,9•xu•,1o·d1reC1, I I I I ... H.... I I --~1------l 
nc""""""u unbreakable, each.SLOAN LETTERS No Bid 600705 $20.5!
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4
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HEA-11460 I ncA•lJ.'l,:,U 1couch drops,non-menthol,fruitfl.avored,600/box I I I I I j I I INoSid I 111c-ano1r.,as9 I $35.601 I 
HEA-1020S Cream, Hydrocortlsone, 1%, l oL, each 

Cups, medicine, plastic, l DL, 100/tube -so 

.$_1!).8_4_(301):-33S-100003 il.33 

ZHOU CASE OF 5,000 
VS SCHOOLSPEOALTY 

HEA-1O21O 
HEA-10220 
n~·~uuv tubes/case -~-~-~185MEO S47.40 2003892 I SQ:~. ~ 
"j:A-J.U:;:;u Oepressors,10111ue,non-sterile,SOO/box 1333481 · ~!:.?!~ JS.76 

_S~L..7()111.CI_X __ C)_F__l(l(I 

HEA-11150 

Olspouble 11enetlc specula for 01oscope 2.5mm, so 
,ertube 

Olsposiblee:ener1cspearlaforotoscope3.0mm,so 
No Bid ~~910.()0(), fU.08 

HEA·lll75 n~-...... ,., ertube No Bid 7300 SH.56 
HEA-1O23O 

HEA-1O240 

HEA-1025O 

HEA-1O260 

Dresslng,su11lpads,s•x9•,2s/box I No Bid NON2l4SC $3.60 
Dressing, non-stlclc, te!fa, 2" x 3•, 100/box No Bid NON2S700 $5.68 

;;~~s:;~o:a;:~:::~~:/non-streich 1-----+-----+-----;------+-----;------t------,1-------i·~-l:' .. ~Ld~---;------t~~-lli Sn.co,_ ___ _. 

measurln,:cord, rii:9",each,SLOAN LETTERS, 
pr1ntedlsldes 
Flncer PulseOxlmeter(cnbeusedonbothadult 

1----+----+----l----+------+----1-----+-----f~-! .. !ld I I I NOBIO jNOBIO I 
-~A-""""" 

~~:,u :~~iP:~a~:~sa~~l:~~;oa;~:~7ure cufh with No 
1443333 I 52f!:~~MR~~g

9 
~~.H~t-----< 
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1 
56 

29 

20 
1 

78 

10 

Tubes or Conn«:1:or (Raw Cuffi - One each Welch 
HEA-11025 MCA·UU-';> All II, REUSE-12 Large Adult (size 12 ~1~1!! f22 .14 IREUSE-12 g!;!?,,_ ___ _, 

FlexlPortReusab!eBtoodPressureCuffswithNo 
Tubes or Connector (Raw Cuff) - One each Welch 

HEA·ll0S0 
.,~-u.,_,u l~,~~~:~~SeE~::b~ed~::~s:;~ure CutfswlthNo I I I I I j I j 11599117 I Slll.S7 JREUSE-ll I 515

•
591 I 

HEA-11O75 

HEA•ll.100 

HEA-1O27O 

HEA-11000 

Tubes or Connector (R- cuff)- One eich Welch 

Allyn, REUSE·lO Small Adult (size 10) 
Flex IP on RNnble Blood Pressure cuffs with No 
Tubes or conneaor (Raw CUffi- one each Welch 
Allyn,REUSE-09Chlld(slte9} 
Foam ~ttlp Sp_llnts, "• x 1r, 11/pacb,:e 

Gaue:e with hmlly Pr.ialce Kit {lndudes: large adult, 
smalladult,ch!!druffs&nylontipperase)We!ch
Allyn lifetime a!lbmlon warranty, D558-MC 

No Bid REUSE-10 i2U7 

-
1 

~ -' m 1 •~ · ! m•m• 

No Bid 1399.10 

HEA-10975 

HEA-1O75O 

Gauge, Welch-Allyn or Tyco ouraShoclc lifetime 
ntA•lU!lt) calibration warrantv, OSSB I I I No Bid 0551 J s221.so ll 

1 
I nc"•J.U•:ou Glutose 15, oral lucose eel, lSgm • No Bid OOS-7400-6930 513.6! 

nu.-,u:1.:1u ~~~;,
6
r:~~ves Itching, Caladryl or brand equ~I, clear, I j No Bld 

411130 55
_
23 
I 

HEA-1O33O 

HEA-1O37O 
HfA.11225 

n=•~u~,., ::~:~t::~;~~~~.a: ~:aner, Germlddal, No Bid ... H NO Bl:l-1N_O_BIO-----il 

ur• •••m MacnlfyJncforceps1 3 ){~ N~··eld NO BIQf NO BID 

HEA-10400 
Olntment,antlblotlc,31n1,multl-purpose,loz., 1446824 $14.7613003-35U)-0004 

nu.•~U'luu each Sl.61 

HEA-1041O Oln1ment,an1lseptlc,Anbesol,.31f1.0z.,each NoBld 2_! ~~ f6.ll 

44 I ............. I I I nu.-n,.:1,u IOlntment.burntreacment,anestheti~loL,each ( I I I I I I I h446823 I S14.1,?J 31X13-3SUX)001 I Sl.66 j I 
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ADVANCED MED

SURG. CONCEPTS 
EMPIRE MEDICAL 

SOLUTIONS 

FIRST AID SUPPLIES BID 2020-2021 

PYRAMI D SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS QUILL 
ZHOU MEDICAL 
SOLUTIONS 

Item # Est. Qty, Commodity Code D~crlptlon • Product Number Unit Price Product Number Unit Price Product Number Unit Price Product Number Unit Price Product Number Unit Price Product Number Unlt Prke 
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HEA-10745 OrthodontlcWv. NoBld _9007974 58.24 

HEA-10420 

0toscope-Relster orequlvi1lent{notp!o1stlc)withl 

-+-~=~----F"="="'~"=''=•=wi="="'="~''=-'='=''=''=a=''=~=u="='"="'---<>----------+-----+------+-------+------+----~------+~-1:'-B=ld----;------t~tttN~---+---=''=oo=."'+------< 
+-===--r'=••~••~"'~'•="~''•~•~"~"•~•'~•~••~l~St~••~,S~O/b='~' - --,f-----<------t------t--------t------;------+-----e-----l"'~""'"'----+-----l!~"''°'-----,,----SS7.15,_ ___ _, HEA-10450 

Pads,san!tary,max!-pad,wilh adheslvestrlp, 
lndlvldtia llywrapped tofltmach!nes(DtialVendor, 

HEA-10460 +-===--+""'""'"""''-"'""'""'''"''""'''"·'-''""O"'S·,cl-2,ccSJ"', '"so,.,,,""''"-' - --,f-----+------+------+------FM'-'T4'----;---~S30.98t----- +------l·'='="~' - --+------F-"='G=U~A'='=' --;-___ S53.001-----< 
+-===+'~"~lig~ht~, '~'"=""bl~••="'="=AAA=b•=n~"~'"'-'' •~"~h ~~f-----;------t------J--------t------;------j208714PET __ -+----~7.:1~. No Bid 354 $2.42f-----J HEA-10470 

Pero:tlde, Hydrogen3%5olutlon,plastlccontalner,16 
HEA-10480 

HEA-10490 
+====-•=•·•="="'~-----------<>---------- +-----+------+-------+------+-------;----->"'~"="~---+-----<ll2-706~9 __ __,_ ___ ~S.!!·.~?.t-----l 
+ -===--r'"'"''-"''"''"ecmc,,l<•=,IIY,c,,Oc,cOL,cl""'-'''-"'"'"----~~-+------+--- - -+------+------,f-----<------+-----+------f"'"-''=;d,_ __ -+ ____ -lc,PlO,_ ___ ...;.. ___ _;SJ=·'ol. , -----< 

HEA-10825 

HEA-10550 

Salineforrinslngcontactlenses,contactsolullon,2 

--t--"""-"'cc'--t';"!:j•1=;:c,;~=,-,,,-,.-.A,-u-,.""',,,-.,-",-h------,f-----+------+-----+------+------+-----+-----;-----l··:!··:=::'----i------l:;.~,;;;,:·lomblnc!Va! ... --... - ... --... ;.;.:.;;,f-----l 

Shampoowlthcomb,pedlCt1llcldetreatment,kl!!sllce 
HEA-10520 -t---====f"='='"=·'·~·~· i' '~"~0~"="·~'="1·•'='='"----t-----1-----+-----+-----+ ----+-----+------+-----1··No,Bld~---+-----1113108Sc_ __ -+----S9.76f------l 

Solutlon,eyewash,sterllelsotonlcformula,cleanses 
lrrltatedeyes, removeslooseforelgnmaterlal,helps 
relieve Irritation, stinging & Itching, )II 01., BOTTLE 

HEA-10560 

HEA-10570 

+-====-: =~UST~11,=~~=:=11!=~'=t:=,,=~:=:.=c:=:~~~:=~=,,-,.-,,-orr-,-,--+------+------+-----+-----<----->-----+-----+------<··lOS5311~--+---~s6.93 1981&~---+---~"~·',' ------l 

-t---===--FM'-"US;'-T-"HAe,V,"-'S,,cCRe,EW"-"OF=F;CA,cP,~H,cd,"-,,===+------!------+-----+-----f-----f-----+------J-------F"°'-''"'"'----+-----+'""'-'28'----!----$'2.16f------j 
Snellen eye chart {wall chart), 22" ll 11", RED/GREEN 

HEA-10875 -t---=="-'---+"'O"'L""OR,.,Be.,AR,,.s ________ -t-----f-----+-----,f-----+-----+-----+------1-----l·NoBld,_ __ -+-----tTMlOSOc_ __ -+----·ss.211-----l 

Sponges,gau1e,orgeneraluse,non-ster!!e,llply, 
HEA-10610 +--===--J"'"ccdl>c,ldcc"'511vc,'Wc,"=""''"-''"'00""'/"c,'":"",,c8•ec•2,._""-''''-"--+------!------+-----+-----f-----f-----+------J-------l l332812, ___ +---~~~&?. ?,9:.~.~.?.~.;lc_ __ f-___ ,Sl.391------J 

Sponges,gauie,orgencral11se,non-sterl!e,l2ply, 
60 " HEA-10620 1-=---a-==-<~==~""'"='"=''="'~"'="="="''=·'=oo=''"="="'="=•'="=''="---+-----~-----+-----+---- -<-----1-----+-----------+~·~~~~="~-----~~~:!.~. 6n2 Sl.o,_ ___ ____, 

f--"---,--'---!-'=='-1"""'"'-'"""ttl=i,s,,1,,,1,~·•"'"~s,,,o/cebo,c• _____ -+-----+-----+-----+-----t-----f-----t------+------1~•~M!ld ~~~~•-----;----=S2B.86,_ ___ -; 61 HEA-10630 

Stethoscopes,adfustableblnaur3Jsforcomfonable 
flt,exce!!entso11ndtr.1nsmlss!on,!!ghtwelgh1,2rl01 

f--''"-' --,--,-'---l-'"='A"'·l,cD64ccO,_.,, .. "'" '"''-"""''''----------+-----+-----+-----+------,-----f-----+------+------l201080,.,_2 ___ f-__ _,,s,,,,,.,,.,,.., .. '","""'"'-' ----+- ---'''-'2~, ... ~?.,----....... 

f--'''-' --,,-~-1~"='A=·'=·'="'-tc'"="c;T=•m~•"="c'"'c;c";-c•~lh="=m'=m="=";c· W=•='"'~·A~ll,c.",,.,-+-----+------+-----+------,-----f-----i-----+-----+ "="="'----+------lo1690"'·'=00'----+----""=""'·',• -----l 
Sure Temp Plus Thermometer probe covers, 1000 In 

,-~•=• ---a!-="~-,.....~"='A=·l=07=9D~l-"bo=•-----------;-----+-----+-----+------+------+------+------+-----tNE• .. ~,~ld----+-------+'•=so=31=·'='•~---+---=S47.081----...-, 
Sure Temp Plus 690, Welch-A llyn Oral Probe with 

>-=-i!-~-+~"='A=·'="="~f'p'=""'=W=•l=I ---------;-----+-----+-----+------+------+------+------+-----;e-''°='="~---+------+0=28=9=3-000=----+---~$103.561-___ ..._, 
Tampons, lndlvldually boxed, regular size, Tampax or 

f--'"~+~'-+~"=EA=·'='"°=--+c''"=''·='oo='=-~,,..------,,c-----,---,-----1------+------+-----; =TSOO==---+---='"=·="t''="="='---+--~s64,36 No Bid 
Tape, clear, flm aid, transparent roll, Oermallte 

7301002500 $63.70 

hypoa!!ergenlcpapertape,J&Jll'S115orequal,Wx 

f--'"'"--+~~+~"=EA,c,·lcc06,c70,_t'lD"'y"'""''''-'''"'""-'~-~~~~---+------+------+-----!-------,-----!-----+-----+-----+"=''="'----+-----l l01665S,_ __ -+-__ ~s9.62,_ ___ -; 
f--'"~+~'-+~"=EA=·'='"=•'-r-T•~P~•·"'"'"''""''"="=w'="'~·'~·~··~,="=''·"'""'"-~--,-----r------+-----,f------+------+--- ---+-----+------,1"'~"=;',_ __ -+ ____ -lwPsS100ST Sl.OOt-----1 

Tape,mlcropore,generalpurposepapertape,hypo-
allergenlc, gentle to the skin, very porous, l" ll 10 

f--''"-'---,-'---+-'""'EA"'·lec06""9D'-l"'""''""''-"""""'""'''b""'-~~~~-~c--l--,--- -t------+------+------+-----+-----+-----l------,1"'=""'"'-- --+------+'"''"'0-""l----+---~s7.62t------l 
Tape,specialty,dermlcel,doth,hypo-allergenlt,l" ll 

,-~7~•-!-~-+~H=EA=·l=D7=00~1-"lD= " =''~•l,_2,=ol~l• _______ -;!-----t------t------+------+------+------+-----f----,-f'-'N'-o8=1d~---+-----11012323~---J----~'='0=.37D--,-----j 

Towelenes,BenzalkonlumChlorideantlseptic. 
71 37 HEA-10730 lndividu;1 llywrapoed,Vlr0No:t-9or Equal,SOO/case No Bid 1126735 $10.851-----< 

f-~7.,_2_f-~-!~HeeEACc·l'-"07cc•o,_f'W"'l~~'-'''°''"'-'=~l,~~,o«"•~l,~g,,~lO~/bo=•-----,--,----r------t------t--------t------l------l7l282~---;----~~H~. N!'.=Bld'------+------,-""~-OOe,2~--+---=Sl.SOt-----l 

l--''-'-'-l--'---+----'""'EA:,o·l,,,00"2S'-f'w""""''"'"""""'""""""''"''"..,_, .,_,s,,_•..,_,"'l/'-8"_,,l•nPPc.,'""'''m"'•"'"""''l-+--,----1------+------+------+------+-----+-----1-------Jf"N'-""'"'----+-----l!21.l,_ ___ t-__ -"'s,"'2.c:,••'t-------l 

,. 250 HE'A-11355 Vin l~gloves,latexfree,smaU, 100/SOX GPVFO.~l ___ ,_ __ ~$9.50 PPENG0002145~-+---$14.99 VSM200 ___ +-___ S7.99+-----+-----•~ .~ .. ~!d~----+-- ---t'0005~F---+---~$12.87t-----< 

Vlnyl~glovM,latHfree,med!um, 

---~'~' -!-'"000~-+-~"=EA~·'="='°'--->='oo=''=ox~---------il-"GP=V~F0,_2 ---+---~$9.50 PPENG0003147~--1----~S1~,.99 VMD200 E:22t-----+------F"'~'="----+-------+'~00=1•~•---+---~~.g.s1 

76 1000 HEA-11365 Vin I __ .,_, __ free glovts, Latex free, large 100/BOX GPVF030 ___ --t----~$9.SO PPENG0004148 $14.99 VLG200 $7,9.21-----+------I NoBl,_d ---+-----• Z90=l=SF~---+---~S}l.:.~l1---- -l 

f-..!.7.!..7_.___,,soo"--+--'H!!eEA:,o·l,cBe,68,__j-'V"'l,'"l-_,w<""'••·••e.s,••:,;l°',e"o,•l:e•toe,.>"'fros:,o,c:,,l,::."B'->'•cel,:OOi.,/8,:,0X~l•••GPc:Vc,FD4:,_ __ -t-----'~2J9. r.~t~ia'°OOO'°S"'l4"'9-+-___ Sa,l=,0.9"9f'VX"'U"'OO"-----i----~S.?.:22t-----+------FNoe..,Bc.,ld ___ _,_ ____ --1'2"'3D"S-----+----'S'-"12"'.8"17f-----j 
f--''"-' -f--"----,----'H!!eEAcc·l'-"13"-70'---f"N°"""'''"''''"'-'"""'°'"•e,,t,c"le,clo ______ __,f-----+------t------J--------t------t------+-----!-----f"N~oBe,ld~---+-----/~19~12~21~---f---~$10.61f------j 

79 HEA-1137S NosecllD.latexfree No81d 64019 531.).~t-----< 

t=j:i:==t=jt=j=j:§::r:!1!:tt:~t=f~t::~:0~:r~~Q'.:'."1
'.::
1 ================jt=========t=========!=========~=========j~=========t=========!=========:1=========::ir.~~=0~~=5~~::""'---_-_-_-_-_ ....... -_-_-_-_-_-..,s:::,:::.,c::_,,:1::::::::~~:-,::::::::::::.:1;::::::::::7s1!::~~f------l I ZHOUPAC-l<IT 

I CONTAINS 57 PC. VS. 

U 10 HEA-11390 Flrstald klt lHU 514.88 2003340 $22.61 ~~----+----~''='·=-03 5).UILL 107PC. 
a3 1 HEA-11395 Soorts la!Ml114",c10vards !!~-~id 130827 574,101------l 

l---'~"-,-f--"----,----':"'::":~""~:=:'---+":""::r"'~i:""":'"::ec';ccdl~ec~s.,,ph";a:u,,,::e-.v., ~,,-,------,f-----+------+------+------+------+------+-----;-----+:•;·~i:----+------t':~:~=,----.----'S~::~:1---- -< 

86 HEA-11450 Castll~Soa TowelettH ,NoBld 041900 $3.641------l 

'---''"-' -'---'----J----'""''Acc•l,,c14,,c00'---"'""'"'"·'""'"'"''-'"'"""""""''m~l,,._,u.,,,",,,'•cc•cc"""-'------J'------~----~ ----~----~ -----+-----~ ----~----~NoB!d~--~----~ 104882~5 --~---~St.77~---~ 
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Item# Est, Qty. Commodity Code Descript ion 

ADVANCED MED

SURG. CONCEPTS 

Product Number Unit Pr ice 

EMPIRE MEDICAL 

SOLUTIONS 

Product Number 

FIRST AID SUPPLIES BI D 2020-2021 

Unit Price 

PYRAMID SCHOOL 
PRODUCTS 

Product Number Unit Pr ice 

QUILL SCHOOL SPECIALTY 

Product Number Unit Price Product Number Unit Price 

ZHOU MEDICAL 

SOLUTIONS 

Product Number 

NOTES 

Unit Pr ice 

..-~"~-t-~~-+-~"=EA~·l=l4=05~r'~·•=5~"=''=''=•=b'="'=" =''=''="c"'"='w~•="~---+------+-----...... -----+-----+l-------'-----i1Q2!!tl~---;----Sl.8'i' 'i,i~'Bid="·_· ---+-----· _· ·•· ~iooo.·=· i9.iiQ9.2=··· _ _,.·_ .... _ ... _ ... _ .... _ .... _ ... ·_····=so=:sc;, _· ------< 
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Dlsinfectan1/Cleaner Wipes t hat an be used on hud 
non-poroussurfaces&vinyl. Must beeffective 

against MRSA, HIV•l, norovirus, He~titls A, 8 & C, TB 
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DISTRICT APPROVED 
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106 so CloroxD!slnfectl11.1WI es, EPARe ,#5813-79 No Bid NOBID NO,B=IO~--• 
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S~nl-Cloth Prime Germ!c!d~! Disposable Wipe, EPA 
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llS soo ~~-t-----J-''='"="="=' =Sh~l•=ld•=Ad="=" - ----- -t------t---~$299.00 PPE•~F5=000=1=11=6--+----$2.99 FS-020-01 $1.791-----+------r'°='="----+------Jf=M=·lO"'S ___ _,__ __ ~$6.50 ZHOU BIO A BOXOFS 

lsolatlonBarrlerGown, wlth e lastlc wrists, dlsposable 
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SafetyG1asses withslde shlelds,able tobewornover 
117 30 
11B 
-i-=-i----F""'°''"'==","""'by'-';i,,""'-11~=---- - --,J------+------f'"-'""'G"'GOOO=l,_,ll'-7 -->---~'='·="'f'="=°''----'---~•1=·'•' IF""-""'"'----!----~~!:!fl 13683-48 

Recoverv Couch, n •L x 27-29"W x 2rH 1469003 
Top Hu Sp«lmen/U rine Collector, white, no lld,25 

Sl.071--- ----f----"N"-O,ca,o'l-------i 
5520.00 3713-1"-0---t---~S940.00J------j 

119 -l--'--l----Fw"""'"'-==~---------t------f------+- - - --t------,l-----t--- --+------t------FN"-oB"ld'----+-----+'-'11='2S"'B1"-o----jJ----~S10.27J------j 
Petroleum JellyS klnProtectant, slngle usepackets, 

120 ,o ~~-+-----+"1~'4='°=""~'-------- - -+------+-----+-----+-- ---+l------+----- +------+-------<·1493641~--+---~$18.00 8884433200 __ +---~'~"~·•"-ial-------t 
Vomit/Emesls bag. single use w ith easy sul, late~ 
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O~wer Orgilnlzer, 6 comp;utment, 2.s• height 
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100 HEA-11505 Thermometer, Verld lan 09-349 lnfrared Forehead 

THE FOLLOWING VENDORS WERE CONSIDERED NON-COMPLI ANT FOR PAYMENT TERMS ANO/OR 

MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS FOR FREE SHIPPING: BSN SPORTS, PERFORMANCE HEALTH, SCHOOL 

HEALTH CORPORATION, ANO SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY. 

• NO BIOS ARE HIGHLIG HTED IN BLUE 

CATALOG DISCOUNT: .. 
RECOMMENDATION: THE KCSO BOARD OF EDUCATION AWARD THE BIO AS INDICATED IN THE HIGH LI GHTED CEUS. 

CATALOG DISCOUNT: 

•• 

21563 525.98 
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CATALOG DISCOUNT: 

"" 
CATALOG DISCOUNT: 

"" 

2039590 $65,37 AET-RlBl 

CATALOG DISCOU NT: 

14-29" 

$30.00 

CATALOG DISCOUNT: 

10-20" 

~--' 
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