JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

COMMENTS:

BID TABULATION
7902

October 27, 2020

AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR PARTS & SERVICE (%) Supplement

October 08, 2020

From October 27, 2020 through June 30, 2021

No renewal option.

An * indicates an award.



Vendor Response Terms

| Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Net 30

Service)

Diesel Injection Service Co. Inc. 1 day delivery on In Stock Items - Out of stock Net 10th
items 2-3 days

Kentuckiana Auto and Truck Supply Kentuckiana Auto & Truck Supply 2107 NET 30
Production Drive Louisville, KY 40299 (502)
272-3761 NET 30

Kirk's Automotive, Inc. Net 30 Net 30

NAPA AUTO PARTS NAPA Auto Parts 211 E College St Louisville, 2%10net30

KY 40203 (A) yes (B) no

Palmer Trucks/Kenworth Of Louisville

all response's sent to Donald S.

payment net30

Uhl Truck Sales

Whayne Supply

1A) YES 1B) NO 2) 10001 LINN STATION RD.

LOUISVILLE, KY 40223 3) 10001 LINN
STATION RD. LOUISVILLE, KY 40223 4) 7
DAYS 5) 6) W9 ATTACHED



ITEM NO. 1 - Captive Dealer Item: Cummins. (4600020-2014078)

AWARD NOTES: Reject Uhl Truck Sales and Palmer Trucks/Kenworth of Louisville - did not submit price sheets for
evaluation.

CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off manufacturer's list prices for any and all items listed
in dealer's catalog(s).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Uhl Truck Sales 35.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Palmer Trucks/Kenworth Of Louisville 34.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) 33.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Cummins Inc is providing our "dealer" pricing, which is a fluctuation of
31%-36% off of MSRP.
Diesel Injection Service Co. Inc. 29.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES: In many cases Bosch is the original equipment manufacturer on fuel
system parts (fuel injectors and pumps) as well as Doser and Supply
Modules for Urea system. When Cummins may have certain product on
backorder, we can supply the original parts we stock in Bosch.
Similarly, Holset is the manufacturer on Cummins turbochargers and
Actuators, when supplies are not available from Cummins, we may have
Holset stock available as well, sometimes at lower cost!
Whayne Supply 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 2 - Non-Dealer Engine Parts and Hardware (new) OEM Standards for Cars and Trucks, (4600020-1715985)
AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Kentuckiana Auto and Truck Supply as low bidder based on total of evaluation items.

CATEGORY NOTES: with diesel or gasoline engine. Approved Brands: AC, Airtex, ASC, Balkamp, Borg-Warner, Carter,
Cloyes, Dana, Federal-Mogul, Fel-Pro, Fram, Hastings, Microtest, Motorcraft, Muskegon, NAPA,
Perfect Circle, Seal Power, Standard, Sterling and Victor. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount
rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Engine Parts

and Hardware (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Kentuckiana Auto and Truck Supply 60.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: AC Delco Water Pumps
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: BIDDING NAPA #43315 AND #45007
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 3 - Non-Dealer Engine Gaskets (new). (4600020-1716000)

Note: * indicates a pending award. 3



CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brand: Fel-Pro. NO SUBSTITUTE. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off
published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Engine Gaskets
(new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND

NAME(S).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 4 - Non-Dealer lgnition Parts (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1716017)

CATEGORY NOTES: Premium Line Only (All tune-up items). Approved Brands: Borg-Warner, Delco, Motorcraft, Prestolite
and Standard. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all
items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Ignition Parts (new). Please respond to the following in

the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: NAPA Echlin
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 5 - Non-Dealer Mufflers for Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks and Buses (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1716028)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published
price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Mufflers (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 70.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: BIDDING NAPA 22551 AND NAPA 22888
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 6 - Non-Dealer Exhaust Pipes for Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks and Buses (new), (4600020-1716029)

CATEGORY NOTES: OEM Standards. Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount
rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Exhaust

Pipes (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 70.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award. 4
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CATEGORY NOTES:

Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service)

.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 7 - Non-Dealer Mufflers for Cars, Light Trucks and Vans (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1718575)
CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published
price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Mufflers (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 70.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00 %
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 8 - Non-Dealer Exhaust Pipes for Cars, Light Trucks and Vans (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1718576)
CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published
price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Exhaust Pipes (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 70.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: BIDDING NAPA #46704,44868,43483
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 9 - Non-Dealer Exhaust Hangers (new), OEM Standards. (4600020-1716031)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: NAPA and Walker. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published

price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Exhaust Hangers (new).
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 70.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Bidding NAPA #35460 and NAPA # 35103
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Note: * indicates a pending award. 5



ITEM NO. 10 - Non-Dealer Suspension Parts (new). (4600020-1716046)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Moog and NAPA. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price
sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Suspension Parts (new). Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 11 - Non-Dealer Wheels and Hardware (new) for Cars, Trucks and Buses. (4600020-1716054)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Accuride, Euclid, Hayes, Leland, NAPA, NWRA, National Rim, Perfect, Rema,
Schrader and Vipar. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any
and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Wheels and Hardware (new). Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 12 - Non-Dealer Valve Stems for Tubeless Rims (new) for Cars, Trucks and Buses. (4600020-1716057)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Accuride, Haltec, Hayes, Leland, NAPA, Perfect, Rema, Schrader and Vipar.
Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in
your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Valve Stems for Tubeless Rims (new). Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 13 - Non-Dealer Axle Seals (new). (4600020-1716060)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brands: Chicago Rawhide. NO SUBSTITUTE. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate
off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Axle Seals (new).
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Palmer Trucks/Kenworth Of Louisville 12.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: C/IR
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award. 6



CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 14 - Non-Dealer Automatic and Manual Transmission Repair Parts for Cars and Trucks. Ford. (4600020-1716082)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTES: GOOD USED AND RECONDITIONED HARD PARTS ARE ACCEPTABLE. VENDORS
MUST FURNISH PRICE SHEETS ON ALL ITEMS THEY ARE QUOTING. Enter ONLY ONE
percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for
Non-Dealer Ford Automatic and Manual Transmission Parts. Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00 %
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 15 - Non-Dealer Automatic and Manual Transmission Repair Parts for Cars and Trucks. GM. (4600020-1716080)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: NOTES: GOOD USED AND RECONDITIONED HARD PARTS ARE ACCEPTABLE. VENDORS
MUST FURNISH PRICE SHEETS ON ALL ITEMS THEY ARE QUOTING. Enter ONLY ONE
percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for
Non-Dealer GM Automatic and Manual Transmission Parts. Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND NAME(S).

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 16 - Spark Plugs (new). AC Delco. NO SUBSTITUTE. (1343540-2002112)

CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in

your catalog(s) for Spark Plugs (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: MANUFACTURER'S NAME.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 60.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Kentuckiana Auto and Truck Supply

52.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: AC Delco
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00 %
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 17 - Spark Plugs (new). Motorcraft. NO SUBSTITUTE. (1343540-2002113)

Note: * indicates a pending award. 7



CATEGORY NOTES: Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price sheet for any and all items listed in

your catalog(s) for Spark Plugs (new). Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: MANUFACTURER'S NAME.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: MOTORCRAFT
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 18 i Non-Dealer Hydrualic Brake Parts and Hardware (new), OEM standards. (4600020-2010120)

CATEGORY NOTES: Approved Brand: Wagner. Or equal. Enter ONLY ONE percentage of discount rate off published price
sheet for any and all items listed in your catalog(s) for Non-Dealer Hydraulic Brake Parts and
Hardware. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: BRAND

NAME (S).
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
NAPA AUTO PARTS 65.00 % *

CATEGORY NOTES:
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. 1.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Bidding NAPA #UP 37337,#NB 4885740 , #ND 4401652
Cummins Inc. (DBA Cummins Sales & Service) .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Note: * indicates a pending award. 8



