THE KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

1055 EATON DRIVE, FORT WRIGHT, KENTUCKY 41017

TELEPHONE: (859) 344-8888 / FAX: (859) 344-1531

WEBSITE: www.kenton.kyschools.us

| 1t’s about ALL Rids. Dr. Henry Webb, Superintendent of Schools

KCSD ISSUE PAPER

DATE:
10/05/20

AGENDA ITEM (ACTION ITEM):

Consider/Approve awarding of the Covid-19 Testing Program Bid to Advanced Diagnostics as indicated
on the Covid-19 Testing Program Tabulation beginning on October 6, 2020. Pricing may be renegotiated
every 6-months, and if agreed upon by both parties, this agreement may be extended up to 1 additional 6
month period.

APPLICABLE BOARD POLICY:
Fiscal Management 04.32 AP.1

HISTORY/BACKGROUND:

The Board voted at the regular meeting on September 14,2020 to reject all proposals for the Covid-19
Testing Program Request for Proposals, and issue a new request for proposals that more closely reflects
the estimated testing volume. An advertisement to accept sealed proposals for a Covid-19 Testing
Program was posted on the district website on September 15, 2020. Proposals were received and publicly
opened on Tuesday, September 22, 2020.

FISCAL/BUDGETARY IMPACT:
Unable to calculate based upon unknown future utilization.

RECOMMENDATION:

Approval to award the Covid-19 Testing Program RFP to Advanced Diagnostics as indicated on the Covid-
19 Testing Program Tabulation beginning on October 6, 2020. Pricing may be renegotiated every 6-
months, and if agreed upon by both parties, this agreement may be extended up to 1 additional 6 month
period.

CONTACT PERSON:
David Lloyd :ﬂ/ M
Principal DtstrtctAdmmtstrato Stéermtendent

Use this form to submit your request to the Superintendent for items to be added to the Board Meeting Agenda.
Principal —complete, print, sign and send to your Director. Director —if approved, sign and put in the Superintendent’s mailbox.

Kenton County Board of Education

Board Members: Carl Wicklund, Chairperson Karen L. Collins, Vice Chairperson Carla Egan Shannon Herold Jesica Jehn
“The Kenton County Board of Education provides Equal Education & Employment Opportunities.”



THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
COVID-19 TESTING PROGRAM TABULATION

Advanced Gravity

ITEM DESCRIPTION Diagnostics Ethos Genetworx Diagnostics Health Quest NLC
Bid Prices - PCR Test
20 Pooled Tests of 5 Individuals 1,160.00 3,200.00 No Bid No Bid 1,300.00 3,000.00
5 Individual Tests 300.00] 300.00 400.00 245.00 325.00 325.00
Total Cost of Tests 1,460.00 3,500.00 No Bid No Bid 1,625.00 3,325.00
Cost Score 75.00] -29.79 No Bid No Bid 66.52 -20.80
Quality of Service (15 Points Possible) 8.50) 10.50 12.50 8.00 9.00 4.00
Reference Score (10 Points Possible) 10.00] 10.00 9.50 10.00 10.00 9.50

Total Score - PCR Tests 93.50] -9.29 22.00 18.00 85.52 -7.30

Page 1 of 2



THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
COVID-19 TESTING PROGRAM TABULATION

Advanced Gravity

ITEM DESCRIPTION Diagnostics Ethos Genetworx Diagnostics Health Quest NLC
Bid Prices - Antigen Test
20 Pooled Tests of 5 Individuals No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Individual Tests No Bid No Bid No Bid 24500 No Bid 135.00
Total Cost of Tests No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cost Score No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Quality of Service (15 Points Possible) No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.33 No Bid No Bid
Reference Score (10 Points Possible) No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00 No Bid No Bid

Total Score - Antigen Tests No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Note: The bids listed below were not considered:
The Fulgent Labs bid was received past the deadline.
Eurofins submitted a bid on-time but qualified it that they would be unable to provide 24 hour turn around.

l | - Recommended as the best evaluated bid.
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