JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

COMMENTS:

BID TABULATION
7862

July 21, 2020

LARGE LUNCHROOM EQUIPMENT (Percentage)

June 16, 2020

From July 25, 2020 through July 24, 2021

Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.

An * indicates an award.



Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

n/a

Net 30

Dine Company

Respond within 48 hours of receipt of PO.
Delivery to be made within 6 weeks of receipt
of PO.

Net 30

Manning Brothers Food Equip

All discounts include inbound freight, delivery,
uncrating and setting in place ready for
connections by others. Training for staff is
also included when requested

net 30 days



ITEM NO. 1 - ADVANCED TABACO (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 54.50 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 41.70 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 2 - ALTO SHAM (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 34.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Dine Company 28.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 12.70 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 3 - ALVEY (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID. Could not get Price List from manufacturer. They consider all
their products as custom pieces.
Manning Brothers Food Equip .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID or LIST PRICE available

ITEM NO. 4 - APW WYOTT (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 51.00% *

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
Note: * indicates a pending award. 3



for final connections by others.

Dine Company

45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 43.10 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 5 - BAXTER (NO SUBSTITUTE)
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 20.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 6.40 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 6 - BEVERAGE AIR (NO SUBSTITUTE)
AWARD NOTES: Tie bid broken by awarding to the local vendor, Dine Company.
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 62.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Dine Company 62.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 58.22 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 7 - BSI (BDESIGNS) (NO SUBSTITUTE)
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Manning Brothers Food Equip 30.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 18.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready

for final connections by others.
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ITEM NO. 8 - BSI| CROWD CONTROL (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Manning Brothers Food Equip 30.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 12.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.

ITEM NO. 9 - CARTER HOFFMAN (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Dine Company 45.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 43.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 39.80 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects inbound freight, delivery, uncrating and setting in place
ready for installation and utility connections by others and training if
requested

ITEM NO. 10 - CHAMPION (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Manning Brothers Food Equip 28.10% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects inbound freight, delivery, uncrating and setting in place
ready for installation and utility connections by others and training if
requested
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 28.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Dine Company 25.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 11 - CLEVELAND (NO SUBSTITUTE)

Note: * indicates a pending award. 5



CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 55.00 % *

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready

for final connections by others.

Manning Brothers Food Equip 51.35 %

CATEGORY NOTES:
Dine Company 47.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 12 - COLDSELL (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 200% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: No response from Factory - no bid

ITEM NO. 13 - CONVOTHERM (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 51.50% *
CATEGORY NOTES: C&T Designs gives you an extra 1 yr. warranty, for a total of 4 yrs.

Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready

for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 51.35%

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 14 - CRES CORE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 46.00% *

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
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Manning Brothers Food Equip 43.52 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company 41.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 15 - DELFIELD (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 52.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: C&T Design can also provide an additional year warranty on Delfield
Serving Counters (Total of 2 years.) Includes freight, unloading,
uncrating, training and setting in place ready for final connections by
others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 51.34 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Dine Company 50.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 16 - DUKE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 53.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Dine Company 45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 43.57 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 17 - EAGLE GROUP (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 56.00 % *

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.

Note: * indicates a pending award. 7



Dine Company

50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 47.63 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 18 - FEDERAL INDUSTRIES (NO SUBSTITUTE)
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 54.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 49.20 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 19 - HATCO (NO SUBSTITUTE)
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Dine Company 39.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 38.20 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Please note that the price list file from Hatco was in excess of 33KB
and server would not accept the large file. It will be mailed before time of
bid opening
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 38.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
ITEM NO. 20 - HOBART (NO SUBSTITUTE)
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 33.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 26.16 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Note: * indicates a pending award. 8



ITEM NO. 21 - INSINGER (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 2550% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 22 - JOHN BOOS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 57.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Dine Company 45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 44.21 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 23 - LAKESIDE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 48.50 % *

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready

for final connections by others.

Manning Brothers Food Equip 48.30 %

CATEGORY NOTES:
Dine Company 45.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 24 - LOW TEMP INDUSTRIES (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

Note: * indicates a pending award. 9



PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME

OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 54.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: C&T Design is included an additional 1 yr. warranty on all products,
which gives you a total of a 2 yr. warranty. Includes freight, unloading,
uncrating, training and setting in place ready for final connections by
others.
Dine Company 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 35.20 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 25 - MANITOWOC (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Dine Company 55.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 53.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 48.23 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 26 - METRO (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Manning Brothers Food Equip 4580 % *

CATEGORY NOTES:
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 42.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready

for final connections by others.

Dine Company 38.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 27 - MOD U SERVE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.
CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

Note: * indicates a pending award. 10



PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME

OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID. Could not get Price List from manufacturer. They consider all
their products as custom pieces.
Manning Brothers Food Equip .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 28 - MULTITERIA (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID. Could not get Price List from manufacturer. They consider all
their products as custom pieces.
Manning Brothers Food Equip .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID - NO LIST PRICE

ITEM NO. 29 - NEW AGE INDUSTRIAL (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 35.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 34.80 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 30 - PANASONIC (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 5450 % *

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready

for final connections by others.

Manning Brothers Food Equip 54.22 %

CATEGORY NOTES:
Dine Company 54.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Note: * indicates a pending award. 11




ITEM NO. 31 - PREMIER FOOD SHIELDS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.
CATEGORY NOTES:

Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID. Could not get Price List from manufacturer. They consider all
their products as custom pieces.
Manning Brothers Food Equip .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 32 - RATIONAL (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 39.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: C&T Design provides an additional year warranty on parts and labor, for
a total of 3 year warranty. Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training
and setting in place ready for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 26.17 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 33 - ROBOT COUPE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Dine Company 19.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 17.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 8.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 34 - SOUTHBEND (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

Note: * indicates a pending award. 12



PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME

OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 53.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: C&T Design will give you an extra 1 yr. warranty for a total of 2 yr.
warranty. Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in
place ready for final connections by others.
Dine Company 52.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 45.70 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 35 - STORTECH (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 15.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 36 - STRUCTURAL CONCEPTS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 54.50 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Dine Company 50.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 38.40 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 37 - T & S BRASS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 48.00 % *

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Note: * indicates a pending award. 13



Manning Brothers Food Equip

45.24 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Dine Company 40.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
ITEM NO. 38 - TRAULSEN (NO SUBSTITUTE)
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 62.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 49.05 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
ITEM NO. 39 - VERSA GUARD (NO SUBSTITUTE)
AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID. Could not get Price List from manufacturer. They consider all
their products as custom pieces.
Manning Brothers Food Equip .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No response from factory rep
ITEM NO. 40 - VULCAN HART (NO SUBSTITUTE)
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Dine Company 55.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 54.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Manning Brothers Food Equip 52.21 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Note: * indicates a pending award. 14



ITEM NO. 41 - WIN-HOLT (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Manning Brothers Food Equip 36.20 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Dine Company 36.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 35.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.

ITEM NO. 42 - WARING (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Manning Brothers Food Equip 43.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 40.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.
Dine Company 40.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 43 - WINSTON (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to

install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 56.50 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Includes freight, unloading, uncrating, training and setting in place ready
for final connections by others.

Dine Company 50.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

Manning Brothers Food Equip 49.26 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Note: * indicates a pending award. 15



