Henderson Coun@ Sehools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www .henderson.kyschools.us

To: Marganna Stanley, Superintendent
And School Board Members

From: Cindy Cloutier W

Director of Finance

Date: June 20, 2020
Re: Bid Recommendations
Bid Recommendations:

Fleet Insurance Bid # 6-20-5-5
Liability Insurance Bid # 8-20-5-5
Property Insurance Bid # 7-20-5-5

Invitations were sent to Double Eagle Insurance, EJ Mabry Insurance, EM Ford Insurance, Field &
Main Insurance, and Vaughan Insurance. Provisions were included in the RFP as recommended by
the Department of Insurance stating all agents and/or companies were welcome and encouraged to
submit proposals. EM Ford was the only company that returned a bid. We are recommending the
contract for Fleet, Liability, and Property Insurance be awarded to EM Ford.

New or Retread Tires & Tubes # 9-20-5-6

Invitations were sent to Best One Fleet Service, Purcell Tire Service, and Raben Tire & Auto
Service. Best One Fleet Service and Purcell Tire Service returned bids. Best One did not bid on
Goodyear tires and Purcell Tire did not bid on Firestone tires. We are recommending the bid be
awarded to both Best One Fleet Service and Purcell Tire Service. This allows us to purchase all of
the listed tires at the best price.

Equal Educational and Employment Institution




Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second Street
Henderson, Kentucky 42420

TABULATION SHEET FLEET INSURANCE

BID # 6-20-5-5
May 13, 2020
Double Eagle
VENDOR Insurance E.J. Mabry E.M.Ford Field & Main Vaughan Insurance
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
INSURANCE COMPANY NAME Liberty Mutual
Auto Liability Combined Single Limit Coverage
$2,000,000 Limits $213,662.00
Non-Owned Liability
$2,000,000 Limits Included
Hired Liability
$2,000,000 Limits Included
Personal Injury Protection
$20,000 Limits Included
Uninsured Motorists
$500,000 Limits Included
Underinsured Motorists
$500,000 Limits Included
Comprehensive
$500 Deductable Included
Collision
$1,000 Deductable Included
Hired Car Physical Damage
$50,000 Limits included
Auto Extension Endorsement
Total Number of Insured Units - 145
Grand Total Automobile Premium $213,662.00
Contact Chris Zollman Gary Mabry Mike Hazelwood Bill Latta Nibby Priest
Address 420 Main Street 422 N Elm St. 2111 US Hwy 41 N 201-B N. Main St. 315 North Main St.
Evansville, IN 47708| Henderson, KY 42420 |Henderson, KY 42420 |Henderson, KY 42420|Henderson, KY 42420
Phone 270-471-3800 270-827-4102 270-830-8877 270-827-3542 270-827-3505
Fax 1-866-615-3464 270-826-1065 270-831-2432
chris@doubleeaglei | gary@eimabryinsurance.co |mhazelwood@emford.co
E-mail nsurance.com m m nibby@govaughn.com

abaumaart@double
eagleinsurance.com




Henderson County Board of Education
1806 Second Street
Henderson, KY 42420

Tabulation Sheet Liability Insurance

Bid # 8-20-5-5
May 13, 2020
Double Eagle
Vendor Insurance E. J. Mabry EM Ford Field & Main Vaughan Insurance
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Insurance Carrier Name
Liberty Mutual
General Liability Insurance
Annual Premium $91,581.00
Educator's Legal Liability Insurance
Annual Premium See Attachment
Umbrella Liability Insurance Annual
Premium $62,392.00
TRIA $2,040.00
Rate Guaranteed Annually
Annual Instaliment
Rate Guaranteed 3 years
3 Year Instaliment
Grand Total Liability Insurance $91,581.00
Contact Chris Zollman Gary Mabry Mike Hazelwood Bill Latta Nibby Priest
Address 420 Main Street 422 N Elm St. 2111 US Hwy 41 N 201-B N. Main St. {315 North Main St.
Evansville, IN 47708 Henderson, KY 42420 |Henderson, KY 42420 Henderson, KY 4242(Henderson, KY 42420
Phone 270-471-3800 270-827-4102 270-830-8877 270-827-3542 270-827-3505
Fax 1-866-615-3464 270-826-1065 270-831-2432
chris@doubleeagleinsu | gary@ejmabryinsuranc
E-mail rance.com e.com mhazelwood@emford com nibby@govaughn.com

abaumgari@doubleeag
leinsurance.com




Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second Street
Henderson, KY 42420

Tabulation Sheet Property Insurance

Bid # 7-20-5-5
May 13, 2020
Vendor Double Eagle Insurance E. J. Mabry EM Ford Field & Main Vaughan

Insurance Carrier Name Liberty Mutual
Property Insurance Annual No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium $245,823.00
Boilwe/Machinery Breakdown
Insurance Included
Inland Marine Included
Mine Subsidence $14,507.00
TRIA (Terrorism Risk Insurance
Act)

Property Coverage

Crime

General Liability Coverage

Inland Marine

Automobile

Umbrelia
TRIA (Terrorism Risk Insurance
Act) Total
Earthquake Insurance ($25
Million Minimum Limit} TBD
GRAND TOTAL PROPERTY
INSURANCE
RATES GUARANTEED
ANNUALLY NIA
ANNUAL INSTALLMENT N/A
YEARS N/A
3 YEAR INSTALLMENT N/A
Contact Chris Zollman Gary Mabry Mike Hazelwood Bill Latta Nibby Priest
Address 420 Main Street 422 N Elm St. 2111 US Hwy 41 N 201-B N. Main St. 315 North Main St.

Evansville, IN 47708 Henderson, KY 42420 |Henderson, KY 42420 Henderson, KY 42420 Henderson, KY 42420

Phone 270-471-3800 270-827-4102 270-830-8877 270-827-3542 270-827-3505
Fax 1-866-615-3464 270-826-1065 270-831-2432
E-mail chris@doubleeagleinsurance.com gary@ejmabryinsurance.com| mhazetwood@emiord.com nibby@govaughn.com

abaumaan@doubleeagleinsurance.com




HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS
1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

New and Retread Tires

Load Range H

Bid # 9-20-5-6
Raben Tire & Auto
Best One Fleet Service Purcell Tire Service Service
|Highway Type Tread No Bid
Michelin XZE

275/80 R22.5 N/A $444.00
Marathon LHS $300.00

Goodyear Fule Max RSA $325.00

N/A Endurance LHS $350.00
Firestone FS591
Load Range H
295/75 R22.5 $299.73 N/A
Banding Retread
BDV $180.00 N/A
HanKook
Load Range AH 37 N/A $286.00
Retreads
Retreads Goodyear
Unicircle N/A $167.70
Retreads: DWT N/A $120.00
Retreads: G66 N/A $162.00
Retreads: RDA N/A $159.00
If headed wheel
refurbish consists of:
sandblast, primer and
painted in color of
choosing with new
valve N/A N/A
Any disposal of tires N/A N/A
Credit for every tire
casing picked up that is $50.00 Virgin / $25 Once
recappable Yes Capped
Discount for tires for
other Henderson
County Schools
Vehicles Yes State Bid Pricin
Contact Dan Davis Ed Whelan Jimmy Matthews
Address 6640 Toney Lane 1029 N Green Street 1400 N Green Street

Evanville, IN Henderson, KY Henderons, KY
47715 42420 42420
Phone 812-471-8473 270-826-3931 618-751-1702
270-748-4901 270-860-7904

Fax 812-471-8924 270-827-8211 270-827-2815
E-Mail ddavisbest1@att.net ed.whelan@purcelltire.com jmatthews@rabentire.com




