

Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us



To: Marganna Stanley, Superintendent
And School Board Members

From: Cindy Cloutier
Director of Finance *Cloutier*

Date: May 8, 2020

Re: Bid Recommendations

Bid Recommendations:

Fire & Safety Equipment Inspection Bid # 4-20-5-4

Invitations were sent to FSI Fire Safety, Johnson Controls, & Koorsen. We received bids from FSI Fire Safety and Johnson Controls. We recommend you award the bid to FSI Fire Safety as highlighted on the Tabulation Sheet.

Courier Service Bid # 5-20-5-5

Invitations were sent to Markham Security, Red Arrow Delivery Service, and Silver Creek Transportation. We received a bid from Silver Creek Transportation. No other bids were returned. We are recommending the contract be awarded to Silver Creek Transportation as highlighted on the tabulation sheet.

Henderson County Schools
Fire & Safety Equipment Inspection
Bid 4-20-5-4
Tabulation Sheet

SERVICE	FSI Fire Safety	Totals	Johnson Controls Simplex Grinnell	Totals	Koorsen	Totals
I. FIRE EXTINGUISHERS					No Bid	
2 1/2# ABC Dry Powder (2)						
Inspection	\$3.00		\$3.50			
6 year Maintenance	\$25.00	Price includes refill	\$10.00			
Hydrostatic Testing	\$25.00	Price includes refill	\$8.00			
Refill/Recharge	\$25.00		\$10.00			
Total			\$31.50			
5# ABC Dry Chemical (61)						
Inspection	\$3.00		\$3.50			
6 year Maintenance	\$32.00	Price includes refill	\$10.00			
Hydrostatic Testing	\$32.00	Price includes refill	\$15.00			
Refill/Recharge	\$32.00		\$15.00			
Total			\$43.50			
10# ABC Dry Chemical (233)						
Inspection	\$3.00		\$3.50			
6 year Maintenance	\$36.00	Price includes refill	\$10.00			
Hydrostatic Testing	\$36.00	Price includes refill	\$15.00			
Refill/Recharge	\$36.00		\$24.00			
Total			\$52.50			
20# ABC Dry Chemical (3)						
Inspection	\$3.00		\$3.50			
6 year Maintenance	\$38.00	Price includes refill	\$10.00			
Hydrostatic Testing	\$38.00	Price includes refill	\$15.00			
Refill/Recharge	\$38.00		\$24.00			
Total			\$52.50			
5# CO2 (1)						
Inspection	\$3.00		\$3.50			
6 year Maintenance	\$55.00	Price includes refill	Not Required			
Hydrostatic Testing	\$55.00	Price includes refill	\$15.00			
Refill/Recharge	\$55.00		\$12.00			
Total			\$30.50			
10# CO2 (7)						
Inspection	\$3.00		\$3.50			
6 year Maintenance	\$60.00	Price included refill	Not Required			
Hydrostatic Testing	\$60.00	Price included refill	\$15.00			
Refill/Recharge	\$60.00		\$15.00			
Total			\$33.50			
20#CO2 (2)						
Inspection	\$3.00		\$3.50			
6 year Maintenance	\$65.00	Price includes refill	Not Required			
Hydrostatic Testing	\$65.00	Price includes refill	\$15.00			
Refill/Recharge	\$65.00		\$20.00			
Total			\$38.50			
Halatraton Fire Extinguishers (44)						

Inspection	\$3.00			\$3.50	
6 year Maintenance	\$145.00			\$15.00	
Hydrostatic Testing	\$145.00			\$15.00	
Refill/Recharge	\$145.00			\$20.00	
Total				\$53.50	
School Bus Fire Extinguishers (125)					
Inspection	\$3.00			\$3.50	
6 year Maintenance	\$25.00			\$10.00	
Hydrostatic Testing	\$25.00			\$8.00	
Refill/Recharge	\$25.00			\$10.00	
Total				\$31.50	
Kitchen K-Class Fire Extinguishers (12)					
Inspection	\$3.00			\$3.50	
6 year Maintenance	\$85.00			Not Required	
Hydrostatic Testing	\$85.00			\$15.00	
Refill/Recharge	\$85.00			\$95.00	
Total				\$113.50	
III. COOKING EXHAUST HOOD (15)					
Inspection					
6 year Maintenance					
Hydrostatic Testing	\$75.00		per system	\$175.00 each Included	
Total				\$5,250.00	
III. SPRINKLER SYSTEM					
Flat rate to test all risers & switches (each) (13)				\$125.00 each	
Check antifreeze HCHS to pottng shed (1)	No Bid			\$35.00	
Refill	No Bid			\$20.00 per gallon	
Total					
IV. PARTS AND LABOR					
Percentage Discount on Parts	15.00%			20%	
Hourly Rate for Labor	\$75.00			\$60.00	
V. TRAVEL					
Mileage Charge	0.00			\$0.00	
Flat Fee Per Visit	0.00			\$0.00	
Hourly Rates	0.00			\$60.00	
ANNUAL TOTALS					
Contact	Chad Lane			Dale More	Chad Hohne
Address	1015 Progress Drive Clarksville, TN 37040			2225 N Burkhardt Rd Evansville, IN 47715	4725 Hitch Peters Rd Evansville, IN 47711
Phone	913-552-7044			812-647-0059	812-305-3819
Fax	913-552-7074			812-423-9224	812-423-2116
E-mail	clane@tsifiresafety.com			dale.a.moore@jci.com	chad.hohne@koorsen.com

HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
1805 Second Street
Henderson, KY 42420

Courier Service
Bid # 5-20-5-5
TABULATION OF BIDS

Company	Markham Security Specialists, Inc.	Red Arrow Delivery Service	Silver Creek Transportation, LLC
Daily costs for Courier Service for all schools, offices, and other buildings	No Bid	No Bid	\$139.00
Daily rate x 209 days per year			\$29,051.00
Fuel Surcharge Rate			0
How many vehicles are available in your company fleet?			22
How many people do you have employed?			29
Are your vehicles properly insured?			Yes
Are your employees properly insured?			Yes
Insurance Company			Berkley Prime
Number of years experienced handling cash over \$5,000			22
Additional Services (charge per hour)			\$25.00
Commodity Runs (average 8-10 per year)			\$0.00
Contact	Larry Markham	Tim Johnson	Jason Cowan
Address	PO Box 715	PO Box 6583	2055 S. Green Street
	Henderson, KY 42419	Evansville, IN 47719	Henderson, KY 42420
Phone	270-827-5515	812-468-3278	270-826-0777
Fax			
E-mail	markhamsecurit0065@att.net	tim@redarrowdeliveryservice.com	jason@silvercreektrans.com