
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

COMMENTS:

7837

April 21, 2020

PUMPS (Various)  . 

March 31, 2020

From May 30, 2020 through May 29, 2021 

No renewal option. 

Awarded to Plumbers Supply Company. 
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Vendor Response Terms

Response Payment TermsResponse TermsVendor Name

CAPP, Inc. 3%20NET30

Oscar's Germantown Hardware NO BID NO BID

Plumbers Supply Company ?1A=YES...?1B=NO PLUMBERS SUPPLY CO 

INC 1000 EAST MAIN ST. LOUISVILLE, KY. 

40206 502-582-2261 2-WEEKS 

GUARANTEED DELIVERY

2%-10th...NET-25th
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ITEM NO. 1   -  Pump, circulating, 1/6 HP, 120 volt, 2 amp. Armflo E9.2B #182202-660, Grundfos #UPS26-150SF or equal.  1 - 

1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225550-2012088)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ARMSTRONG  #182202-660 439.2900Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 182202-660

ARMSTRONG  #182202-660 490.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3033219

ITEM NO. 2   -  Pump, condensate, 115 volt. Little Giant ABS-3 #551320 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 

6 (6225600-1677700)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  0.0001Oscar's Germantown Hardware

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

*LITTLE GIANT  #551320 181.0000Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 551320

LITTLE GIANT  #551320 245.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046052

ITEM NO. 3   -  Pump, condensate, 115 volt, vertical, with safety switch, 1/50 HP. Little Giant VCMA-15ULS #554405 or equal.  1 - 

1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 2 (6225600-2002420)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*LITTLE GIANT  #554405 36.2700Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 554405

LITTLE GIANT  #554405 50.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3109917

ITEM NO. 4   -  Pump, condensate, 115 volt, low profile, 1/30 HP. Little Giant VCC-20ULS #554200 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 4 (6225600-1345002)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*LITTLE GIANT  #554200 54.2700Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 554200

LITTLE GIANT  #554200 70.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS2006356

ITEM NO. 5   -  Pump, submersible, automatic, 1/2 HP, 115 volt, single phase, GPM 79 at 10-ft. head, must have vertical ball float 

control permanently mounted to pump body, cast iron body, non-clogging vortex impeller, passes 5/8" spherical solids.  Zoeller 

M137 #137-0001 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 10 (6225850-1685939)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #137-0001 288.1100Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 137-0001

ZOELLER  #137-0001 410.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046064
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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ITEM NO. 6   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 115 volt, single phase, GPM 79 at 10-ft. head, 1 1/2" NPT discharge, 

cast iron body, non-clogging vortex impeller, passes 5/8" spherical solids.  Zoeller N137 #137-0002 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1698218)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #137-0002 265.2600Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 137-0002

ZOELLER  #137-0002 380.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046077

ITEM NO. 7   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 200-208 volt, 3 phase, GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT discharge, cast 

iron construction, non-clogging vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids.  Zoeller J267 #267-0011 or equal.   1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-2010953)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #267-0011 363.0700Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0011

ZOELLER  #267-0011 515.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046084

ITEM NO. 8   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 230 volt, single phase, GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT discharge, cast 

iron construction, non-clogging vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids.  Zoeller E267 #267-0004 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1722170)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #267-0004 301.9300Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0004

ZOELLER  #267-0004 430.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046086

ITEM NO. 9   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 230 volt, 3 phase, GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT discharge, cast iron 

construction, non-clogging vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids.  Zoeller F267 #267-0010 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, 

Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1722171)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #267-0010 363.0700Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0010

ZOELLER  #267-0010 515.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046088

ITEM NO. 10   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 460 volt, 3 phase, GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT discharge, cast iron 

construction,  non-clogging vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids.  Zoeller G267 #267-0041 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1722172)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #267-0041 363.0700Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0041

ZOELLER  #267-0041 515.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046090
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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ITEM NO. 11   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 2 HP, 200-208 volt, 3 phase, GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" flanged vertical 

discharge, cast iron body,  non-clogging bronze vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids.  Zoeller J295 #395-0008 or equal.  1 - 

1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1718481)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #.J295-XXXX 880.3500Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: .J295-XXXX

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 3in FLANGED DISCHARGE...208V...3-PHASE... BRONZE IMPELLER

ZOELLER  #395-0008 1,100.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046092

ITEM NO. 12   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 2 HP, 230 volt, 3 phase, GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" flanged vertical discharge, 

cast iron body, non-clogging bronze vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids.  Zoeller F295 #395-0006 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-2008834)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #.F295-XXXX 880.3500Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: .F295-XXXX

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 3in FLANGED DISCHARGE...230V...3-PHASE... BRONZE IMPELLER

ZOELLER  #395-0006 1,100.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046097

ITEM NO. 13   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 2 HP, 230 volt, single phase, GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" flanged vertical 

discharge, cast iron body, non-clogging bronze vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids.  Zoeller E295 #395-0004 or equal.  1 - 

1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-2012195)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #.E295-XXXX 768.6500Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: .E295-XXXX

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 3in FLANGED DISCHARGE...230V...SGL-PHASE...BRONZE IMPELLER 

ZOELLER  #395-0004 1,010.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046099

ITEM NO. 14   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 2 HP, 460 volt, 3 phase, GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" flanged vertical discharge, 

cast iron body, non-clogging bronze vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids.  Zoeller G295 #395-0007 or equal.  1 - 1.0000 Each 

Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1722174)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #.G295-XXXX 880.3500Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: .G295-XXXX

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 3in FLANGED DISCHARGE...460V...3-PHASE... BRONZE IMPELLER

ZOELLER  #395-0007 1,095.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046102

ITEM NO. 15   -  Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 3 HP, 460 volt, 3 phase, GPM 250 at 20-ft. head, 4" flanged horizontal 

discharge, cast iron construction, non-clogging vortex impeller, passes 3" spherical solids.  Zoeller G405 #405-0009 or equal.  1 - 

1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-2013057)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*ZOELLER  #405-0009 1,252.9200Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 405-0009

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 4in HORZ. FLANGED DISCHARGE...460V... 3-PHASE
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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ZOELLER  #405-0009 1,780.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3046105
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

14,880.00CAPP, Inc.

.00Oscar's Germantown Hardware

11,015.03  11,015.03Plumbers Supply Company

11,015.03
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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