Christian County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation Antifreeze & Lubricants
July 1, 2020 - June 30, 2021
Engine Oil | Engine Oil Trans. Oil Trans. Oil Gear Oil Grease Antifreeze Antifreeze | Antifreeze | Antifreeze
Vendor 15W40 15W40 Mecron/Dextron |11 Trans/Synd 85 W 140 NLGL2 Ext Life Ext Life Ethylene Ethylene
Bulk Price | 50/55 gal drum 50/55 gal drum 50/55 gal drum | 120 Ib cont. 50/55 gal Full Strength 50/50 Full Strength 50/50
50/55 gal 50/55 gal 50/55 gal 50/55 gal
Home QOil & Gas $ 581 % 360.80 (% 39545 % 167475|% 174.00($ 77200|$ 71280|$ 42900|$ 366.85|% 259.60
* [IMax Arnold & Sons $ 595|% 352.00( % 400.00 |$ 1,73350|$% 150.85|% 69405| % 65565| % 44415|$% 37595|% 295.65
Clarke Power Services no bid no bid $ 802.33 [ $ 2,089.74 | no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Key QOil $ 6.52|$ 41250 $ 450.31 | $ 1,229.37|$ 29455[$1,091.70 $ 599.18| $ 399.88|$% 433.13|$ 30181
* We recommend Max Arnold & Sons receive the bid for Antifreeze & Lubricants.
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