
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

7795

Februaiy 25, 2020

SCIENCE SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT (Percentage)

December 04, 2019

From February 28, 2020 through February 27, 2021

Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.

An * indicates an award.

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

COMMENTS:
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l Vendor Name

BIO CORPORATION

Carolina Biological Supply Company

Fisher Science Education

Vendor Response Terms

l Response Terms

5% off current catalog, free ups ground

shipping on orders over $250.00, no pail
packing, no Iive materials.

14-28 DAYS ARO

r
net 30

NET30

NET30

Response Payment Terms 1

Flinn Scientific, Inc. 1 5% discount for most catalog items, some

exceptions. Free shipping on most catalog

items, some exceptions.

Net 30 Days

Frey Scientific

hand2mind

NASCO

Please reTerence "JCPS #7795" on all quote
requests and Purchase Orders to ensure
receipt of 15% discount. hand2mind Online
Catalog:
http ://www. hand2 mind.com/Resou rces/On line
-Catalogs

No Bid

Net 30

Net 30 days.

N/A

Sargent-Welch VWR International, LLC d/b/a Sargent Welch
and Ward's Science. Please refer to VWR

Quote F<elerence No. 8031156739 on all

purchase orders and on all inquiries. See
attached for ALL Proposal and Pricing details.
Thank you.

Net 30
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ITEM No. 1- SCIENCE CHEMICALS (4600625-1714153)

Awarded to Sargent-Welch based on lowest total of all discounted prices of evaluation items.

See attachment for required responses that must be submitted with your response. Please enter LIST
PRICE. The discounted price will be calculated by the ESM Solutions System based on the
percentage of discount you enter.

AWARD NOTES:

CATEGORY NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Sargent-Welch

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

35.00% "

Frey Scientific

CATEGORY NOTES:

34.00 %

Fisher Science Education

CATEGORY NOTES:

33.00 %

Flinn Scientific, Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

15.00%

Carolina Biological Supply Company

CATEGORY NOTES:

10.00%

BIO CORPORATION

CATEGORY NOTES: 5% off current catalog

5.00 %

NASCO

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

.00 %

ITEM NO. 2 - SCIENCE MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT (4600625-1714154)

Reject Frey Scientific - multiple percentage of discounts not acceptable. Awarded to Sargent-Welch
based on next lowest total of all discounted prices of evaluation items.

Please enter LIST PRICE. The discounted price will be calculated by the ESM Solutions System
based on the percentage of discount you eriter.

AWARD NOTES:

CATEGORY NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Sargent-Welch

CATEGORY NOTES:

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

35.00% "

Frey Scientific

CATEGORY NOTES: 34% on supply items, 25% on furniture & equipment. see cover page for
additional details

34.00 %

Fisher Science Education 33.00 %

Flinn Scientific, Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

15.00%

hand2mind

CATEGORY NOTES: Discounts are fixed for the term of the bid, contract or agreement and
apply to the current catalog in place at the time an order is placed.
Special promotions, quotes, brochures, sale items, and bid prices
(prefixed by BD) are excluded from further discounts. Pricing in a
current catalog expires December 31 st of each year. Prices may
increase or decrease when new catalogs are issued. Professional
Development, hand2mind Custom and Publisher-Aligned Kits including
but not limited to National Geographic NGSS Kits, Curriculum

15.00 %

Note: " indicates a pending award. 3



Associates Ready Mathematics kits, and kits for use with Great Minds'

Eureka Math Curriculum are excluded from catalog discount. Special
promotions, sale items, quotes, brochures and bid prices (prefixed by
BD) are excluded from further discounts.

Carolina Biological Supply Company

CATEGORY NOTES:

BIO CORPORATION

CATEGORY NOTES: 5% off current catalog

NASCO

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

10.00 %

5.00 %

.00 %

ITEM No. 3 - SPECIMENS (4600625-2011814)

AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Fisher Science Education based on Iowest total of all discounted prices of evaluation
items.

Please enter LIST PRICE. The discounted price will be calculated by the ESM Solutions System
based on the percentage of discount you enter.

CATEGORY NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Sargent-Welch

CATEGORY NOTES:

Frey Scientific

CATEGORY NOTES: Live items are Net priced. See cover page for additional details.

Fisher Science Education

Flinn Scientific, Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES: 15% Discount, free shipping, some exceptions.

Carolina Biological Supply Company

CATEGORY NOTES:

BIO CORPORATION

CATEGORY NOTES: 5% off current catalog

NASCO

CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

35.00 %

34.00 %

33.00% "

15.00%

10.00 %

5.00 %

.00 %

Note: " indicates a pending award. 4


