

Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second Street
Hendeson, KY 42420
Fleet Vehicles
Bid # 10-19-6-11
Tabulation Sheet

2 New 2-Door 3/4 Ton Regular Cab 4-Wheel drive

General Vehicle Specifications	Meet Specifications?	Description of Difference from Specification (if any)	Audubon Chrysler	Expressway Chevrolet	Henderson Chevrolet	Henderson Ford	Town & Country Ford		& Sons Chevrolet
V-8 GAS(minimum 6.0 liter)			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	X	X		No Bid
Automatic transmission						X	X		
4-Wheel drive						X	X		
Air Conditioning, Tilt Wheel, AM/FM/CD						X	X		
Power mirrors, locks, and windows						X	X		
Rearview camera						X	X		
Spray-in bed liner						X	X		
Hands Free Talking						X	X		
Full length running boards						X	X		
Exterior Color: WHITE						X	X		
Trailer Brake Controls						X	X		
Max Trailer Tow Package						X	See Note		
Standard Factory Warranty						X	X		
Model of Vehicle Bid						2020	F2B 4x4		
Trim Level of Vehicle Bid						XL	XL		
Rated MPG: City						N/A	N/A		
Rated MPG: Highway						N/A	N/a		
Warranty: Basic						3/36,000	Yes		
Delivery Time from Date of Order						N/A	8 - 10 weeks		
Bid Pricing									
Description	Price	Comments/Description							
MSRP Price	\$					73,220.00	40,190.00		
Dealer Installed Options						838.00	None		
Other									
Less: Discount						17,784.00	13,615.00		
Net Bid Price (must include all costs)	\$					56,274.00	26,575.00 each		

* Tow Package only available with diesel engilne option. Tow package is standard with class 5 hitch receiver and trailer harness and pin wiring pluq.

NEW ½ Ton-4 Door SUV 4x4 Third row Seating

General Vehicle Specifications	Meet Specifications?	Description of Difference from Specification (if any)	Audubon Chrysler	Expressway Chevrolet	Henderson Chevrolet	Henderson Ford	Town & Country Ford		Uebelhor & Sons Chevrolet
							XL	XLT	
10-Speed automatic transmission			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	X	X	X	No Bid
6.2 V8 gas engine(or equivalent)						X	X	X	
Hands Free Talking						X	X	X	
Power Steering						X	X	X	
Power locks						X	X	X	
Cruise control						X	X	X	
Air conditioning						X	X	X	
Trailer tow package(with Trailer Brakes)						X	X	X	
Anti-lock brakes						X	X	X	
AM/FM/CD stereo						X	X	X	
Rear-view Camera						X	X	X	
Exterior color - White						X	X	X	
Model of Vehicle Bid									
Trim Level of Vehicle Bid									
Rated MPG: City									
Rated MPG: Highway									
Warranty: Basic									
Delivery Time from Date of Order									
Bid Pricing									
Description	Price	Comments/Description							
MSRP Price	\$					54,890.00	55,785.00	58,785.00	
Dealer Installed Options							N/A	None	
Other									
Less: Discount						6,091.00	15,360.00	12,413.00	
Net Bid Price (must include all costs)	\$					48,799.00	40,425.00	46,372.00	

Contact Info:						Tony Atherton	Terry Hendricks		
Address						2530 US 41 N	7720 E. Division St.		
						Henderson, KY 42420	Evansville, IN 47715		
Phone						270-827-3566	812-401-1160		
Fax						270-831-7071	812-401-1162		
Email						tom.atherton@hendersonford.com	hendrickstcford@aol.com		