
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

7745

September 24, 2019

FRESH FRUIT & VEGETABLE PROGRAM PREPACKAGED

PRODUCE.

July 22, 2019

From October 01 , 2019 through September 30, 2020

No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An " indicates an award.
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r Vendor Name

Creation Gardens

Sysco Louisville

r
l20days

Vendor Response Terms

Response Terms l
30 days

4 weeks

Response Payment Terms 1
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ITEM No. 1 - Apple, slices, red. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, briqht in color, crisp slices, no core. Samples required. Ready to
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400
(4445840-2012369)

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

5778

30 days

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Peterson Farms #203102

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.2400"

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 100/2oz (.5 cup)

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

8205072

4 weeks

PETERSON FARMS FRESH INC 24.5900

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES? 1 00/2 oz.

ITEM NO. 2 - Apple, slices, qreen. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, briqht in color, crisp slices, no core. Samples required. Ready to
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 99999

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 100/2 oz (.5 cup) per case

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Peterson Farms #203130

UNIT PRICE ($1
0.2950"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES:

8280879

4 weeks

1 00/2 oz.

PETERSON FARMS FRESH INC 31 .4900

ITEM NO. 3 - B66t 3}igk6. Fr66h, Oui. lJ.s. Ng. 2 6{pndard. R6ady to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. 5amples required. SAMPLE
REQLI?RED. Pl6p6e r6g(ind t(i the f(illowinq in the VENDOR REE>PON3E ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and
ni,im56r (if ppgk6q66 p6r q66e. 1 - 1.0000 Eaqh Purqhp66, Estima}ed Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Sysco Louisville no bid

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

no bid

4 vveeks

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS?

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

99999

30 days

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #99999 0.4200"

ITEM No. 4 - Blackberries. Fresh, u.s. No.l standard, dry, clean, plump, briqht and well colored. Samples required. Ready to
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

There were no bids received for this item.

ITEM MANI,lFAOTt,IRER & PART Nl,IMBER

X #X

x

UNIT PRI(,E ($)
o.otoo

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No bid

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

no bid

4 weeks

no bid o.oioo

ITEM No. s - Blueberries. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, firm, plump, dry and dark in color. Samples required. Ready to eat
Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

no bid

4 weeks

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

no bid

UNIT PRICE ($>
o.oioo

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

17110

30 days

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #171 10 0.9900"

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

ITEM No. 6 - Broccoli, florets. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, florets, trimmed, sulfite-free, briqht qreen, Samples required. crisp,
firm. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Creation Gardens as Iow bidder, based on price per each.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #1 7008

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17008

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.3800-

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

8449011

4 weeks

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC #59805 20.1700

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/2 oz.

ITEM No. 7 - Cantaloupe, cubes. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Samples required. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Plea66 r6,pond tq ih6 fgll(iwinq in }h6 VENDOR RE3P0NSE ITEM NOTE3 fi61d: 5pecify ounces per packaqe and
number of paqk6qB6 p6r g366. 1 - 1 .0000 Epqh Pqrgha66, E,}imated Qqantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17061

VENDORREFERENCENUMBER: 17061

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

UNIT PRICE ($i
0.3900"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2516450

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/2 oz.

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 29.5000

Note: ' indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 8 - Carrots, baby. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, briqht in color and moist. Samples required. Ready to eat. Approx.
(200) 1 .6-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv
ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 100

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Grimway #GF-BC-135

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 20490

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS. 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Sold as 200/1 .6 oz case

UNIT PRICE ($>
0.1280"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 100/2 oz.

6919450

4 weeks

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 25.9700

ITEM No. 9 - Cauliflower, florets. Fresh cut. Sulfate free, packaqed in qas permeable packaqe, code dated. Samples required.
Clean, firm, compact florets, no browninq. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES?

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: i 7029

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17029

UNIT PRICE ($1
0.4400"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

B447704

4 weeks

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC #59803 23.8700

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/2 oz.

ITEM No. 10 - C61ery, 6tick6. Fr6sh, lJ.5. Ng.1 6tqndard, gl6an, gisp 6talks. Samples r6quir6d. No leave6 or indications of
wiltinq. Re3dy tg 6Bt. Appr(ix. (50) 2-oz. 3AMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM N0TE3 fi61d: 06gify (iunce6 per pack3q6 and number of packaq6s per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quanjity
- 400

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1 7037

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

UNIT PRICE (!5)
0.3200"

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17037

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/2 oz.

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC

1445236

4 weeks

27.1300

ITEM No. 1 1 - Cherries, red. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, plump smooth skin and briqht red color. Samples required. Ready to
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANL,IFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRK:E ($>

Note: " indicates a pending award. PAGE s



Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

no bid

4 weeks

no bid 0.0100

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17063

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS' 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz per case

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17063 0.9800"

ITEM No. 12 - Cucumber, slices. Fresh, u.s. fancy standard, medium size slices, qood shape shiny or Samples required. waxy
surface. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated
Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1 7049

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz per case

Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17049

UNIT PRICE ($1
0.3200"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS?

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50- 1/2 cup

3326494

4 weeks

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 25.2500

ITEM No. 13 - Grapefruit, wedqes. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, rind to be intact, briqht in color. Samples required. Ready to eat.
Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field' Specify
ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

ITEM MANIIFA(,TIJRER & PART NUMBER

no bid

UNIT PRI(,E ($>
o.oioo

no bid

4 weeks

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1 7075

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80 units per case. Each unit weighs 2.5 oz.

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #1 7075 0.4100'

ITEM No. 14 - (:irap6s. Fr66h, u.S. N(;). 1 6t,indprd. R6pdy tg 6pi Agprgx. (50) 2-OZ. 3ampl66 r6qpir6d. 3AMPLE REQI)IRED.
Plea6e re6pond to th6 f(illgwinq in }h6 VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTEs fi61d: 3p6qify (ii,inq66 p6r p6gkpq6 pnd n4m56r gf

packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 E.pgh Pi,irgh66e, Es}imatpd QuBnlity - 4Q0

ITEM AWARD NOTES?

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17131

17131

30 days

UNIT PRICE ($>
0.4000"

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 22.2700

Note: ' indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

1854508

4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50- 2 oz.

ITEM No. 15 - Honeydew, cubes. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Samples required. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and
number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

Reject Sysco Louisville - no case size specified.
ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17069

ITEM AWARD NOTES?

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17069

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

UNIT ppice ($1
0.4400"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

1457658

4 weeks

no bid 32.9300

ITEM No. 16 - Jicama Sticks. Fresh, Cut. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Samples required. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please
respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per
case. 1- 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

no bid

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

no bid

4 weeks

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

17134

30 days

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17134 0.5900"

ITEM No. 17 - Kiwi, slices. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, no wrinkles or siqns of bruisinq/damaqe. Samples required. Ready to
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

no bid

4 weeks

ITEM MANI,lFAOTl.lRER & PART NUMBER

no bid

UNIT PRICE ($1
0.0100

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 03835

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Kiwi halves, not slices. There are two halves equaling 2.9 oz per unit. 80 units per
case.

Prep Kitchen / Creation Gardens #03835 0.5000'

ITEM No. 18 - Lemqn, wqdqp6. Frq6h U.S. NQ. 1 6t,ind(ird, rind6 15) 56 r6m(iv64 fl66h only. 3pmples required. Ready to ear
Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

ITEM MANI,IFA(,Tl,IRER & PART NUMBER

no bid

UNIT PRI(,E <$i
0.0100

Note: ' indicates a pending award.
PAGE 7



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17137

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80 units per case. Each unit weighs 2 oz.

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17137 0.3200"

ITEM No. 19 - Lime, wedqes. Fresh u.s. No. 1 standard, rinds to be removed, flesh only. Samples required. Ready to ea}.
Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field Specify
ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Sysco Louisville no bid

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17142

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80 units per case. Each unit is 1 .6 oz.

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #1 7142 0.3000"

ITEM NO. 20 - Manqo, chunks. Fresh, sliqhtly soft, yellow tinqe, no fibrous pieces of pit. Samples required. Ready to eat
Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17120

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17120

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case.

IJN?T PRI(,E ($)
0.6800'

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1428178

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/2 oz.

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 45.0800

ITEM NO. 21 - Oranqe, wedqe6. Fresh, U.S. NO. 1 standard. ReadV to eat. j%)Pr0x. (501 2-OZ. Sam91es r6quir6d. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to lhe fgllowinq in {he VENDOR RE3PON3E ITEM NOTE3 fi61d: 5p6gify (iunge6 p6r p3(:kqq6 .3nd
number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Eaqh Purchase, Estimaied Qu6ntity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen / Creation Gardens #17080

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17080

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Size 88 count orange used. U4 of orange per unit. Each unit weight equals about 2.6
oz.

UNIT PRICE ($1
0.3200'

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2766010

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/3 oz.

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 22.6500

Note: ' indicates a pending award.
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ITEM NO. 22 - Peas, suqar snap or snow. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard, briqht qreen with well-filled pods with larqe Samples
required. round peas inside. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17167

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case.

Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17167
UNIT PRICE ($1

0.4900'

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50- 1/2 cup

2395749

4 weeks

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 29.3900

ITEM No. 23 - Pineapple, cubes. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Samples required. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and
number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS.

17093

30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #1 7093

UNIT PRICE ($>
0.4900"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2425603

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50- 1/2 cup

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 33.8100

ITEM NO. 24 - Pomaqrante Arils. Fresh, Class I standard. Packed free from external contaminants. Ready to eat. Samples
required. Approx. (56) s-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: Specify ounces per packaqe and nqmber gf packBq66 p6r cp66. 1 - 1 .0000 Eagh Purgha6e, E6iimp{6d Qi,i3niity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

CreationGardens X#X

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: X

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No bid.

UNIT PRICE ($>
o.oroo

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

no bid

4 weeks

no bid 0.0100

ITEM NO. 25 - Tomato, qrape. Fresh u.s. Ng. 1 standard, ripen6ss staq6 4 gr s. Ready tq 6at. Apprqx. (50) 2-oz. Spmples
required. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Pl6p66 resp(ind {g ih6 fqllgwinq in jh6 VENDOR RE3PON5E ITEM NOTEs fi61d: 3p6gify (ign(:es

per packaqe and number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 E.pqh Pi,irqh666, EjirrJed Qi,ian{i§ - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1 7244

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17244

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.3500"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2395824

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50- 1/2 cup

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 22.8200

ITEM NO. 26 - Turnip Sticks. Fresh, Cut. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Samples required. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please
respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and number of packaqes per
case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

no bid

4 weeks

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

no bid

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1 7349

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17349 0.4100"

ITEM NO. 27 - Watermelon, chunks. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Samples required. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and
number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17116

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17116

UNIT PRICE ($>
0.5200"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 80/2 oz.

8388777

4 weeks

no bid 51 .3800

ITEM NO. 28 - Yellow Squash Coins. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Samples required. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and

npmber of pack3q66 per gps6. 1 - 1 .0000 Epqh P4rghp64 E6}imatBd Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART Nl,IMBER

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17232

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17232

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

UNIT PRICE ($>
0.4000"

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 20.2200

Note: " indicates a pending award. PAGE 10



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3326465

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50- 1/2 cup

ITEM NO. 29 - Zucchini, slices. Fresh, u.s. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Samples required. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaqe and
number of packaqes per case. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Creation Gardens as low bidder, based on price per each.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens Prep Kitchen #17230
VENDORREFERENCENUMBER: 17230

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80/2 oz units per case

tJNlT PRI(,E (:$)
0.3600"

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50-1/2 cup

3242944

4 weeks

TAYLOR FARMS TENNESSEE INC 18.4500

Note: ' indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME

Creation Gardens

Sysco Louisville

J
4,722.80

195,041 .00

AWARDED TOTAL ($)

4,714.80

4,714.80

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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