JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7749

APPROVAL DATE: August 27, 2019

ITEM(S) QUOTED: SCNS LUNCHROOM PRODUCTS (School Delivery)
SUPPLEMENT

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: July 23, 2019

CONTRACT PERIOD: From August 27, 2019 through June 30, 2020

RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name Response Terms Response Payment Terms

Dr. Pepper Snapple Group

Sysco Louisville 4 weeks
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ITEM NO. 1 - Beverage, 100% fruit juce with no added suaar, Grape. Packed approx, {24) 11.5-0z. cans per case. Aobproved
Product: Snapple #10003021. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv size of can
and no. of cans per case. 1 - 24.0000 Count Case. Estimated Quantity - 100

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville no bid 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid
Dr. Pepper Snapple Group Snapple 13.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10003021
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 11.5 0z can. 24/case
ITEMNO. 2 - Beverage. 100% fruit juice with no added suaar. Fruit Punch, Packed aporox. (24) 11.5-0z. cans per case,
Approved Product: Snapple #10003020. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
size of can and no. of cans per case. 1 - 24.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantitv - 100
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3$)
Sysco Louisville no bid 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid
Dr. Pepper Snapple Group Snapple 13.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10003020
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 11.5 0z can. 24cans/case
ITEM NO. 3 - Beverage. slush. Eeek. Orange and Cream Flavor. 100 % juice, frozen. Packed aoprox. (84) 4.4 fl oz. plastic
cups per case. Easv peel foil lid, packed in cardboard box. Approved Product: Country Pure Foods #2022. Please respond to the
followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEMS NOTES field: Specifv size of cup and no. of cups per case. 1 - 84.0000 Count Case,
Estimated Quantity - 750
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville Country Pure Foods #2022 28.5400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 9908887
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 84/ 4.4 ounce
ITEM NO.4 - Cereal bowl pack, Honev Scooters. Must provide 1 oz. arain equivalence for the USDA Child Nutrition Proarams.
Sugar to be less than or equal to 6 grams. No artificial colors, flavors, preservatives. or sweeteners. Packed approx. 96 units per
case. Approved Product: Post #100-42400-27597-5. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: Specifv size of pack and no. of packs per case. 1 - 96.0000 Count Case. Estimated Quantitv - 800
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville Post #27597 20.2000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7025453
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 96/ 1 ounce
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ITEMNO.5 - Gluten Free Crackers, Baked Cheddar. Packed approx. (8) 16-0z, packaaes per case. Product to be peanut and
nut free. Milk allergen approved. Approved Product: Milton's Craft Bakers. Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv size of package and no. of packages per case. 1 - 8.0000 Count Case, Estimated
Quantity - 25

ITEM AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville no bid 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

ITEMNO. 68 - Granola. Whole Grain. Individual packages. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH USDA WHOLE GRAIN RICH
REQUIRMENTS FOR NSLP AND SBP. Product to be peanut and nut free. Packed approx. (150) 1.25-0z. packages. Approved
Product: ES Foods #16195. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv size of
package and no, of packaaes per case. 1 - 150.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantitv - 100

ITEM AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville no bid 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

ITEMNO. 7 - Ham, Cherrvwood. FC. Refrigerated. Product to be NAE. all natural, cage free and 100% vegetarian fed. Packed (6)
2-Ib. baas per case. Approved Product: Hormel Foods Appleaate Naturals #81111. Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv size of packaae and no. of packaaes per case. 1 - 6.0000 Count Case. Estimated
Quantity - 20

ITEM AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville no bid 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

ITEM NO. 8 - Pasta, penne. Samples required. Pasta to be light or medium color. Packed approx. 20-lbs. per case. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packades and no. of packages per case.
SAMPLE REQUIRED. 1 -20.0000 Pound Case. Estimated Quantity - 800

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Sysco Louisville Tree House #259182Q0660 21.8500*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 991549

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2/10 ib.

ITEMNO. 9 - Pasta. spaghetti Samples required. Pasta to be light or medium color. Packed approx, 20-Ibs. per case. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv size of packaaes and no. of packages per case.
SAMPLE REQUIRED. 1 -20.0000 Pound Case, Estimated Quantity - 300

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville Tree House #600732 21.7700%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4862983

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2/10 ib.
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ITEM NO. 10 - Turkev Breast. Sliced. Oven Roasted. FC. Refrigerated. Product to be NAE. all natural. caace free and 100%
veagetarian fed. Packed (6) 2-Ib. bags per case. Approved Product: Hormel Foods Applegate Natural #81112. Please resbond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaages and no. of packages per case. 1 - 6.0000

Count Case, Estimated Quantitv - 20
ITEM AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville no bid 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 5



JOTAL BIDS -

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL (3}

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 6



TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($}
Dr. Pepper Snapple Group 2,600.00 2,600.00
Sysco Louisville 61,579.65 61,576.00

64,176.00

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 7



