MAY 21, 2009

THIS IS A DECISION PAPER

TO:

Members of Hardin County Board of Education

FROM:

Nannette Johnston, Superintendent

SUBJECT:
Oil/Lubricant & Antifreeze Bids

PROPOSAL:
Approve the lubricant & antifreeze bids as tabulated.

FACT A: 
Seven oil companies bid on the annual lubricant & antifreeze contract for Hardin County Schools.

FACT B:
Apollo Oil, Key Oil, and Newcomb Oil have low bids as tabulated below.

RECOMMENDATION:   Approve the low bids as indicated on chart below.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:   I move that the Hardin County Board of Education approves the low bids from Apollo Oil, Key Oil, and Newcomb Oil as indicated on chart below for the duration of one year beginning July 1, 2009, and ending June 30, 2010.

	ITEM
	AMS

OIL
	APOLLO
	HYDROTEX
	KEY OIL


	MAI

DIST
	NEWCOMB

OIL
	SWEPCO

	15W40 Oil, per case of quarts

15W40 Oil, per case of gallons
	No bid

No bid
	26.17

28.91
	92.74

166.28
	24.30

47.50
	58.00

55.00
	31.95

61.50
	136.32

133.92

	15W40 Oil, bulk, per gallon
	No bid
	7.37
	18.81
	5.99
	13.637
	5.64
	19.42

	55-gal drum Dexacool

Red/Orange, per drum
	1273.00
	1032.06
	No bid
	433.95
	No bid
	824.45
	No bid

	55-gal drum antifreeze

Green, per drum
	No bid
	271.56
	No bid
	267.71
	No bid
	378.95
	No bid

	55-gal drum Dextron III

trans fluid, per drum
	No bid
	265.75
	1131.71
	219.05
	No bid
	333.30
	No bid

	Dextron III trans fluid,

Per case of quarts
	No bid
	18.41
	No bid
	26.54
	No bid
	26.13
	No bid

	Gear Oil, 55-gal drum 80-90, per rum
	No bid
	339.41
	1589.9
	462.05
	825.00


	556.00
	1910.60

	Chassis grease 55-gal drum, EP NLGI2, per drum
	No bid
	524.14
	1847.12
	599.52
	995.00
	752.00
	801.60

	Ext Life 5W40 oil, w/ sample, API CJ-4 specs, per gallon
	21.70
	13.99
	21.25
	19.99
	No bid
	No bid


	No bid

	Ext Life trans fluid, Allison TES-295 specs, 55-gallon drum
	28.80
	25.77
	No bid
	17.89
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid








