
HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

1805 Second Street

Henderson, Kentucky  42420

PRINTING BID TABULATION  Bid # 2-19-6-1

Line item bid awarded to 

highlighted vendor

COMPANY
ABBA 

Promotions

Burkert-Walton 

Printing

ESC 

Promotions               Fast Print

Greenwell 

Chisholm               

Oberst Printing 

Company

OR Solutions, 

LLC             

RR Donnelley 

Printing Sign Design SPRINT PRINT         

SECTION I - GENERAL 8.5 x 11
1.  Digital Format, paginated, Adobe In 

Design CS3 60# white offset, printed one 

side black ink

     Per 500 $25.00 $35.00 $25.00 $25.00 $56.00 $15.00

     Per 1,000 $50.00 $50.00 $44.00 $44.00 $77.00 $28.00

     Per 5,000 $170.00 $190.00 $130.00 $134.00 $261.00 $125.00
2.  Digital Format, 60# white offset, printed 2 

sides, 1 PMS colored ink

     Per 500 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $67.00 $75.00 $25.00

     Per 1,000 $90.00 $90.00 $90.00 $94.00 $96.00 $45.00

     Per 5,000 $24.00 $240.00 $199.00 $210.00 $280.00 $199.00
3. 5 1/2" x 8 1/2"  20# white paper, printed 

one color, 2 sided

     Per 1,000 $60.00 $60.00 $55.00 $54.00 $81.00 $45.00

     Per 5,000 $200.00 $130.00 $129.00 $129.00 $227.00 $120.00

     Per add 1,000 $40.00 $20.00 $25.00 $26.00 $46.00 $25.00
4.  5 1/2" x 8 1/2" 20# white paper printed 

one one side black ink

     Per 1,000 $30.00 $40.00 $30.00 $29.00 $57.00 $18.00

     Per 5,000 $72.00 $110.00 $72.00 $72.00 $172.00 $65.00

     Per add. 1,000 $15.00 $25.00 $15.00 $15.00 $36.00 $13.00
5.  8 1/2" x 11"white paper with burgundy 

watermark (Report cards) NB

     Per 1,000 $75.00 $75.00 $50.00 $53.00 $50.00

     Per 5,000 $175.00 $175.00 $125.00 $125.00 $145.00

SECTION II - CARBONLESS FORMS 

(NCR)                     black ink, paginated, 

digital format, padded on top of form

1.  8 1/2" X 11", WC 20# NCR XERO or equal 

2 part, printed one side: 

(Transfer/Withfdrawal Form, Int., School 

Pos,  Immunization) 

     Per 1,000 sets $120.00 $140.00 $99.00 $129.00 $458.00 $120.00

     Per additional 5,000 sets $525.00 $525.00 $425.00 $539.00 $1,012.00 $565.00

     Per add 1,000 sets $100.00 $100.00 $84.00 $109.00 $202.00 $100.00
2.  8 1/2"  x 11", WC 20#, NCR XERO or equal 

2 part, printed 2 sides: (Pre-Trip for Field 

Trips)

     Per 1,000 sets $180.00 $185.00 $150.00 $159.00 $502.00 $160.00

     Per 5,000 sets $580.00 $660.00 $540.00 $629.00 $1,055.00 $750.00

     Per additional 1,000 sets $115.00 $130.00 $100.00 $109.00 $211.00 $150.00
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3. 8.5" X 11", NCR XERO or equal 3 part, 

printed one side,black ink (Extra Curricular 

Trip)

     Per 1,000 sets $195.00 $195.00 $160.00 $184.00 $558.00 $200.00

     Per 5,000 sets $625.00 $765.00 $650.00 $845.00 $1,418.00 $925.00

     Per add 1,000 sets $120.00 $155.00 $119.00 $169.00 $285.00 $190.00
4.  8.5 x 7" 20#, NCRXERO or equal 3 part, 

2color, printed on one side, pre numbered 

(High School Activity PO) NB

     Per 1,000 sets $185.00 $185.00 $193.00 $601.00 $207.00

     Per 5,000 sets $675.00 $660.00 $639.00 $1,277.00 $800.00

     Per add 1,000 sets $130.00 $130.00 $134.00 $258.00 $175.00
5.  8.5 x 5.5", NCR XERO or equal 2 part, 

Printed one side (Behavior Slip)

     Per 500 sets $75.00 $70.00 $45.00 $51.00 $379.00 $37.00

     Per 1,000 sets $75.00 $95.00 $64.00 $78.00 $425.00 $67.00

6.  8.5 x 11", NCR 4 part,WCPG 20#, printed 

one side black ink (Discipline Notice, Prof. 

Dev. Requiest)
     Per 5,000 sets $890.00 $1,110.00 $940.00 $1,188.00 $1,349.00 $1,100.00

     Per 10,000 sets $1,690.00 $2,130.00 $1,775.00 $2,250.00 $2,261.00 $2,200.00

     Per add 1,000 sets $160.00 $205.00 $165.00 $218.00 $230.00 $220.00

7. 8.5 x 11" 4 part reverse, printed blue & red 

front side, crash numbered, same copy and 

20# weitht throughout (Board PO) NB

     Per 5,000 sets $1,250.00 $1,290.00 $1,399.00 $1,449.00 $1,265.00

     Per add 1,000 sets $260.00 $240.00 $275.00 $291.00 $250.00

8. 3 x 5" 3 part NCR XERO or equal, printed 

one side, black ink (Demerit Minor Slip)

     Per 1,000 sets $75.00 $85.00 $70.00 $81.00 $399.00 $53.00

     Per 5,000 sets $230.00 $240.00 $200.00 $259.00 $701.00 $238.00

     Per add 1,000 sets $60.00 $50.00 $40.00 $53.00 $145.00 $46.00

9.  8.5 x 11" 3 part laser perforated, padded 

with wrap around cover stapled at top, 

manila tag, 25 per pad, 2 color, black & 

Yellow, (Child Nutrition TransportForm) NB

     Per 100 $750.00 $700.00 $810.00 $963.00 $1,070.00

SECTION III - Envelopes
1.  Size #10, (9 1/2" x 4 1/2") white wove, blk. 

Ink

     Per 1,000 $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $42.00 $59.00 $46.00

     Per 5,000 $185.00 $175.00 $150.00 $152.00 $226.00 $206.00

     Per add. 1,000 $40.00 $30.00 $29.00 $29.00 $45.00 $42.00

     Window Per 1,000 $55.00 $53.00 $44.00 $44.00 $63.00 $3.00

     Window Per 5,000 $210.00 $190.00 $159.00 $169.00 $236.00 $237.00

     Window Per add. 1,000 $45.00 $33.00 $31.00 $32.00 $47.00 $45.00

2.  Size #9  Window Envelope (3 7/8" x 8 7/8") 

white, blk. Ink      Security for checks

     Per 5,000 $245.00 $240.00 $245.00 $220.00 $249.00 $287.00

     Per 10,000 $470.00 $475.00 $450.00 $398.00 $451.00 $548.00

SECTION IV - CARDS
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Based on no heavy coverage or bleeds
1.  Employee Emergency Card    -  3" x 5" 

card, 90# yellow index, printed 2 sides, black 

ink, digitally printed.

     Per 1,000 $50.00 $65.00 $30.00 $42.00 $72.00 $30.00

     Per add. 1,000 $40.00 $35.00 $25.00 $28.00 $72.00 $25.00
2. 2 1/4 x 3 3/4 67# card, full color, print one 

side (NMS, SMS reward cards) NB  

     Per 500 $50.00 $45.00 $44.00 $48.00 $60.00

     Per 1,000 $80.00 $55.00 $59.00 $61.00 $110.00
3. 2 x 3" 67# card, black ink, one sided, 

numbered NB

     Per 500 $50.00 $45.00 $43.00 $42.00 $35.00

     Per 1,000 $80.00 $50.00 $63.00 $47.00 $63.00
4.  Paneled Note Cards  - 7" x 5" flat, scored, 

white, 3 color ink on one side.   Matching 

envelope with no printing. NB NB

     Per 100 $60.00 $55.00 $45.00 $55.00

     Per 500 $150.00 $140.00 $118.00 $175.00

Matching Envelope With No Printing  

     Per 100 $20.00 $10.00 $18.00 $15.00

     Per 500 $50.00 $47.50 $39.00 $75.00

5.  Paneled Note Cards- Card Size: 8.5 x 5" 

flat, scored, white, black ink on one side
NB NB

     Per 100 $90.00 $45.00 $39.00 $45.00

     Per 500 $105.00 $85.00 $79.00 $60.00

     Matching envelope with no printing

     Per 100 $20.00 $6.00 $10.00 $15.00

     per 500 $40.00 $30.00 $39.00 $75.00

6. 4.25 x 5.5" Paneled Note Care 65#, 100# or 

140# paper, ful color, Printed two sides
NB NB

     Per 100 B/W $65.00 $50.00 $48.00 $100.00

     Per 100 Color $80.00 $60.00 $61.00 $130.00

     Per 500 B/W $120.00 $110.00 $106.00 $165.00

     Per 500 Color $160.00 $175.00 $150.00 $188.00

Matching Envelope With No Printing

     Per 100 $30.00 $6.00 $10.00 $15.00

     Per 500 $50.00 $30.00 $36.00 $75.00

7. 5.5 x 8.5" 65# color, printed 2 sides. black 

ink NB

     Per 1,000 $58.00 $70.00 $71.00 $131.00 $36.00

     Per 5,000 $223.00 $220.00 $230.00 $507.00 $160.00

     Per add 1,000 $48.00 $50.00 $50.00 $105.00 $32.00

8.  Business Cards -3 color logo, 80# white 

cover stock NB NB

     Full color / BK Per 250 $30.00 $35.00 $41.00 $28.00

     Full color/ BK Per 500 $40.00 $45.00 $45.00 $32.00

     3 color Logo / Per 250 $30.00 $35.00 $41.00 $28.00

     3 color Logo / Per 500 $40.00 $45.00 $45.00 $32.00

     Black ink  250 $30.00 $30.00 $41.00 $28.00

     Black  ink 500 $40.00 $40.00 $45.00 $32.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Page 3



COMPANY
ABBA 

Promotions

Burkert-Walton 

Printing

ESC 

Promotions               Fast Print

Greenwell 

Chisholm               

Oberst Printing 

Company

OR Solutions, 

LLC             

RR Donnelley 

Printing Sign Design SPRINT PRINT         
9.  Athletic Cards/Pass for HCHS 2 1/4" x 4" 

Silver glossy plastic, printed 2 side, Font 

white & Maroon  Back ink color black, 

signature panel, numbered NB NB NB NB NB

     Per 100 $290.00

     Per 500 $480.00
10.  Athletic Cards/Pass for HCHS 2 1/4" x 4" 

White glossy plastic, printed 1 side, font 

black & maroon, back ink color black, 

signature panel, numbered NB NB NB NB NB

     Per 100 $290.00

     Per 500 $490.00
11.  3 1/2" x 9" Athletic Schedules, white 

card stock, 1 pms color, printed 2 sides, 

scored 4 times NB

     Per 1,000 $135.00 $145.00 $239.00 $207.00 $85.00

     Per 5,000 $280.00 $445.00 $399.00 $841.00 $225.00

     Per add 1,000 $100.00 $90.00 $95.00 $169.00 $45.00

12. 2.5 x 4" Basketball Season Pass, white 

card stock 1pms color printed 1 side NB

     Per 1,000 $40.00 $55.00 $55.00 $63.00 $63.00

     Per 5,000 $120.00 $135.00 $130.00 $187.00 $130.00

     Per add 1,000 $35.00 $30.00 $35.00 $39.00 $30.00
2.5 x 4" Football Season Pass, white card 

stock 1 pms color printed 2 sides NB

     Per 1,000 $40.00 $75.00 $90.00 $63.00 $100.00

     Per 5,000 $135.00 $175.00 $180.00 $187.00 $150.00

     Per add 1,000 $35.00 $45.00 $35.00 $39.00 $30.00

13.  8.5" x 11" Transportation Emergency 

Card: 14 point white cover, 3 up on sheet, 

full color, printed 2 sides, 1 vertical perf and 

1 horizontal perf, hole punched at corner  NB NB

     Per 1,000 $320.00 $370.00 $297.00 $450.00

     Per 2,500 $650.00 $750.00 $678.00 $600.00

     Per additional 1,000 $275.00 $300.00 $272.00 $240.00

14. Paneled Note Cards 4" x 6" 65#, 100# or 

140# paper, full color, printed 2 sides (Cairo 

Leader In Me) NB

     Per 100 Color $55.00 $40.00 $38.00 $41.00 $75.00

     Per 500 Color $85.00 $60.00 $68.00 $63.00 $150.00

15. 2" x 3.5" Laminated 67# paper, full color, 

printed one side, oblong hole punch (South 

Middle School Student Pass) NB NB NB NB

    Per 50 Color $50.00 $50.00

SECTION V - FOLDERS NB
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1.  Permanent Record Form 18 x 11.5" 

scored four places; 150# TAG, black ink, 

print two sides, 1/2" x 4" left cut tab with 

rounded corners, Mwetal clasp inside back NB NB NB

     Per 1,000 $925.00 $700.00

     Per additional 1,000 $890.00 $700.00
2.  Writing Folder (Elementary)  18 x 11 1/2" 

scored 4 places, red 150# TAG, black ink, 

print one side, left cut tab with rounded 

corners NB NB NB

     Per 1,000 $740.00 $650.00

     Per additional 1,000 $740.00 $650.00
3.  Writing Folder (Middle and High School) 

18 x 11 1/2" scored 4 places, manila150# 

TAG, black ink, printed three sides, left cut 

tab with rounded corners Nb NB

     Per 1,000 $700.00 $600.00 $450.00

     Per additional 1,000 $415.00 $315.00 $450.00

SECTION VI - BOOKLETS/BROCHURES
NB

1.  Booklet 8 page 11" x 17" gloss white with 

bleed, full color, saddle stitch NB

     Per 500 $750.00 $500.00 $1,003.00 $750.00

     Per 1,000 $950.00 $800.00 $1,949.00 $880.00

     Per 5,000 $3,100.00 $3,500.00 $9,566.00 $1,400.00
2.  HCHS/CTE Pathways  72 page plus cover, 

100# gloss cover - 70# white offset full color 

glossy white paper NB

     Per 3,000 $7,350.00 $7,600.00 NB $6,750.00

     Per 5,000 $9,775.00 $9,900.00 $10,000.00
3.  Commencement Programs, 8.5 x 16.5" 

white glossy flat, maroon print, 2 sided 

trifold to 8.5 x 5.5" NB NB

     Per 7,500 $890.00 $3,483.00 $450.00

    3 hrs typesetting $120.00 $210.00 $165.00
4.  CTE Booklet 7 3/4" x 9 1/4" flat 100# gloss 

cover - 70# white gloss paper, full color, 

folded, saddle stitch NB NB

     Per 1,000 $1,200.00 $1,275.00 $1,500.00

     Per 5,000 $2,100.00 $2,050.00 $2,500.00

     Per additional 1,000 $500.00 $225.00 $500.00
5.  8 1/2" x 5 1/2" booklet 20 page self-cover, 

full color 80# gloss text NB NB

     Per 1,000 $775.00 $1,842.00 $1,200.00

    Per add. 1,000 $540.00 $1,842.00 $750.00

6. 8 1/2" x 11" flat Veteran's Day Program, 

full color gloss, printed 2 sides, 67# white 

vellum Bristol Cover, folded to 5.5 x 8.5" 

with 2 sided 20# White insert, printed black 

(South Middle Veterans Day Program) NB NB

     Per 500 $200.00 $175.00 $440.00

     Per 1,000 $300.00 $295.00 $550.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Page 5



COMPANY
ABBA 

Promotions

Burkert-Walton 

Printing

ESC 

Promotions               Fast Print

Greenwell 

Chisholm               

Oberst Printing 

Company

OR Solutions, 

LLC             

RR Donnelley 

Printing Sign Design SPRINT PRINT         

5.5 x 8.5 insert 67# white vellum full color, 

printed 2 sided

    Per 500 $100.00 $85.00 $74.00 $105.00

    Per 1,000 $150.00 $125.00 $128.00 $125.00
7. 8.5 x 11" gloss white, flat, full color folded 

to 4 1/4" x 11" NB

     Per 1,000 $140.00 $140.00 $266.00 $400.00

     Per 5,000 $520.00 $520.00 $1,148.00 $850.00

8. 8.5 x 11" gloss white 80# paper NB

     Per ream $20.00 $20.00 $51.00 $17.00

SECTION VII - Certificates NB
1.  8.5 x 11",20# white, color border with 

black print, one sided paper, 2 color NB

     Per 100 $55.00 $50.00 $43.00 $35.00

     Per 500 $85.00 $75.00 $70.00 $125.00

     Per 1,000 $125.00 $100.00 $108.00 $160.00
2. 8.5 x 11" certificate white bond paper with 

color border NB

     Per ream $75.00 $80.00 $71.00 $125.00

SECTION VIII - MISCELLANEOUS NB

1. HCS Door Hanger 4 1/4" x 10" b/W 

print card stock weight printed one side   

See sample in packet NB NB

     Per 1,000 $100.00 $100.00 $280.00

     Per 5,000 $300.00 $300.00 $350.00

2. Note Pads 4 1/4 x 5.5" 20# white, 

printed one side, black ink, Pads of 50 

sheets (Student Message Form) NB

     Per 100 pads $150.00 $105.00 $227.00 $125.00

     Per 500 pads $205.00 $205.00 $993.00 $325.00

     Per 1,000 pads $345.00 $345.00 $1,904.00 $592.00

3. Note Pads 2 3/4 x 5.5" 20 # paper 

printed one side, black ink, 50 sheets per 

pad NB

     Per 50 pads $50.00 $50.00 $118.00 $85.00

     Per 100 pads $75.00 $75.00 $215.00 $115.00

4. Note Pads 2 x 4.5" 20# yellow paper, 

black ink, pads of 50 sheets 

("PAWS"itive Performer) NB

     Per 50 pads $60.00 $60.00 $128.00 $85.00

     Per 100 pads $80.00 $80.00 $241.00 $115.00

     Per 500 pads $190.00 $190.00 $1,021.00 $325.00

5.  Parent Packet Material 8 1/2" x 11" 20 # 

white paper printed one side, 8 1/2" x 11"  

20# color paper printed two side, collated as 

a set.  See sample of set in packet NB

    Per 5,000 sets $3,150.00 $4,165.00 $2,092.00 $3,750.00

    Per additional 1,000 sets $575.00 $833.00 $438.00 $750.00
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    8000 set $6,510.00
6.  Note pad 3" x 3"  20# color paper, black 

ink, printed one side 50 sheets per pad 

(Gotcha Gator, Wildcat Winner) NB

     Per 50 pads $60.00 $60.00 $118.00 $85.00

     Per 100 pads $90.00 $90.00 $220.00 $115.00

     Per 500 pads $225.00 $225.00 $917.00 $325.00
7. 2.5 x 4 1/4" 20#color paper, full color ink, 

50 sheet pads (Seven Habits) NB

     Per 50 pads $90.00 $90.00 $128.00 $100.00

     Per 100 pads $140.00 $140.00 $238.00 $450.00

     Per 500 pads $400.00 $400.00 $1,011.00 $750.00
8. 2 x 4" PVC card full color, printed one 

side, slot punched top of card (Hall Pass) NB NB NB

     Per 50 cards $170.00 $140.00
9. Bookmarks -  8 1/2 x 2 1/2", full color, 100# 

gloss card printed 2 sided Nb NB

     Per 1,000 $90.00 $90.00 $130.00

     Per add. 1,000 $60.00 $60.00 $130.00
10. Desk Calendars Pad (12 month) 50# 

offset 17" x 22" pad, black ink, printed one 

side NB NB NB

    Per 100 $1,150.00 $980.00

10a. Desk Calendar Pad (12 month) 50# 

offset 17" x 22" pad, color, printed one side NB NB NB

     Per 100 $1,250.00 $2,000.00
11. Henderson County Schools 

Mission/Vision Poster, 8 1/2" x 11" 80# gloss 

full color NB

    Per 100 $40.00 $40.00 $51.00 $200.00

    Per 500 $85.00 $85.00 $115.00 $300.00
12.  Henderson County Schools 

Mission/Vision Poster, 20" x 24 1/2" full 

color, 80 # gloss full color Nb NB

     Per 100 $450.00 NB $350.00

     Per 500 $600.00 $600.00 $675.00
13. Yard Signs- 18" x 24" wired, corrugated 

plastic, four color NB NB NB

    Per 100 (2-sided) $610.00 $650.00 $1,500.00

    Per 100 (one sided) $510.00 $575.00 $900.00
14. Visitor Pass 3 x 5" white sticker, black 

ink (HCHS) NB NB

     Per 1,000 $90.00 $90.00 $118.14

     Per 5,000 $325.00 $325.00 $353.58
15. Visitor Pass 4"x3" roll sticker, 

white/color paper color ink NB NB NB

     Per roll $100.00 $138.29

     Per 50 rolls $2,650.00 $1,303.66
16.   Visitor Pass 3" x 2" roll sticker, 

white/color paper, color ink NB NB NB

     Per roll $138.29

     Per 50 rolls $1,890.00 $1,303.66

17. 3 3/4" round color sticker, color ink NB NB NB

     Per roll $75.00 $81.36
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     Per 50 rolls $1,750.00 $1,246.73
18. 3.5 x 2" white 67# card, black ink, 

numbered NB NB

     Per 100 $50.00 $37.00 $30.00

     Per 500 $60.00 $46.00 $40.00
19. 3.5 x 2" white 67# card, full color ink 

(South Heights Great Bahavior) NB NB

     Per 100 $50.00 $39.00 $35.00

     Per 500 $60.00 $50.00 $50.00

20.  Prenumbered-roll tickets, 2 color print NB NB NB NB

     3 1/4" x 1 3/8" per roll $387.00

     2 7/8" x 1" per roll $335.00

21.  Sheet Labels Visitor Pass with time 

in/out fields, carbonless copy, 2 color print NB NB NB NB NB

     per 800 count box/packet  
22. Vinyl Banners, full color, grommets at 

corners, various sizes NB NB NB

     Per Sq Ft $2.90 $4.00

13 oz. $2.50

18 oz. $4.00
23.  Color photos mounted onto 6 mm pvc 

board and mate spray laminated for 

duribility, various sizes with mounting 

hardware NB NB NB

     Per Sq Ft $4.90 $4.50 $4.00
24. Digital Print 95 x 48" single sided print 

made from 3M IJ35 3 Mil Calendared Gloss 

54" X 50 Yd stock material, mounted on 

Sintra/PVC 3 mm Sintra PVC - 3MM white 48 

x 96", laminated with intermediate gloss on 

face NB NB NB

     Per unit $120.00 $110.00 $130.00

Date Sample Packet Picked Up At 

Board Office
Contact Ty Rideout Dan Heierman Mark Spalding Sam Wolfe David Oberst John Hay Christina Rice Tony Gager Craig Winstead

Address

114 Main Street  

Henderson, KY  

42420

1561 Allens 

Lane 

Evansville, IN  

47724

223 W 9th 

Street  

Anderson, IN  

46016

309 First Street   

Henderson, KY  

42420

420 E Parrish 

Ave  

Owensboro, KY  

42303

2505 W Second 

St.  Owensboro, 

KY  42301

700 Walnut 

Street   

Cincinnati, OH       

45202

300 Lang Blvd  

Grand Island, 

NY  14072

116 Second St. 

Henderson, KY 

42420

23 Dulin Street  

Madisonvile, KY  

42431

Phone Number 270-827-5577 812-425-7157 888-478-5273 270-826-5634

800-684-3267    

270-684-3267 270-684-3551 513-467-8997

800-280-4520             

Ext 2757 270-827-7744 270-825-3376

Fax Number 877-585-2292 765-683-9375 270-826-9196 270-686-19*28 270-686-1499 513-832-0549 800-773-1430 270-827-3078 270-825-9415

800-991-4611 Corp Office

10999 Reed Hartman Hwy #206 

Cincinnati, OH  45242

E-Mail ty@abbapromotions.comdan@burkertwalton.com fastprintky@live.com david@oberstprinting.com christina.rice@rrd.comsigndesign116@gmail.comcraig@sprintprint.net

Final Proofs Must Be Approved By Publications team at Board of Education.  Be sure you have the newest school logo for printing.
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