JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7660

APPROVAL DATE: January 08, 2019

ITEM(S) QUOTED: SCNS LUNCHROOM PRODUCTS (Warehouse Delivery)
Supplement

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: December 17, 2018

CONTRACT PERIOD: From January 09, 2019 through June 30, 2019

RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS:; An * indicates an award.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name _|_ Response Terms | Response Payment Terms
Kenat & Associates net 15 net 15
Rich Products Corporation NET 30
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Net 30 Days Net 30 Days

Southwest Jefferson Inc.

Sysco Louisvilie

Tasty Brands, LLC 1% 10, Net 20
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ITEM NO. 1 - Bagels. Mini, Whole Grain. frozen. thaw and serve. bulk. To contain at least 51% whole arain rich flour. Serving to
provide 2 oz. grain equivalence according to the USDA Child Nutrition Program. Product to have an ambient shelf fife of aporox. 4
days minimum. Allergen to onlv contain wheat. Approved Product: Tasty Brands #20507, 1 - 1.0000 Count Case. Estimated
Quantity - 300 (4445040-2014134)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks with utilization of Sysco account center
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Tasty Brands, LLC Tasty Brands #20507 22.2800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 20507
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1% 10, Net 20

ITEM NO. 2 - Beverage. 100% Vegetable Juice. with no added suqars. colors or flavors. Product will need to count as 1/2 cup of
Red/Orange Vegetable. Product to be shelf stable and carton size to be approx. 125 ml. (4.25 fluid 0z.) aseptic box with attached
wrapped straw. Must meet USDA Smart Snack quidelines. Approved Product: Juicy Juice #00066. 1 - 1.0000 Count Case,
Estimated Quantity - 400 (4445350-2014135)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3$)
Sysco Louisville HARVEST HILL- JUICY JUICE #66 7.6300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4774552

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks with utilization of Sysco account center
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 40/4.230Z

ITEMNQO.3 - Chips. Tortilla. Yellow Corn. butk. Must be made from 100% whole corn. Paper travs to be included in case.
Servina to provide approx. 1.5 o0z. arain equivalence according to the USDA Child Nutrition Proaram. Packed approx. 36 servings
per case. Approved Product: Gehl's #G05501. 1 - 36.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 750 (4445260-2014136)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (8$)
Southwest Jefferson Inc. NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Sysco Louisville GEHL'S #5501 18.9400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7729304
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks with utilization of Sysco account center

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 36/30Z

ITEM NO. 4 - Mozzarella Sticks, Whole Grain, breaded oven readv. frozen. bulk, To contain at least 51% whole grain rich flour.
Serving to provide 2 oz. grain equivalence according to the USDA Child Nutrition Proaram. Alleraens to only contain mitk and wheat.
Sodium to be less than 500 ma per serving. Approved Product: Tastv Brands #41009. 1 - 1.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity
- 750 (4445040-2014137)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Tasty Brands, LLC as lowest price per serving.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks with utilization of Sysco account center
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Rich Products Corporation RICH PRODUCTS 50.4000

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 3



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 65219
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

Tasty Brands, LLC Tasty Brands #41009 65.2100*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 41009
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%10, Net 20

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: commercial price $65.21 -aba is $63.97 if you have cheese with us the PTV is $22.67.
Commodity price would be $41.30

ITEM NO. 5 - Rice, Vegetable Fried, Whole Grain. frozen. Product may contain carrots and peas. Serving to provide 1 oz. arain
equivalence according to the USDA Child Nutrition Program. Packed approx. 30 pounds per case. Approved Products: Chef's
Corner #OFC-2149 and Minh #69074. 1 - 30.0000 Pound Case, Estimated Quantity - 525 (4445040-2014138)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Schwan's Food Service, Inc. 45,3800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 69074

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Brand: Minh; Product Code: 69074; Portion Size: 1/2 cup serving(2.95 oz.)-provides 1
oz. equivalent Grain; No. of servings per case: 168 servings; Pack: Six-5 pound bags per
case, Price provided is Commercial price per case. (Commercial: $45.38 per case/.2701
per serving); Net Weight per case: 30.975 pounds

Sysco Louisville SCHWANS-MINH #69074 48.4700

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2351797
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 weeks with utilization of Sysco account center

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 6 EACH

Kenat & Associates Chef's Corner Foods 54.9100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: OFC-2149
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 15

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: packed 30 Ibs (6 - 5 Ib bags), frozen. 64 cases per pallet, 2 pallets needed per shipment.

ITEMNO. 8 - Waffle Whole Grain. frozen. thaw and serve, bulk. To contain at least 51% whole grain rich flour. Serving to provide
approx. 1.5 oz, grain equivalence according to the USDA Child Nutrition Program. Product should not contain anv artificial colors or
flavors. Packed approx. 48 servings per case. Approved Product: Ginny's #71884. 1 - 48.0000 Count Case. Estimated Quantity -
450 (4445450-2014139)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3$)
Sysco Louisville GINNY'S #71884 22.6300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TBD

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 Weeks with utilization of Sysco account center
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1/48 EA
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

Kenat & Associates 28,827.75

Rich Products Corporation 37,800.00

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. 23,824.50 23,824.50

Southwest Jefferson Inc, 75

Sysco Louisville 52,888.30 27,440.50

Tasty Brands, LLC 55,591.50 55,591.50
106,856.50

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 5



