JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7649

APPROVAL DATE: January 08, 2019

ITEM(S) QUOTED: PAPER (Warehouse Delivery) .

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: November 26, 2018

CONTRACT PERIOD: From February 28, 2019 through February 27, 2020
RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: Awarded to Veritiv, formerly Xpedx and Unisource.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name Response Terms ] Response Payment Terms

Millcraft Paper Company BID PRICES APPLICABLE FOR 30 DAYS OF 1% DISCOUNT 30 DAYS NET 31 DAYS
BID RESPONSE. SAMPLES - BEING
SHIPPED 11/20/18 VIA UPS OVERNIGHT TO:
PURCHASING/BID DEPT. ROOM 164 C.B.
YOUNG, JR. SERVICE CENTER 3001
CRITTENDEN DR. LOUISVILLE, KY 40209

Southwest Jefferson Inc. NO BID NO BID

Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource
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ITEMNO.1 -1OT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 1/2" x 11" blue. ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103309 or
equal. THIS NOTE APPLIES TO ITEM NOS. 1 throuah 8: Acid free. 20 Ib. basis weight, bond smooth surface, superior runnability,
75 GSM, 150 smoothness. 87 opacity, 99.99% iam-free. SEI/FSC certified, guaranteed to run on small and larae offset presses,
digital imaaina equipment. including copiers, laser and ink-iet printers and plain paper fax machines. |IF BIDDING THE APPROVED
PRODUCT. NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED. SAMPLE =1 SWATCHBOOK. 1 -500.0000 Each Ream. Estimated Quantity - 2,400
(5760240-1423383)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company DOMTAR Earthchoice Colors MP 0 Bond CT 3.7400
#81199
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CR96
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Hammermill 4.1200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103309

ITEMNO, 2 -LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper. multi-purpose, 8 1/2" x 11", buff. ream/500 sheets. Hammermill Fore MP #103325 or
eaual. 1-500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 1.200 (5760240-1661785)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company DOMTAR Earthchoice Colors MP 0 Bond CT 3.7400
#81204
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC8928
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30 / Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Hammermilt 4.1200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103325

ITEMNO. 3 -LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper. multi-purpose. 8 1/2" x 11", canarv. ream/500 sheets. Hammermill Fore MP #103341 or
eaual. 1 -500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantitv - 2.000 (5760240-1649967)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company DOMTAR Earthchoice Colors MP 0 Bond CT 3.7400
#31196
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ER96
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30 / Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Hammermill 4.1200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103341

ITEMNO.4 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper. multi-purpose. 8 1/2" x 11", aoldenrod. ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103168
or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream. Estimated Quantity - 1,200 (5760240-1652261)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Milicraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Milicraft Paper Company DOMTAR Earthchoice Colors MP Q0 Bond CT 3.7400
#81203
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HR96
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Hammermill 4.1200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103168

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 3



ITEMNO. 5 -1LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose. 8 1/2" x 11". areen, ream/500 sheets. Hammermill Fore MP #103366 or
eaual. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream. Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240-1649965)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company DOMTAR Earthchoice Colors MP 0 Bond CT
#381197
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: JRO6
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30 / Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Hammermili
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103366

ITEMNO.6 -1LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose. 8 1/2" x 11"_lilac. ream/500 sheets. Hammermill Fore MP #102269 or
eaual. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream. Estimated Quantity - 2,400 (5760240-2012454)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Milicraft Paper Company DOMTAR Earthchoice Colors MP 0 Bond CT
#31200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ACB8930
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Hammermill
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 102269

ITEMNO. 7 -LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper. multi-ourpose, 8 1/2" x 11", pink, ream/500 sheets. Hammermill Fore MP #103382 or
equal. 1 -500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2.000 (5760240-1649966)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company DOMTAR Earthchoice Colors MP 0 Bond CT
#81198
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MR88
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Hammermill
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103382

ITEMNO. 8 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper. multi-purpose, 8 1/2" x 11", salmon. ream/500 sheets. Hammermill Fore MP #103119 or
eaual. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2.400 (5760240-2012455)

.OT AWARD NOTES:; Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company DOMTAR Earthchoice Colors MP 0 Bond CT
#81206
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NR88
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30 / Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Hammermill
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103319

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 4



ITEMNO. 9 - Paper. multi-purpose, 8 1/2" x 11", red. ream/500 sheets. Mohawk Britehue #471608 or equal. Acid free. 20 Ib.
basis weiaght. bond smooth surface. GREEN SEAL certified. compatible with all office equipment and printers. laser quaranteed. IF
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT. NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED. SAMPLE =1 SWATCHBOOK. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream,
Estimated Quantity - 1.200 (5760240-2012456)

ITEM AWARD NOTES:  Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract. There were no other
bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Southwest Jefferson Inc. NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Millcraft Paper Company NEENAH Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26751
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7521
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31

ITEM NO. 10 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose. 8 1/2" x 11", bright blue. ream/500 sheets. Neenah Exact Bright
#26781 or equal. THIS NOTE APPLIES TO ITEM NOS. 10 through 17: Acid and lianin-free. 50 lb, text, bond smooth surface. 74
G/M2, elemental chlorine free. consistent color side-to-side. run-to-run. SEI/ESC certified, copier. laser. ink-iet and offset
guaranteed. IF BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT. NO SAMPLE |S REQUIRED. SAMPLE =1 SWATCHBOOK. 1 -500.0000
Each Ream. Estimated Quantitv - 2,000 (5760240-1719700)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company NEENAH Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26781
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7514
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Exact 5.6900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 26781

ITEM NO. 11 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper. multi-purpose, 8 1/2" x 11", bright areen. ream/500 sheets. Neenah Exact Bright
#26791 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2.800 (5760240-1719702)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company NEENAH Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26791
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7516
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30 / Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Exact 5.6900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 26791

ITEMNO. 12 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper. multi-ourpose. 8 1/2" x 11", briaht orange. ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Bright
#26721 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream. Estimated Quantitv - 2.400 (5760240-1719703)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Miilcraft Paper Company NEENAH Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26731
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7522

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 5



Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Exact 5.6900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 26721

ITEM NO. 13 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-ourpose, 8 1/2"x 11", briaht pine, ream/500 sheets. Neenah Exact Bright
#26801 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream. Estimated Quantitv - 1.600 (5760240-1719706)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)
Millcraft Paper Company NEENAH Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26801
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7519
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Exact 5.6900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 26801

ITEMNO. 14 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper. multi-ourpose. 8 1/2" x 11", briaht pink. ream/500 sheets. Neenah Exact Bright
#26741 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream. Estimated Quantity - 2.400 (5760240-1719701)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company NEENA Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26741
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7445
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Exact 5.6900%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 26741

ITEM NO. 15 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper. multi-purpose, 8 1/2" x 11", briaht purple, ream/500 sheets. Neenah Exact Bright
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#26771 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240-2012457)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company NEENAH Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26771
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7520
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Exact 5.6900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 26771

ITEM NO. 16 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper. multi-purpose, 8 1/2" x 11", briaht red. ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briaht #26751
or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream. Estimated Quantitv - 2.000 (5760240-1719705)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Milicraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Millcraft Paper Company NEENAH Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26751
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7521
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Exact 5.6900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 26751

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 6



ITEMNO. 17 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper. multi-purpose. 8 1/2" x 11". briaht vellow. ream/500 sheets. Neenah Exact Bright
#26701 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3.200 (5760240-1719704)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Millcraft Paper Company - prices not firm for the period of the contract.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Millcraft Paper Company NEENAH Smooth Exact Brights Bond CT 5.2500
#26701
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AC7523
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Our Terms are 1% 30/ Net 31
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource Exact 5.6900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 26701

Note: * Indicates a pending award. PAGE 7



TOTAL BIDS - 10-17

VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource 104,696.00 104,696.00
Milicraft Paper Company 96,600.00
$104,696.00
TOTAL BIDS - 1-8
YENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource 64,272.00 64,272.00
Millcraft Paper Company 58,344.00
$64,272.00

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($

Millcraft Paper Company 161,244.00

Southwest Jefferson Inc. 1.20

Veritiv, formerly xpedx and Unisource 168,968.00 168,968.00
168,968.00

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 9



