JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7624

APPROVAL DATE: January 8, 2019

ITEM(S) QUOTED: FRESH FRUIT & VEGETABLE PROGRAM PREPACKAGED
PRODUCE

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: November 19, 2018

CONTRACT PERIOD: From January 8, 2019 through September 30, 2019

RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name I Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Creation Gardens Thank you for your consideration. We hope
we get to work more with JCPS for the FFV
Program.

30 days

DNO Produce

21 days. 1% discount if paid within 7 days.

Sysco Louisville
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ITEMNO. 1 - Apple. slices, red. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. bright in color. crisp slices. no core. Samples required. Readyv to
eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specifvy ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 400
(4445840-2012369)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Sysco Louisville price of $24.30 adjusted to reflect price per package.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville PETERSON FARMS #210005 0.2430*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8205072

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 100/ 20z

Creation Gardens Peterson Farms #203102 0.2850
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 82075

DNO Produce DNO, Inc. 19.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 13004

ITEM NO. 2 - Apble. slices, areen. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. bright in color. crisp slices. no core. Samples required. Ready to
eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specifv ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to DNO Produce as low bidder based on price per package.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59843 15.9200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3415870

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 18.9000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 13009
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Item is packed in 80 x 2 oz package.

ITEMNO.3 - Blackberries. Fresh. U.S. No.1 standard. dry. clean. plump, bright and well colored. Samples required. Readv to
eat. Aporox. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specifv ounces per package and number of backaaes per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 1.0300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17108
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-20z bags when product is in season.

ITEMNO. 4 - Blueberries. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. firm. plump. drv and dark in color. Samples required. Readyv to eat.
Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per package and number of packaaes per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 3



RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 1.2000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17110
RESPONSE |TEM NOTES: Packed 80-2 oz when in season.

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 53.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 14386

ITEM NO.5 - Broccoli. florets. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. florets. trimmed. sulfite-free. bright green. Samples reauired. crisp,
firm. Readv io eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specifv ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens - insufficient information supplied for evaluation purposes.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.3900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17008

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59771 19.6700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8449011

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 21.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 13033

ITEM NO.6 - Cantaloupe. cubes. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. Readyv to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Samples reauired. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Soecifv ounces per packaae and
number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.3900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17061
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-20z per case.

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 28.7500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 14286

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59762 29.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2516450

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

ITEMNO.7 - Carrots. babyv. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. briaht in color and moist. Sambles required. Readv to eat. Approx.
(200) 1.6-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 100

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens - insufficient information supplied for evaluation purposes.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($

Creation Gardens Bolthouse Farms 0.1300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 20490

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59815 25.7500*

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 4



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 6919450
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 100ct 1/5 cup

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 26.8500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1300

ITEMNO. 8 - Cauliflower. florets. Fresh cut. Sulfate free. packaged in gas permeable package. code dated. Samples reauired.

Clean. firm. compact florets. no brownina. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv ounces per package and number of packaaes per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Sysco Louisville as low bidder based on $0.1532 price per ounce.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.4600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17029

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-2 oz per case.

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59769 22.9800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8447704
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CuUP

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 30.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 13331

ITEMNO.9 - Celery. sticks. Fresh. U.S. No.1 standard, clean. crisp stalks. Samples required. No leaves or indications of wilting.
Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM

NOTES field: Specifv ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens - insufficient information supplied for evaluation purposes.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.3800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17037

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59773 17.1300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1445236

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 17.8500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 13199

ITEM NO. 10 - Cherries. red. Fresh, U.S. No. 1 standard. plump smooth skin and briaht red color. Samples required. Readyv to

eat. Approx. (650) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specifv ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.9800*

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 5



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17063

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: These are extremely seasonal and may only be available at the end of May- beginning
on August. Packed 80-2 oz per case.

ITEM NO. 11 - Cucumber. slices. Fresh. U.S. fancy standard. medium size slices. good shape shiny or Samples required. waxy

surface. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated

Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.3200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17049
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-2 oz per case.

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 25.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 13512

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #60445 25,1900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3326494

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

ITEM NO. 12 - Grapefruit. wedges. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. rind to be intact. bright in color. Samples required. Ready to eat.
Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens and DNO Produce - insufficient information supplied for evaluation
purposes. There were no other bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.4100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17075

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 26.8500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12712

ITEMNO. 13 - Grapes. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. Ready fo eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Samples reauired. SAMPLE REQUIRED.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv ounces per packaae and number of
packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens - insufficient information supplied for evaluation purposes.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.5100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17125

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #60393 22.2100*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1854508

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 24.8500

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 6



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12616

ITEM NO. 14 - Honevdew. cubes. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Aoprox. (50) 2-0z. Samples required. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv ounces per packaae and
number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Fach Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES:  Reject Creation Gardens - insufficient information supplied for evaluation purposes.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.4400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17069

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59763 32.9300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1457658

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

ITEMNO. 15 - Kiwi. slices. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. no wrinkles or signs of bruisina/damage. Samples required. Ready to
eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specifv ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens and DNO Produce - insufficient information supplied for evaluation
purposes. There were no other bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Creation Gardens Creation Garden's 0.3600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17469

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 26,0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 13444

ITEM NO. 16 - Lemon. wedges. Fresh U.S. No. 1 standard. rinds to be removed. flesh onlv. Samples reaquired. Ready to eat.
Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens and DNO Produce - insufficient information supplied for evaluation
purposes. There were no other bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (8)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.3500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17137
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: This product is a wedge cut and includes the rind.

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 25.7500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4220

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 7



ITEM NO. 17 - Lime. wedges. Fresh U.S. No. 1 standard. rinds to be removed. flesh onlv. Samples required. Ready to eat.
Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per packaae and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens - insufficient information supplied for evaluation purposes. There were no
other bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)}
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.2900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 99999
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: This is a wedge product that includes the rind.

ITEM NO. 18 - Mango. chunks. Fresh. slightly soft. vellow tinge. no fibrous pieces of pit. Samples required. Ready to eat.
Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Sysco Louisville as low bidder based on $0.3005 price per ounce.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.7000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17120

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-2 oz per case.

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59761 45.0800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1428178
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER )

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

ITEM NO. 19 - Orange. wedges. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Samples required. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv ounces per package and
number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Creation Gardens and DNO Produce - insufficient information supplied for evaluation

purposes.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.3300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17080

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80 units per case.

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 21.2000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12729

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #60394 22.4300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2766010

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50ct 30z

ITEM NO. 20 - Peas. suaar snap or snow. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. bright areen with wellfilled pods with large Samples
required. round peas inside. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the

VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 400

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 8



ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Sysco Louisville as low bidder based on $0.1959 price per ounce.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.5600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17171
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-20z per case.

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59768 29.3900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2395749

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 35.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10123
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Snow Peas

ITEM NO. 21 - Pineapple. cubes. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. Readv to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Samples reauired. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv ounces per packaae and
number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.4500*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17091
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-2 oz per case.

Sysco Louisville ) TAYLOR FARMS #59764 33.8100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2425603

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

ITEM NO. 22 - Tomato. grape. Fresh U.S. No. 1 standard. ripeness stage 4 or 5. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Samples
required. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv ounces
per packaae and number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Sysco Louisvilie as low bidder based on $0.1517 price per ounce.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.3500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17244
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-2 oz per case

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59770 22.7600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2395824

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 23.7500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 11086

ITEM NO. 23 - Watermelon. chunks. Fresh, U.S. No. 1 standard. Readyv to eat. Approx. {50) 2-oz. Samples reauired. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specifv ounces per packaae and
number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 400

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID 0.0010

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 9



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.5600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17116
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-2 oz per case.

ITEM NO. 24 - Zucchini. slices. Fresh. U.S. No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Approx. {50) 2-0z. Samples reauired. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces per packaae and
number of packages per case. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Sysco Louisville as low bidder based on $0.1230 price per ounce.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Creation Gardens Creation Gardens 0.4000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 17230
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed 80-20z per case.

Sysco Louisville TAYLOR FARMS #59844 18.4500%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3242944

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 4 WEEKS WITH UTILIZATION OF SYSCO ACCOUNT CENTER
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/ 1/2CUP

DNO Produce DNO,INC. 21.8500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 14183
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 80 x 20z. cases

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 10



VENDOR NAME

TJOTAL BIDS

TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL (8§}

Creation Gardens 4,471.00 1,972.00
DNO Produce 170,585.00 7,560.00
Sysco Louisville 145,655.40 103,884.20
113,416.20

Note: * indicates a pending award.

PAGE 11



