JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7618

APPROVAL DATE: October 30, 2018

ITEM(S) QUOTED: FURNITURE, CLASSROOM & OFFICE (Line ltem) .
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: October 04, 2018

CONTRACT PERIOD: From November 02, 2018 through November 01, 2019
RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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Vendor Response Terms

| Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Creative-image technologies

Drennan Equipment Company

Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc.

Available Paint Colors: All Core Paint Colors.
Available Laminate Colors: All Grade L1
Laminate Colors.

Net 30 Days.

John R Green Co

Delivery within 45 business days ARO.

30 days net.

Lakeshore Learning Materials

Lakeshore is offering 7% discount and FREE
shipping on all purchases! Discount not
applicable to sale items. Please reference
"Per Bid #7618" on all purchase orders.
Lakeshore has entered "0.01" and "NO BID"
for items we are not bidding on.

net 30

School Specialty Inc.

Must reference Quote #7788722083 on all
purchase orders to ensure pricing and
delivery. Contact Jessica Stevens at
800-305-0174 Ext 1648 with questions.

Net 30

Tom Sexton & Associates

45-60 ARO

Net 30 Days

Wenger Corp.

Thank you for the opportunity to submit bid
prices for the attached specifications.
Unfortunately, Wenger Corporation cannot
meet the specifications and will be submitting
a 'no bid' response. Gwen Springer
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ITEMNO. 1 -LOT CODE: - 1-6 - Bookcase. wood. 36"W x 30"H x 12"D. with (1) fixed shelf. Communitv Conaress Line or equal.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available finishes for ltem Nos. 1 thru 6, 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 50 (4600250-1702558)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Lakeshore Learning Materials - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Drennan Equipment Company Community/JSI #CO3630BC 335.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CO3630Bc

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Brownie/Dark Mahogany Canyon/Medium Mahogany Citron/Golden Oak Desert/Light
Cherry Ecru/Natural Henna/Medium Cherry Honey/Medium Oak Nut Brown/Medium

Walnut

ITEMNO. 2 - LOT CODE: - 1-6_- Bookcase, wood, 36"W x 36"H x 12"D. with (1) fixed shelf,. Communitv Conaress Line or equal.
1 -1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 40 (4600250-1724326)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Lakeshore Learning Materials - incomplete coverage for Lot ltem Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Drennan Equipment Company Community/JSI #CO3636BC 379.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: C03636BC

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Brownie/Dark Mahogany Canyon/Medium Mahogany Citron/Golden Oak Desert/Light
Cherry Ecru/Natural Henna/Medium Cherry Honey/Medium Oak Nut Brown/Medium

Walnut

ITEMNO.3 - LOT CODE: - 1-6 - Bookcase. wood. 36"W x 48"H x 12"D. with (1) fixed shelf & (1) adiustable shelf. Community
Conaress Line or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 20 (4600250-1693629)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Lakeshore Learning Materials - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #LC229 305.9700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LC229

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FLEX-SPACE 3-SHELF ALL-PURPOSE STORAGE UNIT - NON ADJUSTABLE - 36"W
X 14 1/2"D X 46"H

Drennan Equipment Company Community/JSI #C03648BC 465.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CO3648BC
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Brownie/Dark Mahogany Canyon/Medium Mahogany Citron/Golden Oak Desert/Light
Cherry Ecru/Natural Henna/Medium Cherry Honey/Medium Oak Nut Brown/Medium
Walnut
ITEMNO. 4 -LOT CODE: - 1-6 - Bookcase. wood, 36"W x 60"H x 12"D. with (1) fixed shelf & (2) adiustable shelves. Samples
reaquired. Communitv Conaress Line or equal. SAMPLE REQUIRED. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 20
(4600250-1690106)
LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Lakeshore Learning Materials - incompiete coverage for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 6.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 3



Lakeshore Learning Materials

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LC230
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES:

LAKESHORE #LC230 371.0700

FLEX-SPACE 4-SHELF ALL-PURPOSE STORAGE UNIT - NON ADJUSTABLE - 36"W
X 14 1/2"D X 60 1/2"H

Drennan Equipment Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: C0O3660BC
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES:

Community/JSI #CO3660BC 555.0000*

Brownie/Dark Mahogany Canyon/Medium Mahogany Citron/Golden Oak Desert/Light

Cherry Ecru/Natural Henna/Medium Cherry Honey/Medium Oak Nut Brown/Medium
Walnut

[TEM NO.5 -LOT CODE: - 1-6 - Bookcase, wood. 36"W x 72"H x 12"D. with (1) fixed shelf & (3) adjustable shelves_Community
Conaress Line or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 20 (4600250-1702560)

LOT AWARD NOTES:

Reject Lakeshore Learning Materials - incomplete coverage for Lot ltem Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Drennan Equipment Company Community/JSI #CO3672BC 630.0000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: C0O3672BC
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES:

Brownie/Dark Mahogany Canyon/Medium Mahogany Citron/Golden Oak Desert/Light

Cherry Ecru/Natural Henna/Medium Cherry Honey/Medium Oak Nut Brown/Medium
Walnut

ITEMNO.6 -LOT CODE: - 1-6 - Bookcase. wood, 36"W x 84"H x 12"D. with (1) fixed shelf & (4) adjustable shelves. Community
Conaress Line or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 15 (4600250-1702561)

LOT AWARD NOTES:
VENDOR NAME
Lakeshore Learning Materials

Reject Lakeshore Learning Materials - incomplete coverage for Lot Item Nos, 1 thru 6.

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
NO BID #NO BID

0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
Drennan Equipment Company Community/JSI #C03684BC 723.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CO0O3684BC
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Brownie/Dark Mahogany Canyon/Medium Mahogany Citron/Golden Oak Desert/Light
Cherry Ecru/Natural Henna/Medium Cherry Honey/Medium Oak Nut Brown/Medium
Walnut
ITEMNO. 7 -1LOT CODE: - 7-10 - Cabinet, file with cam tvpe kev lock. 2 drawer letter size. Hon or equal. Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE {TEM NOTES field: List available colors for ltem Nos. 7 thru 10, 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 40 (4600250-1717533)
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. Hon #H312 204.3100%

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HON-H312
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days.

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 4



RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Available Paint Colors: Loft, Muslin, Light Gray, Greige, Putty, Shadow, Charcoal, and
Black.

ITEMNO. 8 - LOT CODE: - 7-10 - Cabinet, file with cam fvbe kev lock. 2 drawer legal size. Hon or equal, 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 5 (4600250-1717534)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. Hon #H312C 255.0600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HON-H312C

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Available Paint Colors: Loft, Muslin, Light Gray, Greige, Puity, Shadow, Charcoal, and
Black.

ITEMNO.9 -LOT CODE: - 7-10 - Cabinet. file with cam tvpe kev lock, 4 drawer letter size. Hon or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 100 (4600250-1717535)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. Hon #H314 277.8100*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HON-H314

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Available Paint Colors: Loft, Muslin, Light Gray, Greige, Putty, Shadow, Charcoal, and
Black.

ITEM NO. 10 - LOT CODE: - 7-10 - Cabinet. file with cam tvpe kev lock. 4 drawer legal size. Hon or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 2 (4600250-1717536)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3$)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. Hon #H314C 333.3800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HON-H314C

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Available Paint Colors: Loft, Muslin, Light Gray, Greige, Putty, Shadow, Charcoal, and
Black.

ITEM NO. 11 - LOT CODE: - 11-12 - Cabinet, lateral file, letter size. 3-compartment. 40 7/8"H x 36"W x 19 1/4"D. Hon or eaual.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE I[TEM NOTES field: List available colors for Item Nos. 11 thru 12, 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 6 (4600250-1717537)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. Hon #H683 486.0600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HON-H683

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Available Paint Colors: Loft, Muslin, Light Gray, Greige, Putty, Shadow, Charcoal, and
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Black.

ITEMNO. 12 - LOT CODE: - 11-12 - Cabinet. lateral file, letter size, 5-compartment 67"H x 36"W x 19 1/4"D. Hon or equal. 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 6 (4600250-1717539)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. Hon #H685 784.0000%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HON-H685

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Available Paint Colors: Loft, Muslin, Light Gray, Greige, Putty, Shadow, Charcoal, and
Black.

ITEM NO. 13 - Cabinet, storage, metal. combination. 36"W x 18"D x 72"H. Sanduskv Lee Classic Series #CAC1361872-XX or
eaual. Please respond o the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 10 (4600250-1702628)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Wenger Corp. Wenger Corporation 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

School Specialty Inc. Sandusky Lee #CAC1 361872-xx 354.5800%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1363921
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: black, charcoal, dove gray, putty, tropic sand

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #DG218 650.0700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: DG218
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 5-SHELVES 30"w x 23"d x 72"h - LAMINATE

ITEM NO. 14 - Cabinet. storage, metal. plain, 36"W x 18"D x 78"H. Sanduskv Lee Classic Series #CA41361878-XX or eaual.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantitv - 100 (4600250-1665392)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Wenger Corp. Wenger Corporation 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

School Specialty Inc. Sandusky Lee #CA41 361878-xx 346.1000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1362505
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: black, charcoal, dove gray, putty, tropic sand

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 6



ITEM NO. 15 - LOT CODE: - 15-18 - Chair_all purpose, traditional stvle. with leas, 11" +/- 1" Artco-Bell or eaual. Please respond
to the followinga in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors for ltem Nos. 15 thru 18. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 5 (4600250-1717541)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot ltem Nos. 15 thru 18.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1357319 22.9600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1357319

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Black, Hunter Green, Gray Navy Blue, Royal Blue, Burgundy, Red, Green,
Yellow, Beige

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-7101 24.6800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-7101
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 45-60 Days. Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple
Green, Azure, Purple, Royal Blue & Navy.

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN611BU 30.6800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN611BU
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: STACKING CHAIR 11 1/2"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #53312-1 67.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53312-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black and Cool Gray

ITEM NO. 16 - LOT CODE: - 15-18 - Chair, all purpose. traditional stvle, with leas. 13" +/- 1", Artco-Bell or equal. 1 - 1.0000
Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 150 (4600250-1717542)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot Item Nos. 15 thru 18.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1357318 22,9600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1357318

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Black, Hunter Green, Gray Navy Blue, Royal Blue, Burgundy, Red, Green,
Yellow, Beige

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-7103 24.6800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-7103
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 45-60 Days. Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple
Green, Azure, Purple, Royal Blue & Navy.

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN613BU 32.5400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN613BU
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: STACKING CHAIR 13 1/2"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #53314-1 ' 67.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53314-1

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 7



RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black, Cool Gray

ITEM NO. 17 - LOT CODE: - 15-18 - Chair, all purpose. traditional stvle. with leas. 15" +/- 1". Artco-Bell or equal. 1 - 1.0000
Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 150 (4600250-1717543)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot ltem Nos. 15 thru 18.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1357317 25.8200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1357317

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Black, Hunter Green, Gray Navy Blue, Royal Blue, Burgundy, Red, Green,
Yellow, Beige

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-7105 28.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-7105
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 45-60 Days. Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple
Green, Azure, Purple, Royal Blue & Navy.

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN615BU 41.8400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN615BU
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: STACKING CHAIR 15 1/2"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #53316-1 79.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53316-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Available Colors include: Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black, Cool Gray

ITEM NO. 18 - LOT CODE: - 15-18 - Chair, all purpose. traditional stvle, with leas, 17" +/- 1". Artco-Bell or equal. 1 - 1.0000
Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 1,200 (4600250-1717544)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot ltem Nos. 15 thru 18.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1357316 28.3300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1357316

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Black, Hunter Green, Gray Navy Blue, Royal Blue, Burgundy, Red, Green,
Yellow, Beige

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-7107 30.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-7107
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 45-60 Days. Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple
Green, Azure, Purple, Royal Blue & Navy.

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN617BU 46.4900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN617BU
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 8



RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: STACKING CHAIR 17 1/2"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #53318-1 82.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53318-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black, Cool Gray

ITEM NO. 19 - LOT CODE: - 19-22 - Chair, all burpose, contemporary stvle. with leas. 12" Artco-Bell or equal. Please respond to
the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:  List available colors for ltem Nos. 19 thru 22. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 20 (4600250-2013459)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot Item Nos. 19 thru 22.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc, Classroom Select #1357326 22.9600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1357326

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Black, Hunter Green, Gray Navy Blue, Royal Blue, Burgundy, Red, Green,
Yellow, Beige

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-D10D 25.0400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-D10D
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 45-60 Days. Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple :
Green, Azure, Purple, Royal Biue & Navy.

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN611BU 30.6800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN611BU
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: STACKING CHAIR 11 1/2"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #53312-1 67.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53312-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black, Cool Gray
Includes 12 Year Warranty

ITEM NO. 20 - LOT CODE: - 19-22 - Chair. all purpose. contemporaryv stvle, with leas. 14" Artco-Bell or equal’ 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 25 (4600250-2013460)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot Item Nos. 19 thru 22.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1357325 22.9600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1357325

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS; Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Black, Hunter Green, Gray Navy Blue, Royal Blue, Burgundy, Red, Green,
Yellow, Beige

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-D10C 25.0400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-D10C
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 45-60 Days. Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 9



Green, Azure, Purple, Royal Biue & Navy.

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN613BU 32.5400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN613BU
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: STACKING CHAIR 13 1/2"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #53314-1 67.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53314-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black, Cool Gray
Includes 12 Year Warranty

ITEM NO. 21 - LOT CODE: - 19-22 - Chair, all purpose, contemporary stvle. with leas. 16". Artco-Bell or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 150 (4600250-2013461)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot ltem Nos. 19 thru 22.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1357324 25.8200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1357324

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Black, Hunter Green, Gray Navy Blue, Royal Blue, Burgundy, Red, Green,
Yellow, Beige

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-D10B 28.5800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-D10B
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 45-60 Days. Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple
Green, Azure, Purple, Royal Blue & Navy.

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN615BU 41.8400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN615BU
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: STACKING CHAIR 15 1/2"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #53316-1 79.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53316-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black, Cool Gray
Includes 12 Year Warranty

ITEM NO, 22 - LOT CODE: - 19-22 - Chair, all purpose, contemporarv stvle, with leas, 18". Artco-Bell or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 600 (4600250-2013462)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot ltem Nos. 19 thru 22.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1357323 28.3300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1357323

RESPONSE [TEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Black, Hunter Green, Gray Navy Blue, Royal Blue, Burgundy, Red, Green,
Yellow, Beige

Note: * indicates a pending award PAGE 10



Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-D10A 30.4600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-D10A
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 45-60 Days. Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple
Green, Azure, Purple, Royal Biue & Navy.

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN617BU 46.4900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN617BU
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: STACKING CHAIR 17 1/2"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #53318-1 82.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53318-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black, Cool Gray
Includes 12 Year Warranty

ITEM NO. 23 - LOT CODE: - 23-25 - Chair. foldina, metal tubular steel. National Public Seatina 300 Series or eaual. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors for Item Nos. 23 thru 25. 1 - 1.0000
Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 400 (4600250-1713451)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty Inc. National Public Seating #300 Series 18.3800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1362371

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Beige, Grey, Brown, Blue, Black

ITEM NO. 24 - LOT CODE: - 23-25 - Rack, chair, 50-chair capacitv. National Public Seatina D4 Series or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 5 (4460570-1703168)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty Inc. National Public Seating #DY-50 181.5600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 677299

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

ITEM NO. 25 - LOT CODE: - 23-25 - Rack. chair. 84-chair capacitv. National Public Seatina D4 Series or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 5 (4460570-1724360)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty Inc. National Public Seating #84 285.5600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 661637

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30
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ITEM NO. 26 - Chair, combination desk, 17 1/2" - 18". Artco-Bell #ABC-7457 or eaual, Samples reauired. HARDWARE SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE [TEM NOTES field: _List available work surface and
seat colors. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 800 (4600250-1722008)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Wenger Corp. Wenger Corpraton 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-7457B 93.6400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-7457B
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple Green, Azure, Purple,
Royal Blue & Navy. Top Colors: Nepal Teak, Grey Glace, Oak & Walnut.

ITEM NO. 27 - Desk, student. open front, with metal book compartment, adiustable pedestals. Scholarcraft #5C7800FB or eaual.
Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors for ton. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 600 (4600250-1717560)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - lowest adjustable height of 23 1/2" not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Wenger Corp. Wenger Corporation 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

School Specialty Inc. Royal Seating/Classroom Select #1497104 88.9900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1497104
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: Montana walnut, Nepal teak, banister oak, fusion maple, gray glace - black
X painted edge

John R Green Co SFT-SC7800FB 98.9900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SFT-SC7800FB
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery within 45 business days ARO. Color top options: Light Oak, Walnut, Gray
Nebula, Sugar Maple

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #10x31x-xxxx 315.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10x31X-XXXX
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Leg Color- Black or Platinum Edgeband - Black or Platinum,
Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Navy, Black, Cool Gray Laminate Color - Gray

Nebula, Fusion Maple, Amber Cherry Includes #66632 - Desk Book Box-Black Twelve
Year Warranty Included

ITEM NO. 28 - L OT CODE: - 28-29 - Desk, teacher's. wood laminate. double pedestal. 60" x 30" x 29 1/2". Hon 10500 Series or
equal. Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors for Item Nos. 28 thru
29. 1-1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 20 (4600250-1724325)
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VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. Hon #H105892 690.7600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HON-H105892

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES:; FULL PEDESTAL DESK IS QUOTED! Available Laminate Colors: Sheer Mesh, Silver
Mesh, Steel Mesh, White, Gray, Grey Tigris, Shadow Zephyr, Desert Zephyr, Canyon
Zephyr, Brilliant White, Whitestone, Loft, Charcoal, Black, Natural Maple, Harvest,
Pinnacle, Bourbon Cherry, Coénac, Shaker Cherry, Mahogany, and Mocha.

Drennan Equipment Company HON #H105892/H1526/C2 1,107.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: H105892/H1526/C2
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Natural Maple Harvest Bourbon Cherry Cognac Shaker Cherry Mahogany Mocha Full
Pedestals-Center Drawer-Brushed Chrome handies

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90449-4622-PL 1,130.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90449-4622-PL
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available included: gray nebula/black edgeband fusion maple/black edgeband
amber cherry/black edgeband Leg Colors - Black or Platinum

ITEM NO. 29 - LOT CODE: - 28-29 - Desk. teacher's, wood laminate. double pedestal, 66" x 30" x 29 1/2". Hon 10500 Series or
eaual. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 5 (4600250-1720043)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. Hon #H105891 734.5600%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HON-H105891

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: FULL PEDESTAL DESK IS QUOTED! Available L.aminate Colors: Sheer Mesh, Silver
Mesh, Steel Mesh, White, Gray, Grey Tigris, Shadow Zephyr, Desert Zephyr, Canyon
Zephyr, Brilliant White, Whitestone, Loft, Charcoal, Black, Natural Maple, Harvest,
Pinnacle, Bourbon Cherry, Cognac, Shaker Cherry, Mahogany, and Mocha.

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90449-4622-PL 1,130.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90449-4622-PL
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available included: gray nebula/black edgeband fusion maple/black edgeband
amber cherry/black edgeband Leg Colors - Black or Platinum

Drennan Equipment Company HON #H105891/H1526/C 1,195.6000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: H105891/H1526/C2
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Natural Maple Harvest Bourbon Cherry Cognac Shaker Cherry Mahogany Mocha Full
Pedestals-Center Drawer-Brushed Chrome Handles

ITEM NO. 30 - LOT CODE: - 30-31 - Stool. teachers'. adiustable heiaht 25" throuah 33" with pad. Artco-Bell D99AU or equal.
Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES FIELD:  List available colors for ltem Nos. 30 thru 31
1-1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 10 (4600250-1717562)
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LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot ltem Nos. 30 thru 31.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1441251 114.7700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1441251

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: black, hunter green, gray, navy blue, royal blue, burgundy, red, green,
yellow

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Bell #ABC-D99A-1 117.1200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-D99A-1
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Shell Colors; Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple Green, Azure, Purple,
Royal Blue & Navy.

ITEMNO. 31 - LOT CODE: - 30-31 - Stool, teachers', adiustable height 25" throuagh 33", without pad. Artco-Bell D99A or equal. 1
- 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 40 (4600250-1717563)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - Classroom Select brands bid are not equal to Artco-Bell specifications
for Lot Item Nos. 30 thru 31.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials . NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty Inc. Classroom Select #1388751 83.2100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1388751

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: black, hunter green, gray, navy blue, royal blue, burgundy, red, green,
yellow

Tom Sexton & Associates Artco Beli #ABC-D99A 95.1700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABC-D99A
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Shell Colors: Ruby Red, Graphite, Blueberry, Wine, Onyx, Apple Green, Azure, Purple,
Royal Blue & Navy

ITEM NO. 32 -1OT CODE: - 32-34 - Table adjustable height ieas_kidnev. 48" x 72" Allied F5. Artco-Bell or equal. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors for ltem Nos. 32 thru 34, 1 - 1.0000
Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 60 (4600250-1713916)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Allied Plastics #F5472K 246.2500%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: F5472K

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select laminate: Red, Green, Blue, Yellow, Gray Nebula, Fusion Maple, Teak, Light
Oak, Walnut

Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #F5472F 249.9900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: F5472F
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Walnut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula
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Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN433 296.6700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN433
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: CLASSIC ADJUSTABLE GROUP TABLE - 48" X 72"

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90527-V-xxxx-xx 349.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527-V-XxXXX-XX
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available: Edge Band - Black or Platinum Twelve Year Warranty Included

ITEM NO. 33 - LOT CODE: - 32-34 - Table, adiustable height leas, 48" diameter. round. Allied F5. Artco-Bell or equal. 1 -1.0000
Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 30 (4600250-1429298)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Allied Plastics #F548CR 140.1300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: F548CR

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select laminate: Red, Green, Blue, Yellow, Gray Nebula, Fusion Maple, Teak, Light
Oak, Walnut

Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #F548CR 176.2400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: F548CR
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Wainut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN423 222.2700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN423
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: CLASSIC ADJUSTABLE ROUND TABLES - 48

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90527-Q-xxxx-xx 260.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527-Q-XxXXX-XX
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Black or platinum edgeband Twelve Year Warranty Included

ITEMNO. 34 -1OT CODE: - 32-34 - Table. adiustable height legs. trapezoid. 30" x 30" x 60", Allied F5, Artco-Bell or equal. 1 -
1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 20 (4600250-1703187)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
School Specialty Inc. Allied Plastics #F530TP 113.6400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: F530TP

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select laminate: Red, Green, Blue, Yellow, Gray Nebula, Fusion Maple, Teak, Light
Oak, Walnut

Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #F530TP 157.4800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: F530TP
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Walnut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90527-S-xxxx-xx 252.0000
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527-S-XxXxX-XX
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Black or platinum edgeband Twelve Year Warranty Included

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #L.C641 371.0700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L.C641
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 60 x 30 x 34

ITEM NO. 35 - Table. adiustable height leas. 60" diameter. round. Allied F5 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantity - 10 (4600250-1429314)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Wenger Corp. Wenger Corporaton 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

School Specialty Inc. Allied #F560CR 205.7300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1605177
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select color: red, blue, green, yellow, gray nebula, fusion maple, teak, light oak, walnut

Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #F560CR 254.4900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: F560CR

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Walnut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula

Creative-image technologies MooreCO #90527-U-xxxx-xx 403.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527-U-xxxx-xx
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Black or Platinum Edgeband Twelve Year Warranty Included

ITEM NO. 36 - LOT CODE: - 36-40 - Table adjustable heiaht. chrome pedestal leas. rectanaular, 24" x 48". Allied T5 Series or
eaual. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors for ltem Nos. 36 thru
40. 1-1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 100 (4600250-1665850)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Allied Plastics #T752448 144.8400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T52448

RESPONSE [TEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select Laminate: Red, Blue, Green, Yellow, Gray Nebula, Fusion Maple, Teak, Light
Oak, Walnut

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90527-B-xxxx-xx 148.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527-B-xxxx-xx
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Black or platinum edgeband Twelve Year Warranty Included

Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #T52448 _ 164.6500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T52448
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Walnut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN443 166.4700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN443
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

ITEM NO. 37 - LOT CODE: - 36-40 - Table. adiustable heiaht. chrome pedestal leas, rectanaular. 30" x 48" Allied T5 Series or
eaual. 1-1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 40 (4600250-1730414)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
School Specialty Inc. Allied Plastics #T53048 154.1600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T53048

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select Laminate: Red, Blue, Green, Yellow, Gray Nebula, Fusion Maple, Teak, Light
Ozk, Walnut

Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN443 166.4700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN443
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 24" X 48"

Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #T53048 229.6300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T53048
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Walnut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90527-D-xxxx-xx 251.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527 -D-xxxx-xx
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Black or Platinum Edge Band Twelve Year Warranty Included

ITEM NO. 38 - LOT CODE: - 36-40 - Table, adjustable height. chrome pedestal leas. rectangular. 30" x 60". Allied T5 Series or
eaual. 1-1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 40 (4600250-1730415)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Allied Plastics #T53060 176.2800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T53060

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select Laminate: Red, Blue, Green, Yellow, Gray Nebula, Fusion Maple, Teak, Light

Oak, Walnut
Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN451 185.0700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN451
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30
Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #T53060 200.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T53060

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Walnut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90527-E-xxxx-XX _ 256.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527-E-xxxx-xx
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RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Black or Platinum Edgeband Twelve Year Warranty Included

ITEM NO. 39 - LOT CODE: - 36-40 - Table, adjustable height. chrome pedestal leas. rectanaular, 30" x 72". Allied T5 Series or
eaual. 1 -1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 150 (4600250-1665851)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
School Specialty Inc. Allied Plastics #T53072 197.8200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T53072

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Seléct Laminate: Red, Blue, Green, Yellow, Gray Nebula, Fusion Maple, Teak, Light

Oak, Walnut
Lakeshore Learning Materials LAKESHORE #CN453 212.9700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CN453
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30
Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #T53072 214.6900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 153072

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Walnut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90527-F-xxxx-xx 260.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527 -F-xxxx-xx
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: Black or Platinum Edgeband Twelve Year Warranty Include

ITEMNQO. 40 - LOT CODE: - 36-40 - Table. adjustable heiaht, chrome pedestal leas, rectanaular,42" x 60", Allied T5 Series or
eaqual. 1-1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 5 (4600250-1656332)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty Inc. Allied Plastics #T54260 222.0600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T54260

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Select Laminate: Red, Blue, Green, Yellow, Gray Nebula, Fusion Maple, Teak, Light
Oak, Walnut

Tom Sexton & Associates Allied #T54260 229.4900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: T54260
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Oak, Maple, Teak, Walnut, Red, Yellow, Blue & Grey Nebula

Creative-image technologies MooreCo #90527-J-xxxx-xx 334.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 90527 -J-xxxx-XX
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors available include: black or platinum edgeband Twelve Year Warranty Included
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ITEM NO. 41 - Table, craft. 60"W x 42"D x 30"H, Shain-Bilt #PT62M or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity -
6 (4460825-1717564)

ITEM AWARD NOTES:  All bids rejected. Will be rebid at a later date with revised specifications.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Wenger Corp. Wenger Corporation 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

School Specialty Inc Allied #AT4260FM 573.5600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1593011
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

Tom Sexton & Associates Diversified #DIV-PT62M 948.3400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: DIV-PT62M
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

ITEM NO. 42 - Table, folding legs, liahtweight, blow molded. rectangular, 30" x 72", National Public Seatina #B8T-3072 or equal. 1
- 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 200 (4600250-2011388)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Wenger Corp. Wenger Corporation 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

School Specialty Inc. National Public Seating #BT-3072 66.4900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 676050
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

ITEM NO. 43 - LOT CODE: - 43-45 - Table. folding deluxe pedestal stvle legs, rectangular, 30" x 72". Correll or equal. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: List available colors for ltem Nos. 43 thru 45. 1 -1.0000
Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 10 (4600250-1713458)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty Inc. Correll #CF3072PX 144,9400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CF3072PX

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Specify top: Walnut, Medium Oak, Black, Black Granite

Tom Sexton & Associates Correll #CF3072PX 170.3800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CF3072PX
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Walnut/Brown/Black or Dove Grey/Gray/Gray
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ITEMNO. 44 -1 OT CODE: - 43-45 - Table, folding deluxe pedestal stvle leas. rectanqular, 36" x 72". Correll or equal. 1 - 1.0000
Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 10 (4600250-1714825)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty inc. Correll #CF3672PX 169.1700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CF3672PX

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Specify top: Walnut, Medium Oak, Black, Black Granite

Tom Sexton & Associates Correll #CF3672PX 191.7500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CF3672PX
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Walnut/Brown/Black or Dove Grey/Gray/Gray

ITEM NO. 45 - LOT CODE: - 43-45 - Table. folding deluxe pedestal stvie leas, 48" diameter. round. Correlf or equal. 1 - 1.0000
Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 10 (4600250-1703205)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

School Specialty Inc. Correll #CF48PX 178.5700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CF48PX

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Specify top: Walnut, Medium Oak, Black, Black Granite

Tom Sexton & Associates Coreli #CF48PX 204.5800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CF48PX
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Colors: Walnut/Brown/Black or Dove Grey/Gray/Gray

ITEM NO. 46 - Table. science, 60"L x 30"H x 24"W, National Public Seating #SLT2460 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 40 (4460825-1703214)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject School Specialty Inc. - does not include built-in book boxes per bid specifications.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Lakeshore Learning Materials NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

Wenger Corp. Wenger Corporation 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

School Specialty Inc. National Public Seating #SLT2460 318.4200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1017252
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

Drennan Equipment Company Community/JSI #5C2460-30-B-COMP-BOO 344.7000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: S5C2460-30-B-COMP-BOO

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Includes 2 book compartments, black rubber boots, Powdercoated Top
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TOTAL BIDS - 11-12

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. 7,620.36 7,620.36
Lakeshore Learning Materials 12
$7,620.36
TOTAL BIDS - 15-18
VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Tom Sexton & Associates 44,025.40 44,025.40
School Specialty Inc. 41,427.80
Lakeshore Learning Materials 67,098.40
Creative-image technologies 120,635.00
$44,025.40
TOTAL BIDS - 1-6
VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Drennan Equipment Company 75,755.00 75,755.00
Lakeshore Learning Materials 13,542.05
$75,755.00
TOTAL BIDS - 19-22
VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($
Tom Sexton & Associates 23,689.80 23,689.80
School Specialty Inc. 21,904.20
Lakeshore Learning Materials 35,597.10
Creative-image technologies 64,065.00
$23,689.80
TOTAL BIDS - 23-25
VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3$) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
School Specialty Inc. 9,687.60 9,687.60
Lakeshore Learning Materials 4.10
$9,687.60
TOTAL BIDS - 28-29
VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. 17,488.00 17,488.00
Lakeshore Learning Materials .25

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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Drennan Equipment Company 28,120.00
Creative-image technologies 28,250.00
$17,488.00
TOTAL BIDS - 30-31
VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Tom Sexton & Associates 4,978.00 4.978.00
Lakeshore Learning Materials .50
School Specialty Inc. 4,476.10
$4,978.00
TOTAL BIDS - 32-34
VENDOR NAME JOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($
School Specialty Inc. 21,251.70 21,251.70
Tom Sexton & Associates 23,436.40
Lakeshore Learning Materials 31,889.70
Creative-image technologies 33,780.00
$21,251.70
TOTAL BIDS - 36-40
VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
School Specialty Inc. 58,484.90 58,484.90
Lakeshore Learning Materials 62,654.15
Tom Sexton & Associates 67,001.15
Creative-image technologies 75,750.00
$58,484.90
TOTAL BIDS - 43-45
VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($
School Specialty Inc 4,926.80 4,926.80
Lakeshore Learning Materials .30
Tom Sexton & Associates 5,667.10
$4,926.80
TOTAL BIDS - 7-10
VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. 37,895.46 37,895.46
Lakeshore Learning Materials 1.47
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PAGE 23



$37,895.46
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL (8
Creative-image technologies 515,510.00
Drennan Equipment Company 117,663.00 89,543.00
Hurst Office Suppliers, Inc. 63,003.82 63,003.82
John R Green Co 59,394.00 59,394.00
Lakeshore Learning Materials 217,306.40
School Specialty Inc. 285,242.36 147,862.10
Tom Sexton & Associates 251,944.79 147,605.20
Wenger Corp. 176.60

507,408.12
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