## 

DATE 9/6/2018

P O Box 1249 Cadiz, KY 42211 NO BID Foundations Primary Care 249 Main Street Cadiz, KY 42211 NO BID  Trigg County Vedical Clinic 250 Main St. Suite A Cadiz, KY 42211 Pennyrile District Health P O Box 770 Eddyville, KY 42038 F-MAIL NO BID  Trigg County Hospital 154 Man Street Cadiz, KY 42211  Jennie Stuart Hospital 320 W 18th Street Hopkinsville KY 42240 NO BID  NO BID  \$10.00
NO BID  NO BID  E-MAIL NO BID  10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00
NO BID  NO BID  E-MAIL NO BID  10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00
NO BID  E-MAIL NO BID  10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID
E-MAIL NO BID  10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID
E-MAIL NO BID  10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID
E-MAIL NO BID  10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID
10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID
10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID
10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID
10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID
10 PANEL INITIAL \$25.00  NO BID



September 4, 2018

Trigg County Schools 202 Main Street Cadiz, KY 42211

Re:

Bid - Student Athlete Random Drug Testing

Opening – 3:00 p.m., September 6, 2018

Attn: James R. Mangels

To Whom It May Concern:

Please, accept the enclosed bid from Trigg County Hospital for the provision of student athlete random drug tests.

We have identified the following person as our point of contact for laboratory services. We are available to answer any questions and/or address any concerns you may have regarding H. Joiner @ Tigg Hospital.019 this service.

Company:

Trigg County Hospital - Laboratory

Contact Name:

Haley Joiner

Title:

Laboratory Manager

Address:

254 Main Street

P.O. Box 312

Cadiz, KY 42211

Phone:

(270) 522-3215

Fax:

(270) 522-6427

We are prepared to provide all services identified under Scope of Services. Trigg County Hospital staff are screened prior to employment and also complete pre-employment drug testing. Additional screening shall be completed as necessary should the hospital be awarded the contract to serve Trigg County Schools in this activity. The Hospital's staff are trained and professional in the completion of their duties to include maintaining confidentiality, ensuring chain of custody requirements are met and processing specimens according to federal laboratory requirements. The hospital has a newly renovated area where specimens can be collected in privacy and comfort. All necessary supplies are readily available and maintained by the hospital.

TCH has an established agreement with a drug screening laboratory that ensures we are kept informed of current regulatory requirements regarding drug testing. Screenings are reviewed by an experienced and trained Medical Review Officer employed by this laboratory. TCH



has years of experience completing drug testing for local employers to include its own employees.

Under our current agreement with our random drug testing reviewer, our testing provider completes a 10-Panel test with pH and nitrates. The testing includes: Amphetamines, Barbiturates, Benzodiazepines, Cocaine, Marijuana, Methadone, Methamphetamines, Ecstasy, Opiates, and Phencyclidine. We recognize that the proposal only requires a 9 panel test. However, we wanted to make you aware that TCH can offer the 10 panel at the same cost you are interested.

We appreciate your consideration of our proposal and look forward to working with you.

Sincerely,

Haley Joiner

Laboratory Director

Enclosures

## Trigg County Schools 202 Main Street Cadiz, KY 42211

## **Proposal for Drug Testing of Student Athletes**

This proposal must be submitted to Trigg County Public Schools 202 Main Street Cadiz, KY 42211 by 3:00 pm CST, Thursday, September 6, 2018.

Proposal Submitted by: Trigg County Hospital - Laboratory Company/Organization\_\_\_ P.O. Box 312 Address 254 Main St., 42211 hab (270) 522-2536 210) 522-3427 Printed Name of Authorized Representative Signature of Authorized Representative **Cost Per Student** Scope Item/Service For the 2018-2019 school year beginning on or near September \$25.00 27, 2018 as defined by 09.313 Initial 9 panel urine drug test AP.1 Drug Testing of Student with pH and Nitrate Athletes. Up to three (3) additional years in one (1) year increments. \$10.00 additional-per specific test requested Transportation and Chain of Custody to certified laboratory Confirmatory test if initial 9 plus cost of confirmation test as panel urine drug test is positive defined by 09.313 AP.1 Drug Testing Student Athletes (7)