

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2019 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID LIST

Custodial Supply Bid Tabulation											
Item #	Description	Unit	CPG	Eagle	Global	Hillyard	HP Prod.	Kenway	Kerr	Leonard	Central Poly
1	Scrubbing Powder	Case	28.32	23.92	28.80	24.00	24.42	22.70	NB	NB	NB
2	Liquid Hand Soap	Case	43.00	27.88	NB	NB	35.88	34.72	NB	29.36	NB
3a	Foaming Anti-bacterial Soap	Case	35.00	30.19	NB	NB	31.40	34.56	NB	31.41	NB
3b	Bulk Dispensers	Doz.	108.00	NB	NB	83.40	120.72	166.44	NB	NB	NB
4	Deodorizing Urinal Screen	Doz.	15.60	NB	146.00	12.08	12.96	15.06	NB	12.48	NB
5	Orange Tough 40 or equal	5 Gal.	156.00	NB	NTS	97.20	113.56	128.02	NB	NB	NB
6	Spartan's Extraction II	Case	27.72	NB	NB	NB	36.05	NB	NB	27.70	NB
7	Spartan Eco-Lyzer	Case	48.96	NB	NB	NB	43.10	NB	NB	43.09	NB
8	Spartan Consume or equal	Gallon	8.75	8.59	12.00	7.18	7.55	10.51	NB	8.94	NB
9	Forward G/P	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	88.58	83.87	85.20	NB	NB
10	Virex II	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	60.46	56.23	58.20	NB	NB
11	Stride (Neutral)	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	56.63	52.95	54.00	NB	NB
12	Glance N/A	Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	40.56	41.11	NB	NB	NB
13	UHS Cleaner	6qt. Case	NB	NB	NB	NB	69.94	63.72	NB	NB	NB
14	Bleach	Case	10.92	NB	11.40	NB	10.06	12.38	NB	NB	NB
15a	Pine Scent Bulk Disinfectant	1 Gal. RTU	0.150	NB	10.49	10.060	14.590	0.140	NB	NB	NB
15b	Aerosol Disinfectant	Per Net Oz.	0.206	NB	NB	NB	2.730	0.382	NB	NB	NB
16a	Lime Away or equal	Case	41.00	NB	44.40	NB	32.48	37.32	NB	NB	NB
16b	Foamy Q&A or equal	Quart	11.880	NB	NB	NB	8.150	10.30	NB	7.730	NB
17	Pumice Stone	Case	131.96	NB	NB	NB	143.28	27.20	NB	NB	NB
18	Envirox H2 Orange2	Per Gal.	NB	34.96	NB	NB	NB	37.50	NB	NB	NB
19	Citro-Shield	Case	34.92	NB	NB	NB	32.00	NB	NB	32.90	NB
20a	Stainless Cleanser - Cream	Case	43.48	NB	29.80	NB	44.00	NB	NB	NB	NB
20b	Stainless Polish - Aerosol	Case	48.20	NB	NB	NB	43.05	NB	NB	48.18	NB
21	Vandalism Mark Remover	Net Oz.	75.000	NB	45.900	NB	38.700	46.84	NB	NB	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2019 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID LIST

Custodial Supply Bid Tabulation											
Item #	Description	Unit	CPG	Eagle	Global	Hillyard	HP Prod.	Kenway	Kerr	Leonard	Central Poly
22a	Extreme Ultra	Case	243.00	NB	NB	NB	NTS	NB	NB	NB	NB
22b(1)	NLC's Bare Bones or equal	5 Gal. Pail	NA	50.46	74.00	46.40	35.20/56	NB	NB	NB	NB
22b(2)	NLC's Bare Bones or equal	4 Gal. case	NA	64.19	64.40	59.01	35.20	NB	NB	NB	NB
23a	Vectra Finish	5 Gal.	NB	NB	82.00	NB	81.78	74.22	NB	NB	NB
23b	Hillyard's Basecoat II	2.5 Gal.	NB	NB	NB	257.76	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
23c	Hillyard's 1907	2.5 Gal.	NB	NB	NB	270.96	278.30	NB	NB	NB	NB
23d	Hillyard's Pre-Game	Gal.	NB	NB	NB	10.79	70.59	NB	NB	NB	NB
24	Revive	5 Gal.		NB	NB	81.79	75.71	72.65	NB	NB	NB
25a	Scraper - Long	Box of 10	187.30	NB	NB	189.20	171.60	NB	171.55	NB	NB
25b	Replacement Blades	Box of 10	75.72	NB	NB	70.10	60.10	NB	60.90	NB	NB
25c	Red Devil Scraper -Short	Box of 10	47.80	NB	NB	NB	46.60	NB	NB	NB	NB
26	Gum Remover	12/Case	24.16	NB	25.60	NB	25.07	34.32	NB	NB	NB
27	Spartan's CX-3 or equal	Case	39.64	NB	NB	NB	39.65	NB	NB	40.00	NB
28	Spartan's Tannin or equal	Case	33.92	NB	NB	NB	33.93	NB	NB	36.20	NB
29	Snapback or Equal	Case	NB	NB	NB	58.04	84.17	79.61	NB	NB	NB
30	Vinegar	Case	10.76	9.48	NB	NB	9.48	NB	NB	NB	NB
31	Dust Mop Treatment	5 Gal.	32.79	47.26	NB	NB	32.96	NB	NB	32.79	NB
32a	35qt. Combo	Each	95.00	53.68	65.00	53.98	53.98	60.37	NB	NB	NB
32b	44 qt. Combo	Each	207.00	85.55	NB	86.02	86.02	96.21	NB	NB	NB
32c	RM6185-M1 Drain Kit	Each	48.95	NB	NB	NB	165.18	NB	NB	NB	NB
32d	FGQ05000 Finish System	Each	227.25	159.17	NB	165.91	160.06	178.94	NB	NB	NB
32e	FGQ93000 Finish Bucket	Each	119.95	77.78	110.90	75.56	78.21	87.47	NB	NB	NB
33a	Push Brm. 18"	Each	14.95	12.43	NB	8.29	3.86	NB	NB	NB	NB
33b	Push Brm. 24"	Each	18.40	15.42	NB	9.65	3.86	NB	NB	NB	NB
33c	Push Brm. 36"	Each	24.50	22.17	NB	16.41	3.86	NB	NB	NB	NB
34a	Corn Broom	Half Doz.	42.90	32.43	NB	NR	21.12	NB	NB	NB	NB
34b	Angle Broom	Half Doz.	37.56	28.42	47.00	NB	26.76	NB	36.44	NB	NB
35	Dust Pan	Doz.	17.60	15.02	NB	NB	6.98	NB	NB	17.00	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2019 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID LIST

Custodial Supply Bid Tabulation											
Item #	Description	Unit	CPG	Eagle	Global	Hillyard	HP Prod.	Kenway	Kerr	Leonard	Central Poly
36a	Lobby Dust Pan Combo Kit	Each	27.50	10.78	NB	NB	9.94	32.54	NB	11.12	NB
36b	Lobby Dust Pan Only	Half Dozen	8.60	7.10	NB	NB	6.98	7.85	NB	7.32	NB
36c	Lobby Broom Only	Dozen	76.92	65.09	NB	NB	37.08	94.60	NB	62.00	NB
36d	Broom Clip or Retainer Only	Package	10.20	8.27	NB	NB	5.91	9.82	NB	9.04	NB
37a	Floor Squeegee-18"	Doz.	101.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
37b	Floor Squeegee-30"	Doz.	205.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
38	Window Squeegee	Doz.	90.00	NB	NB	NB	142.32	NB	NB	NB	NB
39	Doodlebug Pad Holder	10 pack	187.00	NB	NB	NB	331.00	174.35	179.94	NB	NB
40a	Doodlebug Pads-Strd.	Case	15.80	NB	NB	37.27	27.68	NB	NB	14.40	NB
40b	High-Pro Pads	Case	21.00	NB	NB	28.31	48.54	53.94	NB	18.99	NB
	Mop Handles										
41a	60" Quick Release	Doz.	159.00	89.37	NB	114.96	62.40	116.64	NB	100.99	NB
41b	60" Jaw-Style	Doz.	159.00	86.18	NB		127.80	230.00	NB	115.99	NB
41c	Rubbermaid FGQ749000 handle	6 Pack	39.90	43.10	NB	44.94	43.32	48.47	NB	NB	NB
41d	Rubbermaid FGQ55900 Frame	6 Pack	89.20	70.05	NB	72.30	69.72	78.78	76.49	NB	NB
41c	Rubbermaid FGQ80000 Pads	6 Pack	93.00	63.88	NB	66.60	64.26	71.84	NB	NB	NB
	Wet Mop Heads										
42a(1)	Blue Syn. - 20oz.	Doz.	66.00	NB	NB	NB	39.95	NB	NB	48.40	NB
42a(2)	Blue Syn. - 24oz.	Doz.	84.00	NB	NB	NB	45.88	51.99	NB	56.80	NB
42b(1)	Rayon - 16 oz.	Doz.	36.00	33.00	NB	NB	44.33	50.24	NB	35.20	NB
42b(2)	Rayon - 24 oz.	Doz.	49.00	NB	NB	NB	50.40	57.12	NB	50.49	NB
43	Sponges	Doz.	30.00	NB	NB	42.24	9.36	15.97	NB	NB	NB
44	Sponge/Scrubber	Case/20	37.44	NB	NB	65.60	37.28	39.10	37.40	NB	NB
45a	Green Pad #96	Cs. Of 60	32.39	NB	NB	34.32	32.27	33.91	NB	NB	NB
45b	Stainless Steel Scrubbers	Doz./Case	61.00	NB	NB	NB	66.20	66.10	NB	30.80	NB
46a	Short Pot Brush	Doz.	32.00	26.37	NB	NB	27.96	NB	NB	NB	NB
46b	Long Pot Brush	Doz.	57.90	37.16	NB	NB	27.96	NB	NB	NB	NB
47a	Bowl Mop	Per 50	75.00	62.16	NB	NB	33.00	NB	62.00	61.00	NB
47b	Bowl Brush	Dozen	48.00	40.49	NB	NB	24.00	NB	42.00	25.90	NB
48	Measuring Cup	100	330.00	NB	NB	464.00	48.24	NB	NB	NB	NB
49	Grout Brush	Doz.	15.20	11.07	NB	51.96	67.20	NB	NB	10.90	NB
50	Hi-Duster	Doz.	90.00	61.41	NB	107.40	70.68	211.44	84.20	84.20	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2019 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID LIST

	Custodial Supply Bid Tabulation										
Item #	Description	Unit	CPG	Eagle	Global	Hillyard	HP Prod.	Kenway	Kerr	Leonard	Central Poly
51	Wall Wash Pads	Per 10	99.00	86.79	NB	126.60	132.76	NB	74.70	NB	NB
52a	Nipper Nabber-long	Doz.	230.00	NB	NB	258.60	259.68	NB	223.20	NB	NB
52b	Nipper Nabber-short	Doz.	228.00	NB	NB	NB	154.44	NB	NB	NB	NB
53a	Tool Holder -Single	Doz.	49.80	45.40	NB	NB	46.28	NB	NB	NB	NB
53b	Tool Holder -Triple	Doz.	310.68	295.02	NB	327.00	230.88	NB	NB	NB	NB
54a	Flashlight	Doz.	78.00	NB	NB	NB	56.04	NB	NB	NB	NB
54b	Batteries "D"size	Doz.	10.86	8.93	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
55	Rubber Gloves	Doz.	15.00	6.07	NB	NB	NB	19.91	NB	5.98	NB
56a	Disp. Latex Gloves	Case	39.00	33.25	NB	NB	34.40	37.18	NB	34.21	41.05
56b	Disp. Vinyl Gloves	Case	25.00	25.07	NB	NB	25.90	26.92	NB	26.65	33.29
56c	Disp. Nitrile Gloves	Case	39.00	40.33	NB	NB	58.59	43.64	NB	40.70	43.18
57a	Triangle Brush	Each	20.80	NB	NB	20.44	18.91	NB	NB	NB	NB
57b	Deck Brush	Each	10.50	NB	NB	9.80	3.06	NB	NB	NB	NB
58a	Toilet Tissue	Case / 1-ply	NB	44.60	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
58b	Toilet Tissue	Case / 2-ply	NB	40.59	NB	NB	30.29	52.55	NB	NB	NB
59a	Bounty Paper Towel	Cs. Of 30	0.56	0.85	0.67	NB	1.18	NB	NB	NB	NB
59b	Equal Paper Towel	Case	24.60	NB	21.00	18.93	14.20	NB	NB	NB	23.70
60a	Multi-Fold Towels	Case	20.25	15.28	20.00	14.78	15.48	19.92	NB	16.90	19.70
60b	Combi-Dispenser	Each	19.85	16.02	22.08	NB	19.26	NB	NB	NB	31.66
61b	Single-fold Towel	Case	17.65	NB	21.80	14.78	13.71	23.46	NB	16.95	21.77
61b	Dispenser for Same	Each	22.50	NB	NB	NB	19.26	NB	NB	NB	31.77
62a	Sanit. Napk. Rec.	Each	56.60	17.59	20.99	18.18	18.82	NB	NB	NB	NB
62b	Waxed Bags	Case	16.00	13.09	22.40	12.91	13.89	NB	NB	NB	NB
63	Vomit Absorbant	Per pound	0.45	NB	NB	0.78	0.78	0.63	NB	NB	NB
64	Trigger Sprayers & Bottles	Gross	263.52	133.91	201.60	134.22	216.00	NB	NB	NB	NB
65a	Sprayer / Foamer	2 Qt./Each	30.50	13.98	NB	27.99	27.51	28.83	NB	NB	NB
65b	Pump-up Sprayer	2 Gal./Each	110.00	95.67	NB	38.87	83.93	36.90	NB	NB	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2019 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID LIST

Custodial Supply Bid Tabulation											
Item #	Description	Unit	CPG	Eagle	Global	Hillyard	HP Prod.	Kenway	Kerr	Leonard	Central Poly
66a	Buffer Pads 13"	Case	8.25	NB	NB	6.66	11.92	9.84	NB	6.60	NB
66b	Buffer Pads 14"	Case	9.45	NB	NB	7.65	13.47	11.21	NB	7.59	NB
66c	Buffer Pads 20" Standard	Case	15.70	NB	NB	12.67	22.91	19.02	NB	12.49	NB
66d	Buffer Pads 20" Eraser	Case	16.55	NB	NB	31.19	26.08	28.96	NB	13.49	NB
66e	20" Hi-Productivity	Case	20.95	NB	NB	17.16	43.63	54.09	NB	NB	NB
67	Ice Melt Pellets	50 lb.	9.95	NB	8.89	9.40	8.54	8.71	NB	NB	NB
	Trash Receptacles:										
68a	32 gal.	Each	24.65	13.55	34.00	14.00	14.49	16.43	NB	NB	66.00
68b	55 gal.	Each	68.90	25.12	92.00	25.95	26.87	30.45	NB	NB	99.00
68c	41-1/4 qt. - Doz.	Doz.	96.00	69.03	157.80	71.28	73.80	83.68	NB	NB	NB
68d	Dolly 2-pack	Case	51.80	26.38	100.80	54.40	28.16	63.84	NB	NB	77.00
68e	Mega Brute RM-9W73	Each	510.00	416.35	NB	430.11	445.29	504.67	475.50	NB	NB
69	Big Wheel Cans	Each	126.00	48.30	99.00	49.90	51.66	58.56	NB	NB	367.88
70	Jersey Gloves	Doz.	6.50	4.77	5.00	80.76	5.92	NB	NB	NB	NB
71a	Wet Floor Signs	Each	4.17	4.76	12.99	4.92	5.09	5.79	NB	NB	NB
71b	Closed Sign	Each	26.75	8.76	NB	29.63	8.89	10.08	NB	NB	NB
72	Plunger	Doz.	72.00	62.83	NB	131.76	56.88	NB	NB	NB	NB
73a	Custodial Cart	Ea.	112.00	93.62	142.00	95.63	100.13	113.48	NB	NB	NB
73b	Yellow Bag	Case of two	101.00	43.08	NB	82.30	48.64	96.56	NB	NB	NB
74a	41 qt. Can Liners	1000	28.00	23.67	29.90	23.32	46.62	30.84	NB	25.79	15.80
74b	32 gal. Can Liners	250	9.95	13.07	14.99	13.60	31.92	20.92	NB	11.36	18.20
74c	55 gal. Can Liners	100	18.60	15.61	20.40	19.49	35.71	21.03	18.12	18.68	17.10
75a	Safety Treads	Pair	48.00	39.03	NB	NB	48.02	NB	NB	40.80	NB
75b	Paws Strap on Treads	Pair	10.95	NB	12.40	NB	29.34	NB	NB	9.60	NB
76	Back Support Belt	Each	24.00	7.64	NB	NB	5.19	NB	NB	NB	NB
77a	Goggles	Doz.	28.40	13.86	NB	37.20	12.12	NB	NB	NB	NB
77b	Glasses	Doz.	30.00	9.24	NB	31.56	8.88	NB	NB	NB	NB
77c	Reader Safety Glasses	Doz.	NB	NB	NB	NB	27.52	NB	NB	NB	NB
77d	Faceshield	100	875.00	NB	NB	NB	147.00	NB	NB	NB	NB
78	20" Prep. Pads	Case	98.00	NB	NB	91.81	85.19	87.00	NB	NB	NB
79	Magic Eraser	Case/24	25.92	20.56	NB	22.33	47.00	14.93	NB	42.78	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID

HARDIN CO. SCHOOLS FY2019 CUSTODIAL SUPPLY BID LIST

Custodial Supply Bid Tabulation											
Item #	Description	Unit	CPG	Eagle	Global	Hillyard	HP Prod.	Kenway	Kerr	Leonard	Central Poly
80a	Microfiber Cloth-glass	Each	1.39	1.01	NB	0.885	0.41	1.04	0.781	NB	NB
80b	Microfiber Cloth-GP	Each	1.39	1.01	NB	0.833	0.41	1.04	0.781	NB	NB
81	Dust Masks	Box/20	27.50	13.35	NB	NB	7.45	NB	23.50	NB	NB
	Equipment										
82a	Wax-o-Matic	Each	525.00	NB	NB	753.19	1279.15	NB	NB	NB	NB
82b	Thin Pads	Pair	29.50	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
82c	Thick Pads	Pair	29.50	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
83	175rpm Floor Machine	Each	625.00	894.98	649.00	665.76	481.13	629.80	NB	650.00	NB
84	2000rpm Floor Burnisher	Each	1095.00	1088.28	799.00	1483.72	853.53	1215.82	NB	NB	NB
85	Windsor Dominator	Each					3535.00				
86a	Windsor VS18 Vacuum	Each	NB	NB	NB	697.48	664.58	NB	NB	NB	NB
86b	Windsor VS14 Vacuum	Each	NB	NB	NB	532.37	509.30	NB	NB	NB	NB
86c	Windsor Sensor SRXP15 Vac	Each	NB	NB	NB	473.90	523.76	NB	NB	NB	NB
86d	Tennant V-LWU-13 Vac	Each	NB	302.35	NB	235.75	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
86e	Advance Spectrum 15P Vac	Each	353.00	NB	NB	352.75	329.00	NB	NB	NB	NB
87a	Wet Vacuum	Each	551.00	431.92	499.00	468.84	457.03	NB	NB	NB	NB
87b	Squeegee attach.	26" Kit	NB	NB	149.00	254.47	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
88	20" Auto Scrub. Machine	Each	3710.00	3710.00	6400.00	3864.14	NTS	NB	NB	3589.00	NB
89a	Pro-Team QuarterVac	Each	485.00	NB	NB	310.75	320.71	NB	NB	NB	NB
89b	Pro-Team GoFree Vac	Each	2995.00	NB	NB	1025.50	NTS	NB	NB	NB	NB
90	Portable Extractor	Each	595.00	NB	NB	638.12	571.20	NB	NB	NB	NB
91	26" Auto Scrub. Machine	Each	5650.00	6777.77	NB	5688.05	5630.63	NB	NB	5624.00	NB
92	Tennant Ex-SC-412	Each	1495.00	NB	NB	1383.49	1751.40	NB	NB	NB	NB
93a	Tennant EX-SC-716	Each	1795.00	NB	NB	1746.28	2079.00	NB	NB	NB	NB
93b	Wand attachmt./hoses	Set	395.00	NB	NB	335.65	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
94	Manual Sweeper	Each	47.90	43.85	NB	NB	46.62	NB	47.00	NB	NB
95	Floor Dams	Each	51.95	46.55	NB	51.59	38.12	NB	46.00	NB	NB

NTS - NOT TO SPECS NB - NO BID