
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

7546

May 08, 2018

PUMPS (Various) .

March 15, 2018

From May 30, 2018 through May 29, 2019

No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An " indicates an award.
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l

CAPP, Inc.

Vendor Name l
Vendor Response Terms

Response Terms T Response Payment Terms

3%20NET30

l

Ferguson Enterprises Inc.

Global Industrial

Masters Supply 1 . (a) Yes, 1 .(b) No 2. Masters Supply
Company 4505 Bishop Lane Louisville, Ky.
40218 3. 20 Days Guaranteed Delivery

2% 10fh Ntj 30

MBE Contracting & Supply Quoted prices are good until 4/1/18 and will
be extended to thirty days after receipt of
seller's invoice.

Payment for each unit may be in full within
thirty (30) days after receipt of the seller's
invoice and subject to verification of delivery in
accordance with the specifications

Oscar's Germantown Hardware NET EOM

Plumbers Supply Company ?1A=YES...?I B=NO PLUMBERS SUPPLY

C0.INC. 1000 EAST MAIN ST. LOUISV?LLE,
KY. 40206 502-582-2261 2-WEEKS

GUARANTEED DELIVERY

2%-1(Xh...ne?25?h
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ITEM No. 1 - Pump, circulatinq, 1/6 HP, 120 volt, 2 amp. Armflo E9.2B #182202-660, Grundfos #UPS26-150SF or equal. 1 -
1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225550-2012088)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Masters Supply No Bid 00100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: No Bid

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. GRUNDFOS 340 7600"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: G95906632

Plumbers Supply Company ARMSTRONG #182202-660 357.3000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 182202-660

CAPP, Inc. ARMSTRONG #182202-660 435.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3033219

Global Industrial Grundfos #UPS26-150SF 489.9700

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1184368

MBE Contracting & Supply Grundsfo 674.6700

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GRU UPS26-150SF

ITEM NO. 2 - Pump, condensate, 115 volt. Little Giant ABS-3 #551320 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity -
3 (ez:zstsoo-iemoo)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Masters Supply No Bid 0.0100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: No Bid

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. LITTLE GIANT 174.7200"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L551320

Plumbers Supply Company LITTLE GIANT #LG551320 176.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LG551320

Global Industrial Little Giant #ABS-3 192.0400

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: B778524

MBE Contracting & Supply Little Giant 221 7600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ABS-3 #551320

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: LGPABS-3#551320

CAPP, Inc. LITTLE GIANT #551320

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046052

ITEM No. 3 - Pump, condensate, 115 volt, vertical, with safety switch, 1/50 HP. Little Giant VCMA-1 5ULS #554405 or equal. 1 -
1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 2 (6225600-2002420)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Masters Supply No Bid ooioo

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: No Bid

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. PROSELECT 29.1400'

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: PSCP15WS

Plumbers Supply Company LITTLE GIANT #LG554405 38.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LG554405

250.0000

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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Global Industrial

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Os(,ir'5 Germantown Hardware

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 554405

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET EOM

MBE Contracting & Supply Little Giant

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LGP 554200

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: LGP 554200

3109917

B215780

Little Giant #VCMA-15ULS

LITTLE GIANT #554405

Little Giant #VCMA-15ULS

43.9800

47.0000

47.5000

49.6000

ITEM No. 4 - Pump, condensate, 115 volt, Iow profile, 1/30 HP. Little Giant VCC-20ULS #554200 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 4 (6225600-1345002)

VENDOR NAME

Masters Supply

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Ferguson Enterprises Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Global Industrial

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Oscar's Germantown Hardware

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 554200

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET EOM

MBE Contracting & Supply Little Giant

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LGP VCC-20ULS #55420

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Little Giant VCC-20ULS #554200

No Bid

PROSELECT

PSCP20LPWS

LITTLE GIANT #LG554200

LG554200

2390086

B21 5778

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

No Bid

Little Giant #VCC-20ULS

LITTLE GIANT #554200

Little Giant #VCC-20ULS

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

47.2000"

52.0000

59 2500

62.0000

63.2500

69.9800

ITEM No. s - Pump, submersible, automatic, 1/2 HP, 115 volt, sinqle phase, GPM 79 at 10-ft. head, must have vertical ball float
control permanently mounted to pump body, cast iron body, non-cloqqinq vortex impeller, passes 5/8" spherical solids. Zoeller
M137 #137-0001 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 15 (6225850-1685939)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject MBE Contracting & Supply - Ashland Pump not equal to Zoeller cast iron or bronze.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

MBE Contracting & Supply Ashland Pump
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SPV50V1-10

Oscar's Germantown Hardware Zoeller Pump #M137

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 137-0001

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET EOM

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. ZOELLER

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
141 .2800

2175000"

254 6400

21370001

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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Plumbers Supply Company ZOELLER #137-0001

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 137-0001

Masters Supply Zoeller

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 137-0001

Global Industrial Zoeller #M137 #137-0001

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1184406

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #137-0001

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046064

ITEM No. 6 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 115 volt, sinqle phase, GPM 79 at 10-ft. head, 1 1/2" NPT discharqe,
cast iron body, non-cloqqinq vortex impeller, passes 5/8" spherical solids. Zoeller N137 #137-0002 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1698218)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Ferguson Enterprises Inc. ZOELLER 234.2700"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Z1370002

Plumbers Supply Company ZOELLER #137-0002 244.5300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 137-0002

Masters Supply Zoeller 244 9200

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 137-0002

MBE Contracting & Supply Zoeller 346.1150

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ZOE 137-0002 N137

Global Industrial Zoeller #N137#137-0002 350.5900

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 11 84407

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #137-0002 360.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046077

ITEM No. 7 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 200-208 volt, 3 phase, GPM 50 at 1 s-ft head, 2? NPT discharqe, cast
iron construction, non-cloqqinq vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller J267 #267-001 1 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-2010953)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($1
Ferguson Enterprises Inc. ZOELLER 331 0300"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 22670011

Plumbers Supply Company ZOELLER #267-0011 345.5300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0011

Masters Supply Zoeller 346.0800

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0011

Global Industrial Zoeller #J267 #267-001 1 484.2100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1184408

MBE Contracting & Supply Zoeller 489.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ZOE 267-0011

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #267-0011 510.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046084

265.7900

266.2100

378.8500

395.0000

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 8 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 230 volt, sinqle phase, GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT discharqe, cast
iron construction, non-cloqqinq vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller E267 #267-0004 or equal 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1722170)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. ZOELLER 272.4600"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Z2670004

Plumbers Supply Company ZOELLER #267-0004

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0004

Masters Supply Zoeller

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0004

Global Industrial Zoeller #E267 #267-0004

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 11 84457

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #267-0004

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046086

MBE Contracting & Supply Ashland Pump
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: EP50M2-20

284.3900

284.8500

400.8100

420.0000

527 2800

ITEM No. 9 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 230 volt, 3 phase, GPM 50 at 15-ff. head, 2" NPT discharqe, cast iron
construction, non-cloqqinq vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller F267 #267-001 0 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-17221 71 1

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Plumbers Supply Company ZOELLER #267-0010 345.5300"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0010

Masters Supply Zoeller

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0010

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. ZOELLER

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Z2670010

Global Industrial Zoeller #F267 #267-001 0

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1184438

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #267-0010

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046088

MBE Contracting & Supply Ashland Pump
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: EP50M3-20

346.0800

364.5800

484.2100

500.0000

524 0000

ITEM No. 10 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 1/2 HP, 460 volt, 3 phase, GPM 50 at 15-ft. head, 2" NPT discharqe, cast iron
construction, non-cloqqinq vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller G267 #267-0041 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1722172)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Plumbers Supply Company ZOELLER #267-0041 345.5300"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0041

Masters Supply Zoeller

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 267-0041

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. ZOELLER

Note: " indicates a pending award.

346.0800

364.5800
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 22670041

Global Industrial Zoeller #G267 #267-0041

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1184459

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #267-0041

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046090

MBE Contracting & Supply Ashland Pump
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: EP50M4-20

ITEM No. 11 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 2 HP, 200-208 volt, 3 phase, GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" flanqed vertical
discharqe, cast iron body, non-cloqqinq bronze vortex impeller, passes 2" spherical solids. Zoeller J295 #395-0008 or equal. 1 -
1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-1718481 )

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Masters Supply Zoeller 734.7400"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 395-0008

Plumbers Supply Company ZOELLER #395-0008 783.2400

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 395-0008

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. ZOELLER 786.2300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 23950008

MBE Contracting & Supply Ashland Pump 899 8600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SWH200M6-20

Global Industrial Zoeller #J295 #395-0008 1 ,022.5600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1184460

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #395-0008 1 ,050.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046092

ITEM No. 12 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 2 HP, 230 volt, 3 phase, GPM 168 at 20-ft. head, 3" flanqed vertical discharqe,
cast iron body, non-cloqqinq bronze vortex impeller, passes 2? spherical solids. Zoeller F295 #395-0006 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-2008834)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Masters Supply Zoeller 734.7400"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 395-0006

Plumbers Supply Company ZOELLER #395-0006 783.2400

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 395-0006

Ferguson Enterprises Inc. ZOELLER 786.2300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 23950006

MBE Contracting & Supply Ashland Pump 899.8600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SWH200M3-20

Global Industrial Zoeller #F295 #395-0006 1 ,022.5600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1184478

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #395-0006 1 ,050.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046097

484.2100

500.0000

524.0000

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 13 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 2 HP, 230 volt, sinqle phase, GPM 168 at 20-ff. head, 3" flanqed vertical
discharqe, cast iron body, non-cloqqinq bronze vortex impeller, passes 2? spherical solids. Zoeller E295 #395-0004 or equal. 1 -
1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-2012195)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

MastersSupply Zoeller

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Ferguson Enterprises Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

MBE Contracting & Supply

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Global Industrial

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($%
673.5200"

395-0004

ZOELLER 722.1600

Z3950004

ZOELLER #395-0004 722.7900

395-0004

Ashland Pump

SWH200M2-20

Zoeller #E295 #395-0004

899.6600

941 .5600

1184440

ZOELLER #395-0004 995.0000

3046099

ITEM No. 14 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 2 HP, 460 volt, 3 phase, GPM 168 at 20-fk. head, 3" flanqed vertical discharqe,
cast iron body, non-cloqqinq bronze vortex impeller, passes 2? spherical solids. Zoeller G295 #395-0007 or equal. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-17221 74)

VENDOR NAME

Masters Supply

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Plumbers Supply Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Ferguson Enterprises Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

MBE Contracting & Supply

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Global Industrial

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Zoeller

UNIT PRICE ($)
734.7400'

395-0007

ZOELLER #395-0007 783.2400

395-0007

ZOELLER 786.2300

23950007

899.6600Ashland Pump

SWH200M4-20

Zoeller #G295 #395-0007 1 ,022.5600

1184441

ZOELLER #395-0007 1 ,050.0000

3046102

ITEM No. 15 - Pump, submersible, non-automatic, 3 HP, 460 volt, 3 phase, GPM 250 at 20-ft. head, 4? flanqed horizontal
discharqe, cast iron construction, non-cloqqinq vortex impeller, passes 3" spherical solids. Zoeller G405 #405-0009 or equal. 1 -
1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (6225850-2Cll3057)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PlumbersSupplyCompany ZOELLER #405-0009

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Masters Supply

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Ferguson Enterprises Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)

1 ,1 54.8900"

405-0009

Zoeller q , 169.7400

405-0009

ZOELLER 1,218.3600

Z4050009

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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Global Industrial Zoeller #G405 #405-0009

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 11 84479

CAPP, Inc. ZOELLER #405-0009

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3046105

MBE Contracting & Supply Ashland Pump
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ANC300M4-35

1 ,622.5700

1 ,650.0000

2,163.2000

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME

CAPP, Inc.

Ferguson Enterprises Inc.

Global Industrial

Masters Supply

MBE Contracting & Supply

Oscar's Germantown Hardware

Plumbers Supply Company

TOTAL ($)
15,537.00

10,797.73

14,909.64

9,608.74

12,010.91

3,610.50

10,949.06

AWARDED TOTAL ($)

1,949.76

2,877.74

3,262.50

1 ,845.95

9,935.95

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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