
HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS

1805 Second Street

Henderson, KY  42420

AMENDED LAWN MOWING SERVICES TABULATION SHEET

BID # 5-18-5-3

April 2, 2018 Through November 2, 2018

Weekly rates Brandon's Lawn Care Complete Restoration, LLC Cutting Edge Lawn
Daugherty's 

Unlimited Lawn Care
Denton's FYC GCA Services Group

Givens Consulting Group, 

Inc.
Green Eyed Monster Lawn Service Integrity Property Management

Bend Gate $255.00 No Bid $245.00 $225.00 $368.06 $264.00 $240.00

Cairo $215.00 No Bid $190.00 $200.00 $353.89 $209.00 $195.00

AB Chandler $285.00 No Bid $275.00 $230.00 $318.47 $289.00 $285.00

East Heights $320.00 No Bid $300.00 $245.00 $368.06 $327.00 $310.00

Jefferson $165.00 $165.00 $155.00 $175.00 $195.03 $174.00 $150.00

Niagara $195.00 $180.00 $145.00 $175.00 $325.55 $154.00 $145.00

North Middle $295.00 $205.00 $270.00 $290.00 $368.06 $301.00 $280.00

South Middle $330.00 No Bid $300.00 $290.00 $353.89 $336.00 $315.00

Henderson 

County High $400.00 No Bid $375.00 $350.00 $325.55 $422.00 $390.00

Thelma B 

Johnson Early 

Learning 

Center $160.00 No Bid $145.00 $175.00 $195.03 $154.00 $145.00

Weekly Total $2,620.00 $550.00 $2,400.00 $2,355.00 $3,171.59 $2,630.00 $2,455.00

Annual Total $81,220.00 $17,050.00 $74,400.00 $73,005.00 $98,319.29 $81,530.00 $76,105.00

Equipment 

List Provided Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes No

References Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 1 Reference

Number years 

in business 3 6 15 11 33 6 4

Personnel 6 3 8 4 to 5 14 6 6

Custodial area

Contact Brandon Spainhow James Franks Josh Bennett Aaron Daugherty Keith Denton Buddy Helton Terry Givens Eddie Pike Mason McCarnan

Address 9548 Ridgewood Rd PO Box 282 3905 Ridgelane Drive 8766 Hwy 1078 N PO Box 1039 4702 Western Ave, Suite 101 7413 Rucker #1 East 7681 Curdsville/Deleware Road 2502 West Daffodil Ct

Spottsville, KY Henderson, KY Henderson, KY Henderson, KY Henderson, KY Knoxville, TN Henderson, KY Owensboro, KY  Henderson, KY

42458 42420 42420 42420 42420 37921 42420 42301 42420

Phone 270-577-8544 270-724-3089 270577-7226 270-860-0539 270-869-7897 888-736-0863

270-830-6368                     

270-860-6366                   

270-830-9733 270-313-3013 270-860-0627

Fax

E-mail Address spainhoward99@icloud.com jfranks@kyrestoration.com joshbennett@live.com awdaug@att.net kdenton1956@gmail.com bhelton@gcaservices.com tgivens@henderson.net jeddiepike@gmail.com masonmccarnan@hotmail.com
Pre-Bid Tour 3-

1-2018
Attended Attended Attended Attended Attended Attended Attended

Pre-Bid Tour 3-

12-2018
Phone Contact Attended Attended Attended Attended Phone Contact Attended
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HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS

1805 Second Street

Henderson, KY  42420

AMENDED LAWN MOWING SERVICES TABULATION SHEET

BID # 5-18-5-3

April 2, 2018 Through November 2, 2018

Weekly rates

Bend Gate

Cairo

AB Chandler

East Heights

Jefferson

Niagara

North Middle

South Middle

Henderson 

County High 

Thelma B 

Johnson Early 

Learning 

Center

Weekly Total

Annual Total

Equipment 

List Provided

References

Number years 

in business

Personnel

Custodial area

Contact

Address

Phone

Fax

E-mail Address

Pre-Bid Tour 3-

1-2018

Pre-Bid Tour 3-

12-2018

Knights Landscaping Lawncare Perfiction Neil Dreyhaupt, CTP New Branch Lawn Mowing Outdoor Solutions Lance Woolverton

$245.00 $267.00

$195.00 $225.00

$270.00 $325.00

$310.00 $332.00

$170.00 $190.00

$140.00 $180.00

$270.00 $305.00

$270.00 $355.00

$410.00 $475.00

$160.00 $170.00

$2,440.00 $2,824.00

$75,640.00 $87,544.00

Yes
Yes

Yes Yes

21
9

8 6

Brad Knight Dane McCuiston Neil Dreyhaupt Daniel Sanders James Ambrous Lance Woolverton

2278 Melwood Dr 2620 Stage Coach Road 606 3rd Street 8243 Wathen Lane 14140 Hwy 60 East

Henderson, KY Hanson, KY Henderson, KY Henderson, KY Reed, KY

42420 42413 42420 42420 42451

270-869-4601 270-836-3227 270-832-4795

270-454-3198                             

270-844-2999 270-577-8544

bradknight08@gmail.com dane.mccuiston@yahoo.com mrdreyhaupt@gmail.com sandersdaniel150@yahoo.com outdoorsolutionshendersonky@gmail.com woolvertonlance@gmail.com
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