
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

7542

March 13, 2018

RECONDITIONING OF ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT .

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

COMMENTS:

February 21 , 2018

From May 01 , 2018 through April 30, 2019

Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties.

Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.
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l

BSN Sports

Capitol Varsity Sporks, Inc.

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

Riddell / All American

Vendor Name l

30 Days

Vendor Response Terms

Response Terms 1
NET30

Net 30 Days

Net 30

Response Payment Terms l
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ITEM No. 1 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - FOOTBALL HELMETS: Reconditioninq shall include, but not be Iimited to, disassembly,
school inspection, factory examination, sanitizinq, buffinq, replacinq component parts AS NEEDED, includinq facemasks, jaw pads
and chin straps and reassemblinq of the helmet with its component parts accordinq to factory specifications, usinq OEM parts. The
helmet shall be recertified to NOCSAE standards (at no additional charqe) and must have a recertification seal and date affixed per
helmet. Estimated annual quantity - 1200. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (4600015-1724340)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Riddell / All American RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: "Does not include parts missing from helmets.

UNIT PRICE ($)
27.2400

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Schutt Reconditioning
Recon helmets

29.9900

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: cvrrh

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr 34.9500"

BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RECON

NET30

BSN Sports/ Schutt #RECON 45.0000

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: all inclusive w/replacement parts included, $45 per helmet. All helmets are required to
be picked up from school within s business days of 12/18 each year. Parts not on
helmet at time of pickup will be charged to be replaced. BSN SPORTS Field Sales Pro
will work with each coach/school on packing the helmets and arranging pick up.

ITEM NO. 2 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - FOOTBALL HELMETS: Repaintinq (by request only) - cost per football helmet. Estimated
annual quantity - 1 ,200. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports BSN Sports/ Schutt #RECON

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

RECON

NET30

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: :Includedinabovepricingofline1.Helmetmustremainthesamecolorasprevious,
color changes incur an additional fee

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Paint

Schutt Reconditioning 0.0100

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: cvrrp

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr 8.0000"

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON REPAINT

g.oooo

ITEM No. 3 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - FOOTBALL HELMETS: Custom color paintinq per helmet. Estimated annual quantity - 1 ,200.
1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

cvrrcp

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100"

BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

BSN Sports/ Schutt #custom paint

custom paint

7.0000

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Custom or specialty paint, $7 per helmet (this includes changing color of helmet paint)

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: $10.00pricingreferstospecialpaint.Custompaintcolorwillbefrom$12to$18.00
depending on application.

Schutt Reconditioning

Custom Paint

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

8.0000

io.oooo

ITEM No. 4 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - FOOTBALL HELMETS: Stainless steel hardware (must be requested by school) per helmet.
Estimated annual quantity - 1 ,200. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports BSN Sports/ Schutt #Hardware

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Hardware

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Included in line 1 pricing

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Hardware

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Included in Iine 1 .

cvrrhdw

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

Schutt Reconditioning

0.0100"

0.0100

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: INCLUDED

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: INCLUDED

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN o.oroo

ITEM No. s - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - SHOULDER PADS: Reconditioninq shall include, but not be Iimited to, cleaninq, sanitizinq,
sewinq, installation of straps, collars, neck binder, epaulets and caps, elastic cups, flaps, cantilevers, key hole slides, T-hooks,
rivets and Iaces per pad. Estimated annual quantity - 750 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

BSN Sports BSN Sports/ Schutt #clean shouder pads

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: clean shouder pads
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET30

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: $l6pershoulderpad,CIeaning&SanitizingofAllShoulderPads,MinorRepairs
Include: Replacement of Strapping, Laces and T-Hooks, buckles, bad/missing rivets,
Replacement of Biothane parts, Snubbers, Straps, Secure-A-Straps and other Straps
Regrommeting Belts, Sewing Tears, Patching Holes

UNIT PRICE ($)
7 5000"

cvrrsp

Schutt Reconditioning

Shoulder Pad Recon

RIDDELL /ALL AMERICAN

iq .oooo

13.9500

RECON

qe.oooo

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 6 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - FOOTBALL SHOES: Shoes, pair, molded or cleated: In school examination, factory
inspection, clean/sanitize, replace Iaces and insoles, refinish, same color per pair. Estimated annual quantity - 200. 1 - 1.0000
Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSNSports NOBID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

cvrrsh

Shoes

RECON

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

Schutt Reconditioning

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

0.0100"

0.0100

8.9500

ITEM No. 7 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - FOOTBALL SHOES: Cleats, set male, urethane replaced per set. Estimated annual quantity
- 200. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Set, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr o.oioo"

cvrrcl

Schutt Reconditioning o.oroo

Shoes1

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN 9.9500

RECON

ITEM No. 8 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - FOOTBALL SHOES: Cleats, set, male, nylon replaced per set. Estimated annual quantity -
200. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Set, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr o.oroo"

cvrrcl

Schutt Reconditioning 0.0100

Shoes2

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN 9.9500

RECON

Note: " indicates a peridirig award.
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ITEM No. 9 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BASEBALUSOFTBALL BATTERS' HELMETS: In school examination, factory inspection,
clean/sanitize, buff and shine, all repairs, includinq all repairs of interior parts, but excludinq replacinq interior parts per helmet. If
interior parts would need replacinq, the process would not be economically sensible for the customer. Estimated annual quantity -
20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSNSports NOBID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr 0.0100"

cvrrbh

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN 6.9900

RECON

Schutt Reconditioning

Batting Helmets

g.ggoo

ITEM No. 10 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BASEBALL/SOFTBALL BAnERS' HELMETS: Standard one-color paintinqper helmet.
Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

cvrrbhp

Schutt Reconditioning

Batter's Paint

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.otoo

0.0100"

3.9900

g.oooo

ITEM No. 11 - LOT CODE: - 1- 27 - BASEBALUSOFTBALL BATTERS' HELMETS: Custom two-color paintinq?per helmet.
Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

cvrrbhps

Schutt Reconditioning

Batter's Custom Pt

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

o.oroo"

7.9900

17.9500

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 12 - LOT CODE: - 1- 27 - BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' HELMETS: In school examination, factory inspection,
clean/sanitize, buff and shine, all repairs, includinq all repairs of interior parts, but excludinq replacinq interior parts per helmet. If
interior parts would need replacinq, the process would not be economically sensible for the customer. Estimated annual quantity -
20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSNSports NOBID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oioo

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr
cvrrch

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON

Schutt Reconditioning
Catcher's Helmets

ooroo"

5.9900

g.ggoo

ITEM No. 13 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BASEBALUSOFTBALL CATCHERS' HELMETS: Standard one-color paintinq per helmet.
Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSNSporks NOBID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES? NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
ootoo

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

cvrrchp

Schutt Reconditioning
Catcher's Paint

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON

o.oioo"

3.9900

9.0000

ITEM No. 14 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' MASK: In school examination, factory inspection,
clean/sanitize, re-paint wire mask, as necessary and all repairs per mask. Estimated annual quantity - 10. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSNSports NOBID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: -Touch up included. -repaint is N/A

Schutt Reconditioning
Catcher's Mask

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

cvrrcm

Capitol Varsity Sporks, Inc. #cvrr

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

0.0100'

s 9900

g.ggoo

Note: " indicates a pending award.
PAGE 7



ITEM No. 15 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' MASK: Mask pads replaced per mask. Estimated
annual quantity - 10. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cwr 0.0100"

cvrrcmp

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN 9.0000

RECON

Schutt Reconditioning
Catcher's Mask Pads

ITEM No. 16 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' MASK: Harness replaced per mask. Estimated annual
quantity - 10. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

9.9900

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr 0.0100"

cvrrcmh

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN 3.9900

RECON

Schutt Reconditioning

Mask Harness

7.9900

ITEM No. 17 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BASEBALL/SOFTBALL CATCHERS' MASK: Throat protector replaced per mask. Estimated
annual quantity - 10. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oioo

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr ooroo"

cvrrtp

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN 3.9900

RECON

Schutt Reconditioning

Throat Protector

4.9900

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 18 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK: One piece, hockey style, catchers'
helmet with mask: In school examination, factory inspection, clean/sanitize, buff and shine, all repairs, includinq but not Iimited to,
repair of interior parts per helmet. Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSNSports NOBID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr o.o"roo"

cvrrhcm

Schutt Reconditioning

Hockey Catcher Mask

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

14.9900

17.9500

RECON

ITEM No. 19 - LOT CODE: - 1- 27 - HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK: Standard one-color paintinq per
helmet. Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1- 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES. NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

cvrrhmp

Schutt Reconditioning

Hockey Helmet Paint

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

o.oroo"

3.9900

g.oooo

ITEM NO. 20 - LOT CODE: - 1- 27 - HOCKEY STY'LE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK: Custom two-color paintinq?per
helmet. Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

cvrrhcmsp

Schutt Reconditioning

Hockey Paint Custom

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON

capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oioo

0.0100"

7.9900

17.9500

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 21 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK: Mask pads replaced per helmet.
Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sporks, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sporks, lnc

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

cvhcmp

Schutt Reconditioning

Hockey Mask Pads

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

ooroo"

4.9900

g.oooo

ITEM NO. 22 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - HOCKEY STYLE CATCHERS' HELMET WITH MASK: Harness replaced per helmet.
Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

cvrrhcmh

RECON

Schutt Reconditioning

Hockey Harness

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

ooroo"

3.9900

4.9900

ITEM NO. 23 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - SHIN GUARDS: In school examination, factory inspection, clean/sanitize, buff and shine, all
repairs, includinq but not Iimited to, bindinq repair and replacement as necessary of elastics and fastener hardvvare. Estimated
annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Cluantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSNSports NOBID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Capitol Varsity sports, Inc. #cvrr 0.0100"

cvrrsg

1 .9900Schutt Reconditioning

Shin Guards Inspect

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN 8.9500

RECON

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 24 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - SHIN GUARDS: Knee caps replaced each. Estimated annual quantity - 20. 1 - 1 .0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: cvrrsgk

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports Schutt Reconditioning

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Shin Replace )<nee

Riddell / All American RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

ITEM NO. 25 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BATS: In school examination, factory inspection, reqrip each. Estimated annual quantity -
50. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: cvrrb

Riddell / All American RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RECON

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports Schutt Reconditioning
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Inspect Bats

ITEM No. 26 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - BATS: Leather qrips each. Estimated annual quantity - 50. 1- 1 .0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as Iow total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

BSN Sports NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, lnc

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

ooroo"

4.9900

e.oooo

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

o.oroo"

8.5000

8.9500

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oqoo

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr

cvrrblg

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN

RECON

Schutt Reconditioning

Bats-Leather Replace

o.oroo"

9.5000

13.9500

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 27 - LOT CODE: - 1 - 27 - GLOVES: In school examination, factory inspection, clean/sanitize, leather preservative, all
repairs, includinq but not Iimited to restrinqinq each. Estimated annual quantity - 50. 1 - 1 .0000 Each Purchase, Estimated
quantity - 1

LOT AWARD NOTES.

VENDOR NAME

BSN Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES? NO BID

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Riddell / All American

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Awarded to Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. as low total bidder for Lot Nos. 1 thru 27.
ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc. #cvrr o.oqoo"

cvrrgl

Schutt Reconditioning o.oroo

Gloves

RIDDELL / ALL AMERICAN 25.9500

RECON

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR NAME

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

BSN Sports

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

Riddell / All American

TOTAL BIDS - 1 - 27

TOTAL ($)

50.69

68.24

184.79

277.74

AWARDED TOTAL %

50.69

$50.69

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME

BSN Sports

Capitol Varsity Sports, Inc.

Kranos Corporation dba Schutt Sports

Riddell / All American

TOTAL ($)
68.24

50.69

184.79

277.74

AWARDED TOTAL ($)

50.69

50.69

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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