HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

Tabulation Sheet
Athletic Equipment and Supplies
Bid # 1-18-5-1

Part A Athletic Catalog

Purchase from highlighted vendors only.

Eurosport/
Aluminum Athletic Brant BSN Sports Dallas Bumblebee Elite Screen Soccer.co
Use #170787 On . . . Atomic Designs & Williams Include This Bid Number q - m/Sports . . .
Company EEEse G Wi American Whitetail ARC Sports Apparel Golf Shop | On All Purchase Orders 18/ Team Sports Colonel Connection Printing Endeavors, Bill Heath's Family Sports
q No Bid No Bid
Ordering No Bid 52748 Inc.
No Bid

GENERAL SUPPLIES Discount 18% 20% 10% 0-40%
BASEBALL .

Discount 18% 10% 0-40%
BASKETBALL

Discount 10% 0-40%
CHEERLEADING Discount 10%
CROSS COUNTRY Discount 18% 10%
DANCE Discount 10%
FISHING Discount 10-30%
FOOTBALL .

Discount 18% 10% 0-40%
GOLF .

Discount 10%
SOCCER

Discount 18% 10% 0-40%
SOFTBALL .

Discount 18% 10% 0-40%
SWIMMING Discount 10%
TENNIS .

Discount 10%
TRACK

C Discount 18% 10% 0-40%

VOLLEYBALL .

Discount 10% 0-40%
OTHER (LIST)
Archery Discount 10-30%
Bowling Discount 10-30%
Trap Shoot Discount 10-30%
Weightlifting Discount
Ink Kits
Break Through Banners
Mascots & Accessories
Soung System Portable
Bags & Backpacks
Megaphones Contact Finance For
Flags
BASEBALLS
Game Baseballs,
Rawlings R100 KHSAA
Approved
(No Substitutes)
Per Dozen
Part Number 41-100 Pro Series R100 # 1369653 R100-H2




Company

Aluminum Athletic
Use #170787 On
Purchase Order When
Ordering

American Whitetail

ARC Sports

Atomic Designs &
Apparel

Brant
Williams
Golf Shop

No Bid

BSN Sports Dallas
Include This Bid Number

On All Purchase Orders 18-

52748

Bumblebee
Team Sports
No Bid

Colonel Connection

Elite Screen
Printing
No Bid

Eurosport/
Soccer.co
m/Sports
Endeavors,
Inc.

No Bid

Bill Heath's Family Sports

Manufactorer

Spalding

Rawlings

Rawlings

Price

$64.30

$94.92/dz

$65.00/dz

Part Number

Middle School Game Ball

41100KY

RNS

Manufactorer

Spalding

Spalding

Rawlings

Price

$37.10

$65.50/dz

$42.00/dz

Baseballs, Worth Brand
Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

BASKETBALLS

Basketball, Boys Game
Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA
Approved

(No Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

TF1000-Classic "Mens"

#1336016

Contour

Manufactorer

Spalding

Spalding

Rawlings

Price

$41.45 Each

$599.40/dz

$643.80/dz

Basketball, Girls Game
Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA
Approved

(No Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

TF1000-Classic "28.s"

#1336023

Contour-W

Manufactorer

Spalding

Spalding

Rawlings

Price

$41.45 Each

$599.40/dz

$643.80/dz

FOOTBALLS

Footballs, Leather,
Rawlings ST PRO
(No Substitutes) For
HCHS Each

Part Number

Appha-Varsity

#1388060

Pro5AB

Manufactorer

Spalding

Spalding

Rawlings

Price

$62.55 Each

$69.95 Each

$68.00 Each

Footballs, Leather,
Rawlings ST-5

(No Substitutes)
Each

Part Number

Alpha-Varsity

#1388060

Manufactorer

Spalding

Spalding

Price

$62.55 Each

$69.95 Each

Footballs, Leather,
Wilson TDY Middle
School (No
Substitutes)

Each

No longer State Balls!

Please See Attached Sheet.

Bidding Correct Balls.

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

SOCCER BALLS

Balls, Game, KHSAA
Approved Ball (No
Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

#1330167

LESO




Company

Aluminum Athletic
Use #170787 On
Purchase Order When
Ordering

American Whitetail

ARC Sports

Atomic Designs &
Apparel

Brant
Williams
Golf Shop

No Bid

BSN Sports Dallas
Include This Bid Number
On All Purchase Orders 18-
52748

Bumblebee
Team Sports
No Bid

Colonel Connection

Elite Screen
Printing
No Bid

Eurosport/
Soccer.co
m/Sports
Endeavors,
Inc.

No Bid

Bill Heath's Family Sports

Manufactorer

Select Royale

Mikasa

Price

$39.99 Each

$17.00 Each

Part Number

SL450

Manufactorer

Mikasa

Price

$40.00 Each

SOFTBALLS

KHSAA Game Approved,
12" Optic Yellow, Leather
Cover. Wilson A9011SST
or KHSAA approved (No
Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

#43-147 WT12LRFY

#1371532

C12RYLAH

Manufactorer

Dudley/Spalding

Wilson

Rawlings

Price

$62.80/dz

$77.69/dz

$75.00/dz

VOLLEYBALLS

Game, Leather, 18 -
Panel, KHSAA Approved.
Rawlings

(No Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

#1376345

VQ 2000 AR/White

Manufactorer

Baden

Mikasa

Price

$49.42 Each

$32.55

TENNIS BALLS

KHSAA Approved Ball
Only (Suggested Dunlop,
Wilson or Penn)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

#M7Duncan

Dunlop

$35.76/dz

Price

BRAND NAME

A4

30%

0-40%

Active Ankles

25%

Adidas

Alexandra Collection

Alleson

30%

Antigua

30%

Asics

30%




Eurosport/

Aluminum Athletic v v Brgnt BSN Sports Dallas Bumblebee Elite Screen Soccer.co
Company Pu:‘;z:;‘g?; S\;}en American Whitetail ARC Sports Amm':p'szf;?ns @ Gv(\:lllf“ghmjp ol:C/Ixilxdsut::wsagledo’jggnr:e{& Team Sports Colonel Connection Printing E':r/isegsgrss‘ Bill Heath's Family Sports
Ordering No Bid 52748 No Bid No Bid Inc.
No Bid

Atomic DNA
Badger 30% 0-40%
Bike Athletic
Capezio/Bloch/Gotta
Flurt
Champion AE 30%
Champro 30% 0-40%
Cobblestone 30% 0-40%
Converse
DUC 30%
E3 Sports Apparel
Easton 30%
Fila
Gator 30%
General Supplies 30
Gia Mia 0-40%
GTM Direct
Holloway 30% 0-40%
In Sport
Kaepa 30%
MFAthletic 30%
Mikasa 30% 0-40%
Mizuno 30%
Molten 30%
Nike Clothing 30%
Nike Footwear

30%
Perform Better
Premier 30
Puma 30
Rawlings 30% 0-40%
Reebok Footwear
Reebok Uniforms
Riddell
Rip-It 30%
Robbins Next
Russell 30%
Schutt 25% 0-40%
Spalding 25%
Speedo 30%
Sport Source
International
Tachikara 30%
Tyr 30%
UnderArmour 30%
Varsity Spirit Fashion
Wilson 30%
Worth 30% 0-40%
Xenith
Rebel Athletic
Score
Promaxima
BSN Apparel 30%
Seige Custom Apparel 20%
Contact Tom Syron Michael Wulf Anthony Eannacony Mark Glover Brant Williar|Chris Bloomfield Cory Staples Holly Hartma Bill Heath
Address 1000 Enterprise Dr 8478 IN 62 850 Peach Lake Road 2501 Jackson Street| 1030 Countr|PO Box 7726 340 Southside Dr 1026 3rd St 514 Tenth St




Eurosport/
Aluminum Athletic Brant BSN Sports Dallas Bumblebee Elite Screen Soccer.co
Use #170787 On . . . Atomic Designs & Williams Include This Bid Number q - m/Sports . . .
Company Purchase Order When American Whitetail ARC Sports Apparel Golf Shop | On All Purchase Orders 18] Team Sports Colonel Connection Printing Endeavors, Bill Heath's Family Sports
] No Bid No Bid
Ordering No Bid 52748 Inc.
No Bid
Royersford, PA Ferdinand, IN North Salem, NY Paducah, KY Henderson, || Dallas, TX Henderson, KY Henderson, K| Henderson, KY
19468 47532 10560 42003 42420(75209-0726 42420 42420 42420
Phone 800-523-5471 812-937-7185 203-775-4140 270-827-344/800-527-7510 270-577-3330 270-827-806] 270-826-4300
Fax 610-825-2378 812-937-4157 203-775-3809 800-365-7653 270-827-806¢ 270-826-4302
colonelconnection@gmail.com [orders@hend bhfamilysports@hotmail.com

E-mail

toms@aaesports.com sales @archerytargets.com

info@arcsports.com

mark@atomicdesig|brantpga@g]|

bsnbid@bsnsports.com



mailto:toms@aaesports.com#
mailto:sales@archerytargets.com#
mailto:info@arcsports.com#
mailto:mark@atomicdesignsand%20apparel.com#
mailto:brantpga@gmail.com#
mailto:bsnbid@bsnsports.com#
mailto:colonelconnection@gmail.com#
mailto:orders@hendersonelite.com#
mailto:bhfamilysports@hotmail.com#

HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF E
1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

Tabulation Sheet
Athletic Equipment and Supplies
Bid # 1-18-5-1

Part A Athletic Catalog

Purchase from highlig

Hutch and Son Mid
GTM Industrial Just For Korney Lancaster Legends America Mid-West
Company Sports Gopher Sports Electronics IRC Team Sports Kix Boards Archery Ng Bid Sports MFAC, LLC Sports MOJO Sports
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Advantage No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

GENERAL SUPPLIES Discount 10% 10% 32%
BASEBALL .

Discount 10% 32%
BASKETBALL

Discount 10% 32%
CHEERLEADING Discount 10% 32%
CROSS COUNTRY Discount 10% 10% 32%
DANCE Discount 10% 32%
FISHING Discount 32%
FOOTBALL .

Discount 10% 32%
GOLF .

Discount 10% 32%
SOCCER

Discount 10% 32%
SOFTBALL .

Discount 10% 32%
SWIMMING Discount 10% 32%
TENNIS .

Discount 10% Up to 30% 32%
TRACK

Discount 10% 10% 32%
VOLLEYBALL .

Discount 10% 32%
OTHER (LIST)
Archery Discount 10%
Bowling Discount
Trap Shoot Discount
Weightlifting Discount
Ink Kits
Break Through Banners
Mascots & Accessories
Soung System Portable
Bags & Backpacks
Megaphones
Flags
BASEBALLS
Game Baseballs,
Rawlings R100 KHSAA
Approved
(No Substitutes)
Per Dozen
Part Number 41-100KY




Company

Sports
No Bid

Gopher Sports

Hutch and Son
Industrial
Electronics
No Bid

IRC Team Sports

Just For
Kix
No Bid

Korney
Boards
No Bid

Lancaster
Archery
No Bid

Legends
No Bid

Mid
America
Sports
Advantage
No Bid

MFAC, LLC

Mid-West
Sports
No Bid

MOJO Sports

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Baseballs, Worth Brand
Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

BASKETBALLS

Basketball, Boys Game
Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA
Approved

(No Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Basketball, Girls Game
Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA
Approved

(No Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

FOOTBALLS

Footballs, Leather,
Rawlings ST PRO
(No Substitutes) For
HCHS Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Footballs, Leather,
Rawlings ST-5

(No Substitutes)
Each

Part Number

04-677

Manufactorer

Rawlings

Price

$78.97/Each

Footballs, Leather,
Wilson TDY Middle
School (No
Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

61-417 Size 4

Manufactorer

Wilson

Price

$45.04 Each

SOCCER BALLS

Balls, Game, KHSAA
Approved Ball (No
Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

Spalding

$67.15/dz

74-7839

Spalding

$47.00/Each

74-7849

Spalding

$47.00/Each

72-7675

Spalding Alpha

$63.95/Each

WTF-138013

Wilson

$35.05

Royale




Company

Sports
No Bid

Gopher Sports

Hutch and Son
Industrial
Electronics
No Bid

IRC Team Sports

Just For
Kix
No Bid

Korney
Boards
No Bid

Lancaster
Archery
No Bid

Legends
No Bid

Mid
America
Sports
Advantage
No Bid

MFAC, LLC

Mid-West
Sports
No Bid

MOJO Sports

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

SOFTBALLS

KHSAA Game Approved,
12" Optic Yellow, Leather
Cover. Wilson A9011SST
or KHSAA approved (No
Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

42-665

Manufactorer

Dudley

Price

$86.81/dz

VOLLEYBALLS

Game, Leather, 18 -
Panel, KHSAA Approved.
Rawlings

(No Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

TENNIS BALLS

KHSAA Approved Ball
Only (Suggested Dunlop,
Wilson or Penn)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

BRAND NAME

A4

Active Ankles

Adidas

Alexandra Collection

Alleson

Antigua

Asics

603095US

Dunlop

$59.76/Case

602157US

Dunlop

$64.56/Case

521001

Penn

$62.16/Case

522002

Penn

$75.60/Case

WRT100101

Wilson

$71.76/Case

WRT106200

Wilson

$73.20/Case

25-30%

25-30%

25-30%

Select Sport

$45.00

4K147

Dudley

$65.00/dz

62-2722

Molten

$34.00/Each

WRT-1001

Wilson

$84.00/dz

32%

32%

32%

32%




Company

Sports
No Bid

Gopher Sports

Hutch and Son
Industrial
Electronics
No Bid

IRC Team Sports

Just For
Kix
No Bid

Korney
Boards
No Bid

Lancaster
Archery
No Bid

Legends
No Bid

Mid
America
Sports
Advantage
No Bid

MFAC, LLC

Mid-West
Sports
No Bid

MOJO Sports

Atomic DNA

Badger

Bike Athletic

Capezio/Bloch/Gotta
Flurt

Champion

Champro

Cobblestone

Converse

buc

E3 Sports Apparel

Easton

Fila

Gator

General Supplies

Gia Mia

GTM Direct

Holloway

In Sport

Kaepa

MFAthletic

Mikasa

Mizuno

Molten

Nike Clothing

Nike Footwear

Perform Better

Premier

Puma

Rawlings

Reebok Footwear

Reebok Uniforms

Riddell

Rip-It

Robbins Next

Russell

Schutt

Spalding

Speedo

Sport Source
International

Tachikara

Tyr

UnderArmour

Varsity Spirit Fashion

Wilson

Worth

Xenith

Rebel Athletic

Score

Promaxima

BSN Apparel

Seige Custom Apparel

25-30%

20-30%

20-30%

20-30%

20-25%

25-30%

25-30%

Contact

Trent Spatenka

Dee Dee Sc|

Michelle Land

Address

2525 Lemmond St SW

8249 Dean Road

7842 Colleg|

312 Harrison j

32%

32%

32%

32%

32%

32%

32%

32%

30%

30%

32%

30%

30%

32%

32%

32%

32%

32%

30%

30%

Jeffery M. McBride

Michael Vick

1600 Division Rd

PO Box 1172




Hutch and Son Mid
GTM Industrial Just For Korney Lancaster Legends America Mid-West
Company Sports Gopher Sports Electronics IRC Team Sports Kix Boards Archery Ng Bid Sports MFAC, LLC Sports MOJO Sports
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Advantage No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Owatonna MN Indianapolis, IN Baxter MN |Roxton, TX West Warwick,RI Henderson, KY
55060 46240 56425 75477 02893 42419

Phone 800-533-0446 866-486-1762 800-762-33(800-842-7772 800-556-7464 270-631-0520
Fax 888-319-7452 317-842-5631 218-829-76(800-842-7772 800-682-6950 270-631-0521
E-mail bids@gophersport.com sales@ircteamsports.com deedee@ju|sales@kbacoq jeff.mcbride@mfathletic.com Michael@mojosportsllc.com



mailto:bids@gophersport.com#
mailto:sales@ircteamsports.com#
mailto:deedee@justforkix.com#
mailto:sales@kbacoach.com#
mailto:jeff.mcbride@mfathletic.com#
mailto:Michael@mojosportsllc.com#

HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF E
1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

Tabulation Sheet
Athletic Equipment and Supplies
Bid # 1-18-5-1

Part A Athletic Catalog

Purchase from highlig

NASP Rebel Riddell Roger's Athletic [ School Health School
Company Prices Good Thru Omni Cheer Athletics 129750 Must Appear On All gCompany Corporation Outfitters School Specialty Soccer.com Spe;trum Spottsville Monsters
12-31-2018 No Bid POs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | Athletics LLC
34% - Furniture
GENERAL SUPPLIES Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies
BASEBALL 34% - Furniture
Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies
34% - Furniture
BASKETBALL Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies 12%
CHEERLEADING Discount 0% 15%
CROSS COUNTRY Discount 15% 12%
DANCE Discount 0% 15%
FISHING Discount 15%
FOOTBALL 34% - Furniture
Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies
34% - Furniture
GOLF Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies
34% - Furniture
SOCCER Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies 12%
SOFTBALL 34% - Furniture
Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies
SWIMMING Discount 15%
34% - Furniture
TENNIS Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies
TRACK 34% - Furniture
Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies 12% 5%
34% - Furniture
VOLLEYBALL Discount 15% 25% - Office Supplies 12%
OTHER (LIST)
Archery Discount 0%
Bowling Discount
Trap Shoot Discount
Weightlifting Discount
Ink Kits
Break Through Banners
Mascots & Accessories
Soung System Portable
Bags & Backpacks
Megaphones
Flags
BASEBALLS
Game Baseballs,
Rawlings R100 KHSAA
Approved
(No Substitutes)
Per Dozen
Part Number RR100NF




Company

NASP
Prices Good Thru
12-31-2018

Omni Cheer

Rebel
Athletics
No Bid

Riddell
129750 Must Appear On All
POs

Roger's Athletic
Company
No Bid

School Health
Corporation
No Bid

School
Qutfitters
No Bid

School Specialty

Soccer.com
No Bid

Spectrum
Athletics LLC

Spottsville Monsters

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Baseballs, Worth Brand
Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

BASKETBALLS

Basketball, Boys Game
Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA
Approved

(No Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Basketball, Girls Game
Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA
Approved

(No Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

FOOTBALLS

Footballs, Leather,
Rawlings ST PRO
(No Substitutes) For
HCHS Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Footballs, Leather,
Rawlings ST-5

(No Substitutes)
Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Footballs, Leather,
Wilson TDY Middle
School (No
Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

SOCCER BALLS

Balls, Game, KHSAA
Approved Ball (No
Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

Ath. Conn.

$134.98/dz

4883

White Line

$50.34/Each

SSI# 022546

Wilson TDY

$26.99/Each

SSI# 633486




Company

NASP
Prices Good Thru
12-31-2018

Omni Cheer

Rebel
Athletics
No Bid

Riddell
129750 Must Appear On All
POs

Roger's Athletic
Company
No Bid

School Health
Corporation
No Bid

School
Qutfitters
No Bid

School Specialty

Soccer.com
No Bid

Spectrum
Athletics LLC

Spottsville Monsters

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

SOFTBALLS

KHSAA Game Approved,
12" Optic Yellow, Leather
Cover. Wilson A9011SST
or KHSAA approved (No
Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

VOLLEYBALLS

Game, Leather, 18 -
Panel, KHSAA Approved.
Rawlings

(No Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

TENNIS BALLS

KHSAA Approved Ball
Only (Suggested Dunlop,
Wilson or Penn)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

BRAND NAME

A4

Active Ankles

Adidas

0%

Alexandra Collection

Alleson

0%

Antigua

Asics

0%

1371532

Ath. Conn.

$120.39

MTPENCAN

Ath. Conn.

$58.68/dz

Mikasa 3000 Size 4

$6.61/Each

SSl# 1414606

Penn 437

$11.15/dz




Company

NASP
Prices Good Thru
12-31-2018

Omni Cheer

Rebel
Athletics
No Bid

Riddell
129750 Must Appear On All
POs

Roger's Athletic
Company
No Bid

School Health
Corporation
No Bid

School
Qutfitters
No Bid

School Specialty

Soccer.com
No Bid

Spectrum
Athletics LLC

Spottsville Monsters

Atomic DNA

Badger

Bike Athletic

Capezio/Bloch/Gotta
Flurt

Champion

Champro

Cobblestone

Converse

buc

E3 Sports Apparel

Easton

Fila

Gator

General Supplies

Gia Mia

GTM Direct

Holloway

In Sport

Kaepa

MFAthletic

Mikasa

Mizuno

Molten

Nike Clothing

0%

Nike Footwear

0%

Perform Better

Premier

Puma

Rawlings

Reebok Footwear

0%

Reebok Uniforms

Riddell

Rip-It

Robbins Next

Russell

Schutt

Spalding

Speedo

Sport Source
International

Tachikara

Tyr

UnderArmour

0%

Varsity Spirit Fashion

Wilson

Worth

Xenith

Rebel Athletic

Score

Promaxima

BSN Apparel

Seige Custom Apparel

15%

Contact

Michelle Huibregtse

Jay Davis

Dan Gilles

Nathan Yarhouse

Karen Alevedo|

Angela Webb

Amy Fuss

Derek Pahl

Keith Hobson

Address

W4285 Lake Dr

12375 World Trade Dr

7501 Performance Lane

3760 W Luding Dr

865 Muirfield |

3736 Regent Avg

W6316 Design Drive

PO Box 238

520S Elm St




NASP Rebel Riddell Roger's Athletic | School Health School
Company Prices Good Thru Omni Cheer Athletics 129750 Must Appear On All Company Corporation Outfitters School Specialty Soﬁceéi;’m A i?e(.:tru[r:_c Spottsville Monsters
12-31-2018 No Bid POs No Bid No Bid No Bid o B LESHES
Welde, WI San Diego, CA North Ridgeville, OH Farwell, M| Hanover Park, |Cincinnati, OH |Greenville, WI| Gilbertsville, KY |Henderson, KY
53093 92128 44039 48622 60133 45212 54942 42044 42420
866-231-0368  |270-724-2218

Phone

920-523-6040

800-871-0063 ext 114

440-353-8600

800-248-0270

866-323-5465

800-260-2776

800-554-7632

920-523-6042

858-613-1976

440-353-8601

888-549-9659

800-235-1305

800-494-1036

800675-1775

866-205-3339

866-796-7479

E-mail

michelle@naspschools.org

jidavis@omnicheer.com

digilles@riddellsales.com

nyarhouse@rogerg bids@schoolh(

contracts@scho|

bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com

dpahl@spectrun|smtrackclub@gmail.com



mailto:michelle@naspschools.org#
mailto:jdavis@omnicheer.com#
mailto:djgilles@riddellsales.com#
mailto:nyarhouse@rogersathletic.com#
mailto:bids@schoolhealth.com#
mailto:contracts@schooloutfitters.com#
mailto:bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com#
mailto:dpahl@spectrumathletics.com#
mailto:smtrackclub@gmail.com#

HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF E
1805 SECOND STREET
HENDERSON, KY 42420

Tabulation Sheet
Athletic Equipment and Supplies
Bid # 1-18-5-1

Part A Athletic Catalog

Purchase from highlig

Swimoutlet.com Tri-State
Company . Swimville USA Trophies Trophy House Varsity Spirit Fashion
No Bid
No Bid
FreeS&H

GENERAL SUPPLIES Discount 0% 5%
BASEBALL .

Discount
BASKETBALL .

Discount
CHEERLEADING Discount 5%
CROSS COUNTRY Discount
DANCE Discount 5%
FISHING Discount
FOOTBALL .

Discount
GOLF .

Discount
SOCCER .

Discount
SOFTBALL .

Discount
SWIMMING Discount 25%
TENNIS .

Discount
TRACK .

Discount
VOLLEYBALL .

Discount
OTHER (LIST)
Archery Discount
Bowling Discount
Trap Shoot Discount
Weightlifting Discount
Ink Kits 5%
Break Through Banners 5%
Mascots & Accessories 5%
Soung System Portable 5%
Bags & Backpacks 5%
Megaphones 5%
Flags 5%
BASEBALLS
Game Baseballs,
Rawlings R100 KHSAA
Approved
(No Substitutes)
Per Dozen
Part Number




Company

Swimoutlet.com
No Bid

Swimville USA

Tri-State
Trophies
No Bid

Trophy House

Varsity Spirit Fashion

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Baseballs, Worth Brand
Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

BASKETBALLS

Basketball, Boys Game
Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA
Approved

(No Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Basketball, Girls Game
Ball wide seams,
Rawlings KHSAA
Approved

(No Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

FOOTBALLS

Footballs, Leather,
Rawlings ST PRO
(No Substitutes) For
HCHS Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Footballs, Leather,
Rawlings ST-5

(No Substitutes)
Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Footballs, Leather,
Wilson TDY Middle
School (No
Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

SOCCER BALLS

Balls, Game, KHSAA
Approved Ball (No
Substitutes)

Each

Part Number




Company

Swimoutlet.com
No Bid

Swimville USA

Tri-State
Trophies
No Bid

Trophy House

Varsity Spirit Fashion

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

SOFTBALLS

KHSAA Game Approved,
12" Optic Yellow, Leather
Cover. Wilson A9011SST
or KHSAA approved (No
Substitutes)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

VOLLEYBALLS

Game, Leather, 18 -
Panel, KHSAA Approved.
Rawlings

(No Substitutes)

Each

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

TENNIS BALLS

KHSAA Approved Ball
Only (Suggested Dunlop,
Wilson or Penn)

Per Dozen

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

Part Number

Manufactorer

Price

BRAND NAME

A4

Active Ankles

Adidas

Alexandra Collection

Alleson

Antigua

Asics




Company

Swimoutlet.com
No Bid

Swimville USA

Tri-State
Trophies
No Bid

Trophy House

Varsity Spirit Fashion

Atomic DNA

Badger

Bike Athletic

Capezio/Bloch/Gotta
Flurt

Champion

Champro

Cobblestone

Converse

buc

E3 Sports Apparel

Easton

Fila

Gator

General Supplies

Gia Mia

GTM Direct

Holloway

In Sport

Kaepa

MFAthletic

Mikasa

Mizuno

Molten

Nike Clothing

Nike Footwear

Perform Better

Premier

Puma

Rawlings

Reebok Footwear

Reebok Uniforms

Riddell

Rip-It

Robbins Next

Russell

Schutt

Spalding

Speedo

Sport Source
International

Tachikara

Tyr

UnderArmour

Varsity Spirit Fashion

Wilson

Worth

Xenith

Rebel Athletic

Score

Promaxima

BSN Apparel

Seige Custom Apparel

Block Troupe Dance Shoe 5%

Nike Air Mix Down II: Cheer-
Dance-Drill Free S & H Only

Swim Apparel & Equipment

Swim Apparel & Equipment

Cheer-Dance-Drill 5%

5% Discount Does Not Apply To
Packages ad Exclusive Shoes.
These Items Will Receive Free

Shipping Only.

Contact

Anne Kennedy

Nick Clemens

Cecelia Patrolia

Address

11800 Shelbyville Rd

511 Frederica St

6745 Lenox Center Ct. Ste. 300




Swimoutlet.com

Tri-State

Company No Bid Swimville USA Trophies Trophy House Varsity Spirit Fashion
° No Bid
Louisville, KY Owensboro, KY Memphis, TN
40243 42301 38115
Phone 502-245-9811 800-468-2305 800-533-8022, x5827
Fax 502-244-6179 270-684-2306
E-mail anne@swimvilleusa.com nick@trophyhouseusa.com |oebids@varsity.com



mailto:anne@swimvilleusa.com#
mailto:nick@trophyhouseusa.com#
mailto:oebids@varsity.com#

