
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

75'l7

January 09, 2018

PAPER (Warehouse Delivery) .

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

December 05, 2017

From February 28, 2018 through February 27, 2019

No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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l Vendor Name

Complete Printer Source

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

Office Depot

Paper 101

l
Vendor Response Terms

Response Terms

Bid documents and color samples attached.

Please see our response proposal to bid
7517.

ALL OUR PRODUCTS ARE FULLY

GuARANTEED. PLEASE MAKE SURE THAT

WHEN RECEMNG ANY OF OUR PRODUCTS

THAT ALL SHORTAGES OR DAMAGES MUST

BE NOTED ON THE BILL OF LADING.

r Response Payment Terms

Net 30

Office Depot's standard billing payment terms
are Net 30 days from invoice date.

NET

l

Southwest Jefferson Inc.

Xpedx
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ITEM No. 1 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2? x 1 1", blue, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103309 or
equal. This note applies to Items 1 throuqh 8: Acid free, 20 Ib. basis weiqht, bond smooth surface, superior runnability, 75 GSM,
150 smoothness, 87 opacity, 99.99% jam-free, SFI/FSC certified, quaranteed to run on small and Iarqe offset presses, diqital
imaqinq equipment, includinq copiers, Iaser and ink-jet printers and plain paper fax machines. IF BIDD?NG THE APPROVED
PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED. SAMPLE = I SWATCHBOOK. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity-2,400
(5760240-1423383)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Paper 101 - colors do not match specifications for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 8.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYPASTELS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 972424

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY PASTEL BLUE

UNIT PRICE ($)
3. 1980

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001015

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

IP/Hammermill #103309 3.4400'

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MP2201 BE

Fireworx 3.4870

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 345637

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Xerox@ Vitality Colors" Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 20 Lb, 30%
Recycled, Blue, Ream Of 500 Sheets

Xerox (Domtar) 3.9900

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Hammermill #103309

HAM103309

4.4700

ITEM No. 2 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1?, buff, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103325 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 1 ,200 (5760240-1661785)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Paper 101 - colors do not match specifications for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 8.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Paper 101 DOMESTIC #E-COPY PASTELS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3624

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY PASTEL BUFF

UNIT PRICE ($)
3.1980

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001016

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

IP/Hammermill #103325 3.4400"

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MP2201 BF

Fireworx 3.4870

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 345678

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Xerox@ Vitality Colors" Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 20 Lb, 30%
Recycled, Buff, Ream Of 500 Sheets

Xerox (Domtar) #3RO5860 3.9900

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

HAMMERMILL #103325

HAM 103325

4.4700

ITEM No. 3 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1?, canary, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103341 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240-1649967)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.1thru8.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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Paper 101 DOMESTIC #E-COPY PASTELS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 982424

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY PASTEL CANARY

Xpedx IP/Hammermill #103341

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001018

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc. Fireworx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MP2201 CY

Office Depot Xerox (Domtar) #3RO5858

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 345660

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Xerox@ Vitality ColorsT' Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 20 Lb, 30o/o
Recycled, Yellow, Ream Of 500 Sheets

HAMMERMILL #103341

HAM103341

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

3.1980

3 4400"

3.4870

3.9900

4.4700

ITEM No. 4 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", qoldenrod, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103168
or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 1 ,200 (5760240-1652261)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.1thru8.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYPASTELS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3824

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY PASTEL GOLDENROD

Xpedx IP/Hammermill #103168

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001020

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc. Fireworx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MP2201GRP

Office Depot Xerox (Domtar) #3RO5861

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 345686

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Xerox@ Vitality ColorsTM Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 20 Lb, 30%
Recycled, Goldenrod, Ream Of 500 Sheets

HAMMERMILL #103168

HAM103168

UNIT PRICE ($)
3.1980

3.4400"

3.4870

3.9900

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

4.4700

ITEM No. s - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2? x 1 1", qreen, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103366 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240-1649965)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.1thru8.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Paper 101 DOMESTIC #E-COPY PASTELS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 952424

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY PASTEL GREEN

Xpedx IP/Hammermill #103366

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001021

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

UNIT PRICE ($)
3.1980

3 4400"

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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Contract Paper Group, Inc. Fireworx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MP2201GN

Office Depot Xerox (Domtar) #3RO5857
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 345645

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Xerox@ Vitality Colors? Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 20 Lb, 30%
Recycled, Green, Ream Of 500 Sheets

HAMMERMILL #103366

HAM 103366

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

3 4870

3.9900

4.4700

ITEM No. 6 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2? x 1 1", lilac, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #102269 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,400 (5760240-2012454)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.1thru8.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Paper 101 DOMESTIC #E-COPY PASTELS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5124

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY PASTEL ORCHID

Xpedx IP/Hammermill #102269

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001024

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc. Fireworx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MP2201LV

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Lavender

Office Depot Xerox(Domtar) #3R11230

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 478156

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Xerox@ Vitality ColorsTM Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 20 Lb, 30%
F<ecycled, Lilac, Ream Of 500 Sheets

HAMMERMILL #102269

HAM 102269

UNIT PRICE ($J
3.1980

3.4400"

3.4870

3.9900

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

4.4700

ITEM No. 7 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", pink, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103382 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240-16499661

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Paper 101 - colors do not match specifications for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 8.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Paper 101 DOMESTIC #E-COPY PASTELS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 942424

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY PASTEL PINK

Xpedx IP/Hammermill #103382

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001027

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc. Fireworx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MP2201 PK

Office Depot Xerox (Domtar) #3RO5859

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 345652

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Xerox@ Vitality ColorsTM Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 20 Lb, 30%
Recycled, Pink, Ream Of 500 Sheets

UNIT PRICE ($)
3.1980

3 4400"

3.4870

3.9900

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

HAMMERMILL #103382

HAM 103382

4.4700

ITEM No. 8 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", salmon, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103119 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,400 (5760240-2012455)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Paper 101 - colors do not match specifications for Lot Item Nos. 1 thru 8.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYPASTELS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5824

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY PASTEL SALMON

Xpedx IP/Hammermill #103119

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001028

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 478123

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Xerox@ Vitality Colors'M Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 20 Lb, 30%
Recycled, Salmon, Ream Of 500 Sheets

HAMMERMILL #103119

HAM103119

UNIT PRICE ($)
3.1980

3.4400"

3.4870Fireworx

MP2201 SN

Xerox (Domtar) #3R11231 3.9900

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

4.4700

ITEM No. 9 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", red, ream/500 sheets, Mohawk Britehue #471608 or equal. Acid free, 20 lb.
basis weiqht, bond smooth surface, GREEN SEAL cerkified, compatible with all office equipment and printers, Iaser quaranteed. IF
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED. SAMPLE = I SWATCHBOOK. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream,
Estimated Quantity - 1 ,200 (5760240-2012456)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Paper 101 - shade of red not acceptable.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Southwest Jefferson Inc. NO BID #NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Paper 101

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 72624

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY RADIANT RED

Contract Paper Group, Inc. Brite Hue

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Red

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 639959

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: MohawkBrite-HueColoredPaper-Letter-81/2"x11?-20lbBasisWeight-Smooth-
500 / Ream - Ultra Lava

Mohawk/Britehue #471608

UNIT PRICE ($)
oooro

4.4250DOMESTIC #E-COPY BRIGHTS

4.9000"

471608

6.2500Mohawk (SP Richards) #MOW185161

6.6500Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2329353

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Complete Printer Source 8.4500Mohawk #471608

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NuMBER: MOW471608

ITEM No. 10 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", briqht blue, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26781 or equal. This note applies to Items 10 throuqh 17: Acid and liqnin-free, 50 Ib, text, bond smooth surFace, 74 G/M2,
elemental chlorine free, consistent color side-to-side, run-to-run, SFI/FSC certified, copier, laser, ink-jet and offset quaranteed. IF
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED. SAMPLE = 1 SWATCHBOOK. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream,
Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240-1719700)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.10thru17.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYBRIGHTS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 70724

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY BEAMING BLUE

UNIT PRICE ($)
4.4250

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WAU26781

Neenah #26781 4.6800"

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5322028

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Neenah/Exact #26781 4 6900

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 472208

Brite Hue 4.8200

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 424152

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Astrobrights@ Colored Cardstock, 8 112" x 1 1", FSC@ Certified, 30% Recycled, 65 Lb,
Lunar Blue, Pack of 250

Astrobrights (Neenah) #21728 7.6300

ITEM No. 11 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2? x 11 ", briqht qreen, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26791 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,800 (5760240-1719702)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlCll-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.10thru17.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYBRIGHTS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 71024

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY LUMINOUS LIME

UNIT PRICE ($)
4.4250

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WAU26791

Neenah #26791 4.6800"

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2260769

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Neenah/Exact #26791 4 6900

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 101261

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Ultra Lime

Brite Hue 4.8200

Office Depot Astrobrights(Neenah) #21788

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 423545

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: Astrobrights@ColoredCardStock,81/2"x11",FSC@Certified,65Lb,TerraGreen?,
Pack Of 250 Sheets

7.5800

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 12 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1 ", briqht oranqe, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26721 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,400 (5760240-1719703)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.10thru17.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYBRIGHTS

VENDORREFERENCENUMBER: 71124

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY ENERGETIC ORANGE

UNIT PRICE ($)
4.4250

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2260732

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 101329

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Ultra Orange

WAU26721

Neenah #26721

Neenah/Exact #26721

Brite Hue

4.6800"

4.6900

4.8200

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 919500

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: Astrobrights@ColoredCardstock,81/2"x11",FSC@Certified,65Lb,CosmicOrange,
Pack of 250

Astrobrights (Neenah) #21858 7 5900

ITEM No. 13 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", briqht pine, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26801 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 1 ,600 (5760240-1719706)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.10thru17.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYBRIGHTS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 71824

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY GLOWING GREEN

UNIT PRICE ($)
4.4250

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2260769

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 471008

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Green

WAU26801

Neenah #26801

Neenah/Exact #26801

Brite Hue

4.6800"

4.6900

4.8200

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 198758

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: Astrobrights@ColoredCardstock,81/2"x11",FSC@Certified,30%Recycled,65Lb,
Gamma Green, Pack of 250

Astrobrights (Neenah) #98855 7.5400

ITEM No. 14 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 112" x 1 1", briqht pink, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26741 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,400 (5760240-1719701)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlCll-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.10thru17.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYBRIGHTS
UNIT PRICE ($)

4.4250

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 72324

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY FLARING FUCHSIA

Complete Printer Source Neenah #26741

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WAU26741

Xpedx Neenah/Exact #26741

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2260734

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 101311

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Ultra Pink

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 198695

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: Astrobrightsa)ColoredCardstock,81/2"xll?,FSC@Certified,65Lb,PulsarPink,
Pack of 250

Brite Hue

Astrobrights (Neenah) #98854

4 6800"

4.6900

4.8200

7.5400

ITEM No. 15 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", briqht purple, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26771 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240-2012457)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaper10icolorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.10thru17.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlCll DOMESTIC#E-COPYBRIGHTS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 72924

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY NIGHT SKY PURPLE

Complete Printer Source Neenah #26771

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WAU26771

Xpedx Neenah/Exact #26771

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2260767

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 102128

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Violet

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 860402

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: AstrobrightsLaser,InkjetPrintPrintableMultipurposeCard-Letter-81/2"x11"-651b
Basis Weight - Recycled - 30% Recycled Content - Smooth - 250 / Pack - Planetary
Purple

UNIT PRICE ($J
4.4250

4 6800"

4 6900

4.8200Brite Hue

12.5200Astrobrights (Neenah) #22878

ITEM No. 16 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2? x 1 1", briqht red, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht #26751
or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240l7l9705j

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.10thru17.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYBRIGHTS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 71324

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY ENERGETIC RED

Complete Printer Source Neenah #26751

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WAU26751

UNIT PRICE ($!)
4.4250

4.6800'

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2260735

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 185161

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Ultra Lava

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 424241

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: Astrobrights@ColoredCardstock,81/2"x11?,FSC@Certified,30%Recycled,65Lb,
Re-Entry Red, Pack of 250

Astrobrights (Neenah) #21758

Neenah/Exact #26751

Brite Hue

4.6900

4 8200

7.5400

ITEM No. 17 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 11 ", briqht yellow, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26701 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3,200 (5760240-1719704)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectPaperlOl-colorsdonotmatchspecificationsforLotltemNos.10thru17.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PaperlOl DOMESTIC#E-COPYBRIGHTS

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 71424

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: E-COPY SOLAR FLARE YELLOW

Complete Printer Source Neenah #26701

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WAU26701

Xpedx Neenah/Exact #26701

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2260729

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net30

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: to 1246

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Ultra Lemon

Office Depot

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 424367

RESPONSEITEMNOTES Astrobrights@ColoredCardstock,81/2?xll",FSC@Certified,65Lb,SolarYellow,
Pack of 250

UNIT PRICE ($)
4.4250

4.6800"

4.6900

Brite Hue 4.8200

Astrobrights (Neenah) #21738 7.6200

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR NAME

Complete Printer Source

Paper 101

Xpedx

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

Office Depot

TOTALBIDS-10-17

TOTAL ($>

86,112.00

81 ,420 00

86,296.00

88,688.00

149,364.00

AWARDED TOTAL ($)

86,112.00

$86,112.00

VENDOR NAME

Xpedx

Paper 101

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

Office Depot

Complete Printer Source

TOTAL BIDS - 1-8

TOTAL ($)

53,664.00

49,888.80

54,397.20

62,244.00

69,732.00

AWARDED TOTAL ($)

53,664.00

$53,664.00

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME

Complete Printer Source

Contract Paper Group, Inc.

Office Depot

Paper 101

Southwest Jefferson Inc.

Xpedx

TOTAL ($)
165,984.00

148,965.20

219,108.00

136,618.80

120

147,940.00

AWARDED TOTAL ($)
86,11200

5,880.00

53,664.00

145,656.00

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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