
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFF?RMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

7463

July 25, 2017

SCNS LUNCHROOM PRODUCTS (School Delivery)
Supplement

July 10, 2017

From July 25, 2017 through January 01 , 2018

No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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I Vendor Name

Dr. Pepper Snapple Group

Southwest ,Iefferson Inc.

Sysco Louisville

l
Vendor Response Terms

Response Terms ) Response Payment Terms l
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ITEM No. 1 - Beveraqe, 100% fruit juce with no added suqar. Grape. Packed approx. (24) 11 .5-oz. cans per case. Approved
Product: Snapple #10003021 . Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of can
and no. of cans per case. 1 - 24.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 100

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SouthwestJeffersonlnc. NOBID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.ooro

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

NO BID #NO BID o.oroo

Dr. Pepper Snapple Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

10003021

25 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: .54/can 24- 1 1 .5 oz cans/case

Snapple 13.0000"

ITEM No. 2 - Beveraqe, 100% fruit juice with no added suqar. Fruit Punch. Packed approx. (24) 1 1 .5-oz. cans per case.
Approved Product: Snapple #10003020. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
size of can and no. of cans per case. 1 - 24.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 200

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

NO BID #NO BID

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

Dr. Pepper Snapple Group

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:

10003020

25 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: .54/can 24- 11 .5 oz. cans/case

Snapple 13.0000"

ITEM No. 3 - Beveraqe, 100% juice, V8 Fusion Smoothie Mix, Peach Manqo. Packed approx. (12) 32-oz. cartons per case.
Approved Product: Island Oasis #10037597521004. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: Specify size of carton and no. of cartons per case. 1- 12.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 50

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Sysco Louisville - did not submit sample for evaluation. There were no other bids received for
this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SyscoLouisville ISLDOAS #21192

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2555819

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 12/32 02, MPC changed this is the SPEC item

UNIT PRICE ($)
56.8400

ITEM No. 4 - Beveraqe, 100% juice, V8 Fusion Smoothie Mix, Watermelon Raspberry. Packed approx. (12) 32-oz. cartons per
case. Approved Product: Island Oasis #1 0037597520007. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify size of carton and no. of cartons per case. 1 - 12.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 50

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Sysco Louisville - did not submit sample for evaluation. There were no other bids received for
this item.

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2555825

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 12/32 02, MPC changed this is the SPEC item

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

ISLDOAS #21191

UNIT PRICE ($)
56.8400

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. s - Beveraqe, 100% juice, unsweetened, frozen concentrate. Oranqe. Packed (12) 32-oz. cartons per case Approved
Product: Sunkist #10000061 . Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of
carton and no. of cartons per case. 1 - 12.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 75 (4445350-2013594)

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SUNKSTS #10000C)61

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2560209

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 12/32 02

UNIT PRICE ($)
48.3100"

ITEM No. 6 - Beveraqe, premium brewed tea. Decaf Manqo Green Tea. No artificial colors, flavors, or sweeteners. Shelf stable.
Packed approx. (4) 64-oz. juqs per case. Approved Product: Cooper Tea #6218. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of oz. per juq and no. of juqs per case. 1 - 4.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity -
ro

ITEM AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oioo

ITEM No. 7 - Beveraqe, premium brewed tea. Decaf sweet tea. No artificial colors, flavors, or sweeteners. Shelf stable. Packed
approx (4) 64-oz. juqs per case. Approved Product: Cooper Tea #6319. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of oz. per juq and no. of juqs per case. 1 - 4.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity -
qo

ITEM AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.otoo

ITEM No. 8 - Broccoli, cut. 30-Ib. bulk pack. Broccoli heads, no stems and pieces. Grade A. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please
respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaqe. 1 - 30.0000 Pound Case,
Estimated Quantity - 3,400

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3572942

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 12/2LB, NORPAC, SENT SAMPLE

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

FLAVRPK #10572

UNIT PRICE ($)
35.3300"

ITEM No. 9 - Carrots, diced, frozen. Packed approx. (1 2) 2-Ib. packaqes per case. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to
the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaqe and no. of packaqes per case. 1 - 12.0000
Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 125 (444591 s-1729035)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: There vvere no bids received for this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Sysco Louisville NO BID #NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

ITEM No. 10 - Carrots, sliced, frozen. Packed approx. (12) 2-lb. packaqes per case. Approved Product: Simplot #73DL4662.
Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaqe and no. of packaqes per
case. 1- 12.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 1 ,150

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3959327

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1/30 LB, SENECA, SENT SAMPLE

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SENECA #35123

UNIT PRICE ($)
21 .8400"

ITEM No. 11 -? Cereal, bowl pack. Alpha Bits. Must provide 1 oz. qiain equivalence for the USDA Child Nutrition Proqrariis. Suqar
to be less than or equal to 6 qrams. No artificial colors, flavors, preservatives, or sweeteners. Packed approx. 96 units per case.
Approved Product: Post #10884912271 768. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify size of pack and no. of units per case. 1 - 96.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 75

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4932277

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1/96 CT

UNIT PRICE ($)
33.9300"

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

POST #27176

ITEM No. 12 - Chicken, breaded, tenders, qluten free certified. Whole Grain chicken breast tenders, fully cooked. Antibiotic free.
No artificial colors, flavors, preservatives, or sweeteners. Servinq should provide 1 oz. meat/meat alternate and 1 oz. qrain
equivalence for the U3DA Child Nutrition Proqrams. Packed approx. 51b. sealed baq, 2 baqs per case. Approved Product:
Perdue #56203. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify no. of servinqs per
case, size of case, and nutrition component information. 1 - 10.0000 Pound Case, Estimated Quantity - 25

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1707192

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2/5#, PERDUE

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

HRVSTLD #56203

UNIT PRICE ($)
42.5800"

ITEM No. 13 - Chicken, breast, filet, qrilled, fully cooked whole muscle. Each patty to provide 2 oz. meaUmeat alternate for
USDA Child Nutrition Proqrams. Must contain whole muscle white meat. No artificial colors, flavors, or sweeteners. NO TRANS
FAT OR MSG. Packed approx. 215 servinqs per case. Approved Product: Tyson #70322-0928. Please respond to the followinq in
the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weiqht and no. of servinqs per case. 1 - 215.0000 Count
Case, Estimated Quantity - 350

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3865666

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 6/5LBS, TYSON

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

USDA/TYSON #70322-0928

UNIT PRICE ($)
103.0200"

ITEM No. 14 - Chicken nuqqet. Fully cooked, breaded chicken breast chunks. Gluten Free certified. Labeled no food allerqies.

Packed approx. (2) s-Ib. baqs per case. Approved Product: Perdue #56803. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify weiqht of baqs and number of baqs per case. 1 - 10.0000 Pound Case, Estimated
Quantity - 50

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1934148

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2/5 LB, PERDUE

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

HRVSTLD #56803

UNIT PRICE go
41 .6300"

ITEM No. 15 , - Chips, Fritos, Whole Gr;ain. Reduced fat corn chips. 1 oz. servinq to provide a minimum of 1 oz. qrain equivalence.
Packed approx. (8) 16-oz. baqs per case. Approved Product: Frito Lay #00028400577663. Please respond to the followinq in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaqe. 1 - 8.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 50

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3574417

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

FRITOS #57766

UNIT PRICE (i)
15.1800"

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 8/16 02

ITEM No. 16 - Chips, Funyuns, Whole Grain. Servinq to be used as an a Ia carte sales item. Should be smart snack compliant.
To provide 1 oz. qrain equivalence. Packed approx. (104) .75-oz. baqs per case. Approved Product: Frito Lay #0028400648684.
Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaqe and no. of packaqes per
case. 1 - 104.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 50

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7019343

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 104/.7502, MPC CHANGE THIS IS THE SPEC ITEM

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

FUNYUNS #66689

UNIT PRICE ($)
29.6200"

ITEM No. 17 - Condiment, Sauce, Sriracha Ketchup. Packed approx. (12) 20-oz. plastic bottles per case. Approved Product: Red
Gold #HUYYW2R. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of bottle and no.
of bottles per case. 1 - 12.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 50

ITEM AWARD NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

There were no bids received for this item.

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

NO BID #NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
o.oroo

ITEM No. 18 - Cookies, Whole Grain, Gripz Cinnamon Graham Bites, individually wrapped. Must be Whole Grain Rich with first
inqredient to be whole qrain. Must meet 1 oz. qrain equivalent. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH USDA WHOLE GRAIN RICH
REQUIREMENTS FOR NSLP AND SBP; SP30-2012 MEMO Packed approx. (150) 1-oz. packaqes per case. Approved Product:
Keebler #30100-45682. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaqe
and no. of packaqes per case. 1 - 150.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 500 (4445260-2013603)

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

KEEBLER #3010045682

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7645157

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 150/1 0Z

UNIT PRICE ($)
29.1100"

ITEM No. 19 - Cookie, 3" Snickerdoodle. Frozen. Individually wrapped. Gluten free certified Packed approx. 36 cookies per
case. Approved Product: Udis #UGF806871 . Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify no. of cookies per case. 1 - 36.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 25

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1491352

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 36/1 .8 02

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

UDISHFD #UFG806871

UNIT PRICE ($)
24.5100'

ITEM NO. 20 - Cracker, Whole Grain, individually wrapped. Annies Bunny Grahams Friends. Certified Orqanic. Must be whole
qrain rich with first inqredient to be whole qrain, no hiqh fructosei corn syrup. Must meet 1 6z. qrain equivalent. SHALL BE IN
ACCORDANCE WITH USDA WHOLE GRAIN RICH REQUIREMENTS FOR NSLP AND SBP; SP30-2012 MEMO Packed approx.
(100) 1 .25-oz. packaqes per case. Approved Product: General Mills #13562-00237-2. Please respond to the followinq in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaqe and no. of packaqes per case. 1 - 100.0000 Count Case,
Estimated Quantity - 50

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7009697

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: 100/1.2502,GENERALMIL!S

UNIT PRICE ($)
28.0000"

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

ANNIE'S #237

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM NO. 21 - Cranberries, dried. Packed in s-Ib. containers. Approved Product: Sysco Imperial #2403. Please respond to the
followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of container. 1 - 5.0000 Pound Container, Estimated
Quantity - 350 (4445458-201 3608)

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1/5 LB

7102403

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SYS IMP/TRAINA #2403

UNIT PRICE ($)
16.9800"

ITEM NO. 22 - Grapes, refriqerated. Washed (water only), destemmed, seedless, ready to eat. Individually wrapped. Packaqe to
weiqh approx. 3 oz. Packaqe to provide 1/2 cup servinq of fruit accordinq to USDA Food Buyinq Guide. Packed approx. 100
packaqes per case. Approved Product: Grape Escape #93631 . Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of packaqe, no. of packaqes per case, and country of oriqin. 1 - 100.0000 Count Case, Estimated
Quantity - 750

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1854508

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 50/HALF CUP SERVING, TAYLOR FARM, USA

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

PACKER7TAYLOR FARM #60393

UNIT PRICE ($)
19.7900"

ITEM NO. 23 - Macaroni, elbow. Packed approx. 20 Ibs. per case. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify weiqht per case 1 - 20.0000 Pound Case, Estimated Quantity - 500

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5587936

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2/10 LB, SENT SAMPLE

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

AREZZIO #600536

UNIT PRICE ($)
19.6800"

ITEM NO. 24 - Muffin, qluten free, Double Chocolate, individually wrapped, frozen, approx. 3.O oz. per muffin. Packed approx. 36
muffins/case. Approved Product: Udi's #UGF806461 . Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify portion size by weiqht and no. of servinqs per case. 1 - 36.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 25

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SyscoLouisville UDISHFD#80646

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0760043

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 36/3 02

UNIT PRICE ($)
39.0100"

ITEM NO. 25 - Muffin, Whole Grain, blueberry, individually wrapped, frozen, 2.O oz. Must be made from real blueberries. At Ieast 8
qrams or more of whole qrain per servinq. Contributes 2 oz. qrain equivalent for USDA Child Nutrition Proqram. Muffins shall be
packed approx. 48 per case. Approved Product: Sara Lee SKU #8860. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH USDA WHOLE
GRAIN RICH REQUIREMENTS FOR NSLP AND SBP; SP30-2012 MEMO. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify portion size by weiqht and no. of servinqs per case. 1 - 48.0000 Count Case, Estimated
quantity - 200

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2430961

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 48/2 0Z, SARA LEE

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

CHFPIER #8860

UNIT PRICE ($)
21.1200"

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM NO. 26 - Oranqes, mandarin, canned. Grade A. Packed in 100% juice or liqht syrup. Must be a product of the USA. The
canned mandarin oranqes shall be prepared in accordance with current Good Manufacturinq Practices (21 code of Federal
Requlations (CFR) part 110). The fruit shall be properly washed and peeled, and the membrane, seeds and core and the fiber
strands shall have been substantially removed from the sections. The averaqe drained weiqht of 60.1 oz. per can. Packed (6) No.
10 cans per case. Approved Product: Dole #4218. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: Specify size of can, no. of cans per case, and country of oriqin of product. 1 - 6.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 250

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3548385

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 6/#10, SENT SAMPLE

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SYS/FOMDAS #3548385

UNIT PRICE ($)
26.5900"

ITEM NO. 27 - Pizza, breakfast. Must contain turkey sausaqe crumbles, qravy and mozzarella cheese. Must meet a minimum of
1 oz. meat/meat alternate and 1 oz. qrain equivalent. Packed approx. 192 pieces per case. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH
USDA WHOLE GRAIN RICH REQUIREMENTS FOR NSLP AND SBP; SP30-2012 MEMO. Approved Product: The Max
#77387-12708. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify weiqht of pizza and no.
ofservinqspercase. 1-l92.0000CountCase,EstimatedQuantity-650

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8125371

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 192/2.6602

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

THE MAX #7738712708

UNIT PRICE ($)
45.2600"

ITEM NO. 28 - Potatoes, Canned, (6) No. 10 cans per case. Sodium to be no more than 150 mq per 1/2 cup servinq. SAMPLE
REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of can and no. of cans
per case. 1 - 6.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 10

ITEM AWARD NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: ALREADY AWARDED ON BID 7424

There were no bids received for this item.

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

NO BID #NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

ITEM NO. 29 - Potatoes, Sweet. Canned. (6) No. 10 cans per case. Sodium to be no more that 150 mq. per 1/2 cup servinq.
ApprovedProduct:SaqerCreek(Allen's)#00010319001 PIeaserespondtothefollowinqintheVENDORRESPONSEITEM
NOTES field: Specify size of can and no. of cans per case. 1 - 6.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 250

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Sysco Louisville - did not submit sample for evaluation. There were no other bids received for
this item.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SyscoLouisville SYSCLS/MOODYDUNBAR
#2009L603060315

UNIT PRICE r$)
29.8100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4114625

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 6/#10, 20mg sodium per 2/3cup

ITEM No. 30 - Pretzels, individual packaqes, Gluten Free. One baq shall meet a minimum of 1 qrain equivalent. No more than
200 mq. of sodium per servinq. NO TRANS FAT. SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH USDA WHOLE GRAIN RICH

REQUIRMENTS FOR NSLP AND SBP; SP30-2012 MEMO. Packed approx. (50) 1 .0-oz baqs per case. SAMPLE REQUIRED.
Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of baq and no. of baqs per case. 1
- 50.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 50

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0499851

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 88/ 9 0Z, SENT SAMPLE

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SNYDERS #87840

UNIT PRICE ($)
20.2600"

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM No. 31 - Sauce, Cranberry, jellied, free of sterns, Ieaf pieces and oxidized color. Packed approx. (6) No. 10 cans per case.
Approved Product: Clement #0100610. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
size of can and no. of cans per case. 1 - 6.0000 Count Case, Estimated Quantity - 225

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SyscoLouisville SYS/CLEMENT#100610

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 6/#10

UNIT PRICE ($)
39.3900"

5729967

ITEM No. 32 - Veqetables, frozen blend. Blend to include: Broccoli, cauliflower and carrots. Grade A, first quality. (6) 4-Ib.
packaqes per case. SAMPLE REQUIRED. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify size of packaqe and no. of packaqes per case. Proper documentation due for non-domestic items. 1 - 6.0000 Count Case,
Estimated Quantity - 1 ,050

ITEM AWARD NOTES:

VENDOR NAME

Sysco Louisville

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

There were no bids received for this item.

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

NO BID #NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS -

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME

Dr. Pepper Snapple Group

Southwest Jefferson Inc.

Sysco Louisville

TOTAL ($)
3,900.00

.io

304,335.80

AWARDED TOTAL ($1

3,900.00

291,183.75

295,083.75

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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