
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFF?RMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID 7445

APPROVAL DATE: July 25, 2017

ITEM(S) QUOTED: LARGE LUNCHROOM EQUIPMENT (Percentage)

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: June 22, 20'l7

CONTRACT PERIOD? From July 25, 2017 through July 24, 2018

RENEWAL(S): Two (2) annual renewals at the option of both parties

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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l Vendor Name

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

Dine Company

I

Vendor Response Terms

Response Terms

Respond within 48 hours of receipt of PO.

Delivery to be made within 6 weeks of receipt
ofPO.

r
60 days

Net 30

Response Payment Terms I

Quality Kitchen Service
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ITEM No. 1 - ADCRAFT (NO SUBSTITUTE) (4600245-2013865)

AWARD NOTES: There vtere no bids received for this category.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %

CATEGORYNOTES: NOBID-NOLISTPR?CEAVA?LABLE

ITEM NO. 2 - ADVANCED TABACO (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

48.00 % a

30.50 %

ITEM NO 3-ALTO SHAM (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES.

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

32.00 % a

15.50%

ITEM No. 4 - ALVEY (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

5.00%'

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM No. s - APW WYOTT (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

Note: " indicates a pending award. 3



VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

44.00 % "

36.50 o/o ?

ITEM NO 6 - BAXTER (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
installi

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

15.00% "

ITEM NO 7 - BEVERAGE AIR (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

51.00% '

VENDOR NAME

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM No. 8 - BSI (BDESIGNS) (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this categ??

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
installi

50.00 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID - NO LIST PRICE AVAILABLE

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

.00 %

ITEM NO 9 - BSI CROWD CONTROL (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Note: ' indicates a pending award. 4

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

18.00% "



Quality Kitchen Service

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO 10 - CARTER HOFFMAN (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

38.00 % "

37.00 %

.00 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO 11 - CHAMPION (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

27.00 % "

18.50%

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES?

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO 12 - CLEVELAND (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

50.00 % "

46.00 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM No. 13 - CRES CORE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 43.00 % "

Note: " indicates a pending award. s



CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO 14 - EAGLE GROUP (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

45.00 % '

30.00 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM No. 15 - DUKE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 48.00% "

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO 16 - HATCO (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

38.00% "

31.00%

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO 17 - HOBART (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

25.00% '

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO 18-IGLOO PRODUCTS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

Note: " indicates a pending award. 6



AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this category.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID - NO LIST PRICE AVAILABLE

ITEM NO 19 - INS?NGER (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

17.00% '

13.50%

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 20 - JOHN BOOS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
installi

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 42.00 % "

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company 21.00oA

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO 21 - LAKESIDE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 47.00 % "

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company 33.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO. 22 - LOW TEMP INDUSTRIES (NO SUBSTITUTE)

Note: " indicates a pending award. 7



CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 45.00% "

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company 32.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO 23 - MANITOWOC (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: Tie bid broken by awarding to the local vendor, Dine Company.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 47.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES?

Dine Company 47.00 % "

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install

ITEM NO 24 - MASTERBUILT (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and rear:Jy for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

60.00 % "

40.00 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM NO 25-METTLER TOLEDO (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There were no bids received for this category.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES? NO BID - NO LIST PRICE AVAILABLE

ITEM NO. 26 - METRO (NO SUBSTITUTE)

Note: " indicates a pending award. 8



CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES.

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

40.00 % "

30.00 %

ITEM NO. 27 - MOD U SERVE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There vvere no bids received for this category.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID - NO LIST PRICE AVAILABLE

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

.00%

l

ITEM NO. 28 - MULTITERIA (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

25.00 % "

ITEM NO. 29 - NEW AGE INDUSTRIAL (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

33.00 % "

ITEM NO 30 - PANASONIC (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Note: " indicates a pending award. 9

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

54.00 % "



Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM No. 31 - PREMIER FOOD SHIELDS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES? There were no bids received for this category.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID - NO LIST PRICE AVAILABLE

50.00 %

ITEM NO 32 - RATIONAL (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

36.00 % "

32.50 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
rear:ly for others to install.

ITEM NO 33 - ROBOT COUPE (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

16.00% "

15.00%

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

ITEM No. 34 - ROCK TENN (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect.freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 3.00% "

CATEGORY NOTES.

Note: " indicates a pending award. 10



ITEM No. 35 - SOUTHBEND (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and rear:ly for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES?

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES? Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

52.00 % "

40.50 %

ITEM No. 36 - SPG USA (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There vvere no bids received for this category.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID - NO LIST PRICE AVAILABLE

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

.00 %

ITEM No. 37 - STEELKOR (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

29.00% "

ITEM NO 38-STORTECH (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

25.00% "

ITEM NO. 39 - STRUCTURAL CONCEPTS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

VENDOR NAME

Note: " indicates a pending award. 11
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C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

49.00 % '

? 39.00 %

ITEM No. 40 - T & S BRASS (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

40.00 % "

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM No. 41 - TRAULSEN (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

60.00 % '

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO 42-VERSA GUARD (NO SUBSTITUTE)

AWARD NOTES: There vvere no bids received for this category.

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
installi

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

.00 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID - NO LIST PRICE AVAILABLE

ITEM NO 43-VULCAN HART (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

52.00 % "

49.50 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

Note: " indicates a pending award. 12



ITEM NO 44 - WIN-HOLT (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc. 35.00 % '

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM No. 45 - WARING (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

40.00 % '

VENDOR NAME

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

39.00 %

ITEM No. 46 - WINSTON (NO SUBSTITUTE)

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount should reflect freight, delivery, uncrate and set in place, training, and ready for others to
install.

PERCENTAGE

OF DISCOUNT

48.00 % '

46.00 %

VENDOR NAME

C&T Design and Equipment Co. Inc.

CATEGORY NOTES:

Dine Company

CATEGORY NOTES: Discount reflects freight, delivery, uncrate, set in place, training and
ready for others to install.

Note: " indicates a pending award. 13


