
HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

1805 Second Street

Henderson, KY  42420

TABULATION OF BIDS FOR STUDENT ACCIDENT INSURANCE

Bid # 8-17-5-5

Company

Morgan, Trevathan & Gunn, Inc.    

Bollinger Insurance                                       

Plan #2

Morgan, Trevathan & Gunn, Inc.    

Bollinger Insurance                                       

Plan #3

Morgan, Trevathan & Gunn, Inc.      

Bollinger Insurance                                     

Plan #4 Nelson Insurance Agency, Inc.

Roberts Insurance & 

Investments         

Nationwide Life 

Insurance Company

Roberts Insurance & 

Investments              

Nationwide Life Insurance 

Company     Plan #3

Roberts Insurance & 

Investments              

Nationwide Life Insurance 

Company     Plan #4

Roberts Insurance & 

Investments                      

Berkley Accident & Health   

Plan #3

Roberts Insurance & 

Investments                       

Berkley Accident & Health              

Plan #4 Scholastic Insurors, Inc. 

Option A

Student and Athletic Accident Insurance

Paid by District No Bid No Bid $24,805.30 $22,313.30 $26,969.30 $24,515.30 $58,380.00

Option B Voluntary Student Plan

Grade P-5 School Time $17.00 $29.00 to $37.00 $8.00

Grades P-5 24-Hour $80.00 $105.00 to $154.00 $44.00

Grades 6-12 School Time $17.00 $29.00 to $37.00 $8.00

Grades 6-12 24-Hour $80.00 $105.00 to $154.00 $44.00

Grade P-12 24 Hour Summer Only $36.00 to $48.00

Football $171.00 to $284.00

Spring Football $74.00 to $120.00

High School Group Athletic Plan $16,798.00 $15,521.00 $14,060.00 No Bid $21,482.30 $19,489.30 $24,141.30 $22,056.30 $8,216.00

No Bid 
No Catastrophic       

$13,291.00

No Catastrophic       

$11,298.00

No Catastrophic       

$15,950.00

No Catastrophic       

$13,865.00

Middle School Athletic Plan Included in above dollar amount Included in above dollar amount Included in above dollar amount No Bid $3,196.00

Career/Technical Students Included in above dollar amount Included in above dollar amount Included in above dollar amount No Bid $1,920.00

Total Athletic Premium $16,798.00 $15,521.00 $14,060.00
No Bid 

$13,332.00

Optional Extended Dental No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,100.00

Contact Michael Martin Michael Martin Michael Martin Lisa Bentley Joe Roberts Joe Roberts Joe Roberts Joe Roberts Joe Roberts John Jay

Address 106 East 12th Street 106 East 12th Street 106 East 12th Street 2000 Envoy Circle 527 West Main Street 527 West Main Street 527 West Main Street 527 West Main Street 527 West Main Street PO Box 3194

Benton, KY Benton, KY Benton, KY Louisville, KY Louisville, KY Louisville, KY Louisville, KY Louisville, KY Louisville, KY Johnson City, TN

42025 42025 42025 40299 40476-1177 40476-1177 40476-1177 40476-1177 40476-1177 37602

Phone 800-489-4684 800-489-4684 800-489-4684 502-736-7000 877-757-2581 877-757-2581 877-757-2581 877-757-2581 877-757-2581 800-872-1953

Fax 270-252-3521 270-252-3521 270-252-3521 502-736-7001 859-623-0242 859-623-0242 859-623-0242 859-623-0242 859-623-0242 423-928-2761

E-Mail michaelm@mtginsurance.com michaelm@mtginsurance.com michaelm@mtginsurance.com lisa@nelsoninsurancegroup.com joe@bobrobertsins.com joe@bobrobertsins.com joe@bobrobertsins.com joe@bobrobertsins.com joe@bobrobertsins.com johnj@scholasticinsurors.com

Raleigh, NC

$27,609.00

888-574-6288

919-846-1146

doug@younggroup.biz

N
o
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HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

1805 Second Street

Henderson, KY  42420

TABULATION OF BIDS FOR STUDENT ACCIDENT INSURANCE

Bid # 8-17-5-5

Company

Option A

Student and Athletic Accident Insurance

Paid by District

Option B Voluntary Student Plan

Grade P-5 School Time

Grades P-5 24-Hour

Grades 6-12 School Time

Grades 6-12 24-Hour

Grade P-12 24 Hour Summer Only

Football

Spring Football

High School Group Athletic Plan

Middle School Athletic Plan

Career/Technical Students

Total Athletic Premium

Optional Extended Dental

Contact

Address

Phone

Fax

E-Mail

Raleigh, NC

$27,609.00

888-574-6288

919-846-1146

doug@younggroup.biz

Team Assure    

Axis/Mutual of Omaha

The Young Group, Inc.    

QBE Insurance Company   

Plan #1.

The Young Group, Inc.    

QBE Insurance Company   

Plan #2 Parent Paid Primary Coverage

The Young Group, Inc.    

QBE Insurance Company    

Plan #1

The Young Group, Inc.    

QBE Insurance Company     

Plan #2

The Young Group, Inc.    

QBE Insurance Company     

Plan #3

The Young Group, Inc.    

QBE Insurance Company     

Plan #4

School Time - No Sports $35.00 $18.00 $11.00 $10.00

24 - Hour - No Sports $160.00 $88.00 $55.00 $50.00

$76,797.00 $15,225.00 $12,180.00 24 - Hour Extention - No Sports $127.00 $72.00 $44.00 $40.00

School Time - All sports, except 

Sr High Int. Football $44.00 $22.00 $12.00 $11.00

No Bid

24 - Hour - All sports, except Sr 

High Int. Football $238.00 $99.00 $57.00 $52.00

No Bid

Sr High Interscholastic Football 

only $290.00 $143.00 $87.00 $79.00

No Bid

Spring/Summer Weight & 

Conditioning - Training only $99.00 $64.00 $42.00 $38.00

No Bid Extended Dental $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00

$23,468.00 School Time - No Sports $29.00 $15.00 $9.00 $8.00

24 - Hour - No Sports $132.00 $85.00 $43.00 $39.00

$16,977.00 24 - Hour - Extention - No Sports $103.00 $59.00 $33.00 $30.00

$14,487.00

School Time - All Sports, Except 

Sr High Int. Football $41.00 $20.00 $10.00 $9.00

$54,933.00

24 - Hour - All sports, except Sr 

High Int. Football $154.00 $93.00 $53.00 $48.00

$1,684.00

Sr High Interscholastic Football 

only $245.00 $137.00 $82.00 $75.00

Justin Dax Anderson Monica Bennett Monica Bennett

Spring/Summer Weight & 

Conditionins Training only $82.00 $60.00 $38.00 $35.00

556 Clay Street 256 West Millbrook Road 256 West Millbrook Road Extended Dental $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00

Montgomery, AL Raleigh, NC Raleigh, NC

$36,104.00 27609 27609

888-636-7272 888-574-6288 888-574-6288

334-395-8011 919-846-1146 919-846-1146 Monica Bennett Monica Bennett Monica Bennett Monica Bennett

info@teamassure.net doug@younggroup.biz doug@younggroup.biz 256 West Millbrook Road 256 West Millbrook Road 256 West Millbrook Road 256 West Millbrook Road

Raleigh, NC Raleigh, NC Raleigh, NC Raleigh, NC

$27,609.00 $27,609.00 $27,609.00 $27,609.00

888-574-6288 888-574-6288 888-574-6288 888-574-6288

919-846-1146 919-846-1146 919-846-1146 919-846-1146

doug@younggroup.biz doug@younggroup.biz doug@younggroup.biz doug@younggroup.biz

Parent Paid - Excess Coverage
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