## HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS 1805 SECOND STREET HENDERSON, KY 42420

## Bid Tabulation Sheet Pest Control Services Bid # 9-17-5-5

	Brantley's Pest			Swat Pest	
PART A Initial Treatment	Control	<b>Orkin Pest Control</b>	S & P Services	Management	Terminix
Bend Gate Elementary					\$40.00
Carto Elementary					\$40.00
Central Academy					\$40.00
AB Chandler Elementay					\$40.00
East Heights Elementary	-				\$40.00
Jefferson Elementary	-				\$40.00
Jefferson Mobile Unit (1)	-				\$20.00
Niagara Elementary	-				\$40.00
South Heights Elementary	-				\$40.00
South Heights Mobile Unit (2)	-				\$20.00
Spottsville Elementary	-				\$40.00
Thelma B. Johnson ELC					\$40.00
North Middle	-				\$40.00
North Middle Mobile Unit (1)	_				\$20.00
North Middle Athletic Complex	1				\$20.00
South Middle	-				\$20.00
South Middle Athletic Complex	-				\$20.00
Henderson County High	-				\$40.00
Athletic comples Dressing Rooms	-				\$40.00
Archery Comples	-				\$40.00
Henderson County Technology Center	-				\$40.00
Henderson County Board of Ed	-				\$40.00
Henderson County CSS	-				\$40.00
HCS Migrant/Curriculum Annex	-				\$40.00
Transportation Department	-				\$20.00
Buildings & Grounds	-				\$40.00
COMPLETE TREATMENT THE FIRST					\$40.00
WEEK (1ST) OF AUGUST AND SPRING					
BREAK OF ALL FACILITIES TOTAL					\$920.00
BREAK OF ALL FACILITIES TOTAL	-				\$920.00
PART B Monthly Service Charge	_				
Bend Gate Elementary	-				\$40.00
Carto Elementary	-				\$40.00
Central Academy	z	z	z	z	\$40.00
AB Chandler Elementay	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$40.00
East Heights Elementary	<u>a</u>	đ	ā	đ	\$40.00
Jefferson Elementary	-				\$40.00
Jefferson Mobile Unit (1)	-				\$40.00
Niagara Elementary	-				\$20.00
	-				
South Heights Elementary	-				\$40.00
South Heights Mobile Unit (2)	-				\$20.00
Spottsville Elementary	-				\$40.00
Thelma B. Johnson ELC	4				\$40.00
North Middle	-				\$40.00
North Middle Mobile Unit (1)	_				\$20.00
Northe Middle Athletic Complex	_				\$20.00
South Middle					\$40.00
South Middle Athletic Complex					\$20.00

	-				
Henderson County High					\$40.00
Athletic comples Dressing Rooms					\$40.00
Archery Comples					\$40.00
Henderson County Technology Center					\$40.00
Henderson County Board of Ed					\$40.00
Henderson County CSS					\$40.00
HCS Migrant/Curriculum Annex					\$20.00
Transportation Department					\$40.00
Buildings & Grounds					\$40.00
MONTHLY TOTAL ALL FACILITIES					\$920.00
II MONTHS FOR ALL 28 LOCATIONS					\$10,120.00
PART C - TERMITE CONTROL					
Henderson County Board of Ed					\$300.00
Bend Gate Elementary					\$296.00
TOTAL TERMITE CONTROL					\$596.00
TOTAL ANNUAL COSTS TO SCHOOL DISTRICT (A + B+ C)					\$11,636.00
Cost for unscheduled special treatment					
per incident (fleas, head lice, ants, etc.)					\$100.00
Contact	David Brantley	Christa Smith	Sean Forbes	Damon Cheatham	George Sanders
Address	PO Box 922	1320 N. Royal Ave	203 Hancock St	2501 N Cullen Ave	2628 N Cullen Avenue
	Henderson, KY	Evansville, IN	Henderson, KY	Evansville, IN	Evansville, IN
	42419	47715	42420	47715	47715
Phone	270-533-6224		270-748-1250		812-479-0244
Fax					812-479-3122
E-mail					