Todd County Board of Education Custodial Dry Mop May 2017

		Recommendation to reject both bids
\$1.200	\$0.45	1 Replace Towels
\$0.100	\$0.08	1 Towels-Soda W/Red BO
\$0.000	\$0.00	1 Handle/Frame 60"
\$1.430	\$0.00	1 Collapsible Mop
\$0.000	\$0.00	1 Mop Handle
\$1.348	\$0.45	1 Replace Wipers
\$0.140	\$0.05	1 18 x 18 Wipers
n/a	\$0.85	1 60" Dry Mop
\$0.984	\$0.56	1 36" Dry Mop
\$0.829	\$0.38	1 24" Dry Mop
n/a	\$0.29	1 18" Dry Mop
Cintas	Unifirst	Quantity Product and Discription

Todd County Board of Education Food Service A la Carte Drinks May 2017

		Clark Beverage Group	Clark Beverage Group
ase Size	Case Size Product Discription	1 YR BID	3 YR BÎD*
	20 oz bottles waters flavored-strawberry,	\$ 9.00 /cs_plain Dasani	
24	grape, \$11.00 lemon, plain bottled water Dasani	\$11.00/cs flavored Dasani	\$ 9.00 /cs plain Dasani \$11.00/cs flavored Dasani
	Power option drinks-any)))
24	less than 10 grams sugar Powerade	Powerade	Powerade
	Lemonades	\$7.50/cs	\$7.50/cs
24	less than 10 grams sugar	12 oz can Minute Maid	12 oz can Minute Maid
ת	10 07 50#104 30*0*	\$5.00/cs	\$5.00/cs
	100% fruit juices- any	\$16.50 10 oz bottles	\$16.50 10 oz bottles
24	flavor	Minute Maid	Minute Maid
	20 oz. regular carbinated beverages		
	(to be used for special	\$14.00 /cs	\$14.00 /cs
24	events and consessions)	Coco-cola Products	Coco-cola Products
	beverages		
	(to be used for special	\$7.50 /cs	\$7.50 /cs
24	events and consessions)	Coco-cola Products	Coco-cola Products
			THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPERTY O

Todd County Board of Education Food Service Equipment Repair May 2017

Flate Rate Travel Charge \$65.00 Recommendation to accept 1 YEAR BID from Kitchen Care for the 2017-2018	Hourly Rate	Kitchen Care John Hicox \$69.00
Recommendation to accept 1 YEAR BID from Kitchen Care for the 2017-2018	Flate Rate Travel Charge	\$65.00
	Recommendation to accept 1 YEAR BID from Kitchen Care for the 2017-2018	

	Key Oil Co	Max Arnold & Son's LLC	Valor Oil Company
Gasoline unleaded 87 min octane	\$1.797 ± 0599 mark up/down	Rack Price +.075 mark up/down	Rack Price +.085 mark up/down
Diesel Fuel ASTM-D975 Grade Z-D			
Low sulfur Premium diesel #2	\$1.70 + 0599 markup/down	Rack Price + .075 markup/down	Rack Price + .085 markup/down
Motor Oil High Grade C <i>Jl4</i> per gallon	\$5.0	\$8.43 one yr only	\$6.23
Antifreeze 55 gal drum			
Orange	\$436.76 Concentrate	No bid	\$310.38 Premix
Green	\$397.94 Concentrate	No bid	\$335.59 Premix (Purple)
Grease			
Bid per 120 lb Keg	\$282.00	\$384.57 one yr only	\$360.02
Bid per 400 lb Drum	\$855.53	\$1264.49 one yr only	\$1,259.15
Transmission Fluid 55 Gallon Drum			
Dextron III or equivalent	\$386.29	No bid	\$6.64 Gallon
Transmission Fluid			
Synthetic	\$1,076,74	No bid	\$1,597.95
	All bids the same for 1 yr and 3 yr		Pricing quoted will be
			subject to change
			depending on market
			All bids the same for 1 yr & 3 yr
的复数 经通信股票 网络多数医动物 医多位动物 医神经神经 医克里克氏试验检尿病 医神经神经病 医水杨醇 医克勒氏试验检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检检			

Todd County Board of Education
Office Supply Bid
May 2017

Office Supplies 60% off Current List	Kerr Office Group Cornettes 75% off List Price Catalog
Not to fall below 12% margin	EXCLUDES
	Ink, Toner,
	Printers, Ribbons,
	Janitorial, Electronics
	Spec Order Furninture
	All sale items
Recommendation to accept 3 YEAR BID from MyOfficeProducts and Cornettes	
2017-2018, 2018-2019, 2019-2020	