JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7428
APPROVAL DATE: June 13, 2017
ITEM(S) QUOTED: CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT .
- DATE BIDS RECEIVED: May 22, 2017
CONTRACT PERIOD: From July 25, 2017 through July 24, 2018
RENEWAL(S): A one-year renewal at the option of both parties.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

| Response Payment Terms

Dixie Vac Service Inc.

1 to 5 year warranty Repair service: Dixie Vac
Service Inc. 8214 Dixie Highway Louisville, KY.
40258 502-935-1903

1%-20 net-30 days

Hillyard - KY

See attached Required Vendor info, Vendor
References, Vendor Representative Form,
completed W-9 and Required Affidavit.

Net 30 days.

HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise

Please review attached exceptions to payment
terms, product evaluation, indemnification,
and warranty.

Payment terms are Net 30 days. No early
payment or cash discounts.

Kenway Distributors, Inc.

Net 30

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co.

1.a. Yes; 1.b. No; 2. Leonard Brush &
Chemical 1450 Mellwood Ave., Louisville, KY
40206, 585-2381; 3. Leonard Brush &
Chemical 1450 Mellwood Ave., Louisville, KY
40206, 585-2381; 6. 14 days; 8. 10%

Net 30 days

Pyramid School Products Inc.

**OUR BID REFERENCE NUMBER IS
#7428JEFF. THIS NUMBER MUST BE LISTED
ON ALL ORDERS PLACED AGAINST THIS
BID.**
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ITEMNO. 1 - LOT CODE: - 1-6 - Floor machine, 20", electric. Viper TP2015HD or eaqual. Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State Warranty. Vendor shall have repair facilities with adeguate spare parts to provide
rapid maintenance support and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name. address and phone number. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 5 (2000445-1661406)

LOT AWARD NOTES:  Reject Pyramid School Products Inc. — incomplete coverage. Awarded to HP Products, a Ferguson
Enterprise as low total bidder for ltem Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Pyramid School Products Inc. NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
RESPONSE ITEMNOTES: ~ *THIS ITEM IS A "NO BID"™*

HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise Viper #TP2015HD 421.4700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 142034

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached warranty and specification sheets. Services can be provided at school's
location or at our facility, 4220 Saguaro Trail, indpls, IN - 800-457-0916.

Hillyard - KY Viper 432.6200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: VIPVN2015
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Sheet and Viper Warranty Info Sheet.

Kenway Distributors, Inc. SSS / Viper #386011 4441400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 199505

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Terms

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty (see attachment): 5 years - Metal Castings, Injected Molded Parts, Metal and
Gear Boxes, Labor 1 year - Wear ltems Repair Shop: Kenway Distributors 6320
Strawberry Ln. Louisville, KY 40214 (502) 367-2201

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. Viper (LBC Task Pro) #TP2015HD 470.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LBC-TP2015HD
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: For Literature and other attachments see front page of bid.

Dixie Vac Service Inc. Powr-Flite #C201HD 549.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: C201HD

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%-20 net-30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 5,3 & 1 year warranty Repair service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie Highway
Louisville, KY. 40258 502-935-1903

ITEMNO.2 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Floor machine, 20", electric. high speed. buffer/burnisher. Vioer TP1500 20 or equal, Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State Warrantv. Vendor shall have repair facilities with
adequate spare parts to provide rapid maintenance support and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name. address and phone
number. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 10 (2000445-1661879)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Pyramid School Products Inc. — incomplete coverage. Awarded to HP Products, a Ferguson
Enterprise as low total bidder for item Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Pyramid School Products Inc. NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: *THIS ITEM IS A "NO BID"**

HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise vIPER #TP1500 606.4800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 142029

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached warranty and specification sheets. Services can be provided at school's
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location or at our facility, 4220 Saguaro Trail, Indpls, IN - 800-457-0916.

Hillyard - KY Viper . 619.8900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: VIPVN1500
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Sheet and Viper Warranty Info Sheet.

Kenway Distributors, Inc. . SSS/ Viper #86012 : 639.0600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 199510
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty (see attachment): 5 years - Metal Castings, Injected Molded Parts, Metal and
Gear Boxes, Labor 1 year - Wear ltems Repair Shop: Kenway Distributors 6320
Strawberry Ln. Louisville, KY 40214 (502) 367-2201

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. Viper (LBC Task Pro) #TP1500 640.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LBC-TP1500
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: For Literature and other attachments see front page of bid.

Dixie Vac Service Inc. Powr-Flite #C1600 730.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: C1600

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%-20 net-30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 10,2 & 1 year warranty Repair service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie Highway
Louisville, KY. 40258 502-935-1903

ITEMNO. 3 - LOT CODE: - 1-6 - Vacuum. wet/drv pick-up. with front mount squeeaae and tool kit. Viper Shovelnose SN18WD or
equal. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State Warrantv. Vendor shall have repair
facilities with adequate spare parts to provide rapid maintenance support and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name. address
and phone number. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 15 (2000950-1021254)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Pyramid School Products Inc. — incomplete coverage. Awarded to HP Products, a Ferguson
Enterprise as low total bidder for ltem Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Pyramid School Products Inc. NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: **THIS ITEM IS A "NO BID"™*

Kenway Distributors, Inc. SSS/ Viper #86040 420.8600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 199540
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty (See Attachment) - Metal Castings: 3 Years, Injection Molded Parts: 8 years,
Polyethylene Housing: 8 years, Vacuum Motor: 1 year, Parts: 1 year, Labor: 1 year
Repair Shop: Kenway Distributors 6320 Strawberry Ln. Louisville, KY 40214 (502)
367-2201

HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise Viper #TP18WD 422.5300*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 181505
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached warranty and specification sheets. Services can be provided at school's
location or at our facility, 4220 Saguaro Trail, Indpls, IN - 800-457-0916.

Dixie Vac Service Inc. Perfect #BF591 425.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NW BF591
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%-20 net-30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 year warranty Repair service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie Highway Louisville,
KY. 40258 502-935-1903

Note: * indicates a pending award, PAGE 4



Hillyard - KY Viper 432.5800

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: VIPSN18WD
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Sheet and Warranty Info Sheet.

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. Viper #SN18WD 440.0000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LBC-TP18WD
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: For Literature and other attachments see front page of bid.

ITEMNO.4 - LOT CODE: -1-6 - Vacuum. carpet. upright. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: State Warranty. Vendor shall have repair facilities with adeauate spare parts to provide ranid maintenance support
and minimum downtime. Indicate facilitv name, address and phone number. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 60
(2000950-1098931)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Pyramid School Products Inc. — incomplete coverage. Awarded to HP Products, a Ferguson
Enterprise as low total bidder for Item Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Pyramid School Products Inc. NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: **THIS ITEM IS A "NO BID"™*

Hillyard - KY Nilfisk Advance 182.9700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ADVO0O3005A
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Sheet and Warranty Info Sheet.

HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise Sanitaire/Electrolux #899F 210.5800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 107826

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached warranty and specification sheets. Services can be provided at school's
location or at our facility, 4220 Saguaro Trail, Indpls, IN - 800-457-0916.

Leonard Brush & Chemiical Co. Perfect Vac #P102 225.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: PERP102
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty One year parts and labor For Literature and other attachments see front page
of bid.
Dixie Vac Service Inc. : Perfect #P102 236.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: P102

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%-20 net-30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 year warranty Repair service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie Highway Louisville,
KY. 40258 502-935-1903

Kenway Distributors, Inc. Sanitaire #5C899 248.9300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SC899
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 year manufacturer's warranty (see owners manual for details) - does not cover wear
items: bumpers, filters, bristle strips, belts, light bulbs, and hoses. Repair Shop:
Kenway Distributors 6320 Strawberry Ln. Louisville, KY 40214 (502) 367-2201

ITEMNO.5 -LOT CODE: - 1-6 - Vacuum. 15", upright HEPA. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: State Warranty. Vendor shall have repair facilities with adeauate spare parts to provide rapid maintenance support
and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name. address and phone number. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 15
(2000950-1733452)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Pyramid School Products Inc. — incomplete coverage. Awarded to HP Products, a Ferguson
Enterprise as low total bidder for ltem Nos. 1 thru 6.

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 5



VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Pyramid School Products inc. NO BID #NO BID 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: **THIS ITEM IS A "NO BID"**

HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise Sanitaire/Electrolux #SC5815B 176.7600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TBD

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached warranty and specification sheets. Services can be provided at school's

location or at our facility, 4220 Saguaro Trail, Indpls, IN - 800-457-0916.

Dixie Vac Service Inc. Sanitaire #SC5815

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SC5815
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%-20 Net-30 days

215.0000

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2 year warranty Repair service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie Highway Louisville,

KY. 40258 502-935-1903

Hillyard - KY Electrolux Sanitaire
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: EURSC5815D
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs and Warranty Info Sheet.

232.0400

Kenway Distributors, Inc. Sanitaire #SC5815

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SC5815
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

235.9000

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2 year manufacturer's warranty (see owners manual for details) - does not cover wear

items: bumpers, filters, bristle strips, belts, light bulbs, and hoses. Repair Shop:

Kenway Distributors 6320 Strawberry Ln. Louisville, KY 40214 (502) 367-2201

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. Sanitaire #SC5815
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: EURSC5815

238.0000

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty One year parts and labor For Literature and other attachments see front page

of bid.

ITEMNO. 6 - LOT CODE; - 1-6 - Cart, ianitor service. Continental #184BL or eaual. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantity - 20 (2000080-1714515)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Pyramid School Products Inc. — incomplete coverage. Awarded to HP Products, a Ferguson

Enterprise as low total bidder for Item Nos. 1 thru 6.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise Rubbermaid #6173-88 82.9600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 172112
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days.
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty based on Rubbermaid.
Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. Impact Products #6850 95.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: IMPG850
Kenway Distributors, Inc. Impact #6850 100.7700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SP*007495
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty: 1 year manufacturer's defect coverage.
Pyramid School Products Inc. RUBBERMAID #FG617388BLA 101.9800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FG617388BLA

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 6



Dixie Vac Service Inc. . Nationwide #6850 109.9900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NW 6850
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%-20 net-30 days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 year warranty Repair service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie Highway Louisville,
KY. 40258 502-935-1903

" Hillyard - KY Continental 120.6200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CON184BL

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 7



TOTAL BIDS - 1-6

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise 31,455.50 31,455.50
Pyrémid School Products Inc. 2,040.65
Hillyard - KY 31,721.90
Leonard Brush & Chemical Co, 34,320.00
Kenway Distributors, Inc. 35,413.90
Dixie Vac Service Inc. 36,034.80
$31,455.50

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Dixie Vac Service Inc. 36,034.80
Hifiyard - KY 31,721.90
HP Products, a Ferguson Enterprise 31,455.50 31,455.50
Kenway Distributors, Inc. 35,413.90
Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. 34,320.00
Pyramid School Products Inc. 2,040.65
31,455.50

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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