
HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS

1805 SECOND STREET

HENDERSON, KY  42420

RFP Tabulation Sheet

Drug ScreeningMedical Services RFP

RFP # 4-17-3-4

Company

Concorde, Inc LabCorp OTS Compliance Methodist Hospital Phamatech Inc.

Tri State Community Clinics, 

LLC

5 panel urine dip screen for Students: Tests for 

cocaine, amphetamines, PCP, THC, and opiates.
Test $30.00

Lab MRO 

FEE $25.00 $58.00

Lab Based 

$45.00

Rapid With 

Confirmation 

$45.00

Chain of 

Custody 

$50.00

Collection Only 

$25.00 $15.00 each GC/MS Confirm   $30.00 No Bid $30.00 No Bid

8 panel urine dip screen for Students: Tests for 

cocaine, amphetamnes, PCP, THC, barbiturates, 

methamphetamines, benzodiazepines, and opiates. Test $30.00

Lab MRO 

FEE $25.00 $58.00

Lab Based 

$45.00 No Bid

Chain of 

Custody 

$50.00

Collection Only 

$25.00

Sub 12 Panel for 8 panel 

at $20.00 GC/MS Confirm   $30.00 No Bid $31.00 No Bid

12 panel urine dip screen for Students: Tests for 

cocaine, amphetamines, methamphetamines, THC, 

opiates, OxyContin, propoxyphene, PCP, barbiturates, 

benzodiazepines, methadone, and MDMA (ecstasy). Test $30.00

Lab MRO 

FEE $25.00 $60.00

Lab Based 

$47.50

Rapid With 

Confirmation 

$48.50

Chain of 

Custody 

$50.00

Collection Only 

$25.00 $20.00 each GC/MS Confirm   $30.00 No Bid $33.00 No Bid

6 panel mouth swab screen for Students: Tests for 

cocaine, amphetamines, methamphetamines, THC, 

opiates, and benzodiazepines. Test $35.00

Lab MRO 

Fee $25.00 $55.00

Lab Based 

$63.00 No Bid

Chain of 

Custody 

$50.00 $20.00 each GC/MS Confirm   $30.00 No Bid $33.00 No Bid

K2 urine dip screen for Students: will test for the 

use of synthetic cannabinoids.
Lab Only 

$90.00 No Bid

Lab Based 

$22.50 No Bid

Chain of 

Custody 

$50.00

Collection Only 

$25.00 $10.00 each GC/MS Confirm   $30.00 No Bid

$39.00 (if added to above 

panels $15.00) No Bid

K2 Urine Dip Test: Synthetic Cannabinoids $10.00 GC/MS Confirm   $30.00

Alcohol Uring Dip Test: Detects alcohol up to 80 

hours after consuming alcohol. $15.00 GC/MS Confirm   $30.00

Nicotine Urine Dip Test: Nicotine $10.00 GC/MS Confirm   $30.00

5 panel urine dip screen for Staff: Tests for cocaine, 

amphetamines, methamphetamines, THC, and 

opiates. Test $30.00

Lab MRO 

FEE $25.00 $55.00

Lab Based 

$45.00

Rapid With 

confirmation 

$45.00

Chain of 

Custody 

$50.00

Collection Only 

$25.00 $15.00 each GC/MS Confirm   $30.00 No Bid $30.00 No Bid
6 panel urine dip screen for Staff:  Tests for 

cocaine, amphetamines, methamphetamine, 

marijuana (THC), opiates, and PCP $20.00 (Sub 12 Panel) GC/MS Confirm   $30.00 $20.00

5 panel urine screen for Staff: Tests for cocaine, 

amphetamines, marijuana (THC), opiates, and PCP. $20.00 (Sub 12 Panel) GC/MS Confirm   $30.00 $30.00

DOT Physical
No Bid $93.00 No Bid $63.85 $65.00 $80.00

Pre-Employment Physical

No Bid $95.00 No Bid $49.50 $65.00 $45.00

TB Skin Test No Bid $25.00 No Bid $12.60 $25.00 $20.00

Essentials Function Test

No Bid $88.00 No Bid $75.00 $65.00 $100.00*

Post Offer Basic Test No Bid $135.00 No Bid $110.00 $65.00 $135.00*

Post Offer Test With Medical History Review No Bid Varies by Scope No Bid $145.00 $65.00 $165.00*

Post Offer Comprehensive Test No Bid $195.00 No Bid $170.00 $65.00-$110.00 $165.00*

Cost of screen is $5.00 each 

with any additional test

Cost of second lab 

confirmatory screen is 

included in price.  Positive 

samples will be maintained 

at Redwood Toxicology for a 

minimum of 6 months (RFP 

Request)

Contact Sean Collins Preston Herndon Susan Blanford Dana Conde Lisa Gish

Address 1835 Market Street Suite 1200 108 N. Elm St 110 Second Street 15175 Innovation Drive 8401 N Kentucky Avenue, Suite A

Philadelphia, PA Henderson, KY Henderson, KY San Diego, California Evansville, IN  

19105 42420 42420 92128 47725

Phone 215-563-5555 270-831-2949

270-826-4646 or                            

270-724-2115 888-635-5840 x 276 812-205-8355

Fax 215-525-5341 270-831-2609 270-827-7476 858-635-5843 812-491-0033

E-mail sean.collins@concorde2000.com involvementinc@gmail.com sblanford@methosidthospital.net dconde@phamatech.com lgish@tscommunityclinics.com

Bid not signed

Involvement, Inc.
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Assurance Consulting  (ACTS)

Minimum Trip Fee $60.00 on 

Emergency Testing

Alere Lab and National Drug 

Screening MRO

John Siewert

Deaconness Comp Center

$75.00

$49.00

$19.50

223 1st Street

Henderson, KY

42420

270-826-2308

270-826-7516

jsiewert@actstesting.net

812-450-7462

812-450-2960

$52.54

$78.81

$97.50

$97.50

Add $22.50 to any lab based 

drug panel to include K-2.

$125.00 

Karen TokarzTerry Swartz

329 W. Columbia St

Evansville, IN

47710

615-510-3457

karen.tokarz@fastpacemedical.comterry.swarta@deaconess.com

Fast Pace Urgent Care

$85.00  includes Urinalysis

$45.00 for basic exam; $85.00 for 

extended

$20.00 

$85.00  Fee can vary depending 

uppm services requested.  This is 

provided as a general guide.  Fee 

will never be more than the 

$85.00, but could be lower 

depending upon services 

requested.

$85.00 

$100.00 

2634 N Central Ave

Henderson, KY

42420

615-491-1832
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