JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: ' 7384

APPROVAL DATE: April 25, 2017

ITEM(S) QUOTED: ATHLETIC SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT (Percentage)
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: March 06, 2017

CONTRACT PERIOD: From June 01, 2017 through May 30, 2018
RENEWAL(S): A one-year renewal at the option of both parties.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.



Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

| Response Payment Terms

BSN Spor‘(s

F.O.B. DESTINATION 3- 30 DAYS ARO
CONTACT JEFFERY BRICKLER REGIONAL
SALES MANAGER 859 303 4390 CELL 513
266 3189 FAX 513 679 4070
jbrickler@bsnsports.com

www.bsnsports.com

NET 30 DAY

Bumblebee Team Sports

Within 24 hours

Net 30. Discounts based off retail
manufacturer catalog price.

Bush Keller

1-7 days

net 30 days

M-F Athletic Company

10% - *Excludes: Sales, Pits, Hurdles, Pole
Vault Poles, Crossbars, Timing Systems,
Software, Cardio Equipment, Weight
Equipment, In-Ground Equipment, ltems
requiring special shipping or truck shipment
by common carrier. Other exclusions may
apply.

Net 30 Days

Riddell / All American

1% 10, N30

30 ARO

School Specialty Inc.

FOB Destination Prices Firm 6/1/17 to 5/30/18

NET 30 DAYS

Shively Sporting Goods

After receipt of PO# from JCPS Stock items
can be delivered in 3-5 days for the most part.
Some manufacturers stock items can be 1-3
days and some 6-10 days for stock items. All
is subject to inventory availability at time of
PO# being received.

Net 30 days after receipt of invoice from
Shively Sporting Goods.

Varsity Brands Holding Dba Varsity Spirit
Fashions

Varsity Spirit Fashions is offering 5% off
catalog process and Free Shipping.
EXCLUDES: ALL Packages and Exclusive
Shoes - Excluded items will receive Free
Shipping only.

Net 30



ITEM NO. 1 - ATHLETIC SHOES: ADIDAS (4600015-2008743)

CATEGORY NOTES:

BSN SPORTS /NEW BALANCE TEAM SHOES ONLY NOT RETAIL
SHOES '

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Shively Sporting Goods 43.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bumbiebee Team Sports 31.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
M-F Athletic Company 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 10% - *Excludes: Sales, Pits, Hurdles, Pole Vault Poles, Crossbars,
Timing Systems, Software, Cardio Equipment, Weight Equipment,
In-Ground Equipment, Items requiring special shipping or truck shipment
by common carrier. Other exclusions may apply.
Bush Keller .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 2 - ATHLETIC SHOES: ASICS (4600015-2008745)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
BSN Sports 43.00 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: BSN SPORTS/ ASICS
Shively Sporting Goods 38.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Stock shoes can be received in 2-4 days after receipt of PO# from JCPS
subject to availability of inventory
Bumblebee Team Sports 25.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bush Keller 25.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
M-F Athletic Company 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 10% - *Excludes: Sales, Pits, Hurdles, Pole Vault Poles, Crossbars,
Timing Systems, Software, Cardio Equipment, Weight Equipment,
In-Ground Equipment, Items requiring special shipping or truck shipment
by common carrier. Other exclusions may apply.
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 3 - ATHLETIC SHOES: NEW BALANCE (4600015-2008747)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
BSN Sports 35.00% *

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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Bumblebee Team Sports
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.

.00 %

Bush Keller .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 4 - ATHLETIC SHOES: NIKE (4600015-2008748)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Shively Sporting Goods 43.50 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Stock footwear usually delivers about 2-4 days after receipt of PO# from
JCPS pending inventory availability.

BSN Sports 43.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: BSN SPORTS/ NIKE
M-F Athletic Company 10.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: 10% - *Excludes: Sales, Pits, Hurdles, Pole Vault Poles, Crossbars,
Timing Systems, Software, Cardio Equipment, Weight Equipment,
In-Ground Equipment, Items requiring special shipping or truck shipment
by common carrier. Other exclusions may apply.
Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.
Bush Keller .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
Varsity Brands Holding Dba Varsity Spirit Fashions .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Varsity Spirit Fashions is offering Free Shipping ONLY for these
Exclusive Nike Shoes.
ITEM NO. 5 - ATHLETIC SHOES: PUMA (4600015-2008749)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Bush Keller 25.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.
School Specialty Inc. 00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 6 - ATHLETIC SHOES: RAWLINGS (4600015-2008750)

Note: * indicates a pending award. 4



PERCENTAGE

Note: * indicates a pending award.

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Bush Keller 2500% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.
School Specialty Inc. 00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 7 - ATHLETIC SHOES: REEBOK (4600015-2008751)
AWARD NOTES: Reject Bush Keller - did not bid an additional percentage off list price. There were no other bids
received for this item.
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCQUNT
Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.
Bush Keller .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 8 - ATHLETIC SHOES: RIDDELL (4600015-2008752)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Bush Keller 2500% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.
Riddell / All American .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:  WE DO NOT OFFER SHOES IN OUR CATALOG AS OF NOW.
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 9 - ATHLETIC SHOES: UNDER ARMOUR (4600015-2011838)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Shively Sporting Goods 4050 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: Stock model shoes can be delivered in 2-4 days after receipt of PO#
from JCPS subject to inventory availability. No returns on UA shoes
unless defective.
BSN Sports 40.00 %



CATEGORY NOTES:

BSN SPORTS /UNDER ARMOUR

Bush Keller 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bumbiebee Team Sports 25.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 10 - SHOULDER PADS: ADAMS (4600975-2008793)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Bush Keller 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bumblebee Team Sports 15.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 11 - SHOULDER PADS: BIKE ATHLETIC (4600975-2008795)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Shively Sporting Goods 40.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: stock pads usually arrive in 7-10 days after receipt of PO# from JCPS
subject to inventory availability.
Bush Keller 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Discontinued
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 12 - SHOULDER PADS: DOUGLAS (4600975-2008796)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
BSN Sports 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: BSN SPORTS/ DOUGLAS
Bush Keller 25.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Shively Sporting Goods 25.00 %

Note: * indicates a pending award.



CATEGORY NOTES:

Legacy, SP, or Battlefield series pads usually can be delivered in 6-10
days after receipt of PO# from JCPS. CP series pads are custom and
take about 4 weeks +/- a week depending on time of year. July &
August would be a full 4 + weeks but other months could only take 2-3
weeks to receive after recipe of PO# from JCPS

Note: * indicates a pending award.

Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 13 - SHOULDER PADS: GEAR 2000 (4600975-2008797)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
BSN Sports 4000 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: BSN SPORTS/ GEAR 2000
Shively Sporting Goods - 22.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Bidding Gear Pro-Tec. Normal delivery is 5-7 days after receipt of PO#
from JCPS penf=ding inventory availability of product.
Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.
Bush Keller .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 14 - SHOULDER PADS: POWERS (4600975-2008798)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Bush Keller 2500 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Bumblebee Team Sports .OQ %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 15 - SHOULDER PADS: RAWLINGS (4600975-2008799)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
BSN Sports 4050 % *
CATEGORY NOTES: BSN SPORTS/ RAWLINGS
Bush Keller 30.00 %



CATEGORY NOTES:

Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: - Discontinued
School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID
ITEM NO. 16 - SHOULDER PADS: RIDDELL (4600975-2008800)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Riddell / All American 25.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: 25% CATALOG DISCOUNT OFFERED FROM RIDDELL.

Bumblebee Team Sports .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Not available.

Bush Keller .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

School Specialty Inc. .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: NO BID

ITEM NO. 17 - SHOULDER PADS: SCHUTT ATHLETICS (4600975-2008801)
PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

BSN Sports 42.70 %
CATEGORY NOTES: BSN SPORTS /SCHUTT ATHLETICS

Shively Sporting Goods 42.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Stock model should pads are usually received in 3-7 days after receipt

of JCPS PO# pending inventory availability.

Bush Keller 30.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Bumblebee Team Sports 20.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

School Specialty Inc. .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

NO BID

Note: * indicates a pending award.



