JUNE 19, 2008

THIS IS A DECISION PAPER

TO:

Members of Hardin County Board of Education

FROM:

Nannette Johnston, Superintendent

SUBJECT:
Lubricant & Antifreeze Bids

PROPOSAL:
Approve the lubricant & antifreeze bids as tabulated.

FACT A: 
Four oil companies bid on the annual lubricant & antifreeze contract for Hardin County Schools. They were Apollo Oil, Newcomb Oil, AMS Oil and Hydrotex. Newcomb Oil’s bid is disqualified because it specified that their bid prices were good for three months only.

FACT B:
Apollo Oil and AMS Oil have low bids as tabulated below.

RECOMMENDATION:   Approve the low bids from Apollo Oil and AMS Oil as indicated on chart below.

RECOMMENDED MOTION:   I move that the Hardin County Board of Education approves the low bids from Apollo Oil and AMS Oil as indicated on chart below for the duration of one year beginning July 1, 2008, and ending June 30, 2009.

	ITEM
	APOLLO

OIL
	AMS

OIL
	HYDROTEX
	NEWCOMB OIL

	15W40 Oil, per case of quarts

15W40 Oil, per case of gallons
	25.59

48.00
	51.00

no bid
	99.87

179.07
	no bid

no bid

	15W40 Oil, bulk, per gallon
	8.35
	13.91
	21.13
	6.86

	55-gal drum Dexacool

Red/Orange, per drum
	1092.76
	1054.00
	no bid
	877.25

	55-gal drum antifreeze

Green, per drum
	429.69
	no bid
	no bid
	461.45

	55-gal drum Dextron III

trans fluid, per drum
	377.33
	1156.00
	1087.92
	475.75

	Dextron III trans fluid,

Per case of quarts
	19.93
	74.40
	162.82

bid gallon case
	no bid

	55-gal drum Gear Oil, 80-90, per drum
	369.50
	1089.00
	720.43

16-gallon drum
	no bid

	55-gal drum EP NLGI2 chassis grease, per drum
	874.00
	1213.00
	1896.91
	no bid

	Ext Life 5W40 oil, w/ sample, API CJ-4 specs, per gallon
	16.97
	17.71
	28.72
	no bid

	Ext Life trans fluid, Allison TES-295 specs, 55-gallon drum
	1599.95
	1359.00
	1566.95
	no bid








