
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMAT?VE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S):

7340

December 13, 2016

PAPER (Warehouse Delivery) .

November 15, 2016

From March 01 , 2017 through February 27, 2018

No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An " indicates an award.
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I Vendor Name

Complete Printer Source

School Specialty Inc.

STAPLES INC

Xpedx

l
Vendor Response Terms

Response Terms r Response Paymerit Terms I
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ITEM No. 1 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1?, blue, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103309 or
equal. This note applies to Items 1 throuqh 8: Acid free, 20 lb. basis weiqht, bond smooth surface, superior runnability, 75 GSM,
150 smoothness, 87 opacity, 99.99o/o jam-free, SFI/FSC cerkified, quaranteed to run on small and Iarqe offset presses, diqital
imaqinq equipment, includinq copiers, laser and ink-jet printers and plain paper fax machines. IF BIDDING THE APPROVED
PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED. SAMPLE = I SWATCHBOOK. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3,600
(5760240-1423383)

VENDOR NAME

School Specialty Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

o

UNIT PRICE ($)
0 0001

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

IP #103309

20C)IC)15

Hammermill

617257

Hammermill #103309

HAM103309

3.4400"

3.4700

3.6800

ITEM NO 2 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 1/2? x 1 1?, buff, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103325 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 1,200 (5760240-1661785)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SchoolSpecialtylnc 0

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
o oooi

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

IP #103325

2001016

Hammermill

727099

HAMMERMILL #103325

HAM 103325

3 4400"

3.4700

3.6800

ITEM NO 3 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2? x 1 1?, canary, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103341 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3,200 (5760240-1649967)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

School Specialty Inc. o

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES. NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0001

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

IP #103341

2001018

Hammermill

617262

HAMMERMILL #103341

HAM103341

3.4400"

3 4700

3.6800

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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ITEM NO 4 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1?, qoldenrod, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103168
or equal. 1- 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,400 (5760240-1652261 )

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

School Specialty Inc. o 0 0001

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES. NO BID

Xpedx IP #103168

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001020

STAPLES INC Hammermill

VENDOR REFERENCE NuMBER: 617223

Complete Printer Source HAMMERMILL #103168

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HAM103168

ITEM No. s - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", qreen, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103366 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,800 (5760240-1649965)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

School Specialty Inc. o 0.0001

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Xpedx IP #103366

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001021

STAPLES INC Hammermill

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 841528

Complete Printer Source HAMMERMILL #103366

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HAM103366

ITEM NO 6 - LOT CODE: - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1", lilac, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #102269 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3,200 (5760240-2012454)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

School Specialty Inc. o 0 0001

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Xpedx IP #102269

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001024

STAPLES INC Hammermill

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 841619

Complete Printer Source HAMMERMILL #102269

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: HAM102269

ITEM No. 7 - LOT CODE - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 112? x 1 1?, pink, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103382 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3,200 (5760240-1649966)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE <$)

School Specialty Inc. o 00001

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Note: " indicates a pending award.

3.4400"

3.4700

3 6800

3 4400'

3.4700

3.6800

3.4400"

3.4700

3 6800

o
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES? NO BID

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001027

IP #103382 3 4400"

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 617254

Hammermill 3 4700

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

HAMMERMILL #103382

HAM103382

3.6800

ITEM No. 8 - LOT CODE - 1-8 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2? x 1 1", salmon, ream/500 sheets, Hammermill Fore MP #103119 or
equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,400 (5760240-20al2455)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

School Specialty Inc. o

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0001

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001028

IP #103119 3.4400"

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 617253

Hammermill 3.4700

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

HAMMERMILL #103l19

HAM103119

3 6800

ITEM NO 9 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 l12? x 1 1?, red, ream/500 sheets, Mohawk Britehue #4'71608 or equal. Acid free, 20 lb
basis weiqht, bond smooth surface, GREEN SEAL certified, compatible with all office equipment and printers, laser quaranteed. IF
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED. SAMPLE = 1 SWATCHBOOK. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream,
Estimated Quantity - 1 ,200 (5760240-2C)124561

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Staples Inc - prices not firm for the period of the contract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

School Specialty Inc. o

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0001

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NP45274

Neenah 4 7200

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2329353

Mohawk #471608 s 8300-

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Mohawk #471608

MOW471608

6.3500

ITEM No. 10 - LOT CODE' - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 1/2" x 1 1?, briqht blue, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26781 or equal. This note applies to Items 10 throuqh 17: Acid and liqnin-free, 50 Ib, text, bond smooth surface, 74 G/M2,
elemental chlorine free, consistent color side-to-side, run-to-run, SFI/FSC cerkified, copier, laser, ink-jet and offset quaranteed IF
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED. SAMPLE = I SWATCHBOOK. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream,
Estimated Quantity - 2,800 (5760240-1719700)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Staples Inc - prices not firm for the period of the contract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SchoolSpecialtylnc. 0
UNIT PRICE ($)

0.0001

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

WAUSAU #26781

WAU26781

5322028

NP26781

Neenah #26781

Neenah 4.4400

4 5900"

4 6600

ITEM NO 1 1 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 11 ", briqht qreen, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26791 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,800 (5760240-1719702)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Staples Inc - prices not firm for the period of the contract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

School Specialty Inc. o

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

WAUSAU #26791

WAU26791

2260768

NP26791

Neenah

Neenah #26791 .

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0001

4.4400

4.5900"

4 6600

ITEM No. 12 - LOT CODE - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 1/2? x 1 1?, briqht oranqe, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26721 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3,200 (5760240-1719703)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Staples Inc - prices not firm for the period of the contract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

School Specialty Inc. o

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Neenah #26721 .

WAUSAU #26721

WAU26721

2260732

NP26721

Neenah

UNIT PRICE <$)
0.0001

4 4400

4 5900"

4.6600

ITEM No. 13 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 1/2? x 1 1?, briqht pine, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#268CY or equal. 1- 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 1 ,600 (5760240-1719706)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectStapleslnc-pricesnotfirmfortheperiodofthecontract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SchoolSpecialtylnc. 0

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

UNIT PRICE ($)
ooooi

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Neenah

NP26801

2260769

Neenah #26801 .

WAUSAU #26801

WAU26801

4.4400

4 5900"

4.6600

ITEM No. 14 - LOT CODE - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 l12? x 1 1?, briqht pink, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26741 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,400 (5760240-1719701 )

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectStapleslnc-pricesnotfirmfortheperiodofthecontract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

School Specialty Inc. o

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: o

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

WAUSAU #26741

WAU26741

2260734

NP26741

Neenah

Neenah #26741 .

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0001

4.4400

4 5900"

4.6600

ITEM No. 15 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 8 l12? x 1 1?, briqht purple, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26771 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3,200 (5760240-2012457)

LOT AWARD NOTES: F<e)ect Staples lnc - prices not firm for the period of the contract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SchoolSpecialtylnc. 0

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

WAUSAU #26771

WAU26771

2260767

NP26771

Neenah #26771 .

Neenah

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0001

4.4400

4 5900"

4.6600

ITEM NO 16 - LOT CODE: - 1 0-1 7 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2? x 1 1?, briqht red, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht #26751
or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 2,000 (5760240-1719705)

LOTAWARDNOTES: RejectStapleslnc-pricesnotfirmfortheperiodofthecontract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SchoolSpecialtylnc. 0

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

STAPLES INC

UNIT PRICE ($)
0 0001

4.4400Neenah

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NP26751

Xpedx Neenah #26751 .

. VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2260735

Complete Printer Source WAUSAU #26751

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WAU26751

ITEM NO 17 - LOT CODE: - 10-17 - Paper, multi-purpose, 81/2" x 1 1?, briqht yellow, ream/500 sheets, Neenah Exact Briqht
#26701 or equal. 1 - 500.0000 Each Ream, Estimated Quantity - 3,200 (5760240-1719704)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Reject Staples Inc - prices not firm for the period of the contract.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

SchoolSpecialtyInc. 0

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

STAPLES INC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Xpedx

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Complete Printer Source

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Neenah

NP26701

Neenah #26701 .

2260729

WAUSAU #26701

WAU26701

4 5900'

4 6600

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0001

4 4400

4 5900"

4 6600

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR NAME

Xpedx

School Specialty Inc.

STAPLES INC

Complete Printer Source

TOTAL BIDS - 10-17

TOTAL ($)

97,308.00

2.12

94,128.00

98,792 00

AWARDED TOTAL ($}

97,308.00

$97,308.00

VENDOR NAME

Xpedx

School Specialty Inc.

STAPLES INC

Complete Printer Source

TOTAL BIDS - 1-8

[

75,680.00

2.20

76,340 00

80,960.00

AWARDED TOTAL ($i

75,680.00

$75,680 00

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME

Complete Printer Source

School Specialty Inc.

STAPLES INC

Xpedx

[
187,372 00

4.44

i 76, 132.00

179,984.00

AWARDED TOTAL ($1

179,984.00

179,984 00

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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