JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7295

APPROVAL DATE: August 23, 2016

ITEM(S) QUOTED: SURVEILLANCE SYSTEM ACCESSORIES .
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: July 25, 2016

CON;l'RACT PERIOD: From October 10, 2016 through October 09, 2017
RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Anixter, Inc.

Stock to 5 to 7 day delivery depending on
stock at time of po

net 30 terms

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH
AMERICAN VIDEO

net 30. FREIGHT IS INCLUDED. SHIPPING IS
7-10 DAYS ARO UNLESS BACKORDERED
BY THE MANUFACTURER
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ITEM NO. 1 - Altronix. #Vertiline 166D. Power Supply. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 10000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 10
(1300690-2011357)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. no bid 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V ALTRONIX #VERT166D 292.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: VERT-166D

ITEMNO.2 -LOT CODE: - 2-3 - Genesis #5013, CCTV Cable. 1000". NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1000.0000 Foot Spool. Estimated
Quantity - 10 (1300690-2009501)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. no bid 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V GENESIS #WG50131008 178.0000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WG-5013-1008
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: N30

ITEMNO. 3 - LOT CODE: - 2-3 - Genesis #5355. CCTV Cable. 1000'. NO SUBSTITUTE, 1 - 1000.0000 Foot Spool, Estimated
Quantity - 10 (1300125-2011974)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. no bid 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: No bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No bid

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V GENESIS #WG53551012 407.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WG-5355-1012

ITEMNO. 4 - LOT CODE: - 4-9 - Middle Atlantic #DWR-12-22. Eauipment Cabinet. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 10 (1300690-2012295)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Anixter, Inc. as low total bidder for ltem Nos. 4 thru 9.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. Middle Atlantic #DWR-12-22 380.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 240834

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 terms

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: stock to 5 day delivery

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V MIDDLE ATLANTIC #DWR1222 393.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: DWR1222

ITEM NO.5 -LOT CODE: - 4-9 - Middle Atlantic #DWR-16-22. Eouioment Cabinet. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 -1.0000 Each
Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 10 {1300690-2002348)

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 3



LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Anixter, Inc. as low total bidder for ltem Nos. 4 thru 9.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Anixter, Inc. Middle Atlantic #DWR-16-22 457.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 240833

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 terms
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 5-7 day lead time for delivery

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V MIDDLE ATLANTIC #DWR1622 473.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: DWR1622

ITEMNO.6 -LOT CODE: -4-9 - Middle Atlantic #FC-4-1CA. Fan Controller., NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 10 (1300690-2009500)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Anixter, Inc. as low total bidder for item Nos. 4 thru 9.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. Middle Atlantic #FC-4-1CA 135.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 485915

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 terms

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: stock to 5 day delivery

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V MIDDLE ATLANTIC #FC-4-1CA 139.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FC-4-1CA

ITEMNO.7 - LOT CODE: - 4-9 - Middle Atlantic #FD-12. Front Door. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantity - 10 (1300690-2012296)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Anixter, Inc. as low total bidder for Item Nos. 4 thru 9.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Anixter, Inc. Middle Atlantic #FD-12 85.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 255006

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 terms

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: stock to 5 day delivery

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V MIDDLE ATLANTIC #FD12 88.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FD-12

ITEMNO. 8 -1LOT CODE: -4-9 - Middle Atlantic #FD-16. Front Door. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantity - 10 (1300690-2002349)

LOT AWARD NOTES: Awarded to Anixter, Inc, as low total bidder for Item Nos. 4 thru 9.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. Middle Atlantic #FD-16 94.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 255013

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30 terms

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 5-7 day delivery

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V MIDDLE ATLANTIC #FD16 97.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: FD-16

ITEM NO.9 -LOT CODE: -4-9 - Middle Atlantic #QFAN. Blower Fan. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated
Quantity - 20 (1300690-2009499)

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 4



LOT AWARD NOTES:

Awarded to Anixter, Inc. as low total bidder for Iltem Nos. 4 thru 9.
VENDOR NAME

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE ($)
HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V MIDDLE ATLANTIC #QFAN 52.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: QFAN )
Anixter, Inc.

Middle Atlantic #QFAN 53.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 255020

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS:
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES:

net 30 terms

stock to 5 day delivery

ITEM NO. 10 - LOT CODE: - 10-11 - Peerless #ST636P_ Wall Mount. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated
Quantity - 10 (1300690-2011972)

VENDOR NAME

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. no bid 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: no bid
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V PEERLESS #ST630P 20.0000*
'VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ST630P
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET30

ITEMNO. 11 -1LOT CODE: - 10-11 - Peerless #ST640P. Wall Mount. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantity - 10 (1300690-2011973)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. no bid 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: no bid

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V PEERLESS #ST640P 70.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ST640P
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: N30

ITEM NO. 12 - Tatung #TME22W. 22" Wide Full HD LED Monitor. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantity - 10 (1300690-2012294}) '

VENDOR NAME

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE ($)
Anixter, Inc. no bid 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: no bid
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid
HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V TATUNG #TME22W 263.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TME22W .

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 5



TOTAL BIDS - 10-11

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL (8!
HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V 900.00 900.00
Anixter, Inc. .00

$900.00

TOTAL BIDS - 2-3

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($
HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V 5,850.00 5,850.00
Anixter, Inc. .00

$5,850.00

TOTAL BIDS - 4-9

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Anixter, Inc. 12,570.00 12,570.00
HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V 12,940.00

$12,570.00

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 6



TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL($)  AWARDED TOTAL (8}
Anixter, Inc. 12,570.01 12,570.00
HALIFAX SECURITY INC DBA NORTH AMERICAN V 25,240.00 12,300.00

24,870.00

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 7



