HARDIN COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

NANNETTE JOHNSTON, SUPERINTENDENT

JANEY THORNTON, DIRECTOR OF CHILD NUTRITION SERVICES

2514 LEITCHFIELD ROAD

ELIZABETHTOWN, KENTUCKY 42701

This is a decision paper
TO:


Members of the Hardin County Board Of Education

FROM:

Janey Thornton

SUBJECT:

FS-386 Paper Supply Bid

ISSUE:

We bid paper supplies for school food service annually.

FACTS:
We sent out bid requests to seventeen different vendors.  We received bids from ten companies.
CONCLUSION:   

Our recommendations are shown by “(” beside the desired item.  ONLY ITEMS IN BOLD TYPE ARE TO BE ORDERED.

RECOMMENDED    Beginning Date 7-1 2008  -  Ending Date 6-30-2009



           MOTION:
I move that we approve the Paper Supply Bid as recommended.

	
	Bid Item
	Description
	Gordon Food Service


	Hillyard

KY


	Diversified

Distrib./

Paper Prod
	Clark Food Service
	Consolidated Paper Group
	Unipak

Corp.
	Clint Chemical
	Wallace Packaging, LLC


	Kenway
	*

Somerset Foods

	1
	Aluminum Foil

Small Sample Required.
	Heavy Duty, 24” width

To be packed in cutter box
	61.91

18” wide

Not per spec
	No Bid
	69.87
	*

68.13
	84.41
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	98.88

	2
	Bakery Box, 14 x 10 x 4

10” x 10” x 4”
	White
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	3
	Bakery Cake Box w/window,  

1/2 sheet cake size
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	4
	Baking cup liners for cup cakes and muffins.  Standard size. 10,000 cs
	White paper
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	5
	Baking Cup Liners (small) for Petit Fours, Approx. 1 ½” square. 10,000 cs
	White Paper
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	6
	Baking cup liners (small) for mini cheesecakes and tassies.  Approx. 1” to 1 ¼” square. 10,000 cs
	White paper
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	7
	Bowl, Styrofoam 12 oz
	White
	31.63
	No Bid
	*

14.57
	14.95
	19.08
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	17.20

	8
	Brown Paper Bags, 6# size, 2000 per bail.
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	*

32.11
	No Bid
	34.52
	No Bid
	40.93
	No Bid
	No Bid


	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	9
	Bun Pan Bags 27x37 200 ct/case that do not melt at high temps.
	Clear plastic bags SAMPLE REQUIRED
	17.52
	No Bid
	*

15.67
	46.11

500 cs
	25.99
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	24.14

	10
	Cake boards, ½ sheet cake.  100 per case.
	White waxed cardboard.
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

22.95
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	
	Cake Boards, ¼ sheet cake.  100 per case.
	White, waxed, cardboard.
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	11
	Can Liners, 56 gallon, 250 cs.
	Plastic HEAVY DUTY, to fit Rubbermaid “Glutton”

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	16.92

50 cs
	No Bid
	14.94

200 cs
	11.36

or 14.63

100 cs
	14.29

100 cs
	*

14.70

200 cs
	No Bid
	No Bid
	26.00

100 cs


	No Bid

	12
	Can Liners, 20/30 gallon.  

Sample Required
	Heavy Duty
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	34.98

Not Ordering


	

	13
	Catering Trays, round, 12"
	Aluminum, disposable


	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	14
	Cold cups, 5 oz.  (catering)
	White Plastic


	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	15
	Cold Cups, 10 ounce
	Plastic – SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	16
	Cold Cups, 14 ounce, 1000 per case
	Plastic- CUPS MUST FIT WITH A Fabri-kal lid, L1214 x slot, 9500217,FK12 & FK14 SAMPLE REQUIRED
	30.05
	No Bid
	*

23.98

	34.75
	36.85
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	17
	Cutlery, Fork, Spoon, Knife, Straw, Napkin 

500 pkg per cs.
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	19.30
	28.20
	*

18.52
	No Bid
	No Bid
	19.00
	No Bid
	No Bid

	18
	Cutlery (Breakfast Only), Spoon and Napkin Kit 1000/cs
	Kit contains a medium weight spoon with 10x10 napkin.  Sample required.
	No Bid
	No Bid
	14.72
	21.70
	16.72
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

14.00
	No Bid
	No Bid

	19
	6 oz. Deep Trays

3 ½ “x 3 ½ “x 1 ½ “

2,000 per cs.
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

29.71
	No Bid
	33.93
	No Bid
	No Bid


	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	20
	Lids for 6 oz. Deep Trays

3 23/32 “x 3 23/32 “x 9/16”
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

29.39
	No Bid
	33.57
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	21
	Dinner Napkins, 3-ply, 16 ½ x 17”
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

57.50

2000 cs
	32.95 3000 cs

No Sample
	78.33

2000 cs
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	22
	Flat Trays 

9x12 (250 per cs)
	White Styrofoam SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	23
	Foam plate, 9" diameter

9” diameter, 500/cs
	White

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	29.65
	No Bid
	*

12.14
	12.65
	14.56
	No Bid
	No Bid


	No Bid
	No Bid
	13.99



	24
	Foil Hot Dog Bag, No wording on the bag.  1000/cs
	9 1/2" x 3 1/4" plus gusset

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	29.74
	*

20.00
	23.33
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	25
	Foil Squares – 10x10, use for baked potato, 6 bags of 500
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	53.72

3000 cs


	No Bid
	*

44.60

3000 cs
	No Bid
	97.46

6000 cs
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	26
	Food Tray (French Fry Tray) 1000/cs
	4 ounce capacity; #25

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	15.90
	No Bid
	*

10.39
	11.42


	12.27
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	11.73

	27
	 Food Trays, #200 size, 1000 per case
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	28.03
	No Bid
	*

16.30
	16.89


	20.47
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	19.60

	28
	Food Tray, Paper, #500, 500 cs
	(#500) SAMPLE REQUIRED
	30.96
	No Bid
	*

17.20
	19.00


	22.40
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	21.41

	29
	Freezer Bags, 12 x 8 x 30, Heavy Duty, 500/cs
	Plastic, heavy duty

18” x32” SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	30
	Freezer Bags, 10x8x24, 500/cs
	Plastic, heavy duty

10x8x24 SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	31
	Freezer Bags, Heavy Duty, 10x4x20, 500/cs
	Plastic, heavy duty, 10x4x20

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	32
	Hot Cups, 8 oz. capacity
	1000 case SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	33
	Latex Gloves, medium size. “Cheapest latex glove and still usable for food prep) Case of 1,000
	 SAMPLE REQUIRED


	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	45.73

Not Ordering
	

	34
	Lid, Dome to fit 20 oz. “Salad Shaker”
	Plastic, 500 per case SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	63.09
	*

40.14
	45.24
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	35
	Lids for 2 ½ oz. cup

PL2 (fit 2 ½ oz cup)

(2500 per case)
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	36
	Napkins, embossed, 20/500 per case
	To be used with Junior size dispensers.  Folded size:  6 5/8” long x 3 1/2” wide.

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	32.23

6000 cs


	No Bid
	*

23.40
	29.60
	27.96
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	29.22

	37
	Pan Liners 16 3/8 X 24 3/8 1000 Sheet per cs
	To fit large bun pans for use in baking.


	35.92

(Brown Paper)
	No Bid
	*

25.15
	27.55
	33.43
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	27.25

	38
	Paper Towels, roll, 30 rolls per case.
	Solid white, 90 – 210 sheets per roll, width of roll 11”

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	21.18
	21.05

Bid arrived late
	*

16.80
	17.70
	22.15
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	20.34
	19.30

	39
	Plastic Fork, Medium Weight, 1000/cs
	Fork size 6” long

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	9.15
	No Bid
	*

6.10
	6.75
	7.44
	No Bid
	No Bid
	6.50
	No Bid
	7.45

	40
	Plastic plates, divided, 500/cs
	Plastic, white, 9 1/4"


	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	41
	Plastic Spoon, Medium Weight, 1000/cs
	Spoon size 5 1/2” long

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	9.15
	No Bid
	*

6.10
	6.75
	7.44
	No Bid
	No Bid
	6.50
	No Bid
	7.45

	42
	Plastic Wrap, 18” x 2000’


	
	14.28
	No Bid
	11.10
	*

8.97
	10.14
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	13.98

	43
	Plates 6”, clear plastic
	
	41.11

180 cs
	No Bid
	No Bid
	46.95

180 cs
	*

204.60

1000 cs
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	44
	Plates 7”, clear plastic
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	45
	Plate, 10” diameter, 500/cs
	Plastic, white


	83.14

144 cs


	No Bid
	98.35

500 cs
	*

45.42

400 cs


	50.51

500 cs
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	46
	Plate, 9” diameter, clear, SCROLL-WARE plastic
	Plastic
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	47
	Portion Cup, 2 1/2 oz, 20/250 cs
	Plastic SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	48
	Portion Cup, 1- oz, 5000/cs
	Paper, for catsup dispensing
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	49
	Portion Cups, 5 1/2 ounce Solo P550, 10/250 cs
	Plastic 2500 per case

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	57.59
	No Bid
	*

43.51
	43.75
	51.80
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	50
	Lids for 5 ½ oz. cup

(PL 5
Plastic 2500per cs)
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	46.99
	No Bid
	*

36.45
	37.10
	39.29
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	51
	Plastic 2 oz. Clear plastic soufflé cup, 10/250 cs
	
	*

21.16
	No Bid
	21.62
	21.63
	26.38
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	24.30



	52
	Plastic, 2 oz. Clear plastic lid, (to fit item #47 & #51)
	
	32.08
	No Bid
	24.62
	*

24.58
	28.27
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	27.69

	53
	Portion Cup, 20 oz. “Salad Shaker”
	Plastic 1000 per case

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	72.10
	*

42.26
	65.05
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	54
	Punch Cups, hard plastic, clear, 14 oz.
	Plastic
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	55
	Sandwich Bags, saddlebags

7 1/2"x6 1/2"
	Plastic, Saddlebags

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	13.00
	No Bid
	*

12.55
	No Bid
	18.56
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	56
	Sandwich Bags, 6x3/4x6 ½, 6000/cs
	White Wax Paper


	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	57
	Sandwich Wrap, 6000/cs
	10” x 10 3/4” wax sheets
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

34.87
	34.95
	40.61
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	58
	Sandwich wraps, Red Checker Board Sandwich Wraps.  2000 per case 10 ½ x 14
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	69.49

2500 cs
	*

48.90

2000 cs
	54.91

2000 cs
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	59
	Sandwich wraps, Green Checker Board Sandwich Wraps.  2000 per case 10 ½ x 14
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	69.49

2500 cs
	*

48.90

2000 cs
	54.91

2000 cs
	No Bid
	No Bic
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	60
	Sandwich Wraps, Blue Checker Board Sandwich Wraps.  2000 per case 10 ½ x 14
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	69.49

2500 cs
	*

48.90

2000 cs
	54.91

2000 cs
	No Bid
	No Bic
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	61
	Sandwich wraps, Brushstroke paper sandwich wraps. 2000 per case 10 ½ x 14.
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	69.49

2500 cs
	*

48.90

2000 cs


	54.91

2000 cs
	No Bid
	No Bic
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	62
	‘Scoop-Shaped paper cup” – for a-la-carte popcorn chicken.  5.5 oz, decoration, NO WORDING on cup. 15 bags of 80 PER CASE
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

73.13


	92.15
	116.09


	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	63
	Serving Gloves, Small 100 pieces per box, 10 boxes per case.
	100 pieces per box, 10 boxes per case

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	18.33

1000 pieces
	No Bid
	*

36.80

10,000

pieces
	No Bid
	40.87

10,000

pieces
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	64
	Serving Gloves, Medium, 100 pieces per box, 10 boxes per case
	100 pieces per box, 10 boxes per case

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	4.40

1000 pieces
	No Bid
	*

36.80

10,000

pieces
	No Bid
	40.87

10,000

pieces
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	5.50

1000 cs

	65
	Serving Gloves, Large, and 100 pieces per box, 10 boxes per case.
	100 pieces per box, 10 boxes per case

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	4.40

1000 pieces
	No Bid
	*

36.80

10,000

pieces
	No Bid
	40.87

10,000

pieces
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	5.50

1000 cs

	66
	Snack Tray w/well, 500/cs
	Snack Tray w/well 500 per case SAMPLE REQUIRED
	20.33
	No Bid
	*

18.70
	19.80
	22.88
	No Bid
	No Bid


	No Bid
	No Bid


	No Bid

	67
	1 oz Squat Paper portion Cup (5000 per cs)
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

32.37
	No Bid
	57.09
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	68
	Stickers for sandwich wraps, 1000 per roll
	“Ham/Cheese”
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	69
	Stickers for Sandwich wraps, 1000 per roll
	“Turkey/Cheese”
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	70
	Stickers for sandwich wrap, 1000 per roll
	“Grilled Chicken”


	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	71
	Stickers for sandwich wraps, 1000 per roll
	“Breaded Chicken”
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	72
	Straw, 5 3/4” slim

25,000


	Plastic unwrapped.

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	No Bid
	No Bid
	*

40.09
	39.15

Price not valid after 12-31-08
	50.85
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	73
	Tablecovers, white poly, 3-ply, 54x108
	SAMPLE REQUIRED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	74
	Tray, flat

6" x 8", 500/cs
	Styrofoam SAMPLE REQUIRED
	16.88
	No Bid
	12.94
	*

12.80
	15.79
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	75
	Trays, 6 compartment, 500/cs
	Paper or Styrofoam

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	25.23
	No Bid
	21.22
	*

21.10 bag

	28.31
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	76
	Chinese style take out box, no handle.  Pint size.  Plain
	White, pint size.  SAMPLE REQUIRED


	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


· Somerset prices are effective until 12-31-2008

*    Smart Systems sent back invitation labeled “No Bid”

