
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE:

ITEM(S) QUOTED:

7210

April 26, 2016

AUTOMOTIVE ANTIFREEZE, FLUIDS & LUBRICANTS

DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S)?

March 01, 2016

From June 01 , 2016 through May 31 , 2017

No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An " indicates an award.
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l Vendor Name

Apollo Oil, LLC

Vendor Response Terms

r Response Terms

Delivery made within 2 days of receipt of

purchase order. (excluding weekends)

l Response Payment Terms

net 30 no dmm charge no FSC

I

Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep

Heritage Petroleum

Key Oil Company

Moog Louisville Warehouse

Oil Distributing Company

30 Days

1A) Yes, I B) No. Moog Louisville Warehouse
l42al W Magazine St. Louisville, KY 40203
502-583-7795. 3) 3-s Working Days.

1A yes. I B no. 2 RelaDyne/Oil Distributing
Company 601 Wilson BLVD Bardstown, KY
40004 502.337.3467 3. Three business days
from receipt of purchase order.

Net 30 Days

Net lOth Prox.

Net 30 days.

Parman Energy

Valor Oil

Whayne Supply
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ITEM No. 1 - Coolant, 1-qallon container. Concentrated, (color must be Green), no pre-mix. 1 - 1.0000 Gallon Container,
Estimated Quantity - 24 (5400060-15934591

VENDOR NAME

Apollo Oil, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Valor Oil Starfire

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: starfireGrnAF-cs

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: six 1 gallon containers per case

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parts Master/Prestone #PMAOB3/F

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: PMAOB3/F

Oil Distributing Company DURAMAX GREEN CONCENTRATE

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 950820100GNO807

Key Oil Company KOST DEFENDAL UNIVERSAL AF #10123

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Heritage Petroleum

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Mobil

permazone

CHRYSLER #5066386AA

5066386AA

10123

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Polyfreeze Glacier Guard

9998545

UNIT PRICE ($)
4 6600"

5.6500

5.8400

6.5400

-i oooo

7.3100

139000

ITEM NO. 2 - Coolant, 55-qallon drum. Concentrated, (color must be Green), no pre-mix. Please respond to the followinq in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Drum charqe. 1 - 55.0000 Gallon Drum, Estimated Quantity - 25 (5400060-1237521)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Apollo Oil, LLC Polyfreeze Glacier Guard 276 9700'

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 99985454

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Oil Distributing Company SHELL SHELLZONE CONCENTRATE GREEN

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 500820100GRO810

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Valor Oil Starfire

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: starfireGrnAF-dr

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Parman Energy CHEVRON HAVOLINE A/F

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CHHVAF61 10DR

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parts Master/Prestone

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AF55G

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: We must have empty Drums back on a 1 for I Exchange Program.

Key Oil Company KOST DEFENDAL UNIVERSAL AF #102l4

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Note: " indicates a pending award.

292.1100

305.5600

343.7500

345 0000

360 2500

10214

PAGE 3



RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM DEPOSIT. NON RETURNABLE DRUM

Heritage Petroleum Mobil 389.1800

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: permazone

ITEM No. 3 - Coolant, 1-qallon container. Concentrated, (color must be Oranqe),, no pre-mix. Dex Cool GM #12346290 or equal.
1 - 1 .0000 Gallon Container, Estimated quantity - 100 (5400060-1723470)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Heritage Petroleum Mobil 7.4100"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: coolant

Oil Distributing Company SHELL DEXCOOL CONCENTRATE 7 7300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 500820100DCO807

Key Oil Company KOST DEFENDAL DEXCOOL #10270 8.5700

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 10270

Apollo Oil, LLC Valvoline zerex 8 6900

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 99985055

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parks Master / Prestone #AF888/2F

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: AF888/2F

Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep CHRYSLER

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4267020AB

Valor Oil Shell

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 940400602 1

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

ITEM No. 4 - De-icer, windshield, 12-oz. spray can. NAPA #7000 or equal. 1 - 12.0000 0unce Can, Estimated Quantity - 1,200
(5400680-1285087)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Apollo Oil, LLC Pyroil 1 .2600"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: l204Dill

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Can is 11 .5 oz

Moog Louisville Warehouse CRC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 05346

Oil Distributing Company PENRAY DE-ICER

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 581765216001113

ITEM No. s - Solvent, windshield washer antifreeze, ready mix, 1-qallon container. 1 - 1 .0000 Gallon Container, Estimated

Quantity - 24 (5400680-1671330)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Oil Distributing Company DURAMAX WINDSHEILD WASHER FLUID 1 3900"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 950810020000807

Apollo Oil, LLC Extreme Blue 1.4700

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1251155

Moog Louisville Warehouse Peak 1 .6900

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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17.1800

42.2100

1.2900

1 7400



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: WWS-W

Heritage Petroleum

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: solvent

Key Oil Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 803660

Solvent windshield washer

CAMCO #803660

1.7200

2.0000

ITEM No. 6 - Solvent, windshield washer antifreeze, ready mix, 55-qallon drum. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Drum charqe. 1 - 55.0000 Gallon Drum, Estimated Quantity - 24 (5400680-1285078)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Oil Distributing Company DURAMAX WINDSH?ELD WASHER FLUID 67.8700"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 990810020000810

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Apollo Oil, LLC Extreme Blue

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1251164

Valor Oil Duraflow

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5000024-981

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Heritage Petroleum

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Moog Louisville Warehouse Peak

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1/WVS55-W

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: We must have empty drums back, 1 for I Exchange Program.

Key Oil Company CAMCO -22 #803675

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Parman Energy SIGNATURE PREMIX WINDSHIELD -20F

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MIPRM.....DR

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

71.7400

721100

91 9400Solvent Windshield washer

solvent

99.0000

104.5000

803675

129.2500

ITEM No. 7 - Fluid, automatic transmission fluid for Ford vehicle. Mercon V ATF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 12.0000 Quart Case,
Estimated Cluantity - 15 (5400220-1 729559')

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Valor Oil Starfire 29 9500"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: starsynatfv-cs
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parts Master/Valvoline

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5360

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Mercon V ATF

Key Oil Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Heritage Petroleum

Note: " indicates a pending award.

34.4800

35.4300CONOCOPHILLIPS FAMILY MERCON V

#01055512

01055512

Mobil

PAGE s
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: atf

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: case of quarts

Apollo Oil, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Oil Distributing Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

PENNZOIL MERCON V ATF

5013900VI001401

0553470

Motorcrafk 451100

51.4100

ITEM No. 8 - Fluid, automatic transmission fluid for Allison transmissions. 55-qallon drum. PRODUCT BID MUST MEET ALLISON

TES 389 SPECIFICATIONS. Vendor must submit license approval number from the Allison Transmission Company indicatinq the
product bid has been tested and meets TES 389 specifications. 1 - 55.0000 Gallon Drum, Estimated Quantity - 10
(s<oo:z:>o-:>oirsgi)

VENDOR NAME

Key Oil Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103035

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: ALLISON TES 389 LICENSE# AA-32792008

Oil Distributing Company Mobil ATF D/M

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 261390ATFDMO810

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Parman Energy CHEVRON

VENDOR REFERENCE NlmlBER: CHATFHD389DR

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30

Apollo Oil, LLC Shell Spirax S2

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0803364

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: AA-32242011

Valor Oil Shell

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 550026992

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Allison Approval number AA-3224201 1

Heritage Petroleum Mobile/ Delvac

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

UNIT PRICE ($)
393.2500"

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

MOBIL ATF D/M #103035

426 5200

617.6500

696.8800

1 ,665 5600

1 ,799.0000

Mobil

ITEM No. 9 - Fluid, automatic transmission fluid for other than Ford vehicle. Type Dexron 111 or equal. 1 - 12.0000 Quart Case,
Estimated Quantity - 9 (5400220-1204413)

VENDOR NAME

Apollo Oil, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Oil Distributing Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Moog Louisville Warehouse

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5353

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Type Dexron 111

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Pinnacle Multiguard

DURAMAX D/M 111 ATF

950390003001401

Parts Master/Valvoline

0603530

UNIT PRICE ($)
16 5700"

18.4800

22 4800

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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Key Oil Company CONOCOPHILLIPS FAMILY SUPER ATF

#01052775

29 5500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Heritage Petroleum

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: mobil

01052775

Mobil 36.6000

ITEM No. 10 - Fluid, automatic transmission fluid for other than Ford vehicle. Type Dexron 111 or equal. Please respond to the
followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Drum charqe. 1' - 55.0000 Gallon Drum, Estimated Quantity-1
(5400220-1354136)

VENDOR NAME

Apollo Oil, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0603484

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Oil Distributing Company DURAMAX D/M 111 ATF

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 950390003000810

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Valor Oil Duraflow

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5024-990

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Key Oil Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 19500-55

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Heritage Petroleum Mobil

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Mobil

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Pinnacle Multiguard

HALLMARK PREMIUM ATF #19500-55

UNIT PRICE ($)
250.5500'

257.9000

277 2000

298.6500

873 0000

ITEM No. 11 - Fluid, diesel exhaust, bulk. Price per qallon, delivered in bulk. Vendor's price must include delivery and on-site
refillinq of DEF Totes. Product must be Iicensed by the American Petroleum Institute. Vendor must submit API Iicensed approval
number. Vendors biddinq on this item must be able to pump DEF into existinq totes. (330 qallon totes) No exchanqe of totes will be

accepted. 1 - 1.0000 Gallon Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1500 (5400220-2012012)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Oil Distributing Company ALL FLEET API CERT?FIED DEF

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 95222APIDEFO812

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: RELADYNE WILL FILL BULK DEF TOTES ON SITE

Valor Oil Blue Sky

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 30005-990

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Key Oil Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: DB

Heritage Petroleum

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Whayne Supply

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Parman Energy

UNIT PRICE ($)
1 1800"

i..:iooo

1.3500YARA AIR 1 DEF #DB

1 3900DEF

DEF

1.5200Mobile

70000MOB

BLUE DEF 1.6300

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MIDBLUEDEF.BK

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30

ITEM No. 12 - Fluid, synthetic automatic transmission fluid for Allison transmissions. PRODUCT BID MUST MEET ALLISON

TES295 SPECIFICATIONS. Vendor must submit license approval number from Allison Transmission Company indicatinq the
product bid has been tested and meets TES295 specifications. 1 - 55.0000 Gallon Drum, Estimated Quantity - 2
(5400220-2C)11392)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Heritage Petroleum - case of 6 not acceptable.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Heritage Petroleum ATF

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ATF

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Per case of 6

Valor Oil Shell

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5001200001

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: AllisonapprovalnumberAN-121008

Oil Distributing Company BP AUTOTRAN SYN 295

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 160400295000810

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: App Num: AN-031002

Parman Energy CASTROL

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CATRANSYNDDR

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Apollo Oil, LLC BP Autran

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0033404

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: LiscensenumberAN-031002

Key Oil Company MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC ATF #103051

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 103051

RESPONSEITEMNOTES: ALLISONTES295LICENSE#AN-051005NODRUMCHARGE

ITEM No. 13 - Fluid, brake, 12-oz. can. Napa #35012 or equal. 1 - 12.0000 0unce Can, Estimated Quantity - 125
(5400240-1661549)

VENDOR NAME

Moog Louisville Warehouse

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Oil Distributing Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Apollo Oil, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Heritage Petroleum

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Note: " indicates a pending award.

DURAMAX HD BRAKE FLUID

95076BRKFLD1113

Pyroil

120680001

Brake Fluid

Brake Fluid

CHRYSLER

4318080AB

PS312

PAGE 8

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Perfect Stop #PS312

UNIT PRICE ($)
137.9000

1 ,387.7800"

1 ,475.0000

1,514 7000

1,5158200

1 ,667.6000

UNIT PRICE ($)
1.1900"

1 .2200

1.4100

2.1200

5.1700



ITEM No. 14 - Fluid, hydraulic, for qaraqe floor lift, 55-qallon drum. Tellus 32. NO SUBSTITUTE. Please respond to the followinq
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Drum charqe. 1 - 55.0000 Gallon Drum, Estimated Quantity - 6
(5400220-1 z:>z:>ss)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Heritage Petroleum - substitute not acceptable.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Heritage Petroleum Mobil Nuto

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Oil Distributing Company SHELL TELLUS S2 M 32

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 500470032520810

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES? NO DRUM CHARGE

Valor Oil Shell

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 6544800055

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Apollo Oil, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0807374

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

UNIT PRICE ($)
345.8100

Mobil

442 4400"

443.3300

4541100shell

ITEM No. 15 - Fluid, hydraulic, for tractor shop. UTH torque fluid. Please respond to the followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE
ITEM NOTES field: Drum charqe. 1- 55.0000 Gallon Drum, Estimated Quantity - 1 (5400580-1274044)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Heritage Petroleum - s gallon bucket not acceptabe.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

HeritagePetroleum MobilNuto

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: Mobil Nuto

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: per 5gallon bucket

Apollo Oil, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0603814

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Oil Distributing Company ALL FLEET J20C THF

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 95243UTHFOOO810

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Valor Oil Duraflow

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5009-981

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Key Oil Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 45900-55

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

UNIT PRICE ($)
33.7000

249.4100"Pinnacle Multiguard

298.9900

306.6000

'HALLMARK PREMIUM THr #45900-55 388.8500

ITEM No. 16 - Fluid, power steerinq, 12-oz. can. PSF #9800 or equal. 1 - 12.0000 0unce Can, Estimated Quantity - 1 ,000
(5400250-1 zoasg<)

VENDOR NAME

Apollo Oil, LLC

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Pureguard

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.9400"

Note: " indicates a pending award.
PAGE 9



VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12065030

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Moog Louisville Warehouse

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Oil Distributing Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Heritage Petroleum

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

DURAMAX P/S FLUID

95076PWSTFL1113

power steering fluid

power steering fluid

CHRYSLER

6821 8064-AA

PSF12P

Pyroil q ogoo

1.1000

1.5900

5.7300

ITEM No. 17 - Multi-purpose qear lubricant, must be GL5 approved, 55-qallon drum. Gulf 80W/90 or equal. Please respond to the
followinq in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Drum charqe. 1 - 55.0000 Gallon Drum, Estimated Quantity - 2

(5400360-1190036)

VENDOR NAME

Apollo Oil, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0606384

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Oil Distributing Company ALL FLEET MP 80W90

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 952658090MPO810

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Valor Oil Starfire

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: starfire80w90-982

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no drum charge

Heritage Petroleum

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Key Oil Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01041298

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parts Master #75-5840

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

Parman Energy CHEVRON mULlT GEAR

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CHMGL80 90DR

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS? NET 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO DRUM CHARGE

UNIT PRICE ($)
328 2300"

ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Pinnacle Multiguard

366.3000

387.6600

476.5000Gear lubricant

gear lubricant

CONOCOPHILLIPS UNIVERSAL GEAR 80W90

#01041298

483.8000

528.0000

75-5840

zoo oooo

ITEM No. 18 - Oil, 5W30 deterqent. Only these nationally recoqnized name brands are acceptable: Havoline, Marathon, Mobil,
Pennzoil, Quaker State, and Shell. 1 - 12.0000 Quart Case, Estimated Quantity - 170 (5400600-2010252)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep - Chrysler not approved product.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Note: " indicates a pending award.
PAGE 10

UNIT PRICE (i)



Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep CHRYSLER

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 68055891 -AA

Apollo Oil, LLC shell Formula Shell

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0801190

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Oil Distributing Company SHELL FORMULA 5W30

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 500230530001401

Moog Louisville Warehouse Pennzoil

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3609

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Pennzoil

Key Oil Company MOBIL SPECIAL 5W30 #112933

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: il2933

Heritage Petroleum Marathon

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: cs4-1g

Valor Oil Marathon

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MRO130350

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 12/1 qt case

ITEM No. 19 - Oil, 10W30 Iow deterqent. 1 - 12.0000 Quart Case, Estimated Quantity - 2 (5400600-1723304)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: F<e:)ect Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep - size quoted not acceptable.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Oil Distributing Company NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep CHRYSLER

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 68055892-AA

Apollo Oil, LLC Pinnacle Multiguard

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0601290

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Heritage Petroleum Marathon

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: cs4-?g

Moog Louisville Warehouse Valvoline #VV850

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: W850

ITEM NO. 20 - Oil, 20W non-deterqent. 1-12.0000 Quark Case, Estimated Quantity - 1 (5400600-1339117)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep - size quoted not acceptable.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Oil Distributing Company NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Note: " indicates a pending av=tard.

2.4800

24.0400"

24.4700

37.4800

38.0100

44.8700

2,877.0000

UNIT PRICE ($)

0.0100

2.4800

17.5700'

44.i400

69.9500

UNIT PRICE ($)
0.0100
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3 4800

199500"

Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep c

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 68055890-AA

Valor Oil Starfire

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: starfiren/d20w-cs

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Moog Louisville Warehouse SuperS #20ND

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 20ND

ITEM NO. 21 - Oil, 30W non-deterqent. 1 - 12.0000 Quark Case, Estimated Quantity - 2 (5400600-1076320)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Oil Distributing Company NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES? NO BID

Valor Oil Starfire

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: supersn/d30w-cs
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parks Master/Valvoline

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 75-030

Key Oil Company KENDALL ND 30W #01042793

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01042793

Apollo Oil, LLC Valvoline

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 085822382

ITEM NO. 22 - Oil, Iubricatinq, 10W30 hiqh deterqent. 1 - 12.0000 Quart Case, Estimated Quantity - 1 (5400520-1404448)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Apollo Oil, LLC withdrew their bid.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Oil Distributing Company NO BID

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Apollo Oil, LLC Pinnacle Multiguard

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0601290

Key Oil Company CONOCOPHILLIPS AS SYN BLEND 10W30

#01042086

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01042086

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parts Master / Valvoline #5129

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5129

ITEM NO. 23 - Oil, lubricatinq, 15W40 diesel qrade. 1 - 12.0000 Quart Case, Estimated Quantity - 20 (5400520-1698215)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Apollo Oil, LLC Pinnacle Multiguard 23.2400"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0801890

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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28.4800

UNIT PRICE ($)
ooioo

19 9500"

28.4800

290100

47.4500

uNIT PRICE ($)
0.oi00

16.4000

26.2200"

26.4800



RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Valor Oil Starfire

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: starfirl5w40-qsqt
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Oil Distributing Company ALL FLEET SB CJ4 15W40

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 952281540001401

Key Oil Company CONOCOPHILLIPS FLEET EC 15W40

*oros<ioo

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01054100

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parts Master/Valvoline

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5380

ITEM No. 24 - Oil, Iubricatinq, 15W40, heavy duty, bulk (must be API approved). 1 - 1 .0000 Gallon Container, Estimated
Quantity - 10,000 (5400530-15083091

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Parman Energy - not an API approved product.
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Parman Energy SIGNATURE 15W/40

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SNHDM15.40BK

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30

Oil Distributing Company Chevron Ursa Super Plus 15W40

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 210271540URO812

Valor Oil Starfire

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: starfirl 5w40-990

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Key Oil Company CONOCOPHILLIPS FLEET EC 15W40

#01052955

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01052955

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES? API APPROVED CJ-4 oIL

Whayne Supply Mobil

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 130728Mob

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parts Master/Valvoline

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 53387

Apollo Oil, LLC Hicks Formula 500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0601895

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

ITEM NO. 25 - Oil, Iubricatinq, 20W50 deterqent. 1 - 12.0000 Quart Case, Estimated Quantity - s (5400520-1670086)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER

Apollo Oil, LLC shell

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0802119

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Oil Distributing Company CHEVRON SUPREME 20W50

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 210232050001401

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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24.3900

25.4400

28.9800

29 4800

UNIT PRICE ($)
4 9500

s 1400'

52100

s 3000

5.7000

6.9500

7 2800

UNIT PRICE ($)
21 4200"

29 2400



29.8800

a;.s:zoo

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parks Master/Valvoline

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5135

Key Oil Company KENDALL GT-1 HP 20W50 #01057267

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01057267

ITEM No. 26 - Oil, lubricatinq, 30W deterqent. 1 - 12.0000 Quart Case, Estimated Quantity - 10 (5400520-1076302)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Apollo Oil, LLC shell 26 4700"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0801590

Moog Louisville Warehouse Parts Master/Valvoline 29.8800

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5159

Key Oil Company KENDALL GT-1 HP Tl 30W #01057271 30 4500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01057271

Oil Distributing Company SHELL ROTELLA Tl 30W 34.1500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 500270030001401

ITEM No. 27 - Grease, wheel bearinq EP-2, 120-lb. can. Shell Alvania EP-2 Code 71125 or equal. Vendors biddinq on this item
mustprovidespecificationsheets.Theapplicationsectioninspecificationsheetsmuststateforwheelbearinquse. 1-120.0000
Pound Can, Estimated Quantity - 1 (5400280-1383097)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Valor Oil Starfire 187.7800'

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: starfireHTE-823

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

Oil Distributing Company ALL FLEET PREM HT GREASE EP 2

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 952720002HT1329

Key Oil Company CONOCOPHILLIPS DYNALIFE HT 2

#0 1056664

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01056664

Apollo Oil, LLC shell

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 0807023

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: net 30

ITEM NO. 28 - Additive, diesel fuel bio-clean, 80-oz. can. F"ovver Service #9080-06. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 6.0000 Count Case,

Estimated Quantity - s (5400020-2009605)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE t$)

Oil Distributing Company NO BID o.oioo

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Apollo Oil, LLC power service

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12059080

Key Oil Company POWER SERVICE BIO-KLEEN #09080-06

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 09080-06

Note: " indicates a pending award.

1953600

243.6000

281 8500

425. 11 00"

430.0000
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ITEM NO. 29 - Lubricant, 2-oz. bottle. Tri-Flo #TF21010. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 2.0000 0unce Bottle, Estimated Quantity - 40
(5400360-1729533>

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Oil Distributing Company NO BID o.oioo

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Moog Louisville Warehouse Tri-Flo

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TF21010

ITEM No. 30 - Lubricant, 6-oz. can, spray. Tri-Flo #TF20005. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 6.0000 0unce Can, Estimated Quantity -
i,::oo (s<ooaao-res<zgz)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($1

Oil Distributing Company NO BID ooioo

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES? NO BID

Moog Louisville Warehouse Tri-Flo

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TF20005

ITEM No. 31 - Lubricant, 1 1-oz. can, spray. WD-40. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1 - 11.0000 0unce Can, Estimated quantity - 500
(5400360-1 ozez<o)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE t$)

Oil Distributing Company NO BID 00100

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

Apollo Oil, LLC wd 40

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12081050

Moog Louisville Warehouse WD40

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 110078

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: WD-40

3 7900"

6.9500"

4 8700"

5.9700

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME

Apollo Oil, LLC

Cross Motors Chrysler Jeep

Heritage Petroleum

Key Oil Company

Moog Louisville Warehouse

Oil Distributing Company

Parman Energy

Valor Oil

1/Vhayne Supply

TOTAL ($)

109,709 92

8,857 89

47,628.72

87,313.69

105,330.81

83,871 52

74,246 65

581,501 18

59,280.00

AWARDED TOTAL ($'i

20,312.73

741.00

3,958 72

8,640.35

57,486 88

3,472.44

94,612.12

Note: " indicates a pending award.
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