JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7178

APPROVAL DATE: January 11, 2016

ITEM(S) QUOTED: ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES & LIGHTING (Line Item)
Supplement

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: December 02, 2015

CONTRACT PERIOD: From January 12, 2016 through November 30, 2016

RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates award.
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Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name | Response Terms | Response Payment Terms

CAPP, Inc.

CED Construction Group We are not minority owned Net 30 Days

hagemeyer north america

Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC

REXEL prox 25th terms
S&J LIGHTING/LENSE SUPPLY . net 30 days
S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. US MAIL, FAX, EMAIL 2%10 NET 30
WESCO DISTRIBUTION Net 30
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ITEM NO. 1 - Capacitor, motor run, 7.5 microfarad. 440V. oval. Mars #12031 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated

Quantity - 8 (2760240-1196227)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
hagemeyer north america mars 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12031
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID
S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. MARS #12031 2.3400*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12031
CAPP, Inc. MARS #12031 4.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS395584
CED Construction Group MARS 12.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 12031
ITEM NO. 2 - Contactor. definite purpose. 2 pole. 30A. 24V. Furnas #45EG20AJ. Mars #61345 or eaual. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 8 (2700260-1611287)
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
. LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID
S.W.H. Supply Company, inc. MARS #45EG20AJ 9.3700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 45EG20AJ
CAPP, Inc. MARS #61745 12.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3015577
CED Construction Group MARS 23.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 61345
REXEL SQD #8910DP32V14 37.4100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910DP32V14
hagemeyer north america sqd 39.0900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910dp32v14
ITEM NO. 3 - Contactor,_definite purpose. 3 pole. 30A. 24V. Furnas #42CF35AJ. Mars #61445 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each
Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 8 (2700260-1447885)
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID
S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. MARS #42CF35AJ 21.7700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 42CF35AJ
CAPP, Inc. MARS #61430 25.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS624021

Note: * indicates a pending award.

PAGE 3



RESPONSE ITEM NOTES:

CED Construction Group MARS 45,8000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 61430

REXEL : SQb 51.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910DPA33V14

hagemeyer north america sqd 62.5300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910dpa43vi4

ITEM NO. 4 - Contactor, definite purpose, 3 pole. 30A. 120V. Mars #61431 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantitv - 20 (2700260-1727716)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Capp, Inc. - auxiliaries are not the same.

VENDOR NAME ' ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)
hagemeyer north america mars 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 61431

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

CAPP, Inc. FASCO #H330B +17.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS599399

S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. MARS #61431 19.1900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 61431

CED Construction Group MARS 45.8000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 61431

REXEL SQb 51.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910DPA33V02

ITEM NO. 5 - Contactor, definite purpose. 3 pole, 40A, 24V. Honevwell DP #3040A5002 or eaual. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 8 (2700260-1730714)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)
hagemeyer north america honeywell 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3040a5002

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. HONEYWELL #DP3040A5003 27.3300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: DP3040A5003

CAPP, Inc. MARS #61445 27.7500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3003027

CED Construction Group MARS 52.7500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 61455

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 4



REXEL
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER:

ITEM NO. 6 - Contactor. definite purpose. 3 pole. 40A, 240V. Furnas #42CF35AG, Mars #61447 or equal.

sQD 59.8500

8910DPA43V14

1 - 1.0000 Each

Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 8 (4450212-1654709)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. . MARS #42CF35AG 21.7800*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 42CF35AG

CAPP, Inc. MARS #61447 27.7500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS83019893

CED Construction Group MARS 45.8000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 61432

REXEL sQb 59.8500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910DPA43V09

hagemeyer north america sqd 62.5300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910dpa43v09

ITEMNO. 7 - Contactor, definite purpose. 4 pole, 30A, 120V. Packard #C430B or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated
Quantity - 8 (2700260-1714458)
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
hagemeyer north america packard 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: c430b
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID
S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. PACKARD #C430B 22.7200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: C430B
CAPP, Inc. PACKARD #DPBF18T4A12060 56.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071946
REXEL SQD 59.8500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910DPA43V02
ITEMNO.8 - Contactor definite purpose. 4 pole. 40A. 208/240V. Packard #C440C or equal, 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 2 (2700260-1009152)
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)
hagemeyer north america packard 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: c440c
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. PACKARD #C440C 23.7700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: C440C

CAPP, Inc. PACKARD #DPBF26T4A23060 64.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071947

REXEL SQD 77.5400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 8910DPA44V09

ITEM NQO. 9 - Fixture, fluorescent, 1' x 4' Troffer. 2 lamp proarammed start. Lithonia #SP8-G-2-32-RW-K20-MVOLT GEB10PS
or equal with lamps.  Please respond to the followina in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: SPECIFY WARRANTY
AND SUBMIT SPECIFICATION SHEET FOR FIXTURE QUOTED. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 15
(2700520-2011765)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Capp, Inc. - standard lens is not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

hagemeyer north america lithonia 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: sp8g232rwk20mvolt
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC nb #nb 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: nb

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: no bid
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no bid

CAPP, Inc. S-KAR #TY124-232B11 58.7500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071952
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NON CANCELABLE/NON RETURNABLE

S&J LIGHTING/LENSE SUPPLY COLUMBIA #85T814-232G-RAKSH20-E 75.3700"

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ST814-232G-RAKSH20-E

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: COMPLETE PART # ST814-232G-RAKSH20-EPU-F0841. 1 year warranty on mfg
workmanship. 5 year warranty on ballast. lamps included, 841. YOU CAN GET 835
LAMPS IF DESIRED.

CED Construction Group lithonia 87.1000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: sp89g232rwk201200s10p

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: COMPLETE CAT # SP8G232RWK20120S10PSXGLRLPSM835 Ballast is mutti volt
must secify voltage when ordering to correctly size fuse

REXEL LITHONIA 88.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: sp89232rwk201200s10p

ITEM NO. 10 - Fixture. fluorescent, 2' x 4' Troffer, 3 lamp, programmed start. with lamps. Lithonia

#2SP-G-3-32-RW-K20-MVOLT-1/3 or equal. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field
SPECIFY WARRANTY AND SUBMIT SPECIFICATION SHEET FOR FIXTURE QUOTED. 1 -1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated

Quantity - 2 (2700520-1730600)
ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Light Bulb Depot 7 LLC and Capp, Inc. - standard lens is not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
hagemeyer north america lithonia 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2spf332rwk20voit-1/3

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 6



RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC MOBERN #RG24332UNV 53.9500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 28129A

CAPP, Inc. ) S-KAR #TY244-332-B11-PSN-UN 69.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071955

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NON CANCELABLE/NON RETURNABLE

CED Construction Group LITHONIA 92.5000*%

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2SPG332RWK20
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: complete cat #2spg332rwk201201/30s10psxglripsm835 Ballast is muliti volt Must
specify voltage when ordering to properly size fuse

REXEL LITHONIA 94.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: sp8g232rwk201200s10p

S&J LIGHTING/LENSE SUPPLY COLUMBIA #8T824-332G-RAKSH20-3 97.3900
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ST824-332G-RAKSH20-3

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: COMPLETE PART# ST824-332G-RAKSH20-3EPU. LAMPS INCLUDED. 1 YEAR
WARRANTY ON MFG WORKMANSHIP. 5 YEAR WARRANTY ON BALLAST. WE
INCLUDED 841 LAMPS BUT YOU CAN GET 835 LAMPS |F DESIRED.

ITEM NO. 11 - Fixture, fluorescent. 2' x 4' Troffer, 4 lamp. proarammed start. Fixtures are to be bid with lamps. Lithonia
#2SP-G-4-32-RW-K20-MVOL T-1/4 or equal. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
SPECIFY WARRANTY AND SUBMIT SPECIFICATION SHEET FOR FIXTURE QUOTED. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantitv - 48 (2700520-1726240)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Light Bulb Depot 7 LLC and Capp, Inc. - standard lens is not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

hagemeyer north america lithonia 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2spg432rwk20mvoit-1/
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC mobern #24pg32unv 53.9000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 05370a

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: in stock

CAPP, Inc. S-KAR #TY244432B11PSN4LUNV 69.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071956

CED Construction Group lithonia 92.5000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2spg432rwk20

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: COMPLETE CAT # 2SPG432RWK201201/40S10PSXGLRLPSM835 Ballasi is
Multivolt Must Specify voltage when ordering to properly size fuses

REXEL LITHONIA 94.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2spg432rwk201201/40s

S&J LIGHTING/LENSE SUPPLY COLUMBIA #ST824-432G-RAKSH20-4 99.3300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ST824-432G-RAKSH20-4

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: COMPLETE PART# ST824-432G-RAKSH20-4EPU. 1 YEAR WARRANTY ON MFG
WORKMANSHIP. 5 YEAR WARRANTY ON BALLAST. LAMPS INCLUDED, 841.
YOU CAN GET 835 LAMPS IF DESIRED.

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 7



ITEM NO. 12 - Lamp, metal halide, 400W. compact quartz. E39 mogul base BT28. clear. 4000K. rated for enclosed fixtures.
Svlvania M400/U/BT28 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantitv - 100 (5000060-2010895)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

S&J LIGHTING/LENSE SUPPLY HALCO #MH400/U/ED28 7.9900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 108216

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC DAMAR #M400U/4K 8.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01054D
RESPONSE [TEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES:

EQUAL TO SYLVANIA, GE, PHILIPS, VENTURE OR ANY OTHER MANUFACTURER

CED Construction Group HOWARD 9.9000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MH400UED28

REXEL SYLVANIA 10.3200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: M400/U/ED28
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: M400/U/BT28 IS OBSOLETE

WESCO DISTRIBUTION Philips 12.4000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MH400/U/ED28
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies Eiko #MH400/U/ED28 14.3300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 49463
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 400W ED28 REDUCED JACKET MOGUL BASE UNIVERSAL BURN

CAPP, Inc. SYLVANIA #M400/U/ED28 27.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071957
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NON CANCELABLE/NON RETURNABLE

hagemeyer north america phillips 27.1700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 518883
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in mults of 12

ITEM NO. 13 - Lamp. metal halide, 400W, E39 mogul base. BT37. clear, 4000K, rated for enciosed fixtures. Svivania M400/U
or equal. 1-1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 100 (5000060-1718670)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3}

S&J LIGHTING/LENSE SUPPLY HALCO #MH400/U 6.6900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 108208

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC - DAMAR #M400U/4K 8.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01054D

CED Construction Group HOWARD 9.9800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MH400U

REXEL SYLVANIA 10.5200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: M400/U/ED37
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: M400/U/BT37MOG IS OBSOLETE

WESCO DISTRIBUTION Philips 12.4000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MH400/U
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies Eiko #MH400/U 13.9600

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 49197
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 400W ED-37 MOGUL BASE UNIVERSAL BURN

hagemeyer north america phillips 14,4000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 729058
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in mults of 6

CAPP, Inc. " SYLVANIA #M400/U/ED37 16.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071958
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NON CANCELABLE/NON RETURNABLE

ITEM NO. 14 - Nut, lock 1" for threaded conduit, steel/zinc plated. Neer #1 -300 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Fach Purchase, Estimated
Quantity - 25 (2700475-1659640)

VENDOR NAME ‘ ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

WESCO DISTRIBUTION St. City 0.1270*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LN103
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

hagemeyer north america t&b 0.1600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: In103
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in mults of 50

Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies DOTTIE #LN100 0.1700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LN100

REXEL EGS 0.2400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: L-300

CAPP, Inc. BRIDGEPORT #103-S 0.5000
VENDdR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3010096

ITEM NO. 15 - Recebptacle. around fault. 20 amp. 125V. 3-wire. NEMA 5-20A. brown. Tamper resistant. weather resistant, Pass
& Sevmour #2095TRWBROWN or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 10 (2700660-1692268)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Capp, Inc. - receptacles are not tamper/weather resistant.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

CAPP, Inc. HUBBELL #GF20GYLA . 11.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS2997817

WESCO DISTRIBUTION Hubbell 13.1500%
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GFTWRST20
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

CED Construction Group hubbell 13.9000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: gftwrst20

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 9



hagemeyer north america p&s 14.5300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2095trwbrown
Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies BRYANT #GFTWRST20 15.9500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GFTWRST20

ITEM NO. 16 - Receptacle. around fault. 20 amp. 125V, 3-wire, NEMA 5-20A, arayv. Tamper resistant. weather resistant. Pass &
Sevmour #2095TRWRGRY or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 40 (2700660-2000751)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Capp, Inc. - receptacles are not tamper/weather resistant.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB : 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

CAPP, Inc. HUBBELL #GF20GYLA 11.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS2997817

REXEL leviton 12.5000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: gfwt2-gy

WESCO DISTRIBUTION Hubbell 13.1500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GFTWRST20GY
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

CED Construction Group ) HUBBELL 13.9800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GFTWRST20GRY

hagemeyer north america p&s 14.5300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2095TRWGRY

Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies BRYANT #GFTWRST20GY 15.9500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GFTWRST20GY

ITEM NO. 17 - Receptacle, ground fault. 20 amp. 125V. 3-wire. NEMA 5-20A. ivorv. Tamper resistant, weather resistant. Pass
& Sevmour #2095TRWRI or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 20 (2700660-1707638)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Capp, Inc. - receptacles are not tamper/weather resistant.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

CAPP, Inc. HUBBELL #GF20ILA 11.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS2407729

REXEL leviton 12.5000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: gfwt2-i

WESCO DISTRIBUTION Hubbell 13.1500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GFTWRST20I
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

CED Construction Group HUBBELL 13.9800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GFTWR20STI '

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 10



hagemeyer north america P&s 14.5300

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2095TRWRI
Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies BRYANT #GFTWRST20I 15.9500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: GFTWRST20I

ITEM NO. 18 - Strap, EMT. 1/2", 2 hole, steel/zinc plated. Appleton #TH-1901 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantity - 25 (2700790-1064600)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Hagemeyer North America - multiples of "100" not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
hagemeyer north america APPLETON 0.0271
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: th1901

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in mults 100

REXEL EGS 0.0300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TH-1901

WESCO DISTRIBUTION Appleton 0.0500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TH1901

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

CAPP, Inc. MADISON #1124 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071962

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. MA-LINE #MA-BT12 0.1600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MA-BT12

Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies RACO #2092 0.2300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2092

ITEM NO. 19 - Strap, EMT. 2" 2 hole, steel/zinc plated. Appleton #TH-1906 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated
Quantitv - 30 (2700790-1064664)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Hagemeyer North America - multiples of "50" not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

hagemeyer north america appleton 0.1700

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: th1906
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in mults 50

REXEL EGS 0.1700~
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TH-1906

WESCO DISTRIBUTION Appleton 0.2600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TH1906

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 11



S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc.

MA-LINE #MA-BT2 0.4900

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MA-BT2
CAPP, Inc. MADISON #1129 0.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071964
Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies RACO #2098 1.2300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2098
ITEM NO. 20 - Strap. EMT, 3/4". one hole. steel. Raco #2083 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv - 200
(2700780-1064548)
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3$)
REXEL EGS 0.0600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1902
WESCO DISTRIBUTION St. City 0.0800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TS-102
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30
CAPP, Inc. MADISON #1702 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3051945
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID
Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies RACO #2083 0.1100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2083
hagemeyer north america t&b 0.1300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ts102
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in muits 50
S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. MA-LINE #MA-DT34 0.2400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MA-DT34
ITEM NO. 21 - Strap. EMT. 1", one hole. steel. Steel Citv #TS103 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 15
(2700790-1064511)
VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
REXEL EGS 0.0900*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1903
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID
WESCO DISTRIBUTION St. City 0.1350
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TS103
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30
Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies RACO #2084 0.1700
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER;: 2084
S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. MA-LINE #MA-DT1 0.1800
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MA-DT1

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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hagemeyer north america t&b 0.2000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ts103
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in mults 25

CAPP, Inc. MADISON #1703 0.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071966

ITEM NO. 22 - Strap. EMT, 1 1/2". one hole. steel. Appleton #1905 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantitv -
15 (2700790-1660702) '

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

REXEL EGS 0.2200*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1905

hagemeyer north america appleton 0.3000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1905

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in mults 10

WESCO DISTRIBUTION St. City 0.3400

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TS105
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

CAPP, Inc. . MADISON #1705 0.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071967

S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. MA-LINE #MA-DT112 0.5300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MA-DT112

Levy Electrical and Piumbing Supplies RACO #2096 0.8100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2096

ITEM NO. 23 - Strap, EMT. 1/2" for thin wall. one hole. stamped steel. Raco #2082 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 50 (2700790-1140367)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE (3)
LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

REXEL EGS 0.0300*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1901

hagemeyer north america appleton 0.0455
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1901

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: order in mutls of 100

WESCO DISTRIBUTION St. City 0.0500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TS101
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30

Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies RACO #2082 0.0600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2082

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 13



CAPP, Inc. MADISON #1701 0.1000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3071968
S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. MA-LINE #MA-DT12 0.1100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MA-DT12

ITEM NO. 24 - Strap. EMT/Pipe, 1/4". one hole, aalvanized. Empire #233G0025 or equal. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,
Estimated Quantity - 100 (2700790-1660699)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Wesco Distribution - multiples of "100" not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

hagemeyer north america empire 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 23390025
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote

WESCO DISTRIBUTION Dottie 0.0500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: TW14

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Sold in lots of 100.

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

REXEL EGS 0.2600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CL-25

ITEM NO. 25 - Transformer, control. foot-mounted. 75VA. 120/208/240/480 VAC. 24VAC. with circuit breaker. JARD #7541MCB
orequal. 1 -1,0000 Each Purchase. Estimated Quantity - 4 (2700830-2011621)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Capp, Inc. withdrew their bid.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
hagemeyer north america jard 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7541mch

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: no quote

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC NB #NB 0.1000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NB
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

CAPP, Inc. MARS #50327 24.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS303550

S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. JARD #7541MCB 38.3700*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7541MCB

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 14



TOTAL BIDS -

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($!

Note: * indicates a pending award. PAGE 15



TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL (3) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

CAPP, Inc. 11,268.50

CED Construction Group 11,248.10 4,625.00

hagemeyer north america 6,532.87

Levy Electrical and Plumbing Supplies 4,032.10

LIGHT BULB DEPOT 7 LLC 4,402.75

REXEL 12,232.51 800.00

S&J LIGHTING/LENSE SUPPLY 7,561.17 2,598.55

S.W.H. Supply Company, Inc. 1,510.15 1,427.30

WESCO DISTRIBUTION 3,443.35 134.68
9,585.53

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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