JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7141

APPROVAL DATE: October 12, 2015

ITEM(S) QUOTED: FURNITURE, CLASSROOM & OFFICE (Percentage)
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: September 04, 2015

CONTRACT PERIOD: From November 01, 2015 through October 31, 2016
RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.



Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Munson Business Interiors

1.(a) Yes (b) No 2. Munson Business Interiors
2307 River Road Ste 100 Louisville, KY 40206
Contact: Holly Thompson 502-588-7384 Fax:

502-589-1317 3. 20-35 Business days 4. Yes.

Net 30 days.

OfficeMax

Please see attached documents as required.
We reviewed JCPS goods & services contract
per attached.

Net 30 days - Print daily Invoice

School Outfitters LLC

- School Ouftfitters would like to offer you a 2%
discount off of all classroom and office
furniture on our website:
www.schooloutfitters.com. - Please see
attached page of deviations for additional
contract terms.

Net-30

School Specialty Inc.

MUST REFERENCE QUOTATION NUMBER
2015006797 ON APPROVED PURCHASE
ORDERS. PRICING BASED OFF OF MFG LIST
PRICING, NOT SS CATALOG. CONTACT
JONATHAN GOSSOM FOR PRICING.
502-721-5299

NET 30 DAYS

The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE

As per submitted documentation.

Net 30 Days

Tom Sexton & Associates

Delivery 45-60 Days

Net 30 Days



ITEM NO. 1 - CHAIRS, CLASSROOM, OFFICE. ALLSTEEL. (4600250-1733148)

VENDOR NAME

The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE

CATEGORY NOTES:

PERCENTAGE
OF DISCOUNT
55.01 %

Munson Business Interiors .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 2 - CHAIRS, CLASSROOM, OFFICE. GLOBAL. (4600250-2000752)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
OfficeMax 56.73 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

The entire Global line is covered - catalogs available

Munson Business Interiors 54.13 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Tom Sexton & Associates 45.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Net 30 Days
School Ouftfitters LLC 2.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of
debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to
receive your contracted pricing.
ITEM NO. 3 - CHAIRS, CLASSROOM, OFFICE. HON. (4600250-1717549)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE 62.11 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

OfficeMax 59.53 %
CATEGORY NOTES: The entire Hon line is covered - catalogs available
Munson Business Interiors 57.13%

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 4 - CHAIRS, CLASSROOM, OFFICE. KIMBALL. (4600250-1727818)

Note: * indicates a pending award.



PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

Munson Business Interiors 54,13% *

CATEGORY NOTES:

OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 5 - CHAIRS, CLASSROOM, OFFICE. KRUEGER INTERNATIONAL/KI. (4600250-2011988)

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
School Specialty Inc. 4750 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
Munson Business Interiors 44.60 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Ouftfitters LLC 2.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of
debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to
receive your contracted pricing.
OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 6 - CHAIRS., CLASSROOM, OFFICE. NATIONAL. (4600250-1717550)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Munson Business Interiors 59.80 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax 58.53 %

CATEGORY NOTES: The entire National line is covered - catalogs available

ITEM NO. 7 - COMPUTER CARTS. LAPTOP STORAGE WITH ELECTRICAL CHARGING CAPABILITIES AND (4600250-2009598)

CATEGORY NOTES: SURGE PROTECTION. BRETFORD.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
School Specialty Inc. 45.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE 35.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

Note: * indicates a pending award. 4



School Outfitters LLC 2.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of
debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to
receive your contracted pricing.

Munson Business Interiors .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

ITEM NO. 8 - COMPUTER CARTS, LAPTOP STORAGE WITH ELECTRICAL CHARGING CAPABILITIES AND (4600250-2009599)

CATEGORY NOTES: SURGE PROTECTION. DA-LITE.

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE 30.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Ouftfitters LLC 2.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of
debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to
receive your contracted pricing.
Munson Business Interiors .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 9 - COMPUTER WORKSTATIONS, TABLES, CARTS-CLASSROOM TYPE. BRETFORD. (4600250-1727823)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
School Specialty Inc. 45.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE 35.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Outfitters LLC 2.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of

Note: * indicates a pending award. 5



debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to

receive your contracted pricing.

Munson Business Interiors .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 10 - COMPUTER WORKSTATIONS, TABLES, CARTS-CLASSROOM TYPE. TIFFANY/MAYLINE. (4600250-1727824)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Tom Sexton & Associates 41.50 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Net 30 Days

The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE 40.01 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Munson Business Interiors .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 11 - DISPLAY CASES. WADDELL (GHENT MFG.). (4600250-1720042)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
School Specialty Inc. 33.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

OfficeMax 29.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Waddell cases and accessories are covered - catalogs available
The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE 25.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Outfitters LLC 2.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of
debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to
receive your contracted pricing.
Munson Business Interiors .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:
Note: * indicates a pending award.



ITEM NO. 12 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM, OFFICE WOOD/METAL. ALLSTEEL. (4600250-1729473)

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE 55.01 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
Munson Business Interiors .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 13 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM, OFFICE WOOD/METAL. HON. (4600250-1727822)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
The Hurst Group (Fayette) - OBSOLETE 62.11 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax 59.53 %
CATEGORY NOTES: The entire Hon line is covered - catalogs available
Munson Business Interiors 57.13 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

ITEM NO. 14 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM, OFFICE WOOD/METAL. KRUEGER INTERNATIONAL/KI. (4600250-1727821)

PERCENTAGE

VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT

School Specialty Inc. 47.50 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

Munson Business Interiors 44.60 %
CATEGORY NOTES:

School Outfitters LLC 2.00 %

CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of
debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to
receive your contracted pricing.

OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid

Note: * indicates a pending award. 7



ITEM NO. 15 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM, OFFICE MODULAR. WAVEWORKS/RENEGADE ONLY. NATIONAL.

(4600250-2010813)

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Munson Business Interiors 59.80% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax 58.53 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

The entire National line is covered -catalogs available

ITEM NO. 16 - FURNITURE, CLASSROOM, OFFICE WOOD/METAL, (EXCLUDING WAVEWORKS/RENEGADE). NATIONAL.

(4600250-1717556)

PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Munson Business Interiors 59.80 % *
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax 58.53 %
CATEGORY NOTES: The entire National line is covered - catalogs available
ITEM NO. 17 - PORTABLE PARTITION PANELS, COMMERCIAL GRADE. SCREENFLEX. (4600250-1733150)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
School Specialty Inc. 20.00% *
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Oultfitters LLC 2.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of
debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to
receive your contracted pricing.
Munson Business Interiors .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: No Bid
ITEM NO. 18 - SEATING, PORTABLE. CLARIN. (4600250-1731507)
PERCENTAGE
VENDOR NAME OF DISCOUNT
Tom Sexton & Associates 4150 % *

Note: * indicates a pending award.



CATEGORY NOTES:

Net 30 Days

School Specialty Inc. 40.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
School Ouftfitters LLC 2.00 %
CATEGORY NOTES: Shipping will be added to each order as a separate line and will vary by
item. Inside delivery, lift gate, installation, assembly and removal of
debris services are available for an additional charge. Delivery times may
vary by item and all items will drop ship from the manufacturer. Some
items are made to order and their delivery time will be clearly
communicated at the time of order. Discounts are being offered off of our
already discounted prices on our website: www.schooloutfitters.com.
Volume discounts are available - call for a quote! You must call to
receive your contracted pricing.
Munson Business Interiors .00 %
CATEGORY NOTES:
OfficeMax .00 %

CATEGORY NOTES:

No Bid

Note: * indicates a pending award.



